JC

Metropolitan Planning Organization of Johnson County

Date: August 4, 2011

To: University Heights Mayor & City Council

From: Kent Ralston; Assistant Transportation Planner
Re: One University Place TIF — Public Comment

At your request, MPO staff has been collecting public input related to the One University Place
Planned Unit Development (PUD) for 1300 Melrose Avenue. Staff received nine emails (from
six authors) with written correspondence received between July 10 and August 5, 2011 which
are attached for your review. | have not attempted to derive common themes from the written
correspondence due to the relatively small amount of written correspondence received since the
last City Council Meeting.

Attachments:



----- Forwarded Message -----

From: jeri irvine <jerbrat@gmail.com>
To: uhclerk@yahoo.com

Sent: Tuesday, August 2, 2011 7:50 PM
Subject: one univ place

[ appreciate the time and effort the city council and citizens have put forth to discuss, describe and show details
of One University Place. It's a positive reflection on University Heights when I see the council and
citizens working together to make One University Place ... a GOOD 'university place'.

Thank you!
jeri irvine
Leamer Ct

----- Forwarded Message -----

From: belisle <belisle@usinternet.com>

To: uhclerk@yahoo.com

Sent: Thursday, July 28, 2011 8:52 PM

Subject: Comments on One University Place Development

For many years, | have collected black walnuts from several trees in the ONE UNIVERSITY
PLACE proposed development area.

I wish to alert you and expect that you will protect the large black walnut opposite 104 Sunset
Street as well as the large black walnuts on the west side in the area of the church's
amphitheater.

Black walnut trees deserve protection from removal for development.

Jon Belisle

From: irene bowers [mailto:ireneebowers@yahoo.com]
Sent: Saturday, July 23, 2011 1:02 PM

To: pat-yeggy@university-heights.org

Cc: louise-from@university-heights.org

Subject: TIF request

Pleasc DENY Mr, Maxwell's request for TIF assistance. [ do not think it is a good idea.

I have lived at 328 Koser Avenue since 1961 and am very concerned in the direction some of the U-Hits leaders
are trying to take us.

Thank you .

Irene E. Bowers



From: CLuzzie@aol.com <CLuzzie(@aol.com>

Subject: PUD Development Agreement items

To: ballard@@lefflaw.com, brennan-megrath@university-heights.org, uhclerk@yahoo.com, louise-
from{@university-heights.org, mike-haverkamp@university-heights.org, pat-yegey@university-heights.org,
rosanne-hopson@university-heights.org, stan-laverman(@university-heights.org

Date: Sunday, July 24, 2011, 7:33 PM

In looking over the draft development agreement included in the July 12 agenda attachments, | believe the subject of
noise and music should be addressed in greater detail.

Currently, the draft agreement says that occupants, owners and guests must comply with the city's noise

ordinance. Section 3(g). Such a general provision might be adequate for ordinary residential properties but the Maxwell
development includes commercial uses, balconies, and patio areas on the top floor of the rear building. Music piped
outside on commercial outdoor space or on a balcony or the top floor of the rear building can project noise more regularly
and much farther than someone having a back yard party once a year.

Allowing commercial space to be open until midnight both Friday and Saturday nights may seriously impinge on the quiet
enjoyment of neighboring homes (a concern residents near Stella have mentioned when, in nice weather, the patio

areas are used and the windows on some nearby residences are open). Section 3(h). Music played on the top floor of the
back building or on balconies of upper floors could easily reach residents living at considerable distances from the
development.

This is an area where a bit of prevention would save all of us hassles with noise enforcement. | would suggest prohibiting
any outside speakers (either permanent or temporary) on all balconies, the top floor of the back building, or any
commercial areas.

| also would strongly suggest requiring that the outside space of commercial uses be closed much sooner than midnight.
Many people go to bed long before midnight and would not appreciate loud noise that late at night.

Thank you for your consideration.

Chris Luzzie
338 Koser Avenue

Dear council members,

I am writing to you with my opinion on the TIF proposal. Throughout the arguments on changing the zoning for One
University Place | was neutral and did not feel strongly one way or the other. The strongest case that | felt was made for
One University Place was the tax revenue that it would generate. The TIF pretty much takes that away for 20 years, since
| doubt that only 20% of taxes would cover the services that the new residents would require. In addition, we don't
know what One University Place may look like in 20 years; is it going to still be worth much in taxes? Let's remember
that by adding so many new residences closer to the hospital, we'll probably be reducing the value of our own
properties since there will be more housing supply.

The opposite would happen if the University bought the place and put a clinic in there, for example, because it would
increase demand for housing while not affecting supply.

I believe a TIF can be useful if there are areas of a city that reduce the value of surrounding property. | believe cases in
lowa City and Coralville have involved eliminating unoccupied or unattractive lots and putting something new there, In
that case, there is a good case for a city to implement a TIF, as the new development is likely to raise the value of all
properties nearby. In U. Heights, for example, | would support a TIF for replacing the garden apartments/condos off of
Sunset. The St. Andrew's property however is not a problem.

Therefore, there is no need to subsidize the project, since this removes the main incentive (tax revenue), and basically
guarantees profit for a private business on the back of taxpayers without any clear value for taxpayers.

Therefore, | am strongly opposed to the TIF.

Juan Pablo Hourcade
416 Ridgeview Ave



From: pbb338koseriaol.com <pbb338koser(@aol.com>

Subject: Financial Issues Raised by OUP TIF Request

To: mike-haverkamp(@university-heights.org, rosanne-hopson(@university-heights.org, stan-
laverman(@university-heights.org, brennan-mcgrath@university-heights.org, pat-yeggy@university-heights.org
Cc: louise-from(@university-heights.org, uhclerk{@yahoo.com, ballard@lefflaw.com, danos.john{@dorsey.com
Date: Sunday, July 10,2011, 9:17 PM

The attached memo raises issues that should be considered before the City Council sends any letter to Johnson County.

Supervisors presumably expect University Heights to have done a better job of vetting the financial information provided
by Mr. Maxwell than has happened thus far.

| urge you to obtain the independent assessment of financial information that is a reimbursable cost of your consideration
of Mr. Maxwell's PUD application and request for TIF assistance.

Please get back to me if you have questions about any of the information my memo includes.

Dear Steve,

| realize you're off camping with your son, but wanted to raise a question before Tuesday's meeting
about the interpretation of "rise" stated in your July legal report:

e Ordinance No. 128 defines “Protected Slope” as “[a]ny slope rising forty percent (40%) o1
steeper over a run of 10 feet”. The question presented was whether “Protected Slope” means the
40% grade has to extend for 10 feet of rise, or whether the area with 40% grade has to be 10 feet
wide (horizontal measurement).

e I have reviewed my file concerning the adoption of the ordinance and spoken with Josiah
Bilskemper about it. I have also researched common definitions of “rise” and “run” in similar
contexts, | interpret Ordinance No. 128’s definition of “Protected Slope” to mean the area with
40% grade has to be 10 feet wide (horizontal measurement), regardless of the length of the “rise”
itself. I have informed Josiah and Mr. Maxwell’s engineering team of my conclusion.

In part my question reflects certain points made in an e-mail Larry Wilson sent to me last month
(copied below). My not being an engineer, however, I'm placing principal reliance on a "plain
language" reading of sec. 2.E.;

If "rise" is limited to a horizontal measurement and does not refer to the "vertical” length of the
slope itself, will not ordinance's definition of a protected slope encompass the one-foot
high/45% embankment that exists along the north boundary of the lot where we used to live at
40 Koser Avenue?

Presumably your conclusion reflects materials in your file and common definitions in other contexts
that you've consulted, but my respectful inquiry is how those materials and definitions would address
the example I've raised about slopes of very modest vertical length.

Best regards,

Pat

-~---0Original Message-----

From: Wilson, Larry T <larry-wilson@uiowa.edu>

To: pbb338koser <pbb338koser@aol.com>

Sent: Wed, Jun 22, 2011 2:26 pm

Subject: Questions about Neumann Monson Disagreements with Engineering Report #1

Hi Pat--
As indicated in the attachment, Neumann Monson disagrees with Josiah's City Engineer Report #1 on
Sensitive Areas items 20, ¢ & d, 20a, 22 a and 23 a, b & c relative to Sensitive Areas Ord. 128



Item 20b indicates there is no buffer zone shown around the protected slopes and Neumann Monson responds
by saying that there is no requirement for a buffer zone/strip in the ordinance. This is correct, but can't the
Council require a grass or other buffer strip as part of the slope protection? | am not sure what the
recommended width would be, but an expert could be consulted. | would think it should be at least 20ft wide.

Item 20c Josiah contends that the run of the slope is a horizontal distance relative to the vertical distance
based upon Ord. 128, Item 2E “E. PROTECTED SLOPE: Any slope rising forty percent (40%) or steeper over
a run of 10 feet.” | agree with Josiah and have pasted in a Googled definition below. | think both Neumann
Monson and MMS Consultants (engineering firm) are just plain wrong. How can this be resolved?

ltem 20d indicates that a field survey of the topography, which is more accurate, be provided rather than the
aerial photography topographical survey. Neumann Monson disagrees. While a site survey is not required by
Ord. 128, as a compromise, couldn't the Council require that the slopes in question be surveyed, at least to the
extent of providing a cross section of the slopes? This would not require a great expenditure.

Item 21a While the additional information requested by Josiah is not mentioned in Ord. 128, could Council
require it? The additional information Josiah says is needed is to be shown, “indicate areas needed for
construction storage, construction entrances and exits, job trailers, and any other areas on site that will need to be utilized
to accommodate the construction process,” is not shown on the site grading and erosion control plans that Neumann
Monson say will be retitled. Isn't it within the Councils authority to require it as Josiah recommends?

23a, b & ¢ The whole point is that the area has naturalized (become natural-like) over time and regardless of the hidden
disturbances, it does have the characteristics of an protected slope. Couldn’'t Council determine that the protected slope in
question meets the intent of Ord. 128 and therefore should be treated as a protected slope? There are protected slopes
being developed as shown on the attached maps excerpted from City Engineer Report #1 which would be protected
slopes if it is accepted that Josiah's definition of slope in item 20c is correct. Couldn’t these protected areas be part of the
bargaining to get the other items above accomplished, especially since | would not expect the Council to require a design

change to not develop those slopes?
| would appreciate your take on what could be done Josiah's positions in the report.
Again, my 2 cents (suppose that adds up to 4 cents)

Larry

How do | calculate slope/gradient?
"Rise over run" in the geosciences

Many of us know that the slope of a line is calculated by "rise over
run". However, the application of slope calculation can seem a little more complicated. In the geosciences, you may be
asked to calculate the slope of a hill or to determine rate by calculating the slope of a line on a graph. This page is
designed to help you learn these skills so that you can use them in your geoscience courses.

Why should | calculate slope or gradient?

In the geosciences slope can play an important role in a number of problems. The slope of a hill can help to determine the

amount of erosion likely during a rainstorm. The gradient of the water table can help us to understand whether (and how

much) contamination might affect a local well or water source.

How do | calculate slope (or gradient) in the geosciences?

Gradient in the case of hillslope and water table is just like calculating the slope of a line on a graph - "rise" over "run". But

how do you do that using a contour (or topographic) map?



MEMORANDUM

TO: University Heights City Councilors
DATE: August 1, 2011

FROM: Pat Bauer

RE: Assessing the QUP TIF Request’s Fiscal Soundness

Introduction

Even the staunchest supporter of OUP might balk at embracing the proposition that Council
action on the Developer’s TIF request should proceed upon a proposition that “in order to get OUP
we should give the Developer anything he wants.” The distinction between what the Developer
wants and what the Developer needs is of crucial importance, but to date Council consideration of
the Developer’s TIF request has involved minimal effort to determine the difference. Councilors
obviously are not accountants nor are they well-versed on issues of real estate construction and
finance, but absent determined efforts to the contrary, Council action on the Developer’s TIF request
may rest on little more than unquestioning acceptance of financial assertions that are self-serving and
needlessly conclusory.'

The Difficulty of Dealing with a Monopolist

In many instances, competitive bidding avoids the need for city councils to engage in detailed
consideration of the financial intricacies of particular proposed endeavors. If a street is to be
repaved, market forces usually ensure that the contract is awarded to the least cost provider. A
process of similar effect was followed with Plaza Towers, where an initial request generating four
proposals was then followed by a second step allowing anyone to come forward with a proposal
more advantageous than an altered version of one of the proposals the City of lowa City tentatively
had accepted.

A comparable process here could not occur without the complicating details of an
arrangement in which the Developer would on some cost-plus basis agree to assign all of his existing
rights in the project to any other person willing to build a similar project at a “TIF charge” lower than
that being demanded by the Developer. Absent some such arrangement, Councilors must
accommodate the circumstance of the Developer’s monopoly position and (as with utility rate
increases) closely examine his request to determine the soundness of his potentially self-serving
projections of costs and revenues.

1. Although requested a week ago, Dennis Craven has provided no further explanation of conclusory figures
contained in a two-page handout of financial information presented at the June 28th TIF work session. Inthe
absence of such further explanations, the analyses in this memorandum proceed from those conclusory
figures.



TIF Support Should Not Cover the Developer’s Mistake
in Offering to Pay More Than The Property Is Worth

From the outset, the Developer’s allies repeatedly have asserted that $4.3M is a given from
which all else must follow. That figure, however, is simply a no-bid “preemptive” offer the
Developer chose to make in an amount considerably higher than Saint Andrew had been expecting
and also more than the University of lowa was willing to match. The fallacy of uncritical acceptance
of that figure can be illustrated by a fairly simple pair of “thought experiments™ involving changes
in the projected costs that are a foundational component of the Developer’s financial calculations®:

PROJECTED COST PROJECTED REVENUE

Land $ 4,400,000 OUP $53,200,000
Other  $47.050.000 TIF __$3.730,000 Projected Profit
Total $51,450,000 Total $56,930,000 $5,480,000

The first thought experiment assumes that the no-bid preemptive offer the Developer made
to the Church was twice as large. By the logic OUP supporters are using, the level of TIF support
would have to increase by at least the same nominal amount to achieve the same projected profit (a
somewhat larger increase actually would be needed to yield a similar percentage rate of return):

PROJECTED COST PROJECTED REVENUE

Land $ 8,800,000 OUP  $53,200,000
Other  $47.050.000 TIF $ 8,130,000 LProjected Profit
Total $55,850,000 Total $61,330,000 $5,480,000

The second thought experiment assumes that the no-bid preemptive offer the Developer made
to the church was half as large (an amount approximately 10% larger than the land’s estimated value
of $2,040,000 under R-1 zoning as 24 vacant lots’). Here, the level of TIF support could be
decreased by at least the same nominal amount to achieve the same projected profit (again, a
somewhat larger decrease would still yield a similar percentage rate of return):

PROJECTED COST PROJECTED REVENUE

Land $ 2,200,000 OUP  $53,200,000

Other $47.050.000 TIE $ 1,530,000 Projected Profit
Total $49,250,000 Total $54,730,000 $5,480,000

In the absence of some persuasive evidence of the value of the land other than the price at
which the Developer unilaterally chose to make a no-bid preemptive offer, a majority of the
requested TII support simply covers the Developer’s mistake in offering to pay more than the land

2. Developer’s financial calculations were set forth on the first page of a two-page handout distributed at the
June 28 TIF work session, and in later examples stated variations are indicated as bolded figures.

3. See Financial Issues Presented by OUP TIF Request (July 10, 2011), Appendix Page A5.

-



was worth.*

There Needs to Be an Appropriate Connection Between Risk of LLoss and Possibility of Gain

Usually in the circumstances of a free market, the downside of possible loss is tied to the
upside of possible gain. The Developer’s contention that local governments bear no risk in the
circumstances of a TIF rebate is misleading in ways that can again be revealed by another fairly
simple pair of thought experiments. Here, projected costs and TIF revenue remain the same, but
OUP projected revenue either decreases or increases by ten percent. In the first circumstance,
projected TIF revenue fully insulates the Developer from sustaining any projected out-of-pocket loss:

PROJECTED COST PROJECTED REVENUE

Land $ 4,400,000 OUP $47,880,000
Other  $47.050.000 TIF $ 3.730.000 Projected Profit
Total $51,450,000 Total $51,610,000 $ 160,000

In contrast, in the second circumstance the same level of TIF support contributes to
essentially a doubling of the Developer’s projected profit:

PROJECTED COST PROJECTED REVENUE

Land $ 4,400,000 OUP  $58,520,000
Other _$47.050,000 TIF___$3.730.000 Projected Profit
Total  $51,450,000 Total $62,250,000 $10,800,000

An arrangement that amounts to “heads you lose, tails | win” can be fixed by requiring a
process of exacting cost and revenue verification with the amount of TIF support being reduced if
OUP project revenue is itself sufficient to produce the Developer’s stated goal of a 10.16%
annualized rate of return. Such a mechanism certainly seems warranted in view of the proposed TIF
arrangement’s provision that rebates to the Developer will extend out to the statutory limit of twenty
years if assessed values fall short of the levels needed to provide rebates totaling $8,000,000 in the
projected periods of either thirteen (county participating) or ten (city alone) years.

Accounting for he Effect of Incorporating TIF Revenues Into Property Tax Levies
and the Realities of Rising Expenses and Revenues

The Developer’s static example of flat revenues is easy to follow, but even within that
simplistic confine it is possible to identify a discrepancy between the treatment of OUP and the rest
of University Heights while the TIF arrangement is in effect and the treatment that results once the

4. The Developer may contend that the amount requested is instead driven by the financial impact of
reducing the permitted number of dwelling units from 95 to 80 and the permitted number of above-ground
parking spaces from 107 to 55. The Developer, however, failed to identify any increased TIF assistance as
anecessary cost of such changes at the time they were made, and also has not previously provided any factual
foundation for assessing the actual financial impact of such changes. A more direct way of testing the validity
of such a contention is asking the Developer to state the extent to which requested TIF assistance would be
reduced if the permissible number of units and above-ground parking spaces were to be changed back to 95
and 107 respectively.

-3



TIF arrangement ends. The nature and extent of the discrepancy varies between the Developer’s two
submitted scenarios (100/0 (city alone) and 80/20 (county participating))’ and a third scenario
(50/50) proposed in an earlier memorandum.®  Retaining the simplifying assumption of flat
revenues, the nature and extent of the discrepancy also varies depending on whether the availability
of incremental revenues simply produces similarly-sized increases in city expenditures or is instead
used as a basis for a proportionate reduction in property tax rates.

Somewhat more complicated effects follow when the assumption of flat revenues is replaced
with a more realistic assumption that property tax revenues increase over time in amounts
approximately equal to increases over time in the levels of city expenses those revenues cover.” Here
again, however, the nature and extent of effects varies depending on whether the availability of
incremental revenues simply produces similarly-sized increases in city expenditures or is instead
serves as a basis for a proportionate reduction in property tax rates.

In Illustration 1% (100/0 - Flat), the rest of University Heights continues to pay property taxes
of $550,000 for the next twenty years while OUP makes $300,000 in TIF payments to the Developer
for the first ten years and thereafter pay $300,000 in property taxes to University Heights that are
fully consumed by a precipitous 54.5% increase in city expenses from $550,000 to $850,000 inthe
eleventh year. This linked “mesa™ effect in city revenues and expenses is eliminated in IHustration
2 (100/0 - Flat - Incorporated), but the artificial assumption of city expenses remaining exactly the
same for twenty years’ reveals a significant change in the eleventh year involving a proportionate
reduction of 35.3% in the property taxes paid both by the rest of University Heights and (since
there’s no mechanism by which OUP can be required to pay more than its fair share of city expenses)
by OUP as well.

[lustrations 3 (100/0 - Dynamic) introduces the “dynamic” effect of 5% increases in the
taxable values of OUP and the rest of University Heights, with city expenses being covered for the
first eight years entirely by property taxes paid by the rest of University Heights but then increasing

5. The Developer has provided no satisfactory explanation why the participation of Johnson County allows
a twenty percent allocation of incremental taxes to local governments that somehow is not possible if the
exact same amount of TTF assistance is instead provided only by University Heights.

6. See Policy Issues Presented by QUP TIF Request (June 27, 201 1), p. 9. Because the effects can be seen
most readily in the 100/0 scenario, they initially are illustrated in that setting before considering their
dimensions in the remaining scenarios of 80/20 and 50/50.

7. Available historical budget information suggests the reasonableness of annual increases in amounts equal
to approximately a “flat” five percent of the beginning base figure. See Appendix Pages A13-Al4.

8. All [llustrations are based on figures for “Impact on City Revenue from Property Taxes” contained in the
fifth PowerPoint slide the Developer presented at the June 14 City Council Meeting. As a modest
simplification to facilitate comprehension, the “Fiscal 2001 budgeted” amount ot $548,000 has been rounded
up to $550,000 and the “Increase during TIF” and “Increase after TIF” amounts of $58,000 and $288,000
have been rounded up to $60,000 and $300,000 respectively.

9. This assumption is an simplified version of the “OUP won’t cause any increase in city expenses”
contention discussed at greater length in footnote 10.
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by 36% in the ninth year and again by 22% in the tenth year (a two-year increase of almost two-
thirds) to fully consume additional property tax revenue newly then becoming available from OUP.

[llustration 4 (100/0 - Flat - Incorporated) more fully reflects the likelihood that city expenses
would not be driven entirely by nothing more than the availability of city revenues. Once again for
the first eight years city expenses are covered entirely by property taxes from the rest of University
Heights, but instead of a “mesa” effect in city revenues and expenses as TIF payments cease in year
nine, both revenues and expenses are kept in line with the preceding trajectory and property taxes
payable by both the rest of University Heights and OUP are each reduced by almost a third.

Each of the effects depicted in Illustrations 1-4 (100/0) are reflected in Illustrations 5-8
(80/20) and Illustrations 9-12 (50/50). The circumstances of “expenses increase to fit available
revenues” in Illustrations 5 and 9 (Flat) and 7 and 11 (Dynamic) again involve “mesa” effects upon
cessation of TIF payments to the Developer that are somewhat lessened as twenty percent (and then
fifty percent) of incremental taxes are provided to the city from the outset. The “property taxes
reduced to keep abreast of expenses limited to those that would occur in OUP’s absence”
circumstance'® of Illustrations 6 and 10 (Flat - Incorporated) and IHustrations 8 and 12 (Dynamic -
Incorporated), however, involve more immediate and long-lasting reductions in the level of property
taxes paid by the rest of University Heights.

The combined effects of including “fair share” from the outset and increasing the percentage
of incremental taxes allocated to the city obviously provides the greatest benefit to the rest of
University Heights. The possibility of that greater benefit, however, can only be seen by looking
behind the limited set of conclusory numbers the Developer has provided to see some of the
possibilities the Developer obviously would just as soon you not consider.

Conclusion

Although necessarily somewhat simplistic, each of the above analyses demonstrates
significant deficiencies in the fiscal soundness of the Developer’s requested TIF assistance.
Councilors who rather consistently accept almost everything the Developer says at face value and
as consistently dismiss almost all substantial issues raised by concerned citizens may be advancing
their goal of causing OUP to come to pass, but they certainly are not otherwise doing what they
should be doing to fulfill their responsibility to look after the immediate and long-term interests of
all current and future residents of University Heights.

Councilors should recognize that they’re dealing with a monopolist who is most attentive to
his own best interests and consequently should subject his request for TIF assistance to the same sort
of careful scrutiny they would if they were spending their own money instead of the tax revenues
otherwise payable to local government over the course of what could quite easily turn out to be a
period of twenty years.

10. The assumption that OUP will not result in any separate increase in city expenses may be factually
questionable, but OUP supporters rather consistently have claimed that to be true and it independently is a
necessary implication of the Developer’s 100/0 city only scenario in which no incremental taxes would be
paid to local governments for a period of ten years,
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----- Forwarded Message -----

From: "pbb338koser@aol.com” <phb338koser@aocl.com>

To: mike-haverkamp@university-heights.org; rosanne-hopson@university-heights.org; stan-laverman@university-
heights.org; brennan-mcgrath@university-heights.org; pat-yeggy@university-heights.org

Cc: louise-from@university-heights.org; uhclerk@yahoo.com; ballard@lefflaw.com

Sent: Monday, August 1, 2011 11:20 PM

Subject: Fwd: Request for Additional Explanations (Financial Information Provided at June 28 Work Session)

As noted in the memo just submitted to City Councilors, I've not received any response to the following request for
additicnal explanations from Mr. Craven.

If any Councilor feels that the explanations | requested would be of help to you in considering the OUP TIF request, | urge
you to let Mr. Craven know of you interest in having such explanations furnished to you in advance of next Tuesday's
council meeting.

----- Original Message-----

From: pbb338koser <pbb338koser@aol.com>

To: deraven <dcraven@berganpaulsen.com>

Sent: Mon, Jul 25, 2011 9:30 am

Subject: Request for Additional Explanations (Financial Information Provided at June 28 Work Session)

Dear Mr, Craven,

Following my exchange of e-mails with Mayor From is a request for additional explanations of financial information
contained in segments of the first page of the sheets presented at the June 28th University Heights City Council's work
session.

If there's any need for this request to come directly from a councilor, please let me know and I'll pursue that route. Also as
noted in my initial message to Mayor From, please don't hesitate to get back to me by phone if that would be a more
efficient/effective way of addressing the questions | have.

Best regards,

Pat Bauer



Dear Louise,

In attempting some further financial analyses of different elements of the OUP TIF request, I've encountered a few
difficulties (stated below) with specific parts of provided information not "lining up" with other parts.

Dennis Craven offered at the last council meeting to respond to questions about provided financial information, but
because | wasn't clear if his offer was limited to city officials, I'm routing this request for additional explanations to you in
the hope that you will deem it appropriate to forward to him as a way of asking him to respond to questions raised by me
(versus you endorsing in any way the questions I'm asking).

If you think this is something | should instead be doing directly, | certainly will do so if you can direct me towards Mr.
Craven's e-mail address (I haven't been able to find in on e-mails I've received). | also would be happy to instead route my
request through a councilor if you have any concerns about forwarding it as mayor on the understanding indicated above.

If you forward my request to Dennis Craven and it would be helpful for him to talk over with me anything below, he
certainly can call me either during the day at 335-9014 or in the evening at 337-7446.

To complete the additional financial analyses I'm preparing in time to meet the August 3 "deadline” for public input
incorporated into MPOJC's summary for next month's council meeting, it would be most helpful for me to receive the
requested additional explanations from Mr. Craven by the end of the coming week (Friday, July 29).

As always, thanks in advance for any help you're able to provide me on this.

Best regards,

Pat

REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL EXPLANATIONS

NOTE: Referenced figures appear in three highlighted sections of attached PDF (first page of financial information
presented at June 28 work session).

NET VALUE OF TIF TO DEVELOPER (YELLOW HIGHLIGHTING)

1. Are all numbers in this section determined as of the same point in time (e.g., "present value"}), and if so, is the point in
time the same as those used in the other two highlighted sections?

FINANCIAL ANALYSIS (GREEN HIGHLIGHTING)

2. Once again, are all numbers in this section determined as of the same point in time (e.g., "present value"), and if so, is
the point in time the same as those used in the other two highlighted sections?

3. "Total projected revenue (w/o TIF)" is $53,200,000 and "[a]ssessed value of One University Place is assumed to be
90% of retail value." Although 90% of $53,200,000 is $47,880,000, "Assessed vaiue at completion" stated in the
preceding section (Comparison to Plaza Towers) is $48,600,000. The difference is only $720,000, but does it reflect some
other variable not included in my "90% of total projected revenue" calculation.

4. How is the revenue from Parking ($3,300,000) allocated between Commercial ($3,000,000) and Residential
{$46,900,000)7

5. Does "Total projected revenue (w/o TIF)" of $53,200,000 minus "Total projected costs" of $51,450,000 result in a "Total
projected profit (w/o TIF)" (my own term for what seems to be a missing derived figure) of $1,750,0007

2

PROJECTED DEVELOPER ANNUALIZED RATE OF RETURN (PINK HIGHLIGHTING)

6. Does the "Projected Developer Annualized Rate of Return - Without TIF" of 5.12% reflect something besides the "Total
projected profit (w/o TIF)" of $1,750,000 derived in Iltem 5, and if so, what are those other factors?

7. If "Projected Developer Annualized Rate of Return - Without TIF" of 5.12% is produced by "Total projected profit (w/o
TIF)" of $1,750,000, can each per percent of return appropriately be viewed as "encompassing” $341,797 (i.e,
$1,750,00/5.12)?

8. If "Projected Developer Annualized Rate of Return - With TIF" of 10.16% is produced by "Net projected economic value
to developer" of $3,730,000 (from yellow highlighted section), can each per percent of the additional 5.04% return
attributable to TIF(i.e., 10.16%-5.14%) appropriately be viewed as "encompassing" $740,079 (i.e., $3,730,000/5.04)?

9. What justifies the differences in the "relative” rates of return computed in ltems 7 and 8? (Using the factor derived in
Item 8 ($740,079) , the combination of non-TIF profit and TIF assistance ($5,480,000) would seem to produce a "with TIF"
return of 7.4% ; in contrast, using the factor derived in Item 7 ($341,797), the combination of non-TIF profit and TIF
assistance ($5,480,000) would seem to produce a "with TIF" return of 16.0%).



One Unversity Place
Summary of TIF Request
June 28, 2011 Presentation to City Council

Objective:

Develop a TIF proposal that would allow the project to attain a reasonable rate of
return to the Developer based on the preliminary financial analysis and that would
create benefits for the City of University Heights.

Net Value of TIF to Developer;

Proposed TIF payment > 8,000,000

culated based on the 80% option, 5% discount rate

55 discount for time value of money (2,500,000)

ed 14 year collection period. PV is to full assessment date.
Y

Less value of City space (920,000) Value is estimated at 4,000 square feet at $230 per foot
Less cost of offsite improvements and Breakdown of estimated offsite costs:
city upfront cost to be paid by the Sewer improvements S
developer (850,000)  Sunset intersection

il S Water and storm sewer
Net projected economic value to Incremental professional fee cost
jeveloper 3 3,730,000

Comparision to Plaza Towers:

Plaza Towers One University Place
A d value at completi $ 22,000,000 $ 48,600,000
TIF $ 6,000,000 $ 3,730,000
Ratio of TIF to value 27.27% 7.67%

Plaza Towers TIF was an upfront payment to the developer by the City of lowa City. Value of the Plaza Tower TIF
excludes the benefit of the discounted value of the land parcel sold by the City to the developer.

Assessed value of One Unversity Place is assumed to be equal to 90% of retail value.

“Financial Analysis:

Projected project revenue:

Commercial S 3,000,000 Excludes value of proposed City space to be
Residential 46,900,000 deeded as a part of the TIF proposal
Parking 3,300,000

Total projected revenue (W/O TIF) $ 53,200,000

Projected Cost of project:

Land $ 4,400,000
Offsite direct costs 850,000
On site direct costs 36,900,000
Design, engineering and other professonal 4,500,000
Administrative, selling, interest and misc. 4,800,000
Total projected costs $ 51,450,000

“

Proj; d Developer A lized Rate of Return:
Without TIF 5.12%
With TIF 10.16%
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