City of University Heights, Iowa
City Council Meeting

Tuesday, November 10, 2015
Horn School Library room

600 Koser Ave.

7:00-9:00pm.

Meeting called by Mayor Louise From

Time

7:00 Call to Order Meeting

Administration

-Mayor

-City Attorney

-City Clerk

Committee Reports:

Finance

Community Protection

Topic

Roll Call
-Approval of Minutes-October 13t Meeting

One University Place (OUP) construction
report and updates

-Discussion and Consideration of OUP East
Ravine Restoration

-Preservation of Records Supporting City’s
TIF by the National Development Council
(NDC)

Public Input

Mayor’s Report

-Discussion and Consideration of changing
the regular December 8t city council
meeting to a date in the third week of
December

Legal Report

City Clerk Report

Committee Report

-Consideration of Resolution 15-72 to
approve FY2015 Annual Finance Report
-FY 2017 Budget Process

Treasurer’'s Report/ Payment of Bills

Police Chief Report
Committee Report

Owner

Louise From
Jeff Maxwell/Kevin Monson

Josiah Bilskemper, Silvia
Quezada
Silvia Quezada

Public Comments

Louise From

Steve Ballard

Chris Anderson

Jim Lane

Lori Kimura

Chief Ken Stanley
Carla Aldrich/M.
Haverkamp



Time

Streets and Sidewalks

Building, Zoning & Sanitation

e-Government

Topic Owner

Committee Report Virginia Miller
-Third Consideration of Ordinance no.
190

Establishing a City Tree Board

-Third Consideration of Ordinance No.
191 requiring property or resources to be
set aside for open spaces if redevelopment
of property occurs through subdivision of
increased density

-Update of Trees Forever Community
Visioning Grant application

-Street Signs repositioning plan update
-Tree pruning class by Trees Forever at City
office on Dec. 51

Josiah Bilskemper
Engineer Report
-Consideration of Resolution No. 15-73
Setting the Administrative Fee for the 2015
Sidewalk Repair Project and Authorizing
and Directing invoicing for Repair Costs.
-Consideration of Resolution No. 15-74
Authorizing the Mayor to sign the
MidAmerican Energy Company-Light
Emitting Diode (LED) Street Lighting
Installation Agreement. The Agreement
calls for LED street lights to be installed by
MidAmerican over the next 10 years at no
cost to the City.
-Discussion and Consideration of Olive
Court Topographical Survey
- Discussion and Consideration of Melrose
Avenue Panel Replacements in the OUP
Public Improvements Project

Committee Report Silvia Quezada
-First Consideration of Ordinance No.
192, Adopting the 2015 International
Building Code, Plumbing Code, Electrical
Code, Residential Code, and Property
Maintenance Code with amendments.
-Consideration of motion to purchase code
books and/or electronic subscriptions for
various building and zoning codes and
regulations (e.g. International Building
Code, Plumbing Code, Electrical Code,
Residential Code, and Property
Maintenance Code).

-Lights in the Heights: Luminary Walk 2016

Pat Yeggy
-Zoning Commission Chair report Dorothy Dotti Maher
-Board of Adjustment Chair report
Committee Report Mike Haverkamp




Time Topic Owner

Announcements Anyone

Recommendation of City Attorney to meet
in closed session pursuant to Iowa Code
Sec. 21.5(1) to discuss strategy with
counsel in matters in litigation where its
disclosure would be likely to prejudice or
disadvantage the position of the City.

Reconvene to open session

9:00 Adjournment Louise From

Next Regular December Council Meeting: Date and Location to be announced.



Mayor Report November 2015
Meetings Attended:

Monday, October 19%" Joint Entities Meeting at School Board office: Highlights: Discussion of Minimum
Wage Ordinance and certain cities in Johnson County to begin the first increase Nov. 1%. School Board
members outlined new changes with newly elected School Board members.

Wednesday, October 28" Emergency Management Meeting (EMA). Highlights: | will be retiring as
Commission Chair the end of the year. Haz-Mat Team reported about several county incidents.
Countywide debris management was discussed. Also EMA provided support to our largest number of
community events this year, examples: RAGBRAI, County Fair, several summer fests, etc.

$250 MidAmerican Energy annual grant awarded to the City of University Heights. Council member
Virginia Miller and | met and decided to “earmark” the funds toward future community events.

University Heights Future Fire Protection Plans

I met with Coralville Fire Chief Dave Stannard and lowa City Fire Chief John Grier about University
Heights plans for future fire protection. University Heights will begin the process to move forward
for fire protection services to change from the City of Coralville Fire to the City of lowa City Fire by the
start of the new fiscal year, July 1, 2016. It was agreed by Chief Grief that the compensation for
services would remain the same as the Coralville agreement.

*| received the following email from Kathryn M. Kunert, Vice-President Business and
Community Development, MidAmerican Energy Company. Nov. 4, 2015.

*In the next few days, residents in your community will be receiving a mailing from
MidAmerican Energy Company regarding a request we are making to the lowa Utilities Board
to use the gas adjustment clause. This adjustment clause will be added to the bills of lowa
natural gas customers and is a recovery mechanism available to regulated utilities.
Implementing the clause allows MidAmerican to recover the investment costs associated with
capital projects required by government mandates and specific projects that provide gas
safety improvements benefiting the public. An example of a project that may be included in
the request is the relocation of gas pipelines and facilities to accommodate road improvement
projects. MidAmerican will be filing a request with the lowa Utilities Board to approve
recovery of approximately $2.6 million per year. The charge being proposed is a flat cost, not
based on usage, and may start as early as December 7, 2015, if the lowa Utilities Board
approves the request. There will not be an interim adjustment clause implemented; therefore,
the collection of the clause will not start until the IUB approves the request. In addition, the
charge will appear on the bill until the applicable projects are fully depreciated out or until
MidAmerican’s next gas rate case.



It is important to remember that this is a fixed monthly charge and does not fluctuate if the
volume of gas consumed changes. The particular charge, depending on customer class, is

proposed as follows:

Proposed
Fixed
Customer Class Monthly
Increase for
2015-2016
Residential Service S0.29
General Service $S0.98
Seasonal Service $1.98

It is our goal to provide timely information regarding any cost changes associated with utility
services to allow customers to adjust their planning. As always, we are available at any time
to answer any questions you may have. If you have any inquiries regarding this notice, please

have them call 1-888-427-5632.



November “15 — City Attorney’s Report

1. Requiring Open Spaces when Property Development is Permitted. The Council
will have its third consideration of proposed Ordinance No. 191 requiring a property
developer to dedicate (donate) land to the City for a park/open space if the development
1) involves a subdivision of land or 2) includes an increase in density of people or
dwelling units. Proposed Ordinance No. 191 is attached.

2. Establishing City Tree Board. The Council will have its third consideration of
Ordinance No. 190, which establishes a City Tree Board. Proposed Ordinance No. 190
is attached.

3. Sidewalk Repair/Replacement Work. The Council will consider Resolution No. 15-
XX, which concerns the sidewalk repair program.

e The Resolution does 3 things, in accordance with the City Engineer’s analysis
and recommendations (as set forth in his monthly report):

e Establishes an administrative fee at $100.00 per property for those
property owners who joined the City’s sidewalk repair program;

e Establishes an administrative fee at $200.00 per property for those
property owners who did not join the City’s program and also did not
perform the repair work themselves; and

o Directs the City Engineer’s office to invoice property owners for the repair
costs and administrative fees.

e The Resolution is attached. It references a list of properties and respective
amounts; that list will be attached to the Resolution upon receipt from the City
Engineer.

e The Resolution also provides that if property owners do not pay invoices by
December 31, 2015, the amounts invoiced may be assessed against their
properties for collection as additional property tax.

4. Adopting Building Codes. The Council will have its first consideration of Ordinance
No. 192, which adopts current versions of various building codes. This ordinance is
the work product of Silvia Quezada, Terry Goerdt, and | believe one or more members
of the University Heights Zoning Commission and Board of Adjustment. A copy of
Ordinance No. 192 is attached.




5. Purchasing Reqgulatory Codes/Online Subscriptions. The council will consider a
motion to purchase code books and/or electronic subscriptions for various building and
zoning codes and regulations (e.g., International Building Code, Plumbing Code,
Electrical Code, Residential Code, and Property Maintenance Code). | do not know the
costs of these various materials, and 1 do not know whether that information will be
available to the Council before Tuesday. If not, the Council may authorize the purchase
and just pay the invoices when they arrive; alternatively, the Council may set a “not to
exceed” figure in its motion authorizing purchase.

Leff/SEB/UH/UH Atty Reports/UHAttyRept November 15 legal report



City Clerk Report
November 2015

e One building permit received since the last meeting:
One University Place — new development
e 176 rental permits received for FY16 fiscal year (175 last month):

73 for Grandview Court (73 last month)
103 for rest of University Heights (102 last month)

¢ Kudos to Officer Kris Lyon for the new phone message system; nice to be able to
retrieve messages from the computer.

Report from Stan Laverman — Rental Inspector:

Working on the issues that have been reported to him.



Form F-65 (IA-2)
(6-10-2015)

STATE OF lOWA
2015

FINANCIAL REPORT

FISCAL YEAR ENDED

JUNE 30, 2015

UNIVERSITY HEIGHTS

CITY OF UNIVERSITY HEIGHTS , IOWA

DUE: December 1, 2015

16206201000000
City Clark

1004 Melrose Avenue
lowa City, |1A 52248

(Pleage correct any error in nems, address, and ZIF Coda)

WHEN Mary Mosiman, CPA
COMPLETED, Auditor of State NOTE - The Information supplled in this report will be shered by the lowa Slale
PLEASE State Capitol Bullding Auditor's Office, the U,S. Census Bureau, various public Interest groups, and State
RETURN TO Deas Molnes, |A 50319-0004 and federal agenciss.
ALL FUNDS
Itarn description Governmental Proprietary Total actual Budget
(a) (b} {c) (d)
Revenues and Other Financing Sources
Taxes lovied on property 665,380 665,360 668,903
Less: Uncollected property taxes-levy year Q o] 2
Net current property taxes 565,360 665,360 668,903
Dellnguent property taxes 0 0 0
TIF revenyes 0 0 0
Other city taxes 11,081 0 11,001 8561
Licenses and permits 24,388 0 24,386 28 718
Use of mongy and property 4,454 0 4 454 5,000
Intergovernmental 127,238 0 127 2386 128,835
Charges for faes and service 608 o] 808 1,000
Special assessments 0 0 0 0
Miscellansous 179,153 Y 178,153 180,647
Other financing sources 5,535 0 55635 0
Total revenues and other sources 1,017,823 0 1,017,823 1,017,861
Expenditures and Other Financing Uses
Public safety 579,023 i} 579,023 567,203
Public works 206,179 g 206,179 20g,268
Health and scelal services 0 0 0 1]
Culiure and recreation 38,023 o] 38,023 40,881
Community and economfc development 12,658 0 12,558 12,000
General government 234,014 0 234,014 210,051
Debt service 32,689 0 32 588 32,664
Capital projects 0 0 3} 0
Total governmental activities
expenditures 1,102 386 0 1,102,385 1,071,967
Business typa aclivitias 0 0 0 Q
Total ALL expenditures 1,102,386 0 1,102,386 1,071,967
Other financing uses, including transfers out 5,635 0 5,535 1]
Total ALL expenditures/And
other financing uses 1,107,921 0 1,107,821 1,071,967
Excess revenues and other sources over
{Under) Expenditures/And other
financing uses -90,098 0 -90,098 «54,308
Beginning fund balance July 1, 2014 579,298 0 579,288 579,298
Ending fund balance June 30, 2015 488,200 0 489,200 524,992
Note - These balances do not include $ ] held in non-budgeted internal service funds; § 0
held in Pension Trust Funds;,  $ 0 held in Private Purpose Trust funds and & ¢
held In agency funds which were not budgeted and are not available for city operations.
Indebtedness at June 30, 2015 Amount - Omit cents Indebledness at June 30, 2015 Amount - Omit cenis
General obligation dab $ 60,000 |Other eng-term debl 3 0
Revenue debt
b 0|Short-term dekt 3 0
TIF Revenue debt " 0
General obligation debt limit 3 5,546,644
CERTIFICATION
THE FOREGOING REPORT IS CORRECT TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND BELIEF
Signalure of city clerk Dale Published/Posted Mark {x) ona

[X] Date Published
[ ] Date Posted

Frinted name of cily clerk Area Code Mumber Extenslon
Christing Anderson Telephone ——+ 319 337-5900
Signalure of Mayer or other Clly official fNeme and Titls) Cate signed

PLEASE PUBLISH THIS PAGE ONLY




University Heights Budget Timeline

The 2016-2017 budget for University Heights needs to be submitted to the State by March 15, 2016.
Here is our basic timeline:

January 12 Council Meeting- Budgets for all departments are submitted to Steve Kuhl.

February 19 Council Meeting- Steve presents preliminary budget to the Council for input and changes.

March 8 Council Meeting- Steve presents final budget and council makes any final changes and approves
the budget.

Budget Responsibilities-

Each of us has responsibilities for our specific departments and | just list those to make sure we are in
agreement. | am listing current council members now since we do not know who will have the
departments after the first of the year.

1. Public Safety- Mike, Carla and Ken- Ken handles the police budget. Mike and Carla will need to get a
budget estimate from the Coralville Fire Department and Hydrant Flush service from City of lowa City.
We should talk at the November meeting how we will go about requesting a quote from lowa City Fire
Department for the Fire contract.

2. Public Works- Silvia, Virginia and Josiah-Virginia and Josiah will provide budget for roads, bridges and
sidewalks. You will also need to provide Tree Trimming/Management Budget. Josiah will provide
engineering fees budget. Virginia will need to get cost for lowa City Bus Service and Johnson County
Seats Service.

Silvia and Josiah will provide budget for Sanitation and Leaf Vacuuming.

3. Culture and Recreation- | will get cost of library services from lowa City Public Library. Virginia- Will
we have any community support projects to budget beside the $2000 we have committed for
Community Visioning?

4. General Government- | will work with the mayor to review salaries of all non-police personnel.

Steve Ballard to look at Legal Services budget and insure we have right estimate. We will break down
this budget item into General Government, Public Safety and Reimburseable expenses.

Mike Haverkamp to report on E-government budget
Mayor to get MPOJC assessment figure and IA League of Cities fees.

Virginia to get Chamber of Commerce fees. | think we should talk about our membership in the Chamber
at out December, 2015 meeting, and make a recommendation to the new council who will have to make
the decision.



| think this gets most of the major items. Would appreciate any input at our November City Council
meeting on any items that need to be addressed or upcoming changes.

Jim Lane

11/08/15



Treasurer’s Report October 2015

Our total revenue for the month of October was $371,397.06 comprised of the
following amounts:

Property Taxes $276,296.22
Parking permits $ 80.00
Parking fines $ 125.00
Traffic Fines from Clerk of Court $4,227.87
Interest on bank accounts $ 88.24
Road Use Funds $9,876.93
Rental Permits $ 925.00
Building Permits $79,777.80

In addition, we received a check from Shive Hattery to cover the costs of the Ice
Cream Social that were paid to Louise From and Virginia Miller (for ice cream,
face painting, and the Eulenspiegel Puppet show) last month — this was recorded to
offset the expenses under Community Support Projects

Balances in the bank accounts as of 10/31/2015:

MidwestOne Checking Account $394,261.60
Hills Bank Money Market Account $ 1,043.66

CD (1002) at UICCU (due 3/22/17) $77,511.86
CD (1004) at UICCU (due 10/2/15) $52,412.29
CD (1011) at UICCU (due 5/19/17) $ 73,370.88
CD (1003) at UICCU (due 8/28/17) $43,754.34
Hills Bank Time Acct $23,027.50

Forfeiture Fund $ 4,064.94



| abeg

%0°00}

126png Jo %

198png
FHUNLIIANOL 3D170d

§S0C

s0cC

000

000
000
000
000
000
000

s0¢

s0¢

soc
000
000
000
000
000
000

S§1L3190-Inf

%0°00%
%000}

%00

%00

%L'8Y

%L, 8P

%G ¥

12Bpng J0 %,

000

000

0000¥'ZE

00 00¥'Z€

0000¥'2€

00'00%'ZE

00'00v'2€

sLLLL'sL
8L11/'GL

000

000
000
000
ooo
000
000

BLLLL'SY

8.°111'GL

000
0c08
000
000
000
8521261
000

1abpng S1390 - Inf
IDIANIS 1930

%5'298
%G 298

%8y

%l 'SP
%0 CE
%6 €6

%862
%8 ¢c

%9 85

%985
%9ZC

%8 82
%SG Sy
%872l
%S 8¥
%0€

126png J0 %

§10Z 4990320 ybnoayy Ainp

[en)oy "sA j19bpng sso7 g 1joid
emo| ‘sjybroH Ayssaaiun jo 19

00'622'€}
006/l

00'8€L'E2L

00 /9E'VEL
00'150'22k
ooerL'oLl

00'//6'05
00'000'S

00 ZL¥'9€L

00'LLY'9EL
00000'S

000SZ'EL}
00068'9Z
00 6EE'Y
00 8€6's85
00°000'k

196png
VL ENED]

[£A:4-3 41}
zz6Ts'vLL

62 L0L'9LE

16°19€'19
9v'200'SEL
29'620'v01
000
SZTTLL'S)
00 0kk'L

1S 9EC'LEY

1S 9ET LEY

6061}
29960'L
PE €09'ZE
S6 12211
G656
£6'260'v82
00'0€

S1 300 - Inf

awoau| 19N
awoou| AreupiQ 39N

asuadx3 [ejoL

SHYOM J1nand

Al3d4VS 217and

LNIWNYIA0D TIVHINID

JJIAY3S 1930

NOLLY3¥O3Y ® 34NLIND

"A3A JINONOD3 ® ALINNWWOO
asuadxg

1401 SSO0I)

swoay| [B)o)

ALY3dOd¥d 7 ASNOW 40 3Sn
S3IXVL ALID ¥3HL1O
SANNIAIY SNOINVITROSIN
SLIWN3d ? SISN3IIN
“"NIAIY AFYVHSIVYLNIWYIAOODNILNI
SAXVL ALYIJO¥d IVHINID
SIADNIAYIS YOS SIDUVHO
awoou)
asuadx3gjawosu| AieulpiQ

siseq ysen
SL/60/LL
Wv gt:Zi



Z abed

%P'056'2C
%¥ 056'2C

%E LE

%L e
%Z 0E
%926
%00

%8'6C
%822

%6 G5

%655

%l ve
%0001
%8 82
%SGy
%S v
%b 8y
%0 €

196png o %

00622
00’6l

00'60%'956

00'298'162
00'896'205
00264 'EL4
00'00%'2
00°./6'05
00'000'S

00'88l'/S6

00'881'256

00'000's
000
00052 €LL
00'068'SZ
00 6EE'60}
00'602'L0L
00°000'}

190png
IWLOL

Lzesl'sllL
lzesl'sll

TS 255'95¢

9929/'08
€9°969'P5L
86'6V8'v0L
000
SZ'TLLSL
ooovl'L

6/ °0VE'SES

6. 0VE'SES

[AWiAL
LLLLE'L
¥€ €09'Z€
S6 LZTLLLE
98'60.'8¥
18'952'6E€
000e

§1 3190 - Inf

%000}
%0001

%S ¥C

%E ¥C
%P €€

%2 '8b

%Z 8y

%6'Ly

196png Jo %

00'0 98'0ZL'61 %0°'0¢2-
000 9802261 %0 0€2-
00 1488 8y 6¥7'0Z %S9l
000 %59l
00 216'08 116296}
00 ¥S¥'2 1€ 028
000
000
000
00'L£'e8 ye0LL 0P %6 G
00'L.E'e8 rE0LL O %6 G
Sk
6951
000
000
000 %6'G
00'L€'e8 0E'LY6'6E
000
196png §1390- Inf 196png Jo %
SLI43N3E 33A01dW3

§10Z 1940320 ybnosy) Aine

Jenjay "sA 196png ss07 9 Jj0id

emo| ‘syBiay Ansiaaiun jo Ano

0000521~
0000521~

00'005'ZLE
0000521}

00'000'G0}

00'000'50}+

00 000'50}

326png
Xv13ISN avoy

9€'ESL'8Z
9E'€SL'8T

S.00¥'6)

GZ00v'6)
000
000
000
000
000

LSy

LEPSL'SY

000
000
000
000
LLpSL'ey
000
000

SL3120 - Inr

awiodu) 19N

awoouy AleutpiQ 19N

asuadx3 jeyo L

SHOM DInand

AL34vS OITand
LNIWNNIA0D TVHINID
30IAM3S 1930

NOILLYINIIY ¥ 3¥NLIND

"A30 JINONOD3 2 ALINNWWOD

asuadxy

10id SS0I9

WOl |eyo

AL¥3dO¥d 7 AINOKW JO 38N
SIXVL ALID ¥3HIO
S3INNIAIY SNOANVTTIIOSIN
SLIWY3d ? SISN3JN

""NIAIY QIUVHSIVLINIWIIAODYIALNI

SAXVL ALI3d0¥d TvHINTD
S3DIAMIS YO STOAVHO

awosu)
asuadxg/swosu| AeuipiQ

siseg ysen
SLieo/LL
WY 8t:21



| abed

000 0C 09 Z9'960'L SIAXVL ALID ¥3HLO 810}
000 0209 29'960'L xe] as1ox3 Aumn
S3AXVL ALID ¥3H1O
000 000 %8 82 00'0SZ'ELL $E'€09'CE SINNIAIY SNOANVTIIOSIN IejoL
000 000 %8 0Cl 00000+ 05°202'L Fuswasinquiay pue spunjay
[¢ls)0] [eleNo] %0'S- 00'000'L 0006 awoau| “3sIN |ejol
000 000 %06~ 00000'L 00 05- 8y0
awoou| "OsIy
Q00 000 %6'8C 00'000'26 9/'¥€0'8Z Ssauld [eyoL
000 000 %0 0E 00°000'06 9/'6€0'/2 10 J0 Y[Q-sauld ouyses)
000 000 %C V) 00000'L 00 566 sauy4 Bupped
saul4
000 000 %00 00'0S8¢ 000 suojngquuo)
000 000 %P vT 00°000'v L 80'LLP'E astysueld Al siqed
SANNIAIY SNOIANVYITIISIN
000 000 %S Siy 00°068'92 G8'LZL'LLL SL1IWd3d ? SISNIODIT B0
000 000 %EELL 00'00S'9L 00009'sC SHuiad/sasuadr "SIy [eloL
000 000 %4 SLL 00°005'S} 000€Z'22 SR jejuay
000 000 %0'LEL 00'000'L 00'0L€'L sluuad Bunped
SHuLag/saswan oSy
000 000 %2 LEY 00'000'0L S6'lZL'es shuuad uswdinb3/buipiing
000 000 %0 0 00 08€ 000 spuuRd 61ouonbrjeuiseg
SL1INY¥3d ® SISNIDI
000 000 %8 ¢l 00'6€E'Y G/ GSS “"IAIY AFHVYHSNVLNIWHIAODNILNI B30l
000 000 %00 00'6EE'P 000 SaNUIAZY paieyg apmg (el
000 000 000 UONINIISUOY) 10311S/0SN PEoY
000 000 %00 00'6EE'Y 000 Juwoidy xet Apadoid [e1osowwo)
SANULARY PaIRYS alBlS
000 000 1858 ‘9sinquuisyy/sjuely 8RS JaLyiQ jejol
000 000 G/'GSS fiajeg oyjes) puadu) jjagieag

‘asSINqUUIIY/SIURIS) 3)1BYS JAYNO
INNIAIY GIYVYHSIVLINIWYIAOONILNI

000 %S 8% 00'00v'2€ 8G'LHL'SL %S 8F 00'8€6'G85 £6/60'v8C SIAXVL ALNIHOUd TYHINIO [ejoL
000 000 %0 8t 00'609'vt o Cer'le Ana yisues)
000 000 %S 87 00 222'%LS 05€ze'svT xe) Apadoid seinbay
000 000 %0 8¢ 00€PL'LL 66'9€C'8 Ana7 seoinlag Aeign
000 000 %8'GE 00252 vt 08'v0L'S Aaa7 aoueinsu)
000 %S 8% 00'00¥'2€ 85 /LL'GL 000 Ana7 801A19G 1920
000 000 %00 00'6€€'7- 000 fpe yuwdy xe] doid |esswwod
000 000 000 S31A97 sjyauag

S3XVL ALYIJOUd TVHIANTD

000 000 %0'€ 00°000'} 000 SIDIAYIS YO SIDUVHD lejoL

000 000 %0'E 00'000'} 00'0€ spoday ao1j0d
SADIAUIS YO SIDUVHD
awoouy|

asuadxg/swoau| lieuipiQ

1e6png so % yebpng §1320 - Inf 39fipng 4o % 190png Siwo-mmr _ webpngyoy  9@bBprna  §L300-Inf
FANLIFLHOL ID110d JDIAN3S 1930 WH3INIO
§10Z 4290320 ubnosyy Ainp: siseg ysen
1enjay “sA j39bpng sso1 9 1j0id SHeo/LL

emo| ‘syybiey Ausiaaiun jo A9 WY 05:Z}



2 abed

196png 0 %

126png

FANLIZAHO0L 32M0d

000

000
000

000

000
000
000

000

000
000
ooo

000
000

000
000

000

000
000

000

000

000
000

000
000

000
000

soez

S0z

s0¢C
50C

SLWO-INr

000
000
000

000

000
000
000

000

000
000
000

000
000

000
000

%00 00'0017'2€ 000

%00 00000'0E 000
%00 00'00%'C 000

000

ooo
000
000

000
000

000
000

%L 8F 00°00v'2e 8/'21L'GL

%L 81 00 00v'zZe 8L LLL'SL

000
000

_webpngjoy,  3ebpng

JJIA¥3S 1930

§L190-Inr

%t'0E
% 8t
%Y 8€

%€ 02

%99C
%G S¢
%00

%E €€
%E'EE

%0 0
%00

%8 62

%€'001

%0001
%8 L0l

%802
%CEL

%8'¢C
%8'¢c

%985
%9'8S

%9¢C
%922

126png jo %

5102 4890300 ybnosy Ainp
|en)ay “sA j1abpng sso7 '@ Jj0id

emoj ‘spybiaH Anssaaun Jo Ao

00162°12
00005
00008

000097

00'009't
00000'C
00000'}

00 L6791
00°L6¥'9L

00002
0000C

00£26'0G

00008'S

00'000'S
00008

00 £/9'vY
00 00S

00000'S
00°000'S

00 Zip'9EL
00 ZI¥'9eL

00000'S
00'000'G

196png
B\ SELES]

20'€29'9

0o0¢el
0o'zel

0l ¥E6

ve vy
9¢'605
000

000

000
000
000

Z6'96Y'S
26'96Y's
000
000

000

000
000

Sz TLL'SE

Sv18'S

00°000'S
Sl ¥l8

05 '162'6
00'99

o0o'ovL'L
o00'ork'L

LG 9EZ'1ED
1S 9ET'LEY

Z6°0EL'L
B OEL'L

S0 - Inr

sbuipiing |e1aus9 9 IleH Aud e10)

awi) Med Jeinbay-sauejes [ejo]

juelSISSY Sanijioe
awi] yed Jeinboy-saueljes

sapnnAulewseday 230

SUONEIIUNWIWODBIS L
asueuaUIRl
senNunAuereday
§]502) 9 s)y3uag aakojdwz |ejoj
aJesipay
Syadi

voud
$1S02 R Slyauag aako|dwzg

lenjoeijuoy [B}o |

sasea @ sjuay
lenioenuod

Salpowwo? [e10L

saiddng
ssppouno)
sbuipyng |essuan 3 leH Ano
ANIWNYIA0D TVHINID

J0IAY3S 1834 1m0l

lediduug
Jsasa)
IDIAY3S 1830

NOILLY3YOIN # JHNLIND [ej01

syed [ejoL

uonnquyuos aepdn yed
sasuadx3 yed
syed
Kreiqry
sjo9lo1d poddng Ajunwiwo)
NOLLVIHO3N 7 3¥NLTIND
"A3d DINONOD3 ® ALINNWWOD Iejol
2120 uMeT/Bulwy) 9a1]

*A3A JDINONOD3 B ALINNWWOD
asuadx3y

1ol sso015)
awoouy) feyo |

AlL¥3d0Oud ® AINOW 40 3Sn 1eloL
SJUBWIISBAU] YSED UO )salajul
ALY3IdO¥d ® ASNOW 40 38N

siseg yseo
SLi60/LL
WV 0521



¢ abed

196png 30 %

136png
IYNLIZIYOAL 32110d

000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000

000
000

000
co'o
000

000
000
000
000

ooo
000

000
oo
000
000
000

000

000
000

000
000

000

000

000
000

000

000
000
000
000

S§L3120-Inr

000

000

000
000

000
000
000
000
000

000
000

000
000

000

000
000
000
000

ooo
ooo

000

000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000

18Bpng
IDIANIS 1830

196png jo % __ SLPO-Inr

%062

%0'SC

%0'6C
%0'SC

%Y oL
%00

%0'SE
%b 2L

%y L

%0 001
%EPLL
%00
%00

%E 9t
%E 9E

%l €C

%0 /8
%9 98

%00
%00

%0 891

%06

%¥ v
%L 0t

%9'¥C

%00
%9 /G
%9'Le
%00

39Bpng jo %

§102 4290320 ybnosy Ainp

|en)ay “sA jabpng sso 9 J1joid
emo| ‘syybiey Apssaalun jo A1

00 /96'S

00 296'S

00/96'L
000007

00'000'05
00'009'L

00'SE6'vT
00'00E'E

00 00E'E

00599't
00geQ
0000g
0000s

00008'6
00°008'6

00'588'8

0005
00 00S

0009
0009

00 scl

00000'€

0005
0000%'y

0008562

00052
00'000°t
00004
00°000'}

19bpng

SLLer'L

SL'1ep')

Sllev
00°000'}

000

Q000
000
000
000

658LL'EL
000

Lezel's
€8'06E'C

€8 06€'C

£8%99'L
009z,
000
000

85485’
8G /S5’

000

000
000
000
000

98'950'C

0e'2g9
00 €EY

000
000

ooole
9e 0.2
oc'le

00'0L¥

Y0 L2

000
62G/S
et
000

SL190-Inr

B\ LELED]

suonesadQ |1ounod/iokely B30l

awli] ued Jeinbay-saueles |2joL

J0Aep
J12uno)
awi) yed Jejnbay-sauejeg

$1S00) R Slyauag aakojdw] jejo )

a Lol

W 0 . n
aIedIpapy
112UN0Y-S¥y3d|
vold
$1500 R slysuag sakojduig
suonesadQ [1IDuno)/iohel
S321A1ag [eba
sasuadx3 uonss|g

UIWPY 3DURULY R JOINSEAI] PHI[D [BI0L
juswdojanaq yeis [ejol

sdiyssoquisy B seng @10,

JUBWISSAsSSY D0
sapi) Jo anbea v
sdiyssaquisyy pue sang
20JaWWOY JO Joqueyd
sdiysiaqusiy g sang
juswdojsraq yei1s

aun) ued sejnbay-saue(eg |ej0]

ueuUo)SIH ‘Jonseal] “HPa|D
oun) ued seinbay-sauejeg

51502 ¥ Sjyouag aakojdwg jejo

di fond

I k! I n
alesIpaiy
Sy3dl
vold

$150) ¥ sjyauag aako|dwiz

SIDIARG [enjoefjuo) |ejol

saouag ABojouyaa)
BuiAdog/Bunyuug

salouaby sayiQ 0} sjuswhed [ejo)

s394 AuejoN
satouaby JayjQ o3 sjuawiey
8394 dn 19§ Buneap
suonesiiqngd [eba
$834 p1egopjueg
$394 Bununodsoy
SODIAISS |eNjorRjU0D

SanIpowIwoy |ejo |

sbuneaw buide
abeysod pue saiddng soo
ouysa ] ssanddngpuawdinbg Jouiy
aJemjog/aIEMpIeH
sanipowwo)
UIWpY 3oUBLIY R JAINSEAI) PPBID

siseg ysen
SLi60/LL
WY 0521



¥ abed

000 000 %0'ST 0000%'2 00 009 |ejudy abesen
S92IAI9G [BNJOR1IUOYD
000 000 %t 91 00'008'8E 12 9%E'9 SapIpowo) B0
000 000 %2 ZE 00008 Z9LL'y saljddng feroL
000 000 %S 28 00 00% 00 0gE sdiysioquisy |BUOISS3j0Id
000 000 %S Th 00009 gl'ss Buiddygebeysod
000 000 %8'8C 000002 18915 sanddng Jay10
000 000 %00 00°000'€ 000 satddng bunessdo
000 000 %S 61 00 000'€ 22 85 saynddng aa130
000 000 %00 00°00€ 000 sjeapsBunealy ssauisng
000 000 %6 2. 00005'€ 00°055'2 uomunuIwy
sanddng
000 000 %00 00°000°'G 000 wawdinb3 Jouy [eloL
000 000 %00 00°005'€ 000 uuojiun 13310 senbay
000 000 %00 00005t 000 juawdinb3 a21j04 Bunerado
wawdinb3 Jouny
000 000 %0 ¥ 00 000G 00052'2 swidinb3 Jofew ejo)
000 000 %0 St 00000's 000s2'C awdinby rep
jawdinb3 Jofey
000 000 %00 0000091 000 aseyaind Jed
sanpowiwod
@0olj0d
000 000 %6 66 00928 05625 fyuno) uosuyor-jewzeH
000 000 %6 €Y 00 OVE'SE 05'805'GH alld |ejo)
000 000 %6 € 00 Ove'SE 05'808'SL sa19uaby JaLpO/Mm S1oe1UOD |BJOL
000 000 %00 00 02S'e coo A9 emoy Jo A)o-ysni4 juespAy
000 000 %L 8Y 00028'L€ 05'805'SL 1.deq and ejiiajeiod
salouaby JajO/m sjoeUOD
ang
000 000 %6'2T 00'002'% 00620t pieng Buissoi) |ejoL
000 000 %0'0 000 000 1PY10 - preng buissoi)
000 000 %0'0 00002 000 sayjddng
000 000 %6 €T 00005t 00520'L sauefeg [e10]
000 000 %6 €2 00008t 0060'L pseng Buissord
saueles
000 000 000 s)so0) g slyauag sakoldw3 jejo)
000 000 000 nesuadwo) juswhojdwaun
o000 000 000 aledipay
000 000 000 S¥3dI
000 000 000 Vol

§J509 P sjyouag aakojdwz
pseng buissoin

000 000 %6'Lb 00'002'SL 00'68Z'L suondadsu| Buippng feyoL
000 000 %6t 0000Z'S)H 00's8¢'L uoyoadsuj e3uay / Bupiing
suonoadsu| Buip|ing
Al34vs onand
000 000 %6 €6 00'EPLOLL 19'620'v01L ANSWNIIAOD TVHINIO [el0L
000 000 %00 00'0s¥'9 000 edueinsuj Appger] poy
000 000 00°000'1 sisheuy Jj1
wbpnggoy  wbpng L PO-Inr 196png 40 % 3oBpng 51190 - Inp 19Bpng jo % y9bpng §1190 - Inp
FHNLI3INOL 30110d 30IAY3S 1830 B\ ENED]
$10Z 1890300 ybnoayy Ainp siseg ysep
Jenjdy "SA uomv:m S$S07 9 jjold SHeo/LL

emo] ‘sjybiay Ausiaaaiun jo 119 WY 05:ZL



g affed

000

000

000

000
000
ooo

000

000
000
000

000

000
000
000

000

000
000

000

000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000
0o

000

000
000
000

196png 40 %, joBpng $1 320 - Inp

FANLIFIHOS FOIM0d

000
000
000

000

000
000
ooo

000

000

000
000

000

000
000
000

000

000
000

000

000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000

18Bpng 40 % 19bpng
3DI1AY3S 1830

§13°0-Inr

%0 Z€
%2 0E
%68

%68

%1 'S¢
%Pl
%00

%E ¢

%l'ce

%9’V
%S LY

%t 6l

%l Ly
%00
%161

%1€

%G'¢e
%6 LL

%b'SE
%00
HC CE

% |19

%S 0l

%y 0Ll
%L0
%00

%00

%0'0
%00
%00

3a6png Jo %

5102 4990190 ybnosyy Ainr
[en)ay "sA }abpng sso B 1joid

emo| ‘spyblaH Anssaniun jo Ao

00'150'z2Y
00'582'99¢
00000'9L

00000'9}4

000002
00005'9
00005'2

00'9€0'2€

0000Z'0}

0000001
00002

0000Z'ZL

00002
00005
00000'9L

00'9€9'

00'9€9'¢
00°000'+

00'262'992
002
00ELL'8ET

00000'8Z

00289}

00005
00000}
0072082

00056

00 00g
00051
00°00€

19Bpng
TvuINaD

9¥'200'GEL
9Y'ELO0LL
[4Ak2 4

Tz L't

cceos
00626
000

WiEL',

9z'55¢'C

9z 09l
0066

16'6EE'E

00882
000
16'150'€

BL'9ES L

88 9l8
[0 >2-173

G5 PGE'6

000

15 %06'92
oo gle
BB'EEL'LL

000

000
000
000
000
000
000

LO'PEE’L

006G.L
00°¢ss
0L
000

000

o000
000
000

SERO-INC

A134vS o19nd [e1oL
aolod |ejoL
wawdojaaaq Yels [ejol

Buluies 190130 Jejnbay jeyol

sanddng Gulures|
Buures] 1LBOWO
Buiuies) Awapeoy
Gurues] 130140 Jejnbay
juawdojaraq yeis

saniunAueRN/eday ejoL

Ireday sjdIyaA [ejoL

sedaypurey e
nedaypuiey a24o1g
1eday a|oIyap

suonesadQ 3joIYaA (10|

Saysepm
Byio
leng
suonesadQ ajo1yaa

i

3 0ed! 191 [ejoL

woselpap/saa Jabedjuozuap
Hoddng 1)
wm:onxm SUONE2IUNWILWOD3J3 |
sammnAuenseday
sabepp ssoig) aoijod |ejoL
S9AI9SaY-Saue(eg
sabep ssolg aojog
way| [|oiAed snoaue||aasIy
Aed Jay30 3 AepljoH
sabepp ssoun asijod
§150 3 sjljausag ad1jod [e10)

uonesuadwo?) SO 31jod
Yins aollod
a1e21paly aol1jod

asuRINSU| W[eSH 931jod
VI 3d1j0d

$150D @ Sjyaueg 3d1j0d
S82IA19G [ENIDRIUOY) [RI0L

Heis sjuaAg jeroadg
eaisAyd-bunsa) yshsd-aag joid
BuiAdoy/bunuuyg
AMjiger/en-esueinsul 99tjod
salouaby 1930 0} sjuswied [e)o)

saoiAaleg ABojouysa ]

Bunsa) asuapiag

s994 Busiigreointegyiier Aunon
1uUaby 1230 03 keq

siseg ysen
SLi6o/LL
Wv 0s:2t



g abed

000k

186png jo v,

196png
¥NLI34HOL 391704

S0T

s0¢C

000

000

000

000

000

000
000

000
000
000
000

000

000
ooo

000

000

o000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000

§L3190 - Inr

%0°00 00'0
%0001 000
%00 00'00%'Z€
196png jo %, 1o6png
3DIAY3S 1830

emo| ‘sjybiaH Aussaalun jo 1o

8LLLL'SL
BLLL2'S)
000
000

000

000

000
000
000

000

000
000

000
000
0oo
000

000
0oo
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000

000

000

000
000
000

SLWO-Inr

%S298
%S €98
%8'EY
%Ly
%0'S2

%0'G2

%6 Ly
%00
%8 ¢ClL

%¥'0L

%00

%9 vL

%9 L

%1€

%l €e

%L EE
%C €€
%< 82

19bpng j0 %

$10Z 4990300 ybnoay Ainp
|enjoy "sA jJabpng sso g Jljold

00°'622°EL
00'6.Z°€h
00'BEL'ECL
00'9E'PEL
00295'SE
00'Z95'6E
0029802

00005 €l
0000

00'000'€S

00000'€

0000005

00000'0§

00'508'SY

00'508'sY

00'vrr'e
00'191'9E
0000Z'L

196png
L ELED]

Z2'6ZS'PLL
zT6Z5' Ll
6T L0L'9LE
16'19E'19
$2'006'8

S2006'8

SL'vi'8
000
00 €S}

£€'/0€'LE

000

000
000

000
000
000
000

£€/0€'.€
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

£€'20€'LE

€8'€G1 'Sl

€8'ESL'S)

v9vi8'z
£7°000'Ck
9/'8EE

§1390 - I

awosu| 19N
awosu| AreuipiQ 39N
asuadxy |ejo)

SHYOM 21and [e30L
uoyejuEg YO

1en3oeNUOY |eJ0L

BuioAoayyses ]
Bununnoep jea
Bui|opAoay malapuess)
|enmyoenUOD
uoneyuesg

sxlemapis = ‘sabpug ‘speoy |ej0)

Ajajeg pue sjonuod Suyel] €101

Ayowmosia by oyger)

sanipowwon-subig y9ans
fyayeg pue sjonuo owes|
lenjoesuod-Buideams j9ang
Kyowmoe|3 bunybi 1eang
juvad Jajem uLolg
|ENIORNUOD-[BACWIDY MOUS

S301AISG [EMORIUOY) [BI10 ]
Buuaquinusy quny/Buiduyg
sjuawaaoiduwi/siieday ejoL

Jwbwpauswssasse ubis ouyel|
adesspue| j9ang Jasung
sieday 19an8
sileday ylemapis
juwaoeldas joued - 3se3 asoljay
sjuawaoe|dal |aued |jeso]
s309f0ud yojed sjeydsy
sjuswaoe|dal |aued feuspy

sjuawaaocidusireday

s394 Buusauibug

S99IAJ9S [EN}IBIRUOD
syemapig B ‘sabpug ‘speoy

SYIOM Dlignd J9UI0 [BIOL
sajouaby Jayi0-$19813U0Y) |BIO |

?21A198 §1VIS
89jAJ9g Shg 9|
18jU39 [ewiuy o)
s8jouaby 1810-SI0ENUOD
SHIOM 211qnd J2YO
SHHOM 211and

siseg ysen
SLi60/LL
WY 0521



1 abed

%0 001
%0 001

%8 8¢
%8021
%06~

%0 G-

%6'8C
%0 0g
%Pl

%00
% vT

%S Sy

%EELL
%LGLL
%0 'LEL

%2 LE8
%00

%S ¥

%07

%6 S¥
%00

%000}
%0001

%¥ 8t

%0 8¥
%S 8y
%0 8F
%8'GE
%S 8%
%00

%6’ Ly

%0'€
%0'€

186png Jo %

000
000

000SZ'elt
00000t
00000'}
00000'}

0000026
00'000'06
00'000'Z

00'0sc
00000'P1L

00'068'9Z

00°005'9}
00'00S'SL
00000'}

00'000'0+
0006¢

00'6£€'601

00'6£€'601

00°000'50}
00 6€E'Y

000
000

0060.'102

00'509'vt
0022715
00 EVL'LL
002sT'yL
00'00¥'2¢
00 6€E 't~
00 LIE'ES

00'000'}
00'000't

viol

LULLE')L
LULLE'L

¥E'€09'2E

05 202’}
00 0S-

00 0g-

9. vE0'8Z
9/'680°LZ
00566

000
80'LIp'E

G LZL'LLE

00009'8
00 0€2'L2C
000/E't

S6'1ZL'e8
000

98'60Z'8¥

LiysL'ey

LLrst'sy
000

G699
S1G6SS

18'95.'6EE

vgzev'ie
05°€CE'6YT
66 9cZ'8
08'40L'S
85 LL2'SL
000
0E'I¥6'6E

000e
oooe

%6 Lt 00'LE'E8
%86'LY 00'LLee8
S1143N39 33A0dW3

68'vGL
68'vG1

000
000
000

000

000
000
000

000
000

000

000
000
000

000
ooo

000

000

000
0oo

000
000

0E'L¥6'6E

000
000
0oo
000
ooo
000
0E'L¥6 6€E

000
000

000
000

000
000
000

000

000
000
000

000
000

000

000
000
000

000
000

%65y 00'000'504 LLvSL'ey

LLvSL'8Yy

15%¢:1%:14
000

%6 Gt 00'000'50}
%6 'SP 00'000'S04

000
000

000

000
000
000
o000
000
000
000

000
000

1e0png 10 % 19bpng

XV13sn avoy

§10Z 4390300 ybnosy finp

len)ay sA Jabpng ssoT 9 Jj0id
emo) ‘spybiay Aissaaun jo Ao

SLWO-inf

SAXVL ALID ¥3HLO IB104

xe] as1ox3 AN
SAXVL ALID ¥3HLO

SINNIATY SNOINVITIIOSIN {B10L
quitay pue spunjay
awoou| "SIy [ejo)

Yo
awooau| "SIy

saul4 [e10]

1D 0 )[D-sauLd duyser)
saut4 bunped
saul4
suonnquiuod
asiyoueld Al ajqed
SIANNIAIY SNOANVTIIOSIN

S1IN¥3d ® SISNI30IT [Bj0L

S)WIBL/SASUIIT "ISIN |BI0L

sjuLIad |ejusy
sjluad Bunpey
SHULIad/SaSUadIT dSI
sHuLad juawdinbgy/Buiping
shwsag Biguonbiyeuipiasg
SL1INY3d ® S3SN3IIN

“IAIY QAVYHS/TVINIWNIAODYILNI 18301

SanuUaAdy paleyg 3jels |BjoL

UONOTUISUOY) 1931)G/aS PEOY
uwd|dy xe] Apsdosd [e1ossunuo)
SBNUBASY PRUBYS JIRIS

‘asINquIIdY/SIURIS) BIB)S JaYI0 |20 L

Kjayeg olyes ) puasuj Jjaqieag
‘esINquIIRY/SIURID 3)e)S SIS0
FANNIAIY QIUVHS/TVLNIWYIAOONILNI
SAXVL ALYIJOUd TVHINTO IeoL
Ana Jisuea]
xe) Auadoid reinbay
AnoT saoialeg Aurigi
£Aa1 soueInSU|
Aaa 2010198 193Q
fpe Juwidy xe) doud [e1ssswwon
S3IA9T SHjausg
SAXVL ALYIJO¥Nd TVHINTD
S3IDIAYIS Y04 SIDUVYHO IeIoL
suoday asijod
S3DIAYIS MOH SIADUVHO

awoou|
asuadxg/awodu) Leupio

siseg ysen
Si/60/LL
WV 0§21



@ obed

%E 0E

%P'8e
%P 8E

%E 02

%9 92
%S GZ
%00

%00

%00
%00
%00

%E EE
%EEE

%00
%00

%00

%00
%00

%862

%€ 001

%0001
%8101

%8 0T
%ZEL

%B'CC
%8 22

%6 6
%6 G5

%l ¥e
%l vT

19Bpng jo %

00.8'tZ

00'00g
00 00g

00009'%

00009't
000002
00'000't

00€8

002
00's¥
0o'le

00 L6794
00'}6¥'9L

00002
00002

00°00¥'2E

00 000'0E
0000p'T

00°£26'05

00°008'S

00000'S
00008

00 £.9'v¥
0000S

00'000'S
00'000'S

00'881'/56
00'881'256

00000'S
00000'S

1ebpng
IvioL

20€29'9

0028l
00'Z6L

0l vE6

yevey
9¢ 605
000

000

000
000
000

26'96Y'S

26 96Y'S

000
000

000

000
000

SZZTLL'SL

SIPi8's

00000'S
Sivle

05'162'6
0099

0o'ovk'L
ooorl't

6.0VE'SES
6.0VE'SES

zL20z'L
[ pivAt

SL320-Inr

%00 00 €8 000 000 sbBuip|ing jesauag 3 j1leH AnD fejoL
000 000 auil) Med te|nbay-saLiejes [ejoL
000 000 uesissy sanijioedq
awn] yed Jejnbay-sauejes
000 000 sanunAue/eday [ejoL
000 000 minn
000 000 SUONEIIUNWIWOB|S |
000 000 aosuruUIRH
samnnAureneday
%00 00'€8 000 000 $)s09 2 S)yauag sakojdw3 ejoL
%00 002 000 000 aledlpaiy
%00 00 000 000 Sy3dl
%00 00'LE 000 000 vold
§1502) § sjyauag sakojdwy
000 000 |enjoenuoy [ejol
000 000 S9SEaT § Sjuay
enidelUCD
000 000 SanIpowLo) [ejo
000 000 soliddng
sailpowwio)
sBuip|ing [esausS 2 lleH A1D
LNIWNYIAOD TVHINID
000 000 3DIAY3S 16930 ®0L
000 000 lediound
000 000 1sa13ju|
JOIAN3S 193a
000 000 NOLLYVIHI3H 8 JUNLIND IeI0L
000 000 Sied |ejol
000 000 uonnquiue) ajepdn ued
000 000 sasuadx3 sued
s’led
000 000 Aeigny
000 000 syoalold poddng Ajunwwod
NOILYINOIY 2 ¥NLIND
000 000 "A3A DINONQOD3 ® ALINNWWOD [e10L
000 000 dJen ume/Bunuu) 3alp
"A3d JINONOD3 B ALINNWWOD
asuadxy
%Z 8y 00 +Z€'€8 pE0LL'OF %6 'SP 00'000'S0} (3221514 Jyoid ssoi9
%C 8Y 00't/c'e8 pEOLL'OV %6 S¥ 00'000'S0} LLysL'sy awody] jejol
Skl 000 ALY¥3dO¥d 2 ANOW 40 3SN 1eyoL
SlbL 000 SJUDWISIAU| YSED UO 1S3J93U)
AL¥3dO¥d ® AINOW 40 3SN
126png Jo % 196png §1390 - Inf 1eBpng j0 %, 19bpng 54320 - It
SL1I43N3g JIA0TIN3 Xv1 3Isn avod
$102 4390300 ybnoyy Ainp siseg ysep
lenjay “sA }9bpng sso B Jjoid SH60/LL
emo| ‘siybroH Ayissaaiun jo A9 WY 05:21



6 abed

%052

%05¢

%0 5S¢
%0'sC

%L ST

%S 0C
%6 VT
%\ 02
%Y L2

%P opL
%00

%C SE
%bTL

%Y TL

%0001
%EPLL
%00
%00

%E 9E
%E 9E

%0 BE

%V ve
%E 8E
%€ 8e
%Z 8E

%l €C

%0 /8
%9 98

%00
%00

%0891

%06

%b 2y
%, 0L

%9 ¥C

%00
%9'/S
%9+
%00

126png Jo %

00'€65'9

00 /96'S
00'296'1
00'000'%

00929

0008
00'/8
0068
000.€

00°000'05
00'009't

00089'9Z
00'00€'E

00'00€'e

00'699'L
00'ge9
0000S
0000s

00'008'6
00'008'6

00'6vL')

0002k
oozrl
00'6/8
00809

00'588'8

0005
00005

0009
0008

0o scL
00000
000g

00 00b'y

00'056'C

000s2
00000't
0000
00000}

19Bpng
101

rLeva'L

SLieb'L

Sll6y
00'000't

6€ /Gl

Lrol
€g'lz
98'/1
6¥'10L

658LL'EL
000

€2'S6E'6
€806€'C

£€8'06€'C

€8'¥99'L
0092/
000
000

8G'/5S'E
85/55'¢

¢6 299

STy
JAR <)
€8 vEE
PALKA A

98'950'C

0g'288
00 €cv

000
000

ooolz

9e042

oc e
00 0.y

0 L2L

000
61645
Sz 1Sk
000

SL30-Inr

%l 'S¢ 00929 8e.G1

000

000
000

%l SC 00929 6€ /Gt

%S 0C 0008 A °13
%6 vC 00 /8 €91¢
%1 0T 00es 98 /1
%Y 'LC 000.g 6% 101

000
000

%08 oosyLL 26'299
000
000

000
Q00
000
000

000
000

%0 8€ 00'svL'L 26299

%Y vE 0o ozl STy
%E 8E 002vh LEPS
%E 8¢ 006.8 €8 VEE
%T 8t 00 809 JAZATA

000

000
000

000
000

000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000

196png J0 % 190png

yabpng Jo % jebpng
Xv1 3sn avoy

§1390 - Inf

SL1I43IN38 IIA0TdN3

$10Z 4990320 ybnosyy Ainp
lenioy “sA jJabpng sso 9 Jjoid
emo| ‘sjybrayH Ayssaalun jo K19

ooo

000

000
0oo

000

000
000
000
000

000
000

000

000

000

000
000
000
000

000
000

000

000
000
000
000

000

000
000

000
000

000

000

000
Q00

000

000
000
000
000

S0 - Inf

suonesadp pounoniokey 2301

aun) ped JeinBoy-sauees (€10

Jokey
pounon
auwi) Hed renbay-sauejeg

S)S09 ¥ sjyauag aakojdwz [ejo

d ford

I ol n
aledlpaly
1OUNOY-SH3dI
voId
§1S09) 9 sjyauag aako|dwg
suonessdQ pouncoschep
saoueg [ebaq
sasuadx3 uonaalz

UlWpY adueUl] B JaINSeaL] PUS|D |RI0L
juawdojeraq yess [ejol

sdiyssaquiay '@ sanq jejoy

JUBWISSISSY DO
san1y Jo anbea y|
sdiyssaquiapy pue sang
92JOWWOY JO JAqWEYD
sdiystaquiay ' sang
uawdojaaaq yeis

awy) ved JeinGay-sauereg |ejo]

ueUo)SIH ‘Usnsedl) 3D
2w ued Jenbay-saueles

s]1s09 @ s)yauag asko|duig |ejo )

uonesuadwo) juawiojdwaun
aJedIpajy
Sy3adi
vOold
§]1509 B s)yauag asakojdwg

S3JIAJSG |BMIBNUOY (BJOL

s3oIA18g ABojouysa]
BurAdog/Bunuuyg

salouaby Jay)Q 03 syuswied [ejo

saag AuejoN
19usby Jayio 03 Aed
s394 dn 198 Buneap
suonealgng feba
S884 pIepopiueg
saa4 Bununoaoy
S30JAJag |ENJORNUOD

senipowwoy |ejoy

sbunaaw Huide |
abe)sod pue saijddng asw0
ouyoa ] sanddngpuawdinbg Joury
aJeM)Jog/aIeMpleH
saRIpoWwwoD
UIWPY 92UBULY R J3INSESI| PHB|D

siseg ysen
S1/60/LL
WY 05-ZL



ol abed

%0 62

%Y 9l

%C C8

%S 28
%S Tl
%8 8¢
%00

%G 61
%00

%62,

%00

%00
%00

%0 S¥
%0 S¥

%00

%6 66
%6 EY

%6tV

%00
%L 8y

%l cc

%00
%00

%6'EC
%6 €C

%9LL

%9 6
%L Ll
%6 £C
%Ll

%6 Ly
%6'L¥

%9'C6

%00
%0 00}

198png jo %

0000V’

00008'8€

00008'ZL

00007
00009
00000'Z
00000'€
00000'¢
0000
00005'e

00'000'S

00005'e
00008'L

00'000'S
00000'S

00 000'9)4

00928
000vE'sE

00 O¥E'SE

0002s'e
000z8'Le

00'90S'S
000
00002
00 00S'v
00005

00908

0009
0069
00 Zoy
006/2

00'002'SL
00002Z'SsL

00'/6L'ELL
0005%'9
000
yebpng
Iv10l

00009

LT99E'9

Z9ll'y

000ge
8L G/
189.S
000

2T v8S
000
00085'C

000

000
000

000522
00'052'C

000

06'G2S
05'805'SH

05'805'SH

000
05805'SL

S6912't

000
000

006.0'L
0060t

S6 Ll

LS
19
2096
gsze

00's8Z'L
00'58Z'.L

86'GhR'POL
000
00000'v1
S1190- 101

%9'LL 00'908
%9'LL 00908
%96 0009
%L 0069
%6'€Z 0020%
%L bL 006/2
%Y €€ 00Sk'Z
198png Jo % 1eBpng
S1143IN38 I3A01dIWI

000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000

000
000
coo

000
000

000
000
000

000
000

G6 Ll

000
000

000
000

S6 Ll

11'S
oL
2096
ge'ze

000
000

Le'028

000
000

§L130 - Inr

$10Z 120300 ybnoays Ainp
lenjoy “sA jJabpng sso '9 Jjoid
emo| ‘spybiay Aisisalun jo A10

000

000

000

ooo
000
000
000
000
000
000

000

000
000

000
000

000

000
000

000

000
000

000

000
000

000
000

Q00

000
000
000
000

000
000

000

000
000

1aBpng SL190 - Inr
Xv13sn avoy

Jeluay abeieg
SODIAIIG [en)orluOD

sapipounuo |ejo )

soyddng [ejo)

sdiyssoquialy |euolssajoid
Burddiyg/ebeysod
solddng 2100
salddng Buneradp
saiddng aswoQ
s|eapy/sbunesjy ssaursng
uonunwWwWYy

sanddng

juawdinbg Jouly jej0L

uvoyun JasysQ Jenbay
wawdinb3g asyod Buneladp
wawdinb3 Jouly

yawdinb3 Joley |eyo1

yuawdinbg 1ep
awdinbg Jofey
oaseyoind Jep
saIpowwon
adljod
Auno? uosuyor-lewzey

a4 [ejoL

s319uaby JOYIQ/M S}ORNIUOY) [BlO |

Ano emoy jo Ano-ysnid yueipAy
1.deq and ajaero)
salouaby JaIQ/m s1oBIUOYD
EYE]

piens) Buissol) [ejo)

1810 - pieng) Buissoi)
sa)ddng

sauefeg [ejoL

pJens) Buissoin
sauejeg

$150D ¥ slysuag aakojdwz |eyo)

L dwo? juawio|d n
asesipay
Syadi
Vo
S)s09 P siyauag aakojdwy
pJens) Guissoin
suonoadsu| Guipjing |ejoL
uonosadsuj jeyuay / Buip|ing
suonosadsu| Buipjing
AL34VS oand
ANIWNNIA0D TVHINIO (eyot

asueinsu| Aypqer] pol
siskjeuy 411

siseg yseo
SiLieont
Wv 05:CL



11 obed

%/, 0E
%162
%6'8

%68

%1 SC
%Z YL
%00

%E'TT

%l 22

%9 1T
%S Ly

%t 6l

%l Ly
%00
%L 61

%L €e

%% 2T
%6'LL

%¥'se

%00
%c 2e
%0001
%C 19

%EPYC

%ES

%V LT
%Y SE
%V Ce
%L 91
%b'se

%S 0L

%0001
Y%y OLL
%L0
%00

%00

%00
%00
%00

196png Jo %,

00'896'20S
00 96€ ‘9P
00 000'9¢

00'000'9L

000002
00005'9
00'005'L

00 9€0'2E

00 00Z'01

00000'0+
00'00¢

00002'LL

00002
00005
00000'9k

00 9€9'%

009£9'
00000’}

00 /61'99C

00 ve

00 €22'8EC
000

00 000'8Z

oo'LLL'o8

00 LED'8L
000002
00'698'€
00'€52'9Z
00 LLY'EL
00'Hp5'9L

00259'CL

000
00005
00000'+
00208'L

00 056

00'00s
0005t
00'00€

19bpng
IvLiOoL

€9'0€9'v51
89'001'0E}
celzy'l

[«AVka "

2ce0s
00 526
000

WLEL'L

92 552

9z'09t'T
0066

/B'BEE'E

0o'ese
000
26°150'€

8L 9ES'L

88918
OE6LL

SS ¥SE'Y6

000
15'¥06'9.2
00'9ie
B6EEL'ZL

ze /8p'sl

00 856
[4¥ie]
TSLLE'S
88ELS'S
€0 L¥Z'e
1¥'558'S

L0 pEE'L

00621
00'2ss
0L
000

000

0oo
000
000

St 00 -Inr

%E ¥ 00'.16'08 L1'629'61

%E ¥ 00'LLL'08 Tz 8¥'6l

000

000

000
000
000

000

000

000
000

000

000
000
000

000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000

%E T 00 L1L'08 Tz 18v'slL

%E S 00'1€0'8L 00'856
%Y LC 000002 [4WA4)
%V GE 00'698'¢ TS'LLETL
%v 2€ 00'€52'92 88'ELGB
%.91 00'LIF'EL €0'l¥eC
%¥'GE 00'I¥S'9L 1p'SS8'S

000
000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000

jeBpng
SLI43N39 33A0dW3

19B6png 30 %

S1 3120 - Inf

196png J0 %,

$102 1890390 ybnoiy Aine

{enjoy "sA 196png sso7 9 Jj0id
emo| ‘sybraH Aisianiun jo Ao

1968png
XvL 3sn avoy

000

000

000

000
000
000

000

000

000
000

000

goo
000
000

000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000

§1320-Inf

Al34vS 21718N0d 1e10l
aojjod |ejoL
juswdojarag yeis [eloL

Buiues) JasyyQ reinbay |eyol

saljddng Guures)
Buwurel) JaswO
Buiuier) Awapeoy
Bulures) 122130 Jenboy
wawdojaaaq yeis

sanuunAueN/eday [BjoL

Jeday apdIyaA [ej0)L

Jredaypuiey 1en
Jredayauiepy ajd4oig
Jleday apoyap

suoneladQ ap2IYaA [e10L

saysem
BYo
1nd

suoleradp apdyap

asuadx3 suonesiumMuwods|a] [ejo0]
wWooBIpap/sad4 Jabeduozuan
uoddng (|

nesy 1oL
saniInAUIRN/Iedey

sabep ss049) 921j0d [R10L

S9AJ9SaY-Saur|es
sobep ssosg aoljog
w3y ||osheyd snoaue|@osIN
Aed Joy10 2 AepljoH
sabepp ssoug) aajjog
$1S09 '® S)yaudg ad1jod |ejoL

uonjesuadwio)) SIBUOM 3J1|0d

v.ins adllod

aledipajy ad1j0d

Sy3dl 3dtjod

asueInsu| Yyeay asljod

VOI4 3dljod
$1509) % S)ysuag aoljod
S301AIDG [ENYIRIUOY) (BI0),

He)S Sluaag [e1oads
eaisAyd-bunss | yohsd-a1ag Joid
BuAdonBunuuyg
Amqeruen-asuesnsu| adijod
s31ouaby Jay1Q o) sjuswAed |ejo]

s2a01A198 ABojouydsa)

Bunss) asuspiag

s9a4 Buinidjedimagyier Ajunod
sarpuaby JayjQ 01 sjuawiey

siseg yseo
StLieo/LL
Wv 0s:2¢4



Z| abeyq

%¥"056'ZZ

% 0S6'2C

%E'LE

%l ce
%062

%0'sC

%6 Ly
%00
%8¢l

%E €

%C 6T

%Y SE
%901

%00
%8'1E
%00
%00

%6 ¥
%9 6.
%E 8L

%Y 0
%00
%0001
%0001
%00
%00
%00
%00

%9vL

%l €e

%l €€

%E'EE
%C EE
%Z 82

196png Jo %

00'6LL
00622
00'60%'956
00 £98'L5Z
00295'S€

00295'sE

00298'0Z
00005'€L
0000Z'L

0000S'0L}

00000’}

000s.
00052

00°005'€
00'00S'8
00 000'€
00'000'6E

00 005’641
00000'9
00 00S'€9

00'005'¥
00005’
000

000
00'000'€C
00005 '€
00'000'%
00'000'9L

00°000'05

00 508'sY

00508'Sy

00’
00 L9L'sE
0000Z't

196png
Iviol

lz'esL'all
1z€82'8/L
25°255'9G€E
9929.'08
52006'8

S/ 006'8

Sllvi'e
000
00 est

80'802'95

00 ¢6¢

05992
0592

000
28504
000
000

9zZOoLL'ES
€6'8.L'Y
00ve9'Lt

0099€'L
000
00G8L'E
00€20'2
000
000
000
000

€€ L0E'LE

€8 ESH'SL

€8'€ESL'SL

vovie'T
£/ 000'CL
9/'8ee

SL1¢0-Inr

%0°001 000 98'0ZL'61 %0°0€2- 00°005'Z1- 9€'652'82
%0 001 000 98'0Z.'61 %00£Z- 000052} 9E'€5L'8T
%S T 00'LLE'E8 81'6vv'0Z %S'9) 0000524} SL00v'6L
000 %G 9L 00005211 52 007'6)
000 000
000 000
000 000
000 000
000 000
000 %G 9L 00005211 G2 007'6)
000 %C 62 00000t 00262
000 %¥'SE 00052 05'59¢
000 %90k 00052 0592
000 %00 00'00S'E 000
000 %8 LE 00005'8 28'60L'T
000 000
000 %00 00°000'6€ 000
000 %9'€Z 00 005'69 €6 20P'91
000 %96/ 00'000'9 €68y
000 %E8L 00005'€9 0029't 4
000 %Y 0€ 00'00S't 00 99€'L
000 %00 00°005'C 000
000 00s8L'E
000 00€L0'L
000 %0'0 0000062 000
000 %00 0000G'EV 000
000 %0'0 00000t 000
000 %0'0 0000094 000
000 000
000 000
000 000
000 000
000 000
000 000
100png 40 % 1e6png SLI90 - Inf 3obpng Jo % 1ebpng SL320-Inf
S1143N38 3IA0TdWI XYL 3ISN avoy

§10Z 120320 ybnoy Ainp
|en)oy 'sa }9b6png sso 9 jjoid
emoj ‘sjybioH Aussaalun jo Ao

swoou| 38N
swosu) Leuipi0 19N
asuadx3 |ejoL

SHMOM 2118Nd [e10L
uonejueg [e1oL

[enjoeuUOY) [BJOL

BuippAoaymyses)
Bununnoep jesay
Buijakoay malapuern
Jemsenuon
uonejiueg

slemapig 3 ‘sabpug ‘speoy fejoL

K)ajeg pue s|01U02 d1eL) (8oL

K1ouyoei3 b owges )

sanIpowwon-subig j9a1s8
KAajeg pue sjosuo) sues)
[emoenuon-buidoams j9ang
Anowyae|g Gunybi 1sang
Nuuad rejem uL0I§
|eNIDBHUCD-[EAOWIDY MOUS

S80IAIAS |ENJORHUOY jBYO L
Buuaquinusy quny/Buiduyg
sjuawaroidwsneday [ejo)

Jjwbwpuawssasse ubls oyjes)
adeaspue| J9a0g J9sung
sJieday 19208
sneday yjemapis
Juwaoeidal jaued - yse3 asoslBl
sjuawade|das jaued jeooT]
s303[01d yojed ajeydsy
sjuawaoe|dai jaued jeusyy

sjuawarosdwyssiieday

saa4 buuassuibuz

S89IAIag |ENJ2ENUOD
sH|emapts g ‘sebpug ‘speoy

SHIOM 211qNd JBUIO [B)OL
sapuaby Jayio-s1oenuo eyor

201A198 S1V3S
221AJ8g SN )|
13jua) fewuy 9|
sa1ouaby JonQ-s1oRHUOD
SHIOM 2lignd 19410
SMNOM O1and

siseqd yses
SLie0/LL
Wv 0521



12:49 AM

Cash Basis

Ordinary Income/Expense
Income
CHARGES FOR SERVICES
Police Reports

Total CHARGES FOR SERVICES

GENERAL PROPERTY TAXES
Benefits Levies
Commercial Prop Tax Rpimnt adj
Debt Service Levy
Insurance Levy
Library Services Levy
Regular Property Tax
Transit Levy

Total GENERAL PROPERTY TAXES

INTERGOVERMENTAL/SHARED REVENUE
Other State Grants/Reimburse.
Seatbelt Incent/Traffic Safety

Total Other State Grants/Reimburse.

State Shared Revenues
Commercial Property Tax Rplcmnt
Road Use/Street Construction

Total State Shared Revenues

Total INTERGOVERMENTAL/SHARED REVEN...

LICENSES & PERMITS
Beer/Wine/Liquor/Cig Permits
Building/Equipment Permits
Misc. Licenses/Permits

Parking Permits
Rental Permits

Total Misc. Licenses/Permits

Total LICENSES & PERMITS

MISCELLANEOUS REVENUES
Cable TV Franchise
Contributions
Fines

Parking Fines
Traffic Fines-Clk of Ct

Total Fines

Misc. Income
Other

Total Misc. Income
Refunds and Reimbursements
Total MISCELLANEOUS REVENUES

OTHER CITY TAXES
Utility Excise Tax

Total OTHER CITY TAXES

USE OF MONEY & PROPERTY
Interest on Cash Investments

Total USE OF MONEY & PROPERTY
Total Income

Gross Profit

City of University Heights, lowa

11/09/15 Profit & Loss Budget vs. Actual
July through October 2015

Jul - Oct 15

30.00
30.00

39,941.30
0.00
15,717.58
5,104.80
8,236.99
249,323.50
21,432.64

339,756.81

555.75
555.75

0.00
48,154.11

48,154.11

48,709.86

0.00
83,121.95

1,370.00
27,230.00

28,600.00

111,721.95

3.411.08
0.00

995.00
27,039.76

28,034.76

-50.00
-50.00

1,207.50

32,603.34

1,311.71
1,311.71

1,207.12
1,207.12
535,340.79

535,340.79

Budget

1,000.00
1,000.00

83,371.00
-4,339.00
32,400.00
14,252.00
17,143.00
514,277.00
44,605.00

701,709.00

4,339.00
105,000.00

109,339.00

109,339.00

390.00
10,000.00

1,000.00
15,500.00

16,500.00

26,890.00

14,000.00
250.00

7,000.00
90,000.00

97,000.00

1,000.00
1,000.00
1,000.00

113,250.00

5,000.00
5,000.00

957,188.00

957,188.00

% of Budget

3.0%
3.0%

47.9%

0.0%
48.5%
35.8%
48.0%
48.5%
48.0%

48.4%

0.0%
45.9%

44.0%

44.5%

0.0%
831.2%

137.0%
175.7%

173.3%

415.5%

24.4%
0.0%

14.2%
30.0%

28.9%

-5.0%
-5.0%
120.8%
28.8%

24.1%
24.1%

55.9%

55.9%



12:49 AM City of University Heights, lowa
11/09/15 Profit & Loss Budget vs. Actual
Cash Basis July through October 2015
Jul - Oct 15 Budget
Expense
COMMUNITY & ECONOMIC DEV.

Tree Trimming/Lawn Care 1,140.00 5,000.00
Total COMMUNITY & ECONOMIC DEV. 1,140.00 5,000.00
CULTURE & RECREATION

Community Support Projects 66.00 500.00

Library 9,291.50 44,677.00

Parks

Park Expenses 814.75 800.00
Park Update Contribution 5,000.00 5,000.00

Total Parks 5,814.75 5,800.00
Total CULTURE & RECREATION 15,172.25 50,977.00
DEBT SERVICE

Interest 0.00 2,400.00

Principal 0.00 30,000.00
Total DEBT SERVICE 0.00 32,400.00
GENERAL GOVERNMENT

City Hall & General Buildings

Commodities

Supplies 0.00 200.00
Total Commodities 0.00 200.00
Contractual

Rents & Leases 5,496.92 16,491.00
Total Contractual 5,496.92 16,491.00
Employee Benefits & Costs

FICA 0.00 31.00

IPERS 0.00 45.00

Medicare 0.00 7.00
Total Employee Benefits & Costs 0.00 83.00
Repair/Maint/Utilities

Maintenance 0.00 1,000.00

Telecommunications 509.26 2,000.00

Utilities 424 .84 1,600.00
Total Repair/Maint/Utilities 934.10 4,600.00
Salaries-Regular Part Time

Facilities Assistant 192.00 500.00
Total Salaries-Regular Part Time 192.00 500.00

Total City Hall & General Buildings 6,623.02 21,874.00
Clerk/Treasurer & Finance Admin

Commodities

Hardware/Software 0.00 1,000.00

Minor Equipment/Supplies/Techno 161.25 700.00

Office Supplies and Postage 575.79 1,000.00

Taping meetings 0.00 250.00
Total Commodities 727.04 2,950.00
Contractual Services

Accounting Fees 470.00 4,400.00

Bank/CCard Fees 21.20 50.00

Legal Publications 270.36 3,000.00

Meeting Set Up Fees 210.00 125.00

Payments to Other Agencies

Notary Fees 0.00 60.00
Total Payments to Other Agencies 0.00 60.00

% of Budget

22.8%
22.8%

13.2%
20.8%

101.8%
100.0%
100.3%

29.8%

0.0%
0.0%

0.0%

0.0%
0.0%

33.3%
33.3%

0.0%
0.0%
0.0%

0.0%

0.0%
25.5%
26.6%

20.3%

38.4%
38.4%

30.3%

0.0%
21.6%
57.6%

0.0%

24.6%

10.7%
42.4%
9.0%
168.0%

0.0%
0.0%

Page 2



12:49 AM City of University Heights, lowa

11109115 Profit & Loss Budget vs. Actual
Cash Basis July through October 2015
Jul - Oct 15 Budget
Printing/Copying 433.00 500.00
Technology Services 652.30 750.00
Total Contractual Services 2,056.86 8,885.00
Employee Benefits & Costs
FICA 232.47 608.00
IPERS 334.83 875.00
Medicare 54.37 142.00
Unemployment Compensation 41.25 120.00
Total Employee Benefits & Costs 662.92 1,745.00
Salaries-Regular Part Time
Clerk, Treasuer, Historian 3,557.58 9,800.00
Total Salaries-Regular Part Time 3,657.58 9,800.00
Staff Development
Dues & Memberships
Chamber of Commerce 0.00 500.00
Dues and Memberships 0.00 500.00
IA League of Cities 726.00 635.00
JCOG Assessment 1,664.83 1,665.00
Total Dues & Memberships 2,390.83 3,300.00
Total Staff Development 2,390.83 3,300.00
Total Clerk/Treasurer & Finance Admin 9,395.23 26,680.00
Election Expenses 0.00 1,600.00
Legal Services 73,178.59 50,000.00
Mayor/Council Operations
Employee Benefits & Costs
FICA 101.49 370.00
IPERS-Council 17.86 89.00
Medicare 21.63 87.00
Unemployment Compensation 16.41 80.00
Total Employee Benefits & Costs 157.39 626.00
Salaries-Regular Part Time
Council 1,000.00 4,000.00
Mayor 491.75 1,967.00
Total Salaries-Regular Part Time 1,491.75 5,967.00
Total Mayor/Council Operations 1,649.14 6,593.00
TIF Analysis 14,000.00
Tort Liability Insurance 0.00 6,450.00
Total GENERAL GOVERNMENT 104,845.98 113,197.00
PUBLIC SAFETY
Building Inspections
Building / Rental Inspection 7.285.00 15,200.00
Total Building Inspections 7,285.00 15,200.00
Crossing Guard
Employee Benefits & Costs
FICA 32.55 279.00
IPERS 96.02 402.00
Medicare 7.61 65.00
Unemployment Compensation 5.77 60.00
Total Employee Benefits & Costs 141.95 806.00
Salaries
Crossing Guard 1,075.00 4,500.00
Total Salaries 1,075.00 4,500.00

% of Budget

86.6%
87.0%

23.1%

38.2%
38.3%
38.3%
34.4%

38.0%

36.3%
36.3%

0.0%
0.0%
114.3%
100.0%

72.4%
72.4%

35.2%

0.0%
146.4%

27.4%
20.1%
24.9%
20.5%

251%

25.0%
25.0%

25.0%

25.0%

0.0%
92.6%

47.9%
47.9%

1.7%
23.9%
11.7%

9.6%

17.6%

23.9%
23.9%

Page 3



12:49 AM City of University Heights, lowa
11109115 Profit & Loss Budget vs. Actual
Cash Basis July through October 2015
Jul - Oct 15 Budget
Supplies 0.00 200.00
Crossing Guard - Other 0.00 0.00
Total Crossing Guard 1,216.95 5,506.00
Fire
Contracts w/Other Agencies
Coralville Fire Dep't 15,508.50 31,820.00
Hydrant Flush-City of lowa City 0.00 3,520.00
Total Contracts w/Other Agencies 15,508.50 35,340.00
Total Fire 15,508.50 35,340.00
Hazmat-Johnson County 525.50 526.00
Police
Commodities
Car Purchase 0.00 16,000.00
Major Equipment
Car Equipment 2,250.00 5,000.00
Total Major Equipment 2,250.00 5,000.00
Minor Equipment
Operating Police Equipment 0.00 1,500.00
Regular Officer Uniform 0.00 3,500.00
Total Minor Equipment 0.00 5,000.00
Supplies
Ammunition 2,550.00 3,500.00
Business Meetings/Meals 0.00 300.00
Office Supplies 584,22 3,000.00
Operating Supplies 0.00 3,000.00
Other Supplies 576.87 2,000.00
Postage/Shipping 75.18 600.00
Professional Memberships 330.00 400.00
Total Supplies 4,116.27 12,800.00
Total Commodities 6,366.27 38,800.00
Contractual Services
Garage Rental 600.00 2,400.00
Payments to Other Agencies
County Jail/Service/Filing Fees 0.00 300.00
Evidence testing 0.00 150.00
Technology Services 0.00 500.00
Total Payments to Other Agencies 0.00 950.00
Police Insurance-Car/Liability 0.00 7,802.00
Printing/Copying 7.01 1,000.00
Prof Serv-Psych Testing-Physica 552.00 500.00
Special Events Staff 175.00
Total Contractual Services 1,334.01 12,652.00
Police Benefits & Costs
Police FICA 5,855.47 16,541.00
Police Health Insurance 2,241.03 13,417.00
Police IPERS 8,513.88 26,253.00
Police Medicare 1,371.52 3,869.00
Police SUTA 547.32 2,000.00
Police Workers Compensation 958.00 18,031.00
Total Police Benefits & Costs 19,487.22 80,111.00
Police Gross Wages
Holiday & Other Pay 17,133.98 28,000.00
Miscellaneous Payroll Item 316.00
Police Gross Wages 76,904.57 238,773.00
Salaries-Reserves 0.00 24.00
Total Police Gross Wages 94,354.55 266,797.00

% of Budget

0.0%
0.0%

22.1%

48.7%
0.0%

43.9%

43.9%
99.9%

0.0%

45.0%
45.0%

0.0%
0.0%

0.0%

72.9%

0.0%
19.5%

0.0%
28.8%
12.5%
82.5%

32.2%

16.4%

25.0%

0.0%
0.0%
0.0%

0.0%

0.0%
0.7%
110.4%

10.5%

35.4%
16.7%
32.4%
35.4%
27.4%

5.3%

24.3%

61.2%

32.2%
0.0%

35.4%

Page 4



12:49 AM

11/09/15
Cash Basis

Repair/Maint/Utilities
Telecommunications Expense
IT Support
Verizon/Pager Fees/Mediacom

Total Telecommunications Expense

Vehicle Operations
Fuel
Other
Washes

Total Vehicle Operations

Vehicle Repair
Bicycle Maint/Repair
Car Maint/Repair

Total Vehicle Repair

Total Repair/Maint/Utilities

Staff Development
Regular Officer Training
Academy Training
Officer Training
Training Supplies

Total Regular Officer Training
Total Staff Development
Total Police

Total PUBLIC SAFETY

PUBLIC WORKS
Other Public Works
Contracts-Other Agencies
IC Animal Center
IC Bus Service
SEATS Service

Total Contracts-Other Agencies

Total Other Public Works

Roads, Bridges, & Sidewalks
Contractual Services
Engineering Fees
Repairs/Improvements
Arterial panel replacements
Asphale patch projects
Local panel replacements
Melrose East - panel replacemnt
Sidewalk Repairs
Street Repairs
Sunset Street landscape
Traffic sign assessment/mgmt

Total Repairs/Improvements
Striping/Curb Renumbering
Total Contractual Services

Snow Removal-Contractual
Storm water permit

Street Lighting Electricity
Street Sweeping-Contractual

City of University Heights, lowa

Profit & Loss Budget vs. Actual
July through October 2015

Jul - Oct 15

719.30
816.88

1,536.18

3,0561.97
0.00
288.00

3,339.97

95.00
2,160.26

2,255.26

7,131.41

0.00
925.00
502.22

1,427.22
1,427.22
130,100.68

154,636.63

338.76
12,000.43
2,814.64

15,153.83

15,153.83

37,307.33

0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
7,073.00
3,185.00
0.00
1,366.00

11,624.00
4,778.93
53,710.26

0.00
0.00
2,705.82
0.00

Budget

1,000.00
3,636.00

4,636.00

16,000.00
500.00
700.00

17,200.00

200.00
10,000.00

10,200.00

32,036.00

7,500.00
6,500.00
2,000.00

16,000.00
16,000.00
446,396.00

502,968.00

1,200.00
36,161.00
8,444.00

45,805.00

45,805.00

50,000.00

16,000.00

4,000.00
13,500.00
23,000.00

2,500.00
4,500.00

63,500.00
6,000.00
119,500.00

35,000.00
3,000.00
8,500.00
3,500.00

% of Budget

71.9%
22.5%

33.1%

19.1%
0.0%
41.1%

19.4%

47.5%
21.6%

22.1%

22.3%

0.0%
14.2%
25.1%

8.9%
8.9%
29.1%

30.7%

28.2%
33.2%
33.3%

33.1%

33.1%

74.6%

0.0%
0.0%
0.0%
0.0%

0.0%
30.4%

18.3%
79.6%
44 9%

0.0%
0.0%
31.8%
0.0%

Page 5



City of University Heights, lowa

12:49 AM
11109115 Profit & Loss Budget vs. Actual
Cash Basis July through October 2015
Jul - Oct 15 Budget
Traffic Controls and Safety
Street Signs-Commodities 26.50 250.00
Traffic Light Electricity 265.50 750.00
Total Traffic Controls and Safety 292.00 1,000.00
Total Roads, Bridges, & Sidewalks 56,708.08 170,500.00
Sanitation
Contractual
Grandview Recycling 153.00 1,200.00
Leaf Vacuuming 0.00 13,500.00
Trash/Recycling 8,747.75 20,862.00
Total Contractual 8,900.75 35,562.00
Total Sanitation 8,900.75 35,562.00
Total PUBLIC WORKS 80,762.66 251,867.00
Total Expense 356,557.52 956,409.00
Net Ordinary Income 178,783.27 779.00
Net Income 178,783.27 779.00

% of Budget

10.6%
35.4%

29.2%

33.3%

12.8%
0.0%
41.9%

25.0%
25.0%
32.1%
37.3%
22,950.4%

22,950.4%

Page 6



11/09/15

Date

Oct 14 - Nov 10, 15
10/16/2015
10/15/2015
10/15/2015
10/15/2015
10/156/2015
10/15/2015
10/156/2015
10/15/2015
10/15/2015
10/15/2015
10/21/2015
10/21/2015
10/21/2015
10/23/2015
10/26/2015
10/30/2015
10/30/2015
10/30/2015
10/30/2015
10/30/2015
10/30/2015
10/30/2015
10/30/2015
10/30/2015
10/30/2015
10/30/2015
10/30/2015
10/31/2015
10/31/2015
10/31/2015
11/01/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/20156
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015
11/10/2015

Oct 14 - Nov 10, 15

City of University Heights, lowa

Warrants for Council Approval
October 14 through November 10, 2015

Name

Jones, Christian R
Lyon, Kristofer S
Plate, Harold,
Schmitz, Jakub J
Sherman, Nicholas M
Simcox, Levio M
Stenda, Jeremy P
Stanley, Kenneth L
Stanley, Kenneth L
Internal Revenue Service
MidAmerican Energy
MidAmerican Energy
MidAmerican Energy
MidAmerican Energy
MidAmerican Energy
Anderson, Christine M.
Jones, Christian R
Kimura, Lori D.

Lyon, Kristofer S
Schmitz, Jakub J
Sherman, Nicholas M
Simcox, Levio M
Stanley, Kenneth L
Stenda, Jeremy P
Plate, Harold,

Stanley, Kenneth L
Stanley, Kenneth L
Internal Revenue Service

IOWA PUBLIC EMPLOYEES ...
IOWA PUBLIC EMPLOYEES ...

Verizon Wireless
CenturyLink

Breese Plumbing & Heating
Stan Laverman

SEATS

Internet Navigator

City of lowa City

lowa City Tire and Service
Johnson County Refuse, Inc.
L-Tron

Mediacom

Racom Corporation
Westport Touchless Autowash
NAPA Auto Parts

Louise From

Terry Goerdt

Dorsey & Whitney LLP
Nick Messersmith

Old Republic Surety Group
Leff Law Firm, L.L.P.

Fort, Matthew A

VISA

VISA

Memo

42-1109342

pedestrian lights at 113 Golfview
1301 Melrose stop light

1011 Melrose stop light

street lights

City Hall gas/electricity

VOID:

42-1109342

monthly wireless service
monthly telephone service
winterize park water fountain
rental inspector salary
Seats Payment

monthly fee for city website/email service
bus & animal services, park water, fuel

mount tire for spare

October recycling

2 new scanners

online service 11/3/15-12/2/15
repair computer mount in vehicle
September vehicle washes

balance owed for jumper cable pack

reimburse for 11/10 meeting fee
October inspection services

legal services thru 9/30/15 for 2015 Urban Ren..,
videography services at October meeting

public official schedule bond
legal services 10/3/15-11/6/15
final paycheck 80 hours

water cooler rental
postage/office supplies

Amount

-440.10
-1,446.80
-219.60
-1,262.81
-1,794.44
-1,163.34
-278.11
-1,575.50
-211.46
-3,123.46
-30.29
-32.01
-28.83
-645.87
-78.23
-315.35
-358.61
-323.04
-1,394.72
-1,386.19
-1,969.48
-1,166.41
-1,675.50
-366.74
-219.60
0.00
-281.58
-3,508.08
-3,6564.65
-207.64
-120.41
-341.45
-148.40
-500.00
-703.66
-24.95
-3,362.68
-15.00
-1,738.50
-678.00
-109.95
-47.50
-24.00
-5.15
-30.00
-1,260.00
19,435.97
-50.00
-133.00
-5,692.50
-1,384.62
-27.98
-523.88

Page 1



OCTOBER POLICE REPORT

Police received a possible vehicle description of a suspect who has been breaking in cars. Time
of day/night was also possibly identified. All officers have been advised and shifts have been
adjusted to attempt capture.

Officer Chris Jones graduated from the Waterloo Academy and is fully state certified.

Officers Lyon, Schmitz and Simcox are all doing well and will graduate December 11, 2015

October was relatively quiet/slow month as only the Chief and Officer Sherman were working.

Game days in October with without incident.

K. Stanley, Chief



Streets & Sidewalks November 15 report

1)

2)

3)

4)
5)

update on Community Visioning program - We have been awarded the grant!
We had 16 community members sign up for the Visioning steering
committee. The training session will be in Ames on November 20, probably
4-6 of us will attend. After that meetings will be held approx. monthly
through all of 2016. Expect monthly updates from someone on the steering
committee.

Street light upgrade to LED program - MidAmerican Energy is upgrading all
of the streetlights in their service area to LED lights from the current high-
pressure sodium lights. The LED bulbs use less electricity and are cheaper to
run. They will replace all of our lights over the next 10 years at no charge, or
we can upgrade them now for a fee of $100 per bulb. We have 59 bulbs in
University Heights, so the cost to the city would be roughly $6000.
MidAmerican energy estimates that cities will recoup the upgrade cost in
around 3 years, as a result of lower electric bills. We are not opting for the
upgrade at this time since we did not include the cost in the current years
budget, but I ask the next council to consider whether or not they want to go
ahead with the upgrade, as doing so will very likely save the city money in
the long run.

Update on street sign repositioning plan - Kent Ralston at the MPO
conducted a street sign audit on our main streets to identify redundant and
unnecessary signs that can be safely removed. Extra signs are ugly, costly to
maintain, and can be distracting to drivers. Their report is attached, they
identified 15 signs to be removed on Melrose, Sunset, Koser and George
streets. If council supports this action [ would like MPO]JC to continue their
analysis of the remaining streets in town. They would be able to complete
this project in spring 2016.

Last leaf vacuuming is November 19th,
Tree pruning class at the city office put on by Trees Forever December 5th.



ORDINANCE No. 190

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE 52 REGULATING THE PLANTING,
CARE, AND MAINTENANCE OF TREES AND SHRUBBERY UPON AND
ADJOINING PUBIIC PROPERTY IN THE TOWN OF UNIVERSITY
HEIGHTS, JOHNSON COUNTY, I0OWA.

BE IT ENACTED by the Council of the City of University
Heights, lowa:

University Heights Ordinance No. 52 1is amended as
follows (with additions indicated by underline and deletions

indicated by strike—through):

Section 1. Definitions. For the purpose of this ordinance,
certain terms and words used herein shall be interpreted or
defined as follows:

1. Fhe—word—""publie—Public property"” means any
property owned by the Fewn-City of University
Heights, and shall specifically include that
portion of street rights-of-way located between
the private property lines and streets or

sidewalk(s).

2. "Trees and shrubs'™ shall mean all wood
vegetation.

3. "Parking" shall mean that part of the street

right-of- way lying between the private lot line
and the curb line of the improved streets, and on
unimproved streets i1t shall mean that portion of
the public right-of-way lying between the lot
lines and that portion of the street

usually etr dbye vehicular traffic.

4. “City Tree Board” shall mean the Board created
and established pursuant to Section 6 of this
Ordinance.

Section 2. No person, Ffirm or corporation shall plant
or remove any tree or shrub on publiePublic property
Property without specific approval of the FewnCouncil-of
the—Foewn—-City Tree Board of University Heights, lowa.

Section 3. TFhat—+tThe owners of private property shall
be responsible for the proper care and maintenance of all
trees and shrubs located in the parking adjoining said



private property.

Section 4. ThataAll trees and shrubs on public or
private property bordering on any street shall be trimmed
to a sufficient height to allow free passage of pedestrians
and vehicular traffic and so that they will not obstruct or
shade street lights, the vision of traffic signs, or the
view of any street intersection. The minimum clearance of
any overhanging portion of such trees or shrubs shall be
eight (8) feet over sidewalks and thirteen (13) feet over
all streets.

Section 5. That—+#If the owner of any property fails to
maintain trees and shrubs in compliance with the provisions
of this ordinance, the Fewn-City Council or the City Tree
Board shall cause written notice to be served upon the
property owner, requiring compliance with this ordinance
within Fhirtey-thirty (30) days after receipt of said
notice. The notice required herein shall be served by
mailing a copy of said notice to the property address or
address used by the Johnson County Treasurer to mail
property tax statementslastknown—-address—of -the property

— T 1f U lork i ¢
owner—py-Certified °?" ’ L - ,
R e
Spome s b copen o oo oo ol e et IF this
ercinance—Ordinance is not complied with by said property
owner within the date specified in the written notice the
Fown—City Council shall cause such work to be done as is
necessary to bring sakd-the trees on the property oewner
within compliance with the provisions of this erdinance
Ordinance and the exact cost of such work shall be
certified by the FownClerkCity Council to the Johnson
County Auditor efJehnsen—Countytewa—to be collected with

and 1In the same manner as general property taxes.

Section 6. City Tree Board

1. Creation and Establishment of a City Tree Board.
A City Tree Board i1s created and established.
The Board shall consist of five (5) residents of
the City who shall be appointed by the mayor.

2. Term of Office. The term of each Board member
shall be five (5) years; provided, however, that
the term of one member appointed to the first
board shall be for only one (1) year, the term of




one member of the first board shall be for two
(2) years, the term of one of the members
appointed to the first board shall be for three
(3) years, and the term of one of the members
appointed to the first board shall be for four
(4) years. In the event that a vacancy shall
occur during the term of any member, the Mayor
shall appoint a successor for the unexpired
portion of that member’s term.

Compensation. The Board members shall serve
without compensation.

Duties and Responsibilities.

a. The Board shall develop a written plan for
the care, preservation, pruning, planting,
replanting, removal or disposition of trees
and shrubs on Public Property, including
Parking areas. This written plan shall
constitute the Comprehensive City Tree Plan
for the City of University Heights.

b. The Board shall update the Comprehensive
City Tree Plan annually.

C. The Board shall study and advise the City
Council with respect to selection,
maintenance, and care of trees and shrubs
and with respect to such other matters as
the City Council may request from time to
time.

d. The Board, when requested by the City
Council, shall consider, investigate, make
findings, report, and make recommendations
upon any special matter of question coming
within the scope of i1ts work.

e. The Board shall meet from time to time to
consider and approve or reject requests from

the owners of private property to plant or
remove trees or shrubs from Public Property,

including Parking areas, adjoining the
respective private property.




5. Operation. The Board shall choose its own
chairperson, make its own rules and regulations,
and keep minutes of its proceedings. A majority
of the members shall constitute a quorum for the
transaction of Board business.

6. Appeal . Any person aggrieved by a decision of the
Board may appeal to the City Council by
submitting a written appeal request that sets
forth the basis for the appeal. The City Council
may affirm, reverse, or modify any decision of
the Board.

Section 6. Violation of this ordinance shall
constitute a misdemeanor and shall be punishable by a fine
not to exceed $100.00.

Section 7. That this ordinance shall be i1n full force
and effect from and after i1ts passage and posting as
provided by law.

Passed and approved by the Council of the City of
University Heights, lowa, on the __ day of , 2015.

Louise From, Mayor

Attest:

Christine M. Anderson, City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO. 191
AN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING REQUIRMENTS AND PROCEDURES FOR DEVELOPMENT

ENTITIES MANDATING THAT THEY DEDICATE ADEQUATE LAND FOR COMMUNITY
PARKLAND AND, OR PAY A FEE IN LIEU OF SUCH DEDICATION

BE IT ENACTED by the Council of the City of University Heights,
lowa:

SECTION 1. PURPOSE.

The purpose of this ordinance iIs to establish requirements and
procedures for development entities to ensure that in, or within
reasonable proximity to new developments, there will be
sufficient park and recreational areas (“Parkland”) to meet the
demand and needs of future and current residents of the City of
University Heights. In determining the size of the parcels that
should be dedicated in this section, the City Council has taken
into consideration the current and future needs of the City and
iIts residents.

SECTION 2. APPLICABILITY.

Before the issuance of any building permit for (1) subdivision or
(2) rezoning of land that would increase population or dwelling-
unit density, Parkland must be dedicated to the City or a Park
Development Fee must be paid to the City. Council approval for
any zoning change is required by City Ordinance and lowa law, and
this Ordinance shall not be construed as authorizing or
commenting upon any zoning change proposal.

Acceptance of public improvements shall not be issued for any (1)
subdivision or (2) rezoning of land that would iIncrease density
unless Parkland i1s dedicated for such subdivision or rezoning or
unless cash shall have been paid in lieu of such dedication (or a
combination thereof) for park, recreational or open space
purposed in accordance with the standards and criteria in this
Ordinance.

SECTION 3. DEDICATION AND CHARACTER OF LAND.

A. AMOUNT OF LAND TO BE DEDICATED.

The minimum amount of Parkland to be dedicated
pursuant to this Ordinance shall be one-half (1/2)
of an acre for every one hundred (100) dwelling
units (DUs). The required amount of Parkland shall



SECTION 4.

be proportionate to the one-half acre for every
100 DUs. For example, a 50 DUs would require one-
quarter (1/4) of an acre; 150 DUs would require
three-quarters (3/4) of an acre; and so on.

CHARACTER OF LAND TO BE DEDICATED

1. No Land shall be dedicated that is deemed
unusable for Parkland. The City Council shall
decide whether particular land i1s suitable. This
determination may include consideration of the
following: land lying in floodplains, lakes, ponds,
or other bodies of water. The topography of the
land to be dedicated should be similar to
surrounding neighborhoods and be usable for either
active of passive parks.

Active Parkland - Land to be used for sporting
fields and similar uses.

Passive Parkland - Land to be used for playgrounds,
nature trails, bike trails, and nature areas that
may have a greater portion of slopes and wooded
areas.

2. No Bland dedicated i1in compliance with this
Ordinance shall have dimensions smaller than 150
feet iIn width and 200 feet 1in depth. 1In any
development that 1includes wooded areas, tree
preservation, or other natural features that are
desirable to maintain, the City Council may decide
to allow these lands to deviate from the strict
adherence to the above dimensions i1f determined
that by doing so the protection and preservation of
such areas will be promoted.

PLATTING REQUIREMNETS FOR DEDICATED PARKLAND.

Any land dedicated for Parkland shall be shown on the face of a
development plan submitted for approval by Zoning Commission and
City Council. Simultaneously with the filing of the development
plan, the land proposed to be dedicated shall be submitted by the
developer or owner to the Zoning Commission and the City Council.
Upon approval, the plat shall be filed of record with the county.

SECTION 5.

PAYMENT OF CASH IN LIEU OF DEDICATION.

2



Unless otherwise recommended by the Zoning Commission, in any
cases iIn which the land requirement to be dedicated by this
section would be less then 150 feet by 200 feet, and in all cases
in which the City Council determines, in i1ts sole discretion,
that the park and recreational needs of a proposed development
would be better severed in a different location or the expansions
or improvements to other public city lands, the developer shall
pay to the City a sum of money that is equal to the fair market
value of the Parkland otherwise required for dedication. This
assessment shall be determined and based on the fair market value
of the land otherwise required to be dedicated as Parkland under
this Ordinance at the time of the proposed plat. The amount of
the payment will be determined by the City Council with the
assistance of a certified real property appraiser. No
subdivision, rezoning, or other development application shall be
approved unless and until such amount is paid to the City.

SECTION 6. SAVINGS CLAUSE

In the event any word, phrase, sentence, paragraph or section
contained 1in this ordinance shall be held to be 1invalid,
unlawful, or unconstitutional for any reason, then it iIs hereby
declared that the remaining such portions and provisions of this
ordinance would have been enacted and remain in full force and
effect.

SECTION 7. EFFECTIVE DATE.

This ordinance shall become effective upon 1its passage and
publication as provided by law.

SECTION 8. REPEALER.

All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with the
provisions of this ordinance are hereby repealed.

Adopted by the University Heights City Council this day of
, 2015, and approved this day of , 2015.

Louise From, Mayor



ATTEST: (seal)

Christine M. Anderson, City Clerk

STATE OF I0OWA )
SS:
COUNTY OF JOHNSON )
On this day of , 2015, before me, a notary

public in and for the state of lowa, personally appeared Loulise From
and Christine M. Anderson, to me personally known, and who, being by
me duly sworn, did say that they are the Mayor and City Clerk of the
City of University Heights, lowa; that the seal affixed to this
instrument is the corporate seal of the city; and that said instrument
was signed and sealed on behalf of the city, and that Louise From and
Christine M. Anderson acknowledged the execution of said instrument to
be their voluntary act and deed and the voluntary act and deed of the
city, by it and by them voluntarily executed.

Notary Public in and for the
State of lowa

STATE OF I0OWA )
SS:
COUNTY OF JOHNSON )

I, Christine M. Anderson, being Tfirst duly sworn, certify that
the above ordinance was published in the lowa City Press-Citizen the
day of , 2015.

Jerry Musser

Signed and sworn to before me on the day of ,
2015, by Christine M. Anderson, Clerk of the city of University
Heights.

Notary Public in and for the
State of lowa

UH — proposed ordinance No. 191 re open spaces



JC

Metropolitan Planning Organization of Johnson County

Date: November 5, 2015
To: Virginia Miller
From: Emily Bothell; Assistant Transportation Planner

Rachel Serslev; Transportation Planning Intern

Re: University Heights Sign Recommendations

The City of University Heights requested MPOJC to provide guidance on the removal and / or
repositioning of signs to reduce sign clutter on Melrose Avenue, Sunset Street, George Street,
and Koser Avenue. The existing sign inventory completed by the MPO in 2011 was updated and
utilized in field observations for the analysis.

Recommendation

After examining the existing signage on the four identified streets we recommend removing,
replacing, or repositioning fifteen (15) signs and adding three (3) new signs. A detailed analysis
and map outlining the recommendations is provided on the following pages. Please note, some
of these actions may require an ordinance change (identified in the analysis).

If you have any questions or comments, please contact Emily Bothell, Assistant Transportation
Planner at Emily-Bothell@iowa-city.org or 319-356-5250.



mailto:Emily-Bothell@iowa-city.org

Table 1: Recommended Sign Alterations

Mel R
'erose/ 500 No Parking Any Time emove .
Birkdale (shares post with 499)
Melrose /
i 499 Stop None
Birkdale Nearby signs sufficiently explain the
Remove arking restrictions.
Melrose 102 |No Parking 2AM - 6 PM/ 2 hour Parking/ 8AM - 5PM _ parking
(shares post with 477)
. Remove
Melrose 477 No Parking/Ul Football/Home Game Days/Tow Away Zone .
(shares post with 102)
Melrose 108 No Parking Any Time Remove
Change the No Parking Between
Sunset 68 No Parking Between Signs Remove/Replace Signs prohibition to a No Parking
prohibition. Install a No Parking Any
Time sign (on new post) half-way
Sunset 64 No Parking Between Signs Remove/Replace between the existing signs.
(Ordinance Change)
The sign is repetitive as nearby signs
George 453 No Parking Any Time Remove clearly detail the parking
restrictions.
. . Relocate the No Parking Any Time
George 452 No Parking Any Time Relocate .
sign to post 454.
George 454 Stop Ahead None
Relocate the No Parking Any Time
George 445 No Parking Any Time Relocate . g ANy
sign to post 443.
George 443 Stop Ahead None
It is reasonable for the school zone
Koser 308 School Zone Remove or replace with o
. to have ended at this distance from
Koser 309 |[Speed Limit20 End School Zone sign the school.
Koser 298 No Parking/Ul Football/Home Game Days/Tow Away Zone The sign is repetitive as nearby signs
Remove clearly detail the parking
Koser 297 No Parking Any Time

restrictions.




University Heights

Locations of Recommended
Sign Alterations

® Removal of existing sign

Installation of new sign or relocation
of existing sign

Date Prepared: November 5, 2015
Data sources: Johnson County, MPOJC

R




II1TFE
HITEC

TO:
FROM:
DATE:
RE:

SHIVEFI

ATTERY

GINEERING

MEMORANDUM

University Heights, Mayor, Council, and Staff
Josiah Bilskemper, P.E.

November 6, 2015

City Engineer’s Report

(1) 2015 Sidewalk Repair Project (SE Quadrant)

a.

The council adopted Resolution 15-06 (Resolution Concerning Administrative Fee for
Sidewalk Repair Project) at the February 10, 2015 meeting. That resolution set the
administrative expense at an amount not to exceed $100 per property for owners who
elected to join the city repair project (based on an estimate of administrative expenses
of approximately $200 per property address). The resolution reserves an option for the
council to assess a lower administrative expense if the administrative expenses proved
to be less than anticipated.

Expenses billed to the city for administration of the 2015 Sidewalk Repair Project
averaged $211 per property address.

Resolution 15-06 also indicated that the administrative fee may be higher for those who
did not respond to the repair notification and did not repair their own sidewalks by the
required date (expense to be determined after actual expenses are known). There
were 8 properties that did not elect to join the city repair project, and also did not
complete any repairs by the July 20, 2015 deadline. Actual additional expenses
incurred to document, mark and incorporate these properties into the city contract
amounted to $100 per property address.

A resolution will be prepared for Council consideration setting the administrative
expense for the 2015 Sidewalk Repair Project at $100 per property for those that
elected to join the city repair project, and at $200 per property for owners that did not
elect to join the city repair project and did not complete the required work by the July
20, 2015 deadline.

The next step for this portion of the sidewalk repair program is to send invoices to
residents to collect reimbursement of repair costs paid to the contractor.

(2) 2015 Sidewalk Inspections (SW Quadrant)

Project #115102-0

Shive-Hattery, Inc. | 2834 Northgate Drive | lowa City, IA 52245 | 319.354.3040 | fax 319.3546921 | shive-hattery.com

a.

Letters with sidewalk reports have been mailed to each SW property owner with needed
sidewalk repairs. A few people have responded requesting to be included in the city
sidewalk repair project next year.

One location marked in the SW section of town was a panel of the 8-foot sidewalk at
the SW corner of the Melrose and Sunset intersection (city responsibility). A large
panel at the corner dropped near where the water main and hydrant were extended,



Page 2 of 5

likely due to some settling of soil over the new pipe. Since the panel was new and in
good shape, and because this is a higher traffic pedestrian area, we had the panel
raised (leveled) with a high density polyurethane injection (similar to mud jacking) below
the slab. The cost of the work ($750) is comparable to the cost of removal and
replacement for a panel of this size and thickness, as well as the sidewalk closures and
pedestrian detour signage required at this location. The work was completed in about
an hour, and the panels are now level. We will forward the final invoice once received.

c. In an effort to attract more contractors to bid on the 2016 repair contract, the notification
and sign-up dates are being moved ahead this year. The notification process will occur
earlier (October instead of January), and the sign-up for the city administered repair
project will occur earlier (February 1 instead of April 15). This will allow bids to be
obtained earlier (April instead of June), therefore providing more time for the work to be
completed, and hopefully generating more contractor interest. (October Mtg.)

(3) 2015 Pavement Markings

a. All pavement markings have been completed. Pay Application #2 for this work is
included in the warrants ($439.07). We recommend approval of the pay application.

b. L.L. Pelling has substantially completed the repainting of pavement markings in town.
There are some white lines that still need to be completed on Melrose in front of the city
office, and the stop bar at the Grand and Golfview intersection. (October Mtg.)

(4) MidAmerican Energy Street Lights — LED Conversion

a. MidAmerican is transitioning their company-owned streetlights throughout the state of
lowa from traditional streetlights to energy-efficient LED streetlights beginning in 2015.
They are providing cities the option of converting all or some portion of street lights to
LED lighting immediately (Custom Option; $100 per light fixture), or having
MidAmerican phase in new LED fixtures gradually over several years (they mention that
it could be up to 10 years). There is no additional cost to the city if they choose to let
MidAmerican phase in the LED fixtures over time.

b. There are 60 MidAmerican owned street lights in University Heights. MidAmerican
projects savings in the monthly costs as each light is converted from high pressure
sodium (HPS) fixtures to LED fixtures. Attached is a HPS vs. LED cost breakdown
provided by MidAmerican.

c. The recommendation from the Streets/Sidewalks committee is to notify MidAmerican to
proceed with the gradual phase in of LED fixtures (Standard Conversion), at no
additional cost to the city. Attached is a copy of the MidAmerican LED Street Lighting
Installation Agreement prepared in this manner.

d. Council could consider this as a budget item in the next budget process, and decide
whether accelerating LED replacement for some or all fixtures should be included.

Project # 115102-0 | November 6, 2015 SHIVEHATTERY
ARCH T'E EERING

ECTURE+ENGIN



Page 3 of 5

(5) Driveways (Work in Right-of-Way Permits)

a. 204 Golfview —We are reviewing a request for conversion from one to two driveways
aprons at this location, which is directly on the east side of the Grand Avenue and
Golfview Avenue T-intersection. We're providing guidance on maximum allowable
driveway widths for a 2-driveway scenario (based on Joint Municipal Design Standards)
that would still limit the amount of paving to less than 1/3 of the Front Setback area.
There is also an existing tree in the parkway that needs to be avoided and on-street
parking in this vicinity to be evaluated.

(6) MS4 Permit — Damaged Street Intake

a. The intake top has been reconstructed by J&L Construction. There is some remaining
work to remove the forms, backfill, restore and clean up the area. Pay Application #1
for this is included in the warrants ($2,432.00), which estimates the work at 80%
complete. We recommend approval of this pay application.

b. On October 7" we received two contractor quotes to replace the damaged intake top at
the SE corner of the Oakcrest and Koser intersection near Horn School (the tabulation
of quotes is attached). The lowest responsive quote was from J&L Construction out of
Washington, lowa, in the amount of $3,200.00. (October Mtg.)

(7) One University Place - Clarification

a. Silvia requested clarification to a portion of the October City Engineer report, wanting to
know what date trees in the east ravine that were outside the construction limits had
been cleared. As indicated in Item 7.c (i) of the October City Engineer report, we were
notified Friday, September 25" about the issue, and that no additional work would occur
until we could meet on site the following Monday morning. Vegetation was observed to
have been cleared on the Monday morning site visit, so this additional clearing would
have had to occur on or before September 25",

(8) One University Place — Construction Changes

a. Atthe October meeting, there was discussion about what types of construction changes
would require city council approval before occurring. Attached is a memo we prepared
suggesting the types of construction changes that would require council involvement.

(9) One University Place — East Ravine

a. Atthe October meeting, during Jeff Maxwell’s discussion with the city council, it was
agreed that an outside environmental consultant (Judy Joyce with EarthView
Environmental) would visit the site and provide recommendations for the work that
would need to be prepared for this portion of the ravine.

b. 1am attaching the report Judy provided to the council on October 28". The report
addresses three main concerns: Light Pollution and Screening, Erosion/Slope Grading,
and Vegetation Restoration. Each section provides detail of the tradeoffs associated
with choosing various options. There is an effective summary at the end of the report.

Project # 115102-0 | November 6, 2015 SHIVEHATTERY
ARCH T'E EERING

ECTURE+ENGIN



Page 4 of 5

c. Although not addressed in Judy’s report, | did follow up with her about the possibility of
using retaining walls at one or more locations along the slope as a method to obtain
gentler slopes while limiting any further impact down into the ravine. | also asked
whether this approach (using retaining walls) would still allow the type of vegetation
plan she recommended to be implemented. This was Judy’s response:

i. “Structural walls could be added. Any work done in the drip lines of trees can
and most likely will cause damage, so with walls there may still be tree removal.
When | met with the group (October 20" on-site meeting), they mentioned
having that area have a “natural” look, so | didn’t address terracing. Structures
will give it a different look and create a different space.”

ii. If walls were used, could the vegetation plan still be implemented? “Yes, there
are many options. It all depends on what the expectations are and what the
desired look and future use of that area might be.”

(10)One University Place — Public Improvements Project

a. There are several poor condition street panels on Melrose Avenue that are adjacent to
(but not included within) the paving work that will be required for the street widening and
the intersection realignment work. We marked out these panels in September before
the site construction got underway to identify a baseline of existing conditions.

b. Attached is a sketch of the additional panel locations and an estimate prepared by MMS
of the replacement cost associated with these additional panels. The actual costs
would be determined by the bidding results of the project.

c. Our recommendation is to include these additional panel replacements in the Public
Improvements construction drawings being prepared by MMS Consultants. This project
will already have a concrete contractor on-site doing this type of work, and would limit
traffic disruption to one construction project.

d. MMS can include these additional panel replacements in the construction drawings, but
the developer would like to get confirmation from the city council that costs for removing
these additional street panels will be paid by the City.

e. MMS provided the following schedule for developing the Public Improvements Project:

 November 6" — Submit Preliminary Plans for City Review
 December 30" — Submit Final Plans and Right-of-Way Acquisition Plat to City

e January 14™ — Send Plans out to Bidders

Project # 115102-0 | November 6, 2015 SHIVEHATTERY
ARCH T'E EERING

ECTURE+ENGIN



Page 5 of 5

(11) Olive Court Street Reconstruction — Topographic Design Survey

a. One of the first steps in preparing proposed designs for the reconstruction of Olive
Court is to have the street topographically surveyed. This will create a design base
map with accurate locations and elevations of the existing roadway, intersection, trees,
driveways, storm water intakes, sidewalks and property lines. This survey will then be
used throughout the project to develop construction drawings and/or exhibits. Jim Lane
asked that we provide an estimate of cost to complete this initial survey and base map.
Our estimate to complete this work is $5,500.

b. The Olive Court project was deferred during the last budget process, but there was an
estimate provided at that time for the preliminary engineering work required to get a
project designed and out to bid. The survey estimate provided above is not in addition
to that amount, but is a portion of that amount.

(12) lowa DOT - All Town Sign Replacement Program

a. Russ reports 5 or 6 sign installations left, to be completed soon after his utility locates
are marked (estimated to occur next week).

b. Russ has continued to install signs as his schedule allows. When Russ finishes this
work, we’'ll notify the DOT that the work has been completed. (October Mtg.)

Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions about these or any other items.

JDB

Project # 115102-0 | November 6, 2015 SHIVEHATTERY
ARCHITE EERING

ECTURE+ENGIN



31va m\\Q\Z 3Lva \\w.\. L&h\\ Alwa

HOAVIN %I,@_moﬂ EELILT I¥ah S

\va REEEIVERS ]

SLIHOITH ALISHIAINA 40 ALID "ONI ‘A¥ILLVH-3AIHS NOISIAD DNLLNIVA - Ol 032 DNITIRd ™
HINMO MIINIONI TMOLIYELNGD
10°6EVS :1S3ND3Y SIHL 3nd LNNOWY
7 “SINIWAY SNOIATH SS31
00'812'5% 552818 :3Na LNNOWY L3N
<7IUNId> 0005 <IYNId> 0008 {(%S) IOYNIVLTY ST
%00L  00'8LZ'SS %b  §518L% SHIYOM A1 TdNOD 40 INTVA
00'812'5$ 11 9VHLINOD TVLOL
%00L  00°8E$ L %0 000$ 1 008§ o0'8es s1 ! (35) 43ISO ANY ISOMTAN - MOTIZA BH¥ND INIVd L-OLI
%001 09'8L.S 1 %0 00°0$ 1 05'8LLS 05'8L8 s1 1 LSIHONYO ANV LISNNS - NOILOISHIALNI INIVdIY 9
%00L  00°9€S$ L %0 000% L 00°9£5$ 00'985% 1 b HISOM ANY LSTHOMVO - NOILOISHILNI INIVdIY S
%00L  00'E62% L %0 000§ PR 00'€62$ 00'€62$ s1 L M3IAZI09 - INITHILNID ANV ONDINVA INIVE3Y  +
%00L  05'9¥$ L %00l 0S'9%$ L 0 05'9v$ 05'9v$ s1 b MAINITOD ANV ONVHO - dvd dOLS INIVd3d €
%00L  00°S0$ 1 %0 0008$ L 00°5048 005028 ST L 133418 13SNNS - INITYELNTD MOTI3A 319000 INIVA3Y ¢
%00L  00'129'2$ L %S SOLELS 500 560 00128'2$ 00'128'2$ S b INNIAY ISOUTIN - INIVETH 1
% INNOWY QLr  ALD aLr % LNNOWY ALD ALD SNOIAZNd NOISNILX3Z  30mMd LINN  LINN  ALD INVN WLl #
LNINNND LNZH¥ND w3y

(sz) 0-zoLSLL "ON L23roud
SLOZ/S/LL THONOWHL MHOM HO4 S1HOI3H ALISH3IAINN 40 ALID
AVNIS -2 “HIGNNN NOILYDITddY Avd SONIMYVYIN LNINIAVC SLOZ




MidAmerican

ENERGY.

Louise From
Mayor

1004 Melrose Ave
lowa City, 1A 52246

Dear Mayor and City Administrator,

MidAmerican Energy is starting an exciting new LED streetlight initiative and changing the look and
image of our cities at night. Long-term community benefits include lower lighting rates, fewer outages
and maintenance issues and environmental benefits. MidAmerican estimates that once the
MidAmerican-owned system is fully converted to LED streetlights that approximately 40 million
kilowatt-hours will be saved annually.

MidAmerican will begin the process of converting our existing streetlight system to more efficient LED
streetlight equipment beginning in July 2015. With more than 100,000 MidAmerican-owned
streetlights in the state of lowa, a full conversion of lights between 70 and 250 watts will be phased-in
during the next 10 years. More information on this conversion process is provided in the enclosed
brochure and on MidAmerican’s website: www.midamericanenergy.com\cityLED.

While LED lighting is more efficient and provides brighter, more direct lighting than our current HPS
fixtures, the new fixtures will meet similar lighting standards as the HPS lights being replaced.
Communities need to ensure the current and new lighting systems adhere to IES, DOT or their own
city standards. Each lighting application is unique and may need to be reviewed further by the city.
Before work can begin in your community, please complete and return the LED Streetlight Agreement
and review the performance specifications found on our website.

The agreement allows MidAmerican to pursue the most efficient methods of changing the fixtures out
and helps keep costs lower for everyone. This conversion will be done at no cost to the city, but it may
take up to 10 years to complete. MidAmerican understands some communities may prefer a more
accelerated conversion for their community or in specific areas; and this can be done for a one-time
charge of $100 per light fixture. More information on this option can be found in the LED Streetlight
Agreement.

Once your community’s Streetlight Agreement is received, a MidAmerican representative will begin
planning the streetlight conversion work for your community.

Sincerely,

o Th. s

Kathryn M. Kunert
Vice President
Business and Community Development




MIDAMERICAN ENERGY COMPANY — LIGHT EMITTING DIODE (LED)
STREET LIGHTING INSTALLATION AGREEMENT

This is a LighEitti Diode Street Lighting Installation greetbete

(Please Print Municipality, Government Body and/or City, State of Customer
below)

City of University Heights, lowa

(Customer) and MidAmerican Energy Company (MEC). Customer and MEC may be
referenced as “Parties” collectively.

This Light Emitting Diode (LED) Street Lighting Installation Agreement (Agreement) is
entered into by and between MEC and Customer and effective upon signature of both
Parties.

Whereas, MEC and the Customer agree that LED street lighting provides many
benefits;

Whereas, MEC notified the Customer of the MEC LED street lighting standards
selected are comparable to the High Pressure Sodium (HPS) lights they will replace;

Whereas, the Customer is aware that differences do exist in the performance
between HPS street lights and LED street lights.

Whereas, the Customer consents and approves of MEC converting existing HPS
street lighting to LED street lighting at the Customer’s locations including the installation
of future street light installation locations requested by the Customer;

Whereas, Service hereunder is subject to the Rules and Regulations of the
Company and Applicable Riders included in the (MEC) Electric Tariff.

Now wherefore MEC and the Customer agree as follows:

Customer Responsibilities:

The Customer is responsible for ensuring the street lighting systems meet any
applicable lighting standards and requirements of the llluminating Engineering Society
(IES) and/or Department of Transportation (DOT) adopted by the Customer and/or the
Customer’s own lighting standards.

Customer shall independently evaluate the adjustment of LED street light illumination
levels to the road surface to determine the quality of a roadway lighting design.

Customer agrees to the terms and conditions and street lighting pricing out lined in
MEC’s Rate SL — Street Lighting.

Page 10of3
(MEC) - LED STREET LIGHTING INSTALLATION AGREEMENT




MIDAMERICAN ENERGY COMPANY - LIGHT EMITTING DIODE (LED)
STREET LIGHTING INSTALLATION AGREEMENT

MidAmerican Responsibilities:

MEC will replace existing HPS street lights with new LED lights according to the
Customer’s election below.

At the Customer’s request, MEC will provide the performance specifications of the LED
lights placed into service for the Customer to review.

MEC will provide street lighting service in accordance with its Rate SL — Street Lighting.

Please Select an Option

1) _X_ Standard Conversion - The Customer elects to allow MEC to convert
existing HPS lights by planned project areas at MEC's discretion and pace and
will allow MEC to install LED lights through the normal streetlight maintenance
process as the existing HPS lights fail at no cost to the Customer (estimated 10
year conversion).

2) ___ Custom Option - The Customer elects to convert lights on a faster pace
and timeline at locations the Customer chooses for a charge of $100/light. A
MidAmerican representative will contact the person identified on this Agreement
to begin working on the process to identify and change the lights.

The signee of this Agreement confirms they are the Municipality/Government Body/City
(Customer) Official, Authority or Representative having legal privileges and rights to
sign this agreement on behalf of the Municipality/Government Body/City (Customer).

Date

Agreement Signature of Customer (Official, Authority or Representative)

Louise From 5
ate

Please print name of Customer (Official, Authority or Representative)
Title: Mayor

Phone#:  (319) 354-1433

Email: louise @university-heights.org

***Please keep one signed copy of this Agreement for your records and return
one signhed copy of this Agreement in the enclosed self-addressed envelope. ***

Page 2 of 3
(MEC) - LED STREET LIGHTING INSTALLATION AGREEMENT




MIDAMERICAN ENERGY COMPANY = LIGHT EMITTING DIODE (LED)
STREET LIGHTING INSTALLATION AGREEMENT

Additional Customer Lighting Project Primary Points of Contact

(Please Print)

name: JOSiah Bilskemper, PE 4 (319) 354 - 3040

Phone
Title: City Engineer Email: JRilsSkmeper@shive-hattery.com
Name: Phone #:
Title: Email:
Name: Phone #:
Title: Email:

Page3of3
(MEC) - LED STREET LIGHTING INSTALLATION AGREEMENT




EAST AREA - HPS Vs LED COST

|PREPARED FROM MOST RECENT STREETLIGHT BILL CODE/QUANTITY INFORMATION FOR THE CITY OF UNIVERSITY HEIGHT¢

[VEARLY
SAVINGS | YEARLY YEARLY
FORALL [SAVINGS FOR [SAVINGS FOR
100MPUG [ALL EMK ALL 150MPUG
LIGHTS  |LIGHTS IGHTS

YEARLY
SAVINGS
FOR ALL EML
LIGHTS

VEARLY
SAVINGS
FOR ALL
250MPUG
LIGHTS

EAST EXISTING 100W HPS MP UG RATE CONVERSION TO LED EAST EXISTING 100W HPS WP OH RATE CONVERSION TO LED
ENTER MONTLY RATE EARLY ENTER MONTLY RATE MONTHLY
Quantity [MONTLY RATE [COMPARABLE MONTHLY SAVINGS Quantity |MONTLY RATE |COMPARABLE SAVINGS VEARLY
SUMof [100WHPS@ |100WLED@ |MONTHLY [SAVINGS |YEARLY |FORALL suMof |100WHPS  |100wLED@ |MONTHLY |FORALL |VEARLY [sAviNGs
2220n 222 Billing Code|ELA Billing  |SAVINGS [FORALL [sAviNGs (222 EMKon |@EMK Billing |ELK Billing CodefsAvINGs  [emk SAVINGS |FOR ALL
VEARBill Rate Code Rate  |PER LIGHT |222 LIGHTS|PER LIGHT |LIGHTS YEAR|Bill Code Rate Rate PERLIGHT  [LIGHTS  |PER LIGHT [EMK LIGHTS
2015] 26,11 22.59 352 - 2112 - 2015] 5. 10.80 7.28 3525 20768]5 2112]5 1,246.08
2016} 27.42 2381 361 - 2332 - 2016] 5 1089 7.28 361|$ 21299[¢ 4332$ 255588 U H TS HAS 5 9
2017} 27.84 2453 331 - 3972 - 5 1059 7.28 331]5 19529[$ 39.72[$ 2,343.48
2018} 2825 25.25 3.00 - 36.00 - 5 1028 7.28 3.00[$ 177.00 36005 2,124.00 " 100W" L | G H TS
2019) 28.66 25.96 270 - 3240 - 5 998 7.28 270|S 15930 $ 3240 1,91160
2020) 29.10 2670 240 - 28.80 - 5 968 7.28 2405 14160 S 2880 1,699.20
2951 2741 210 - 2520 - 5 938 7.28 2105 12390]$ 2520 1,486.80
29.93 28.13 180 - 2160 - 5 9.08 7.28 180 S 10620 21.60|S 1,274.40
30.34 28.85 1.49 B 877 7.28 149 87.91 1,054.92
9 YR
SAVINGS
FOR ALL
EMK LIGHTS
$15,696.36
EAST EXISTING 150W HPS MP UG CONVERSION TO LED EAST EXISTING 150W HPS WP OH CONVERSION TO LED
ENTER MONTLY RATE EARLY ENTER MONTLY RATE MONTHLY
Quantity [MONTLY RATE [COMPARABLE MONTHLY SAVINGS Quantity |MONTLY RATE |COMPARABLE SAVINGS VEARLY
SUMof [150WHPS@ |150WLED@ |MONTHLY [SAVINGS |YEARLY |FORALL sUMof |150WHPS@ |150WLED@ |MONTHLY [FORALL |VEARLY [sAvings
2220n 2?2 Billing Code|ELB Billing  |SAVINGS [FORALL [|sAviNGs (222 EMLon |EMLBilling  |ELL Billing Code [sAVINGS  |EML SAVINGS |FOR ALL
VEARBill Rate Code Rate  |PER LIGHT |222 LIGHTS|PER LIGHT |LIGHTS YEAR|Bill Code Rate Rate PER LIGHT  [LIGHTS  |PER LIGHT [EML LIGHTS
2015) 27.04 2412 292 - 17.52 - 2015] 1 1173 881 292 292 1752 1752
2016} 2844 2534 310 - 37.20 - 2016 1 1191 8381 310 3105 3720 37.20
2017 28.92 26.06 286 - 3432 - 1 1167 8381 286 2865 3432 3432 U HTS HAS 1
2018} 29.40 2678 262 - 3144 - 1 1143 8381 262 2625 3144 3144
2019) 29.87 27.49 238 - 28.56 - 1 1119 8381 238 2385 2856 2856 n 1 50Wll L I G H T
2020) 3037 2823 214 - 2568 - 1 10.95 8381 214 2145 2568 2568
30.84 2894 1.90 - 22.80 - 1 1071 8381 1.90 190]|s 2280 22.80
3132 2966 1.66 19.92 1 1047 8381 1.66 1.66 1992 1992
31.79 30.38 141 1 10.22 881 141 141 1692
9 YR
SAVINGS
FOR ALL
EML LIGHTS
$ 23436
-
EAST EXISTING 250W HPS MP UG CONVERSION TO LED EAST EXISTING 250W HPS WP OH CONVERSION TO LED
ENTER MONTLY RATE VEARLY ENTER MONTLY RATE MONTHLY YEARLY
Quantity [MONTLY RATE [COMPARABLE IMONTHLY SAVINGS Quantity |MONTLY RATE [COMPARABLE SAVINGS SAVINGS
SUMof [250WHPS@ |250WLED@ |MONTHLY [SAVINGS |YEARLY ~|FORALL SUMof [250WHPS@ [250WLED@ |MONTHLY |FORALL |VEARLY |FORALL
2220n |27 Billing Code|ELC Billing  |SAVINGS [FORALL [sAVINGS EMMon [EMMBilling  |ELMBiling  [sAvINGS  |EmM SAVINGS |EMM
VEARBill Rate Code Rate PR LIGHT |222 LIGHTS|PER LIGHT |LiGHTS YEAR|Bill Code Rate Code Rate PERLIGHT  [UGHTS  |PER LIGHT |LIGHTS
2015 0 28.74 2533 341 - 20.46 - 2015 0 1343 10.02 341 - 20.46 -
2016] 0 3027 2655 372 - 24.64 - 2016] 0 1374 10.02 372 - 44.64 -
2017 o 30.84 2727 357 - 22.84 - 2007] o 1359 10.02 357 - 4284 -
2018 0 31.40 27.99 341 - 40.92 - FIE ) 1343 10.02 341 - 40.92 -
2019 0 31.96 28.70 326 - 39.12 - 209 0 1328 10.02 326 - 39.12 -
2020] 0 3254 29.44 3.10 - 37.20 - 2020] 0 1312 10.02 310 - 37.20 -
2021 o 33.09 3005 294 - 35.28 - 202 o 12.96 10.02 294 - 3528 -
202 0o 33.66 30.87 279 - 33.48 - 202 0o 12.81 10.02 279 - 3348 -
203 0 3422 3159 263 - 3156 - 203] 0 12,65 10.02 263 - 3156 -
SAVINGS
FOR ALL
EMM
LIGHTS
B -

[VEARLY
SAVINGS
FOR ALL
EMMF
LIGHTS

YEARLY
SAVINGS
FOR ALL
LIGHTS

TOTAL cosTTO
[QUANTITY |CONVERT @
OF LIGHTS |$100 EA

1,246.08 -

17.52

2,555.88

37.20

2,343.48

34.32

2,124.00

3144

1,911.60

2856

60 $ 6,000.00
$ 4,736.40
$ 2,14332
S (234.48)
$ (2,389.92)

1,699.20

25.68

1,486.80

1,274.40

1,054.92

$ (4,330.08)
$ (6,054.96)
$ (7,564.56)
$ (8,858.88)

9 YR SAVINGS |9 YR SAVINGS
FORALLEMK |FOR ALL150HPS|
LIGHTS IMPUG LIGHT:

FOR ALL EML|
LIGHTS

$ 15,696.36 | $ -

$ 23436

$15,930.72

MID-AMERICAN PROVIDED SUMMARY
FOR ALL 60 LIGHTS...BASED ON A
SCENARIO WHERE THE CITY PAYS
$6,000 UP FRONT TO IMMEDIATELY
CONVERT ALL 60 LIGHTS TO LED
FIXTURES (60 LIGHTS x $100/LIGHT)




eIk < Lo i d 1& = _ ~ 31va
HOAYIN \ \ AINIOISAY '¥34413d 031
§ y M“
SLHOIFH ALISYIAINN 40 ALID *ONI'AYILLYH-IAIHS o717 ‘uonanysueg Tgr
WINMO IHIINIONT 'HOLOVHLNOD
00°ZE+'2S :LS3AND3Y SIHL 3N INNOWY
——————
00°cs 'SINIHAVS SNOIAIHd SSTT
00°ZEY'TS 0CZEY T ‘AN ANNONY L3N
(o0'ez1$) loc'gze) :(%55] IDOYNIVLIY ST
%08 0009528 %08 00095 2¢ MHOM G3137dW02 40 3MIVA
_ ¢ ues|y '/ SWEL '8U0JSEY / |[fIeE "SULO dUIS ,____ctwm%m_
00°002'c$ {LOVHELNOD TVLO0L
%08 00'09s'2$ 20 %08 0C'095 2¢ 89 00'00Z'es 00°002'¢S va I fup doj ‘;06-MS 'SNew| L
% INNOWY aLr  AlDALr INNOWY ALD ALD SNOIAZHd NOISNALXZ FOM4LINN LINn ALD JNVN WL #
ANZHNAD  ININMAD Nzl |
(sz) 0-z0LSLE "ON LOZrodd
SLOZIFILL  HONOYHL HYOM H04 SLHOIFH ALISHIAINN 40 ALID
! HISWNN NOLLYDMddY AV

Alvd3d IMVLNI NHOLS S102




SHIVEHATTERY

TO:

FROM:

DATE:

RE:

MEMORANDUM
Jim Lane, University Heights City Councilor
Steve Ballard, City Attorney
Terry Goerdt, City Inspector
Josiah Bilskemper, P.E. (Shive-Hattery, Inc.)
November 6, 2015

One University Place — Construction Changes

Based on discussion at the October city council meeting, subsequent review of the PUD Development
Agreement, and Section 13 (Multiple-Family Commercial PUD) of Ordinance 79, below is a list of
recommended items that would trigger some type of city review, first with city staff and the designated
council contact, and then follow-up with the city council if warranted.

1.

Changes to the project boundaries:

Work that would go beyond the approved construction limits (within the site).

Work that would impact additional sensitive slopes beyond the approved limits.

Work that would impact adjacent properties.

Work that would increase tree removals beyond what is shown on the approved plan.

aoop

Changes to the project occurring within city right-of-way:

a. Changes that would impact vehicular or pedestrian traffic, regardless of duration.
b. Changes that would impact any public utilities.
c. Changes to the design of facilities within the right-of-way.

Changes to the project that implicate development regulations or zoning ordinance restrictions:

a. Building square footage, commercial square footage, or number of dwelling units.
b. Building height and building setbacks.
c. Parking (above ground or below ground).

Changes to the project storm water design:

a. Changes that would alter flow direction or quantity of storm water.
b. Changes that would impact the bio-retention cells in any way.

Changes to the project that implicate any of the conditions in the PUD Development
Agreement. Some examples include:

Changes to dumpster locations.

Changes to the landscaping plan.

Changes to exterior building materials or colors, exterior signing, or exterior lighting.
Changes to the timing of construction.

aoop

Please let me know if you have any questions, thanks.

JDB

Project # 115102-0(60)

Shive-Hattery | 2839 Northgate Drive | lowa City, |A 52245 | 319.354.3040 | fax 319.354.6921 | shive-hattery.com =



#* Wetland Services and Natural Resources Consulting ¥ Watershed Studies % Soil Borings % Educational Training % Geoarchaeological and Geomorphological Services ¥Prescribed Fire & Vegetation Management

October 26, 2015

Mayor and City Council
City of University Heights
City Hall 1004 Melrose Ave
lowa City, lowa 52246

RE: OUP East Ravine Restoration

To The Mayor and City Council of University Heights:

At the request of the City of University Heights and Jeff Maxwell, Developer, | have completed a review of the
proposed ravine restoration plan for the OUP East Ravine. On the morning of 10/20/2015, Mr. Maxwell and myself
met onsite along with Josiah Bilskemper, City Engineer, Mayor Louise From, and Council Member Silvia
Quezada. Also attending were residents David Shriver, Larry Wilson, Pat Yeggy and Ken Yeggy. After some
discussion, we concluded that there were three issues the group wanted me to address in my review. Those
concerns include:

e Light Pollution and Screening
e Erosion/slope grade
e Vegetation Restoration Plan

Concern 1: Light Pollution and Screening

Based on discussions, the developer will have his landscape architect (Confluence) design a planting plan which
addresses light pollution. Our field discussion led to a consensus that evergreens, such as arborvitae, would be
placed along the north side of the development exit drive to sunset to screen vehicle lights. The evergreen screen
would also serve to separate the urban landscape of the development from the native plantings in the ravine.

Currently there is a grouping of three (3) trees on the southeast corner of the ravine which provide some additional
screening. On the current plan provided by MMS Consultants, the design shows them protected with a retaining
wall. Itis worth noting:

1) Tree species include 2 hackberry and 1 black walnut (See Photos 1-3)

a) One of the hackberries has had one of its branches recently removed. Both hackberries are 10-12 inches in
diameter. This species is one of our most common trees and is a moderately fast growing tree.

b) The largest tree is a walnut with a diameter of approximately 24”. It has had several large branches
removed and one large branch is split, possibly due to wind.

2) These trees were impacted during construction. In addition to some recent branch removal, there is a good
chance that the roots of those trees were impacted by construction activities such as the installation of the
storm sewer and compaction within the dripline/root zone. Soil compaction is the single largest killer of urban
trees.

3) The proposed retaining wall is needed in order to keep fill away from the trees and to keep the three trees
standing. However, it is possible and likely that those trees are stressed and may die in the near future.

My background and experience is not in structural engineering, therefore my review does not address the viability
or constructability of the retaining wall. | understand the desire for the city, the developer and the neighbors to
preserve as many trees as possible. However, | would urge the group to reconsider installing a retaining wall to
protect trees that do not have a good chance for long term survival. Another option is to allow those trees to be
removed and modify the slope to a more stable, manageable grade. Additional evergreen trees could be planted
along Sunset Street to provide screening until newly planted native trees are established in the ravine.

#*EarthView Environmental, Inc. 310 Second Street Coralville, lowa 52241 % Office: 319-358-2542 * Fax: 319-358-2562
#* Mobile: 319-330-3833 # Email: EVE@EVEInc.consulting ¥ Web site: www.EVEInc.consulting



Construction
with Root Zone

Catalpa

OUP East Ravine Page 2
EarthView Environmental, Inc. October 28, 2015




Concern 2: Erosion/slope grade

Preserving trees while controlling erosion and achieving a manageable slope were two of the goals expressed by the
city engineer, the council representatives, the neighbors and the developer. Initially, | was provided with a proposed
plan showing a 2.5:1 slope. | also reviewed two other grading plan options with slopes at a 4:1 and 3:1.

Proposed 2.5:1 Slope:

The proposed plan shows a 2.5:1 slope with
a retaining wall protecting three (3) trees in
the southeast corner and no additional trees
to be removed. It is worth noting that there
will be some tree removal along the west
slope following the remove of “junk” along
the bank.

2:5:1 slopes can be difficult to stabilize, but
can be done with fabric to control erosion.
Establishing vegetation, especially native
vegetation, can be difficult because a 2:5:1
slope is NOT considered a “mowable” slope.
To establish native plants with seeding, the
area needs to be mowed in order to control
weeds. If the area cannot be mowed,
controlling weeds will need to be done by
hand. To establish a native planting from
seed takes a minimum of 3 years. Long term
maintenance to control weeds is needed.

In summary, this plan meets the goal of

keeping trees, but the proposed slope is
steep. | recommend this option ONLY if the desire to
keep the trees outweighs the desire of easier short
and long term management of the site.

Option 1: 4:1 Slope:

This would be the most stable of the three options.
The slope could be mowed to control weeds to help
with the establishment of new trees and shrubs.
However, as you can see in Figure 2, a 4:1 slope will
require at least six (6) medium to large trees to be
removed including a large Catalpa tree with a
significant canopy (Photo 4). The roots of other trees
may be impacted if grading occurs within the drip line
of the trees. This meets the goal of having a stable
slope but does not meet the second goal of protecting
trees because it removes a large tree with a large
canopy.

OUP East Ravine
EarthView Environmental, Inc.

B

A ., f L“I\

IFigure 2:4:1Slo

pe (Basé Map and gra;iing prdvided by MMS Consultants)

Page 3
October 28, 2015



C

AR
%

Option 2: 3:1 Slope:

For this option, the slope would not be “mowable”
but would be more stable than the 2.5:1. Four Trees
would need to be removed. Those trees include
ashes and smaller walnuts. The Ash trees will most
likely be impacted by the Emerald Ash borer in the
near future and walnuts are fairly quick growing and
there are many other walnuts in the area. They are
also small enough and at a low elevation, with many
other surrounding trees, so removing them would
not significantly alter the canopy, as visible from the
road. In summary this would remove some trees, but \ Y -
would provide a more stable slope then that \ \\ €4
NN X
\ /

proposed. If this level of tree removal is acceptable, | A ‘
recommend the site graded at a 3:1 slope. We . . /

recommended at least 4” of topsoil be placed along [Figure 3: 3:1 Slope (Base
the slope. Following seed bed preparations, the

slope should be seeded with a temporary seed mix of

Winter Wheat (Triticum aestivum) at a rate of 10lbs per acre along with the recommended permanent seed mix (see
below). Caution: No other erosion stabilization mix other than the winter wheat should be used as it will hinder the
establishment of native vegetation. We recommend the use of erosion control matting following the temporary
seed and permanent seed mix.

Concern 3: Vegetation Restoration Plan

For the re-vegetation of the ravine, | recommend the following native trees and shrubs from the list below. The
developer’s landscape architect can work with the list to develop a planting plan OR they can contract the services
to us at EVE. We recommend planting 80% trees and 20% shrubs. For spacing, | recommended planting 3 shrubs
grouping with each shrub spaced 3 feet apart and each grouping spaced 25 feet apart. For the tree spacing, |
recommend 1 tree every 25 feet. Standard best management practices should be used for planting, including the
installation of fabric and mulch.

Note, EVE has experienced better long-term success with planting smaller tree sizes (<1” diameter) especially with
natives, such as hickories, which have a large tap root. It takes longer for larger transplanted trees to become
established due to the longer time required to reestablish a root. We have had the most success with trees less-than
1 inch in diameter and less-than 4 feet in height. Therefore, a smaller size is preferred over larger ball and burlap
trees. Cages and/or tubes should be added to protect from deer and small rodents. Maintenance of cages/tubes is
required. Exact locations should be flagged in the field by the designer. If vegetation is present, the flagged areas
may be sprayed by hand with herbicide 7-10 days prior to planting. Caution, many times nursery provides non-
native substitutions or varieties (nativars). Planting materials should come from a native nursery source and species
should be verified on-site to insure that natives specified are planted.

Trees - Total 80% Shrubs — Total 20%

20%  White Oak (Quercus alba) 4% Highbush Cranberry (Viburnum trilobum)

20%  Bur Oak (Quercus macrocarpa) 4% Witch-hazel (Hamamelis virginiana)

20%  Hackberry (Celtis occidentalis) 4% American Hazelnut (Corylus americana)

20%  Shagbark Hickory (Carya ovata) 4% Spicebush (Lindera benzoin): low elevations in wet soils

4% Indigo Bush (Amorpha fruticosa): low elevations in wet soils

OUP East Ravine Page 4
EarthView Environmental, Inc. October 28, 2015



Following standard best management practices for seed bed preparations, the area should be seeded with the
temporary (cover crop) and permanent mix. The seed should be mixed thoroughly using ten parts moist sand to one
part seeds. Mixing seeds in this manner ensures an even broadcast and minimizes waste. Seeding rate should be at
the rate specified by the supplier (see recommended mix below). The seed can be hand cast or broadcast using
equipment. This site is too steep to be mechanically drill seeded. Given the timing of construction, a dormant
seeding (October through December) is recommended. Dormant seeding allows the freeze/thaw processes to work
the seeds into the ground.

A Tallgrass woods edge or Savanna Seed Mix from Prairie Moon Nursery is recommended (see below). For seed
order information and more information on establishing a native plant community see this website at

https://www.prairiemoon.com/seed-mixes/tallgrass-woods-edge-savanna.html)

aligra DOO (e ava 3 eed
DFLO = DFELO = o e
Species % by wit. Species % by wt.

Agastache nepetoides (Yellow Gilant Hyssop) 1,29 Rudbeckia subtomentosa (Sweet Black-eyed Susan) 0.64
Aster laevis (Smooth Blue Aster) 1.42 Rudbeckia friloba (Brown-eyed Susan) 1.29)
Aster prenantholdes (Crooked-stemmed Aster) 1.28 Scrophularia lanceolata (Early Figwort) 0.77|
Aster sagithfolius (Arrow-leaved Aster) 064 Scrophularia marnlandica (Late Figwort) 1.29]
Cacalia muehlenbergii (Great Indian Plantain) 0.97 Smilacina racemosa {Solomon's Plume) 7.09
Camassia sdilloides (Wild Hyacinth) 258 Veronicastrum virginicum (Cubver's Root) 0.97]
Campanula americana (Tall Bellflowaer) 1.93 Zizia aurea (Golden Alexanders) 387
Caoreopsis lripteris (Tall Corsopsis) 071 Total % by wt. WILDFLOWERS :  52.92%
Desmodium illinoense (llimois Tick Trefoil) 1.29

Echinacea purpurea (Purple Conaflower) Ll GRASSES, SEDGES & RUSHES

Eupatorium purpuraum (Sweet Joe Pye Weed) 1.40 Species %% by wi.
Gaura biennis (Blennial Gaura) 1.29 Andropogen gerardil (Big Bluestem PLS) 2.58]
Gentiana flavida (Cream Gentian) 1389 Bromus kalmii (Prairie Brome PLS) 5.80)
Heliopsis helianthoides (Early Sunflower) 1.42 Bromus pubescens (Hairy Wood Chess PLS) 10.32
Mapaea digica (Glade Mallow) 580 Elymus canadensis (Canada Wild Rye PLS) 7.74
Penstemnon digitalis (Foxglowe Beardiongue) 1,42 Elymus hysfrix (Bottlebrush Grass PLS) 5.16)
Palygonatum biflorum (Solomen’s Seal) 426 Elymus villosus (Silky Wild Rye PLS) 7.74
Pycnanthemum vericillatum var. pilosum (Hairy Mountain Mint) 0.97 Elymus virginicus (Virginia Wild Rye PLS) 7.74
Rudbeckia hifa (Black-eyed Susan) 258 Total % by wi. GRASSES, SEDGES & RUSHES:  47.08%|

-+ Prairie Moon® Nursery

To ensure success of any native, or non-native planting, short-term and long-term maintenance is required. We
recommend a qualified vegetation manager/maintenance provider who specializes in the establishment of native
plants be hired to manage the vegetation within the ravine area. The area outside the ravine (proposed arborvitae,
for example) would be maintained along with the more conventional vegetation. | have attached a BMP that EVE
hands out to contractors. The following maintenance is recommended for the ravine area:

Maintenance

1) Faster growing herbaceous species will need to be trimmed back occasionally; especially those that threaten to
shade the slower growing trees.

2) During the first and second growing seasons, the vegetation should be mowed regularly to a height of 10 to 12
inches, where possible. Subsequent years should be mown once a year.

3) In the Spring, the trees and shrubs should be monitored to evaluate their conditions and determine if there has

OUP East Ravine Page 5
EarthView Environmental, Inc. October 28, 2015


https://www.prairiemoon.com/seed-mixes/tallgrass-woods-edge-savanna.html

been any winter damage due to harsh conditions, deer, other animals or other. Replace damaged/dead shrubs

as needed.

4) Once per month during the growing season of the first two years.
a) Make adjustments and/or repairs to tree/shrub cages/tubes and manipulate branches so they don’t grow
improperly through spaces in the cages/tubes. Remove vegetation around bases.
b) Monitor mulch depth and condition. Note any areas of erosion.
c) Weeds and invasive species shall be sprayed or mechanically removed.

d) Remove Trash.

e) Repair damage/erosional issues as needed.
f) Add additional mulch as needed to control weeds and retain moisture.
g) Areas disturbed should be reseeded with the specified seed mix.
h) Other required maintenance as needed.

5) To ensure establishment and long term management of the area, we recommended that at the end of the two
years of monitoring/management, an adaptive management plan be submitted to the City identifying updates
to the monitoring and maintenance plan.

Summary

In summary, | was asked to address 3 main concerns. The following is a quick summary of those concerns and my

comments/recommendations:

Concerns

Comments/Recommendations

Light Pollution and Screening

The developer’s Landscape Architect (Confluence) can come up with a
planting plan which addresses light pollution.

A 7' retaining wall is proposed to protect one large walnut and two
hackberries. They have been impacted by wind/storm events and
construction activities so their long term viability is uncertain. Unless the
desire to keep those trees is very strong, | recommend the trees be
removed and that the slope be modified to a more stable, manageable
grade. Additional evergreen trees could be planted along Sunset Street to
provide screening until newly planted native trees are established in the
ravine.

Erosion/slope grade

The proposed 2.5:1 slope does not require removal of any additional trees,
however that is a steep slope and more difficult to maintain long term. A
4:1 slope would be preferred, but would remove a large tree with a large
leaf canopy. A 3:1 slope would only remove a few trees low in the
landscape and would provide a more stable, manageable slope. Anything
steeper than a 4:1 would need to be mowed with a hand held brush cutter.

Vegetation Restoration Plan

Native trees and shrubs are recommended with a native seed mix.
Recommending a minimum of 2-years of maintenance with an adaptive
management plan provided to the city by the end of the second growing
season (year two).

The overall goal is to restore the ravine to a stable and natural condition while addressing light pollution. | have
provided my comments and recommendations with some options. The options address additional removal of trees
in exchange for gentler, more manageable slopes which would make establishment of native plants and long term
management of the area easier and more cost effective.

OUP East Ravine
EarthView Environmental, Inc.

Page 6
October 28, 2015




Please let me know if you have any questions, comments or concerns.

Sincerely,

[ R S /"“‘wfgf’{f{‘r

J%‘H"‘;;%E Joyce, é;}VS&Geo g|2?
H

anﬂVmw Enwronmental_;”il}fc. f
i i

Attachment: EVE - Native Seeding Establishment BMP

OUP East Ravine Page 7
EarthView Environmental, Inc. October 28, 2015



EarthView Environmental Inc. (EVE)
Native Seeding Establishment
Best Management Practices

General Practices

e Site monitoring by EVE should be conducted at regular & frequent intervals during the first 1-2 growing seasons.
e ALWAYS sweep off ALL equipment before entering a native establishment area.

o Pickup trucks, tractors, mowers, sprayers, booms, ATVs, etc.

Communications

¢ Ground condition can change very rapidly, necessitating rapid mobilization.
e (lear, concise, & timely communication needed between:
o Monitors, Inspectors, Contractors, & Operators.

o We are all responsible to keep communication lines open and active.

Seeding

e The PREPARED seed bed must be inspected by EVE not more than 1 week before seeding is conducted.
e Use fresh (less than 2 years old) seed from reputable & widely-recognized sources.
e Drill Seeding
o Usearecognized NATIVE seed drill with an agitator in the hopper.
=  Examples: Truax Native Grass Drill, John Deere Rangeland Drill.
o Never drill seed deeper than 1/8” depth.
o For small to medium size plantings, filler is needed (moist sawdust) in the hopper.
o Not for use when seeding less than 1 acre of contiguous area.
e Broadcast Seeding (with hopper or by hand)
o Mix seed thoroughly using ten parts moist sand to one part seed to aid in distribution.
o Use crisscross pattern wherever possible.
o Compact surface after seeding wherever possible using a roller or cultipacker.

e Seed with a nurse crop (one only), type-dependent on season:

Spring Summer Dormant (Nurse crop optional)
Plantings Plantings October - March
April - May June - August
Oats (Avena sativa) 20lbs/acre 20lbs/acre Not used.
Winter Wheat (Triticum aestivum) Not used Not used 10 Ibs./acre
OUP East Ravine Page 8

EarthView Environmental, Inc. October 28, 2015



Mowing
Timing frequency and height of mowing in early years of prairie establishment is CRITICAL, but is also highly variable
depending on many factors, such as: predominance of weedy species and which species, predominance of native species
and which species, recent rainfall or drought conditions, seasonal timing and level of establishment. It is up to the site
inspector/monitor to determine when mowing is needed, and at what height. Basic guidelines are:
e Timing is critical to hinder weedy seed production.
o Frequency my vary from every 2 weeks to 2 months dependent on conditions.
e Sweep BEFORE entering a native planting, sweep off mower deck and tractor.
e Sweep AFTER mowing a patch of weeds in a native planting, move the equipment to a safe road, field or ditch and
sweep it before returning to any native planted areas.
e  When mowing adjacent weedy or non-native areas, the following are critical to reducing spread of weed seed:
o FINISH one area BEFORE moving into the other.
o Do not mow in and out of the native planting.
o Clean the mower deck before entering the native planting.
o Beaware of the wind and where it is blowing weed seed, just like herbicide drift.
e Mower deck height should be based on current field conditions, optimizing damage to weedy species while
minimizing damage to natives. GENERALLY:
o Never below 8”. Raise higher if ground is uneven to avoid scalping.
o First Year Plantings - 10-12”"
o Second Year Plantings - 14-20”
o Third Year - only individual weed patches or dormant season mowing should be needed.

e Trimmers, Brush Cutters, or Hand Mowers may be required in some instances for finer levels of control.

Herbicide Application

e Sweep all tractors and booms before entering a Native Planting.
e Avoid drift & be aware of surrounding assets:
o Some plantings have trees planted IN and AROUND them. Be aware that you may be liable for
replacement of trees if your chemical drifts onto or otherwise affects them.
e Chemical persistence.
o Do notuse herbicides or additives that may hinder future plantings; coordinate with EVE.
e Aquatic Safe
o Many of our plantings are IN or AROUND wetland areas. The applicator is responsible for knowing if the
chemical is being used appropriately and in conformance with the label.
e No Substitutions & Adjuvants
o NO SUBSTITUTIONS or additions (dyes, surfactants, etc.) without prior approval from EVE.

OUP East Ravine Page 9
EarthView Environmental, Inc. October 28, 2015



PRELIMINARY COST ESTIMATE

PREPARED FQR: Jeff Maxwell BY: RLA DATE: 10/26/15
PROJECT NAME: Replace Bad Panels on Melrose PROJ NO:  5138-012
e SITE IMPROVEMENTS COSTS
Unit Estimated Extended
ltam Description Unit Price Quantity Amount
Remove Existing Pavement SY $20.00 296 $5,0920
Paving, 10 inch PCC with CD Baskets sY $90.00 298 $26,640
EXTENDED AMOUNT $32,560






ST
't 'iljli I W | szxamrn | I‘
i

ey | 1 [ 1
g

% = E
- L —_— _-;_':"'._"
T imeam

o .
>

October 30, 2015

Site_Addresses_1758 0.02 0.04
Parcel Lines 1:220 to 1:14062 0.0325 0.065

History

Parcel

Parcel Lot

ROW

Parcels

- - County Boundaries
Streets_1758




RESOLUTION NO. 15-XX

RESOLUTION SETTING THE ADMINISTRATIVE FEE FOR
THE 2015 SIDEWALK REPAIR PROJECT AND AUTHORIZING AND
DIRECTING INVOICING FOR REPAIR COSTS.

WHEREAS, the University Heights City Council adopted Resolution 15-03
January 13, 2015, requiring abutting property owners to repair certain portions of
sidewalk marked previously by the City Engineer’s field staff; and

WHEREAS, the City notified property owners to complete required repair
work by July 20, 2015, on their own, with their own contractor, or through the
contractor engaged by the City; and

WHEREAS, the City Council adopted Resolution 15-06 February 10,
2015, indicating that the a portion of the City’s administrative fees with respect to
the sidewalk repair project would be passed along to respective property owners
at a rate not to exceed $100.00 (in addition to the actual repair costs) if owners
joined the City’s repair program, with the precise rate to be determined by later
Council action; and

WHEREAS, the City informed property owners of the anticipated
administrative fee and also informed owners that if they elected not to join the
City’s program but did not satisfactorily complete the repair work themselves,
then the administrative fee assessed to their property might be greater than
$100.00; and

WHEREAS, the sidewalk repair program has now been completed and
the City Engineer has informed the Council that administrative expenses
amounted to $211.00 per property; and

WHEREAS, the Council now desires to establish the administrative fee to
be passed along to property owners who joined the City’'s repair program,
establish the administrative fee for those who elected not to join the City’s
program but did not satisfactorily complete the repair work themselves, and to
direct that the City Engineer’s office invoice property owners accordingly; and

WHEREAS, if property owners who are invoiced for repair work and
administrative fees do not pay in a timely manner, the Council may by further
resolution assess the repair costs and administrative fees against respective
properties for collection as additional property tax,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Council of the City of
University Heights, lowa, as follows:

1. Property owners who elected to join the City’s repair program are hereby
assessed an administrative expense of $100.00 per property address (in



addition to the actual cost of repair based upon the contractor’s invoice for
work performed);

2. Property owners who did not elect to join the City’s repair program and did
not complete the required work by the July 20, 2015, deadline are hereby
assessed an administrative expense of $200.00 per property address (in
addition to the actual cost of repair based upon the contractor’s invoice for
work performed);

3. The City Engineer is authorized and directed to invoice respective
property owners for payment of repair costs and administrative fees and
inform property owners that the deadline for payment of invoices is
December 31, 2015;

4. The property owners to be invoiced, and the invoice amounts, are listed in
the attached Exhibit “A”; and

5. If property owners who are invoiced for repair costs and administrative
fees do not by the deadline, the Council may by further resolution assess
the repair costs and administrative fees against respective properties for
collection as additional property tax

Upon motion by , and seconded by
, the vote was as follows:

AYES: NAYS ABSENT

Aldrich
Haverkamp
Lane

Miller
Quezada

Upon Roll Call thus recorded, the Resolution is declared adopted this 10"
day of November, 2015.

Louise From, Mayor
City of University Heights

ATTEST:



Christine M. Anderson, City Clerk

Steve/UH Resolutions/Resolution 15-XX re sidewalk project fee and invoicing 11 10 15



Building Zoning & Sanitation Committee
October 2015 Report ¢ By Silvia Quezada

Part 1.

(a) Grandview Condos Recycling.
* Grandview recycling launched October 5".
* Grandview Condo Association paid the City their $475 contribution towards the

recycling program. The remainder of the recycling costs will be submitted to the
Iowa DNR for the City to obtain reimbursement under the grant agreement.

(d) City Building Inspector Comments for October period:
At One University place the first building is underway have been doing a lot of footing
inspections, also | have started getting engineering reports from Terracon on the footing.

City Rental Inspector Comments for October Period:

The inspector raised concerns regarding the display of commercial banners and sale of
food items. I have requested the Rental Inspector refer to (i) Ordinance 79 Section
3(22) for homes displaying commercial banners and (ii) Ordinance 81 Section 4 for the
sales of food services to address these issues with properties engaged in these activities.
See also, Clerk’s report.



Prepared by: Terry Goerdt, Building Inspector, City of University Heights. 319-330-9806
ORDINANCE NO. 192

AN ORDINANCE PROVIDING FOR THE ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE,
2015 EDITION, INCLUDING APPENDIX K; ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL
CODE, 2015 EDITION, INCLUDING APPENDIX F AND APPENDIX J, AND PROVIDING FOR
CERTAIN AMENDMENTS TO THOSE CODES; ADOPTION OF THE STATE ELECTRICAL CODE
(IOWA CODE § 103.6(1)(A)); AND ADOPTION OF THE STATE PLUMBING AND MECHANICAL
CODES (IOWA CODE § 105.4(1)(A)); AND REPELAING ORDINANCE 147.

WHEREAS, the City’s current building code is the 2003 edition of the International Building Code (IBC) and
the International Residential Code (IRC), and the City should adopt the 2015 editions of those codes; and

WHEREAS, for purposes of uniformity throughout the State, the State Code has been amended to require all
local jurisdictions to adopt the State Plumbing and Mechanical Codes by December 31, 2016; and

WHEREAS, the fuel gas code is contained in the State Plumbing Code; and
WHEREAS, for uniformity in greater Johnson County area, the City should adopt the State Electrical Code; and

WHEREAS, the purpose of this ordinance to provide for the protection of the health, welfare and safety of the
r ts of University Heights,

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY UNIVERSITY HEIGHTS
Section .

(A) Codes Adopted: Subject to the following amendments, the 2015 edition of the international building code
(IBC) including Appendix K, electrical administrative process, and 2015 edition of the international residential code (IRC)
including Appendix F, radon control methods, and Appendix J, Existing Buildings And Structures, are adopted.

(B) Additionally, the City further adopts Section 103.6(1)(a) of the lowa Code (the lowa State Electrical Code),
Section 105.4(1)(a) of the lowa Code (the lowa State Mechanical Code), and Section 105.4(1)(a) of the lowa Code (the
lowa State Plumbing Code).

(C) Collectively, these codes shall be known and may be identified, in this Ordinance and elsewhere, as “the City
of University Heights Building Code” or the “Building Code”. Interpretations of the building official may be guided by
publications of the International Code Council, Inc., or the International Existing Building Code, or by such other and
further professional and regulatory publications and information as the building official in the official's reasonable
discretion deems prudent and appropriate.

(D) Interpretation of Building Code provisions: The provisions of the Building Code shall be held to be
the minimum requirements adopted for the protection of the health, safety and welfare of the residents of the City
of University Heights. Any higher standards in the state statute or City ordinance shall be applicable.

(E) Amendments to Code: The following sections of the 2015 edition of the international building code and 2015
edition of the international residential code are amended as follows:

(1) Section 101.1 of both the IBC and IRC. Delete Section 101.1 of both the IBC and IRC and insert in lieu
thereof the following:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of City of University Heights, hereinafter
referred to as "this code.”

(2) Section 105.2 of both the IBC and IRC. Delete Section 105.2 of both the IBC and IRC and insert in lieu
thereof the following:

105.2 Work Exempt from Permit. A permit shall not be required for the following:
Building

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and

1



3

similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 144 square feet provided the structure
is not located in a flood hazard area.

2. Fences not over 6 feet (1829 mm) high.
3. Oil derricks.

4. Retaining walls which are not over 4 feet (1219 mm) in height measured from the bottom of the
footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or impounding Class |, Il or lIl-A liquids.

5. Water tanks supported directly on grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons (18 925 L)
and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2 to 1.

6. Sidewalks and driveways not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above grade and not over any
basement or story below and which are not part of an accessible route.

7. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish work.
8. Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery.

9. Prefabricated swimming pools which are less than 24 inches deep, do not exceed 5,000 gallons and
are installed entirely above ground.

10. Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes and not including service
systems.

11. Swings and other playground equipment accessory to detached one- and two-family dwellings.

12. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall which do not project more than 54 inches (1372
mm) from the exterior wall and do not require additional support.

13. Movable cases, counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches (1753 mm) in height.

14. For structures regulated by the IRC the reapplication of shingles and roof sheathing provided:

a. Less than 50% of the structural sheathing is replaced and other structural alterations are not
required.

Note: Applying solid sheathing over space sheathing is not considered structural sheathing.
15. For structures regulated by the IRC replacing windows provided:

a. Replacement window(s) is in compliance with Appendix J.
16. For structures regulated by the IRC replacing exterior doors, including garage doors, provided:

a. Replacement door(s) is in compliance with Appendix J.
Note: screen and storm doors do not require a permit regardless of the location.

Electrical:

1. Portable motors or other portable appliances energized by means of a cord or cable having an
attachment plug end to be connected to an approved receptacle when that cord or cable is permitted by
this code.

2. Repair or replacement of fixed motors, transformers or fixed approved appliances of the same type
and rating in the same location.

3. Temporary decorative lighting.

4. Repair or replacement of current-carrying parts of any switch, contactor, control device or contact
device of the same type and/or rating.



5. Replacement of non-emergency over-current device of the required ampacity and interrupt rating in
the same location.

6. Repair or replacement of electrodes or transformers of the same size and capacity for signs or gas
tube systems.

7. Temporary wiring for experimental purposes in suitable experimental laboratories.
8. The wiring for temporary theater, motion picture or television stage sets.

4) Gas:
1. Portable heating, cooking or clothes drying appliances.

2. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment or make such equipment
unsafe.

(5) Portable-fuel-cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping system and are not
interconnected to a power grid.

Mechanical:
1. Portable heating appliances.

2. Portable ventilation appliances.
3. Portable cooling units.
4. Steam, hot- or chilled-water piping within any heating or cooling equipment regulated by this code.

5. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment or make such equipment
unsafe.

6. Portable evaporative coolers.

7. Self-contained refrigeration systems containing 10 pounds (4.54 kg) or less of refrigerant or that are
actuated by motors of 1 horsepower (746 W) or less.

8. Portable-fuel-cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping system and are not
interconnected to a power grid.

9. The replacement of fixed appliances provided however that the replacement appliance is in the same
location and has a rating equal to or less than the appliance being replaced, and it is not necessary to
remove, replace, alter, or install any additional ductwork or piping.

(6) Plumbing:

1. The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste or vent pipe; provided, however, that if any
concealed trap, drainpipe, water, soil, waste or vent pipe becomes defective and it becomes necessary
to remove and replace the same with new material, such work shall be considered as new work and a
permit shall be obtained and inspection made as provided in this code.

2. The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes, valves or fixtures, and the removal and
reinstallation of water closets, provided such repairs do not involve or require the replacement or
rearrangement of valves, pipes or fixtures.

3. The replacement or removal and reinstallation of any fixture or appliance, provided, however, that the
fixture or appliance is installed at the same location and it is not necessary to remove, replace, alter, or
install any piping. Exemption from the permit requirements of this Code shall not be deemed to grant
authorization for any work to be done in violation of the provisions of the Code or any other laws or
ordinances of this jurisdiction.

Exemption from the permit requirements of this Code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to
be done in a manner in violation of the provisions of this Code or any other laws or ordinances of this
jurisdiction.



. Modify Section 105.5 of both the IBC and IRC by adding a
sentence to the end as follows:

In no case shall the permit be effective unless the work covered by the permit has a documented inspection
every 6 months minimum and is completed within 24 months of the date on which the original permit
was issued.

(8) Section 105.8 of the IBC and R105.10 of the IRC. Add two new Sections 105.8 and 105.8.1 to the IBC
and R105.10 and R105.10.1 to the IRC as follows:

105.8(IBC) R105.10(IRC) Demolition permits required. A demolition permit shall be required as follows:
1.For the removal of any building or structure.

2. For the removal of any portion of a building (i.e. porch, porch railing, decorative brackets and trim,
dormers, chimneys, etc.)

105.8.1(IBC) and R105.10.1 Requirements. The applicant for any demolition permit shall state on the
application the proposed disposal plans for all demolition materials. No demolition permit shall be issued
until seven (7) working days after the date an application has been properly filed and said demolition
permit shall not be effective until applicant has posted the premises to be demolished with a notice to be
provided by the City and as directed by the City; provided, however, that accessory buildings as defined
in the City of University Heights Zoning Ordinance and dangerous buildings shall be exempt from said
notice and waiting requirement.

(9) Section 105.9 of the IBC and R105.11 of the IRC. Add two new Sections 105.9 to the IBC and
R105.11 to the IRC as follows:

105.9 (IBC) and R105.11 (IRC) Permittee:

1. An electrical, plumbing or mechanical permit may be issued to any person holding a valid master
license for the respective trade as described in Section 17-11-1 E of the City of Univsersity Heights Code,
or to any company who employs a duly licensed master in the respective trade on a full-time basis who
supervises the work of the apprentice and or journeymen during the company's normal business hours.

2. An electrical, plumbing or mechanical permit may be issued to the owner of an existing owner-
occupied single-family dwelling, pursuant to a valid certificate of occupancy and used exclusively for
residential purposes, to do any electrical work in connection with said dwelling and accessory buildings.
The owner must personally purchase all material and perform all labor in connection with the permit.

(10) Section 105.10 of the IBC and R105.12 of the IRC. Add two new Sections 105.10 to the IBC and
R105.12 to the IRC as follows:
105.10 (IBC) and R105.12 (IRC) Insurance:
Before any permit to perform electrical or plumbing work may be issued, the applicant shall have on file with the
building official a copy of a certificate of insurance stating the liability amounts of no less than three hundred
thousand dollars ($300,000.00) property damage and five hundred thousand dollars ($500,000.00) bodily injury.
The city shall be named as additional insured. The policy shall also provide for at least ten (10) days' notice by
the insurer to the city of termination of the policy by the insured or insurer. Electrical permits issued under
sections 105.9 (IBC) and R105.11 (ICR) 2 and 3 shall be exempted from this insurance requirement.

(Usection R107.3 of the IRC and Section 108.3 of the IBC. Amend Section R107.3 of the IRC and Section
108.3 of the IBC as follows:

R107.3 (IRC) 108.3 (IBC) Temporary Power: Replace the "NFPA 70" with "lowa State Electrical Code.".

(12) Section R108.2 of the IRC and Section 109.2 of the IBC. Delete Section R108.2 of the IRC and Section
109.2 of the IBC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

R108.2 (IRC) 109.2 (IBC) Permit Fees and Valuations. The fee for any permit shall be as set forth in the
permit fee schedule as established by resolution of the City Council. The determination of value or valuation
under any of the provisions of this Code shall be made by the Building Official. The value to be used in
computing the building permit and building plan review fees shall be the total value of all construction work

4



for which the permit is issued, as well as all finish work, painting, roofing, site grading, paving, landscaping,
elevators, and other permanent equipment. The value to be used in computing the value of construction
for reports shall be the total value of all construction work for which the permit is issued, as well as all
finish work, painting, roofing, electrical, plumbing, heating, air conditioning, site grading, paving,
landscaping, elevators, fire extinguisher systems and other permanent equipment.

FBection R108. 5 of the IRC and Section 109.6 of the IBC: Delete Section R108.5 in the IRC and Section
109.6 of the IBC and insert in lieu thereof the following:
R108.5 (IRC) 109.6 IBC Refunds: The Building Official may authorize the refunding of any fee paid
hereunder which was erroneously paid or collected. The Building Official shall not authorize the refunding
of any fee paid except upon written application filed by the original permittee within one hundred eighty
(180) days from the date of fee payment.

(14) Section R108.6 of the IRC and Section 109.4 of the IBC. Delete Section 108.6 of the IRC and Section

109.4 of the IBC and insert in lieu thereof the following:
R108.6 (IRC) 109.4 (IBC) Work commencing before permit issuance: Any person who commences
work on a building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system before obtaining the
necessary permits shall be subject to a fee equal to the amount of the permit fee plus a penalty of twice
the amount of the permit. This fee shall be collected whether or not a permit is issued. The payment
of such fee shall not exempt any person from compliance with all other provisions of this Code or
from any penalty prescribed by law. Only the Building Official may reduce this fee when it is
demonstrated that an emergency existed that required the work to be done without a permit.

(15) Section 202 of both the IBC and IRC. Add new definition as follows:

Authority Having Jurisdiction. The organization, office, or individual
responsible for approving equipment, materials, an installation, or a
procedure.

(16) Section 202 of both the IBC and IRC. Add new definition as follows:

Chief Electrical Inspector. A building inspector who either is the authority having jurisdiction or is designated by
the authority having jurisdiction and is responsible for administering the requirements of this code.

(17) Section 202 of both the IBC and IRC. Add new definition as follows:

Electrical Inspector. A building inspector authorized to perform electrical inspections.

(18) Section 202 of both the IBC and IRC. Add new definition as
follows:

Emergency Communications Center. Shall mean the Johnson County Emergency Communications
Center.

(19) Section 202 of the IBC and IRC. Modify definitions as follows:

Habitable space: Add a sentence to the end of the definition of habitable space or room to read as follows:
Basement areas finished to a degree to encourage their use as anything other than storage or mechanical
rooms shall be considered habitable space.

(20) Section R202 of the IRC. Delete definition of Accessory Structure and insert in lieu thereof the
following: ACCESSORY STRUCTURE. See Zoning Definitions in the City Code.

(21) Table R301.2 (1) of the IRC Modify by inserting data in the table as

follows:
Wind Design Subject to Damage From Flood Hazards
Ground Speed Topographic effects, Seismic Winter Ice-Barrier Air Mean
Snow Design Weathering Frost Termite Design Underlaymen NFIP FIRM Freezing
line " Maps
Load (mph) Special wind region, or Category Temp t Required P Annual




Wind-borne debris zone depth Index Temp

Moderate
25 115 No A Severe 42" H -5°F Yes 5/22/77 2/16/07 2000 50°F
eavy

(22) Section R302.5.1 of the IRC. Delete Section R302.5.1 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

R302.5.1 Opening protection. Openings from a private garage directly into a room used for sleeping purposes
shall not be permitted. Other openings between the garage and residence shall be equipped with solid wood
doors not less than 1 3/8 inches (35 mm) in thickness, solid or honeycombcore steel doors not less than 1 3/8
inches (35 mm) thick, or 20-minute fire-rated doors.

(23) Section R302.13 of the IRC. Delete Section R302.13 of the IRC entirely.

(24) Section R304.1 of the IRC. Delete Section R304.1 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

R304.1 Minimum area. Habitable rooms shall have a floor area of not less than 70 square feet .
Exception: Kitchens.

(25) Section R310.6 of the IRC. Delete Section R310.6 in the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

R310.6 Alterations or repairs of basements in structures built after May 10, 1989. An emergency escape and
rescue opening is not required where existing basements undergo alterations or repairs.

Alterations or repairs in structures built prior to May 10, 1989 shall conform to Appendix J Section AJ102.4
Replacement windows.

Exception: New sleeping rooms created in an existing basement shall be provided with emergency escape and
rescue openings in accordance with Section R310.1.

(26) Section R312.2 of the IRC and 1015.8 of the IBC. Delete Section R312.2 of the IRC and 1015.8 of the IBC
entirely.

(27) Section R313 of the IRC: Delete Section R313 of the IRC entirely.

(28) Section R320.2 of the IRC. Add Section R320.2 in the IRC as follows:

R320.2 Accessibility for projects other than those mentioned in Section R320.1.

R 320.2.1 Scope. The provisions of this section are enacted to implement universal design features that provide
accessibility, usability and visit-ability for all.

R320.2.2 Definition. Public funds shall mean funding or assistance from the City of University Heights or any
agent thereof through any of the following means:

1. a building contract or similar contractual agreement involving a City-funded program or fund;
2. any real estate received by the owner through a subsidy, lease, or donation by the City or its agents;

3. preferential tax treatment, bond assistance, mortgage assistance, or similar financial advantages
from the City or its agents;

4. disbursement of federal or state construction funds including a Community Development Block
Grant; or

5. a City contract to provide funding or a financial benefit for housing.
R320.2.3 Applicability. The amendment applies to new one- and two-family dwellings and is not required for
new townhouses, accessory apartments or existing structures for repairs, alterations, change of occupancy or
additions unless the square footage of the addition is more than 25% of the existing structure, then, the addition
must comply.
Exception: Applies to new townhouses constructed using public funds.

The minimum usability requirements are as follows:

6



1. Step-less Entrance: At least one building entrance must be designed, without encroaching into any required
parking space, that complies with the City of University Heights Building Code standard for an accessible
entrance on an accessible route served by a ramp in accordance with section R311.8 or a no-step entrance. The
accessible route must extend from a vehicular drop-off, or parking to a building entrance. The entry door
must have a minimum net clear opening of thirty-two inches (32").

Exception:

1. If public funds are used the step-less entrance must be provided.

2. The building official may waive this requirement based upon the determination that strict compliance is
financially or environmentally impractical. Split-level and townhouse style homes may be exempted.

2. Interior doors: At least one bedroom and one bathroom (if either are provided) and
all other passage doorway header widths, on the level served by the designed step-less entrance,
must be framed toaccommodate a minimum 38" clear rough opening. The framing for the doorway

width opening may be reduced to accommodate any door size.

Exception:

1.If public funds are used the minimum door clear opening shall be thirty-two inches (32") when the door
is open ninety degrees (90 ), measured between the face of the door and the opposite stop.

2.Doors serving closets twenty-four inches (24") or less in depth need not be framed to 38" clear opening
width.

Note: A 34" door hung in the standard manner provides an acceptable 32" opening.

3. Sanitation facilities: There must be at least one bathroom containing a water closet (toilet) and
lavatory (sink) on the level of the dwelling to be accessed by the designed step-less entrance. The room
shall have a minimum thirty inches (30") by forty-eight inches (48") clear floor space at the water closet and
lavatory. The clear floor space can be shared by both fixtures. The clear floor space shall not be obstructed
by a doorway swing.

The plans must show a shower, bathtub or combination tub/shower can be provided within the room or an
adjoining room without removing part of the concrete floor to provide necessary plumbing to the future plumbing
fixture(s).

Exception:

1.If public funds are used a shower, bathtub or combination tub/shower shall be provided within the room.

2.Doors may swing into the clear floor space provided at any fixture if sufficient maneuvering space is provided
within the room for a person using a wheelchair or other mobility aid to enter and close the door, use the
fixtures, reopen the door and exit. Maneuvering space may include any knee space or toe space available
below bathroom fixtures.

3.The building official may waive this requirement based on the determination that strict compliance is
financially impractical.

4._Wall Reinforcement: A bathroom must be provided with wood blocking installed within wall framing to
support grab bars as needed. The wood blocking, when measured to the center, will be located between
thirty-three inches (33") and thirty-six inches (36") above the finished floor. The wood blocking must be
located in all walls adjacent to and behind a toilet.

Exception: Backing is not required behind pre-manufactured showers and bathtubs.

5. Decks: All exterior decks and patios surfaces adjacent to the level served by the designed step-less
entrance must be built within four inches (4") of the dwellings finish floor level. Decks shall be a minimum 50%
the size of a patio that is served by level served by the designed step-less entrance.



6. Switch and outlet requirements: All wall switches, controlling light fixtures, fans, all temperature
control devices and all receptacles shall be located in an area between fifteen (15) and forty-eight (48) inches
above finished floor. The height will be determined by measuring from the finished floor to the center of the
device. When the control or receptacle placement is prohibited by the height of the window or design feature,
alternative locations may be approved by the building official.

7. Electrical panel requirements: Electrical panels on the level of the dwelling to be accessed by the
designed step-less entrance shall be located so that the individual circuit breakers are located between 15"
and 54 " above the floor.

8. Garages: Must be wired for power operated overhead

(29) Section R326 of the IRC. Delete Section R326 of the IRC entirely.

(30) Section R403.1.4.1 of the IRC. Modify by deleting all exceptions and inserting in lieu thereof the

following:
Exceptions:
1. One story detached accessory buildings of wood or steel frame construction not used for human occupancy
and not exceeding one thousand (1,000) square feet in floor area may be constructed using slab on grade
construction as follows. The slab shall be three and one half inches thick, poured monolithically with
thickened perimeter footings extending twelve inches (12") below finish grade and be twelve inches (12")
wide at the base. The top of the foundation shall not be less than six inches (6") above finish grade.
Reinforcement of the slab, including the thickened portion, shall be minimum 6x6-10/10 welded wire
mesh, #4 deformed reinforcing bars at twenty four inches (24") on center each way or fiber mesh reinforced
concrete.

2. One-story wood or metal frame building not used for human occupancy and not over 200 square feet in
floor area may be constructed with walls supported on a wood foundation plate or "skids" when approved
by the building official.

3. Decks not supported by the structure need not be provided with footings that extend below the frost line.

(31) Section R404.1.1 of the IRC: Amend Section R404.1.1 of the IRC by adding an Exception after number 2 as follows:

Exception: Foundation walls with unbalanced lateral forces created by finish grade, i.e. walkout basements which
are exempt from the lowa Architectural Act shall be designed by a licensed structural engineer or constructed in
accordance with the Table R404.1.1(5) and diagram as follows:



T
Table R401.1.1(5)
b
CB = Corner Bars
5 = Span of Wall
T =Thickness
D = 4 Offset _ I
— ' . 2" Minimum Inside Face of
D ! s Wall to edge of reinforting
) [ - )
ey | s [y )
cB &" & 12" Foundation Walls 7 : T
A Provide corner bars to match harizontal
foundation wall reinforcing into wall 2'
T J
Span Wall Thickness |  Horizontal | Corner Bar 4
() m Relnforcing (cB) = See Schedule for
10 or less 8" 44 @ 12" 20" /_ Horizontal Reinforcing
10' 0 12 8" 5 @ 12" 2-6" 1
1210 14' L3 i@ 127 30 #4 Reinforcing Vertical
14'to 16 12" i5 @ 12° 2'-6" 39" 0.0 TYDiC&l
16' to 18' 12" #6 @ 14" 3-0°
18'to 20 12" 6 @ 12" 3'-0" .
! #4 Reinforcing Dow
P
— g
Frost Wall & Footing [Walkout) R
Naotes:
1. Corner Bars are required in addition to horizontal reinforcing.
2. All Corner Bar reinforcing splices shall be lapped a minimum of 24*,
3. If span (S) is greater than 16", the minimum dimension of (D) shall be &',

(32) Section R404.1.3 of the IRC. Modify Section R404.1.3 by adding a second paragraph as follows:

Wall thickness may be reduced to eight inches (8") if a minimum of three (3) one-half inch diameter
deformed ASTM A615 grade 40 steel bars are placed horizontally at the center of the wall thickness with
one bar located within 14" of the top, one bar within 14" of the bottom and one bar located within 14" of the
mid-height of the wall provided the wall height does not exceed eight feet (8").

(33) Section 423.4 of the IBC. Delete Section 423.4 in its entirety and insert in lieu thereof the following:

Group E occupancies. In areas where the shelter design wind speed for tornados is 250 MPH in
accordance with Figure 304.2(1) of ICC 500, all new Group E occupancies shall have a storm shelter
constructed in accordance with ICC 500. The shelter shall be capable of housing the total occupant load of
the Group E occupancy or as required by 661-301 of the lowa State Building Code, whichever is more
restrictive.

Exceptions:
1. Group E day care facilities.
2. Group E occupancies accessory to places of religious worship.
3. Buildings meeting the requirements for shelter design in ICC 500.

4. Portable buildings.

(34) Section 501.2 of the IBC (F). Modify by inserting the following after the second sentence:

From 100-199 feet from the street the number shall be a minimum of 6 inches high with a minimum stroke
of 0.5 inches. From 200-299 feet from the street the numbers shall be a minimum 8 inches high with a
minimum stroke of 0.5 inches. For each additional 100 feet from the street, the number shall increase
by an additional 2 inches in height. Measurements to determine the minimum number size shall be measured
from the approved address location to the center line of the street for which the premises is addressed.

9



(35) Section R703.2 of the IRC. Modify by deleting the last sentence in the paragraph.

(36) Section R807.1 of the IRC. Modify by adding a sentence at the end of the second paragraph as follows:

The opening shall not be located in a closet, bathroom, mechanical room, laundry room, or similar room or
location.

(37) Section 903.2.2 of the IBC (F). Delete Section 903.2.2 of the IBC and replace with:

903.2.2 Group B ambulatory health care facilities. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed
throughout all fire areas containing a Group B ambulatory health care facility occupancy.

(38) Section 903.3.5.3 of the IBC (F). Add a new Section 903.3.5.3 in the IBC to read as follows:

903.3.5.3 Water supply safety margin. Provide a minimum 10%, but not less than 5 psi, safety margin
above static pressure in the fire protection system hydraulic calculation.

(39) Section 903.4.2 of the IBC (F). Delete Section 903.4.2 of the IBC and replace with:

903.4.2. Alarms. An approved weatherproof horn/strobe device shall be mounted directly above the
fire department connection between seven (7) and ten (10) feet in height above grade. The water-
flow alarm device shall be activated by water flow equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the
smallest orifice size installed in the system. Approved and supervised audible visual notification
appliances shall be installed on each level of the interior of the building as required by the fire code official
and NFPA 72.

(40) Section 903.6 of the IBC (F). Add a new Section 903.6 to the IBC to read as
follows:

903.6 Zones. Automatic sprinkler system zones shall not exceed the area permitted by NFPA 13 or
NFPA 13R and shall provide a sprinkler control valve and water flow device for each normally occupied floor

(41) Section 906.1 of the IBC (F). Delete the exception without substitution.

(42) Section 906.3 of the IBC (F). Add a sentence to the end of the section to read as
follows:

The minimum rating of any required portable fire extinguisher for Class A, Class B, or Class C
hazard shall be 2-10 B C

(43) Section 907.2 of the IBC (F). Delete the section and replace
with:

907.2 Where required-new buildings and structures. An approved and addressable fire alarm system
installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided in new buildings
and structures in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.23 and provide occupant notification in
accordance with 907.5, unless other requirements are provided by another section of this code.

A minimum of one manual fire alarm box shall be provided in an approved location to initiate a fire
alarm signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or water-flow detection devices.
Where other sections of this code allow elimination of fire alarm boxes due to sprinklers, a single fire
alarm box shall be installed.

EXCEPTION:

1. The manual fire alarm box is not required for fire alarm systems dedicated to elevator recall
control and supervisory service.

(44) Section 907.2.1 of the IBC (F). Delete the "exception" in Section 907.2.1 in its entirety and insert in lieu
thereof the following exceptions:

EXCEPTION:

10



1) Except for Group A-2 occupancies with occupant loads of 200 or more, manual fire alarm boxes
are not required where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system and the
alarm notification appliances will activate upon sprinkler water flow.

2) Group A-2. An automatic/manual fire alarm system shall be installed in Group A-2 occupancies
with and occupant load of 200 or more. Activation of the fire alarm shall additionally
cause:

a. lllumination of the protected premises to not less than 10 foot-candles over the area of the
room at a height of 30 inches above the floor; and

b. All conflicting or confusing sounds and visual distraction to automatically stop.

(45) Section 907.2.3 of the IBC (F). Modify by adding a sentence to the end of the first paragraph as
follows:

New and existing educational occupancies shall have a monitored fire alarm system.

(46) Section 907.2.3 of the IBC (F). Modify by adding a 4' exception as
follows:

4, Day care occupancies classified as Group E Occupancy shall not require a monitored fire alarm
system unless required elsewhere in the code.

(47) Section 907.2.11.2 of the IBC. Modify by adding a fourth location requirement as follows:

4. Supervised smoke alarms shall be installed in all common corridors and at the top and bottom of all
stairway enclosures in Groups R-2, R-4 and 1-1 occupancies. In corridors, detectors shall be located
within fifteen (15) feet of the end of the corridor and in such a way that one detector is located for each
thirty (30) feet of corridor length or spaced as allowed by the code.

(48) Section 907.4.2 of the IBC. Modify by adding a sentence to the end of the section to read as follows:

Where in the opinion of the code official manual fire alarm boxes may be used to cause false fire
alarms, the code official is authorized to modify the requirements for manual fire alarm boxes.

(49) Section 907.6.4 of the IBC (F). Modify by deleting the exception and inserting in lieu thereof the following
exception:

Exception: Automatic sprinkler system zones shall not exceed the area permitted by NFPA 13 and
shall provide a sprinkler control valve and waterflow device for each normally occupied
floor.

(50) Section 907.6.4.3 of the IBC (F). Add a section to read as
follows:

Section 907.6.4.3 Zone and address location labeling. Fire alarm and/or annunciator panels shall have all
zones and address points plainly and permanently labeled as to their location on the outside of the panel
or on an easily readable map of the building.

(51) Section 907.6.6 of the IBC (F). Modify Section 907.6.6 by adding two sentences to the end as follows:

Each address point identification, shall have an alpha/numeric descriptor location. Alpha/numeric
descriptor locations are required to be reported to the Emergency Communications Center upon activation
of supervisory and/or alarm conditions as specified by the fire code official.

(52) Section 910.2 of the IBC (F). Delete exception 2 without substitution.

(53) Section 910.3.2.2 of the IBC (F). Delete Section 910.3.2.2 and replace with:

910.3.2.2 Sprinklered buildings. Where installed in buildings provided with an approved automatic
sprinkler system, smoke and heat vents shall be designed to operate automatically by actuation of
a heat- responsive device rated at least 100 degrees F (38 degrees C) above the operating temperature

11



of the sprinkler.
Exception: Gravity-operated drop-out vents complying with Section 910.3.2.1.

EGSection 912.6 of the IBC (F). Add a new section 912.6 to the IBC to read as follows:

912.6 Size. Minimum fire department connection size shall be 21?2 inch National Standard Thread.

(55) Section 912.7 of the IBC (F). Add a new section 912.7 to the IBC to read as follows:

912.7 Water supply. Fire department connections shall be located not more than 100 feet from a
hydrant and both the fire department connection and hydrant shall be located on the same side of
the fire department access or as approved by the fire code official.

(56) Section 1011.3 of the IBC. Modify by adding a third exception as follows:

EXCEPTION:

3. Stairs within individual dwelling units of Residential Group R occupancies that existed prior to
8/28/02 (adoption of the 2000 IRC) are permitted a 78-inch (6’-6”) headroom clearance.

(57) 1015.8 of the IBC. Delete Section 1015.8 of the IBC entirely.

@Section 1023.4 of the IBC. Modify Section 1023.4 by adding a fourth unnumbered paragraph as follows:

Fire door assemblies that provide access to a non-pressurized interior exit of R-2 occupancies shall also be
automatic closing by actuation of a smoke detector.

(59) Section 1029.2 of the IBC (F). Modify by adding two new exceptions as follows: EXCEPTION:

1) Except for Group A-2, in assembly occupancies where there is no well-defined main exit or
where multiple main exits are provided, exits shall be permitted to be distributed around the perimeter
of the building provided that the total width of egress is not less than 100 percent of the required width.

2) The main entrance/exit of A-2 occupancies shall be of a width that accommodates not less than
two-thirds of the total occupant load

(60) Section 1030.1 of the IBC. Modify by deleting the exceptions and inserting in lieu thereof the following:

EXCEPTIONS:

1. The emergency escape and rescue opening is permitted to open onto a balcony within an atrium
in accordance with the requirements of Section 404 provided the balcony provides access to an exit
and the dwelling unit or sleeping room has a means of egress that is not open to the atrium.

2. Regardless of what Tables 1006.3.2(1) and 1006.3.2(2) allow, all group R-2 occupancies other than
hotels and motels must be provided with emergency escape & rescue openings.

3. Emergency escape and rescue openings are not required from basements or sleeping rooms

that have an exit door or exit access door that opens directly into a public way or to a yard, court or
exterior exit balcony that opens to a public way.

(61) Section 1030.3 of the IBC. Modify by adding an exception as follows:

EXCEPTION: For emergency escape and rescue openings required for the remodeling or finishing of
space in an existing basement, the maximum sill height may be measured from an elevated landing
not less than 36 inches wide, not less than 18 inches out from the interior finish of the exterior wall and
not more than 24 inches in height. The landing shall be permanently affixed to the floor below and
the wall under the window it serves.

(62) Section 1030.6 of the IBC. Add a new Section 1030.6 to the IBC to read as follows:

Section 1030.6. Emergency escape windows under decks and porches. Emergency escape windows
12



are allowed to be installed under decks and porches provided the location of the deck allows the
emergency escape window to be fully opened and provides a path not less than 36 inches in height to a
yard or court.

(63) Chapter 11 of the IRC. Delete Chapter 11 in its entirety and insert in lieu thereof the following:

Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency, Section N1101. Energy efficiency for the design and construction of
building regulated by this code shall be as required by 661-303 of the lowa State Administrative Code.

(64) Chapter 11 of the IBC. Delete Chapter 11 in its entirety and insert in lieu thereof the following:

Chapter 11 Accessibility, Section 1101. Buildings or portions of buildings shall be accessible to persons
with disabilities as required by 661-302 of the lowa State Administrative Code.

(65) Section 1209.2 of the IBC. Modify by adding a second unnumbered paragraph as follows:

1209.2 Attic spaces. The opening shall be located in a corridor, hallway, or other readily accessible location.
The opening shall not be located in a closet, bathroom, mechanical room, laundry room, or similar room or
location. Attics with a maximum vertical height of less than thirty inches need not be provided with access
openings.

(66) Chapter 13 of the IBC. Delete Chapter 13 in its entirety and insert in lieu thereof the following:

Chapter 13 Energy Efficiency, Section 1301. Energy efficiency for the design and construction of
building regulated by this code shall be as required by 661-303 of the lowa State Administrative Code.

(67) Section G2406.2 (303.3) of the IRC. Prohibited locations of the IRC. Modify by deleting exceptions 3 and 4.

(68) Section G2415.3 (404.3) of the IRC. Prohibited locations of the IRC. . Modify by deleting the last sentence.

(69) Part VIl Plumbing, Chapters 25 through 33 inclusive of the IRC. Delete Part VII Plumbing Chapters
25 through 33 inclusive of the IRC and insert the following:

Part VII Plumbing, Chapter 25

Section P2501 GENERAL

P2501.1 Scope. Plumbing systems shall comply with the lowa State Plumbing Code.

Administrative Provisions. The Plumbing Code shall be administered in accordance with administrative
provisions in chapter 1 of this code as amended.

(70) Chapter 27 of the IBC. Delete Chapter 27 of the IBC and insert the following:

Chapter 27 Electrical
Section 2701.1 Scope. Electrical systems shall comply with the lowa State Electrical Code.

Administrative Provisions. The Electrical Code shall be administered in accordance with administrative
provisions in chapter 1 of this code as amended and Appendix K as amended.

(71) Chapter 28 of the IBC. Delete chapter 28 of the IBC and insert the following:

Chapter 28 Mechanical Systems

Section 2801.1 Scope. Mechanical systems shall comply the lowa State Mechanical Code with the following
amendments:.

Administrative Provisions. The Mechanical Code shall be administered in accordance with administrative
provisions in chapter 1 of this code as amended.

Commercial Kitchen Hood Exhaust Termination:

In addition to the code requirements for commercial kitchen hood exhaust terminations locations, the following
shall apply:
13



For new construction, change in occupancy or change in use, that requires a new commercial kitchen hood or
revisions to an existing commercial kitchen hood, the new or existing commercial kitchen hood exhaust duct
shall terminate as follows:

1. Above the roof level without passing through an exterior wall; or
2. Through an alley facing exterior wall provided the termination is above the roof level; or

3. Toan alley right of way per 3202.3.2 of the International Building Code.

(72) Chapter 29 of the IBC. Delete Chapter 29 of the IBC and insert the following

Chapter 29 Plumbing Systems

Section 2901.1 Scope. Plumbing systems shall comply with the lowa State Plumbing Code.
Administrative Provisions. The Plumbing Code shall be administered in accordance with administrative
provisions in chapter 1 of this code as amended.

(73) Section 3002.4 of the IBC. Delete Section 3002.4 of the IBC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

3002.4 Elevator car to accommodate ambulance stretcher.

In buildings four or more stories above, or four or more stories below, grade plane, at least one
elevator shall be provided for fire department emergency access to all floors. The elevator car shall be
of such a size and arrangement to accommodate an ambulance stretcher 24 inches by 84 inches (610
mm by 2134 mm) with not less than 5-inch (127 mm) radius corners, in the horizontal, open position
and shall be identified by the international symbol for emergency medical services (star of life). The
symbol shall not be less than 3 inches (76 mm) high and shall be placed inside on both sides of the
hoistway door frame.

(74) Part VIII Electrical, Chapters 34 through 43 inclusive of the IRC. Delete Part VIII Electrical Chapters
34 through 43 inclusive of the IRC and insert the following:

Part VIII Electrical, Chapter 34

Section E3401 GENERAL

E3401.1 Applicability. Electrical systems shall comply with the lowa State Electrical Code.
(75) (Appendix K of the IBC.)

(76) Section K103.2 of the IBC. Work exempt from permit. Delete Section K103.2 in the IBC and insert in lieu
thereof the following:

Section K103.2 Work exempt from permit. See section 105.2 in both the IRC and IBC.

(77) Section K106.5 of the IBC. Add a new Section K106. 5 as follows:

Section K106. 5 Energy Connections; An electrical system or equipment regulated by this code for which a
permit is required shall not be connected to a source of energy or power until approved by the building
official.

(78) Section K106.6 of the IBC. Add a new Section K106. 6 as follows:

Section K106. 6 Temporary Energy Connections. The building official may authorize the temporary
connection of the electrical system or equipment to the source of energy or power for the purpose of testing
the equipment, or for use under a temporary certificate of occupancy.

(79) (Appendix J of the IRC.)

(80) Section AJ102.4 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ102.4 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

14



AJ102.4 Replacement windows and doors. Regardless of the category of work, where an existing window or
door, including the sash and glazed portion, or safety glazing is replaced, the replacement window, door or
safety glazing shall comply with the requirements of Sections AJ102.4.1 through AJ102.4.3, as applicable.

(81) Section AJ102.4.1 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ102.4.1 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

AJ102.4.1 Energy efficiency. Replacement windows or doors shall comply with the requirements of Chapter 11.

(82) Section AJ102.4.4 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ102.4.4 of the IRC entirely.

(83) Section AJ501.7 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ501.7 and insert in lieu thereof the following:

AJ501.7 Ceiling height. Habitable spaces created in existing basements or attics shall have ceiling heights of
not less than 6 feet, 8 inches (2032 mm), except that the ceiling height at obstructions shall be not less than 6
feet 4 inches (1930 mm) from the basement or attic floor. Existing finished ceiling heights in nonhabitable
spaces in basements or attics shall not be reduced.

(84) Section AJ501.8.1 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ501.8.1 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

AJ501.8.1 Stair width. Existing basement and attic stairs and handrails not otherwise being altered or modified
shall be permitted to maintain their current clear width at, above and below existing handrails.

(85) Section AJ501.8.2 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ501.8.2 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

AJ501.8.2 Stair headroom. Headroom height on existing basement or attic stairs being altered or modified shall
not be reduced below the existing stairway or attic finished headroom. Existing basement or attic stairs not
otherwise being altered shall be permitted to maintain the current finished headroom.

(86) Section AJ501.8.3 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ501.8.3 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

AJ501.8.3 Stair landing. Landings serving existing basement or attic stairs being altered or modified shall not
be reduced below the existing stairway landing depth and width. Existing basement or attic stairs not otherwise
being altered shall be permitted to maintain the current landing depth and width.

(87) Section AJ601.4 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ601.4 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

AJ601.4 Ceiling height. Habitable spaces created in existing basements and attics shall have ceiling heights of
not less than 6 feet, 8 inches (2032 mm), except that the ceiling height at obstructions shall be not less than 6
feet 4 inches (1930 mm) from the basement or attic floor. Existing finished ceiling heights in nonhabitable
spaces in basements or attics shall not be reduced.

SECTION Il. REPEALER. Ordinance No. is hereby repealed.

SECTION Il CONFLICTS. If any section, provision or part of the Ordinance, as now existing or as hereafter
amended, conflicts with the University Heights Zoning Ordinance, Ordinance No. 79, or the University Heights
Rental Housing Code, Ordinance No. 110, as either now exists or is hereafter amended, such conflicts will be
resolved by applying and enforcing the more stringent or more restrictive provision or provisions.

SECTION IV. SEVERABILITY. If any section, provision or part of the Ordinance shall be adjudged to be invalid or
unconstitutional, such adjudication shall not affect the validity of the Ordinance as a whole or any section, provision
or part thereof not adjudged invalid or unconstitutional.

SECTION V. EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ordinance shall be in effect after final passage, approval and publication as
provided by law.

15



Passed and approved this day of , 2016.

MAYOR

ATTEST:

CITY CLERK

Approved by

City Attorney's Office

16



October 29, 2015

o  Construction updates

October 22, 2015

University Heights November 2015 eGovernment Report

o Construction Updates page

October 20, 2015

o Zoning commission meeting

October 19, 2015

o Trick or treat date change

October 16, 2015

o  October council meeting webstream

October 14, 2015

o Leaf vacuuming dates, trick or treating

October 12, 2015

o Council meeting agenda and attachments

October 11, 2015

o Council agendas/minutes

Monthly Statistics from Stat Counter

Page Views Unique Visits 15t Time Visits Returning Visits
1,590 1196 858 338 Total
52 39 28 11| Average

Monthly Statistics from Webalyzer

Hits per Hour 85
Hits per Day 2042
Pages per Day 437
Total Visits 7213
Total Unique User Agents 1116
Average Visits Per Day 232

U-H Website Twitter Statistics October 1- 30, 2015

Tweets 8
Re-tweets 1
Followers 76



http://university-heights.blogspot.com/2013/02/february-5-2013.html
http://university-heights.blogspot.com/2013/02/february-5-2013.html
http://university-heights.blogspot.com/2013/02/february-5-2013.html
http://university-heights.blogspot.com/2013/02/february-5-2013.html
http://university-heights.blogspot.com/2013/02/february-5-2013.html
http://university-heights.blogspot.com/2013/02/february-5-2013.html

	00 Agenda- Nov. 10 2015
	01 Mayor Report
	02 UHAttyRept November 2015
	03 Clerk Report - November 2015
	05 financial reportUSE
	06 University Heights Budget Timeline
	07 Treas october
	08 Warrants
	09 POLICE REPORT
	10 Streets November ’15 report
	11 Ordinance 190
	12 Ordinance 191 re open spaces 090815
	13 Streets UH Sign Inventory
	14 Engineer-Report-2015-11
	15 Resolution 15-73 sidewalk
	17 BZS_100715-pdf
	18 Ordinance 192
	19 15-11eGovReport-1

