City of University Heights, Iowa
City Council Meeting

Tuesday, December 15, 2015
Horn School Library room

600 Koser Ave.

7:00-9:00pm.

Meeting called by Mayor Louise From

Time

7:00 Call to Order Meeting

Administration

-Mayor

-City Attorney

-City Clerk

Committee Reports:

Finance

Community Protection

Topic

Roll Call
-Approval of Minutes-October 13t
-Approval of Minutes- November 10th

Public Input

-One University Place (OUP) construction
report and updates.

-Discussion and consideration of request by
One University Place developer to divide
the OUP development site into two parcels.
-Consideration of Resolution No. 15-75
authorizing the Mayor to sign and the Clerk
to attest a Memorandum of
Understanding Addendum to the City’s
Agreement with the National Development
Council regarding records retention.

Mayor’s Report

-Consideration of Resolution No. 15-76/
authorizing the Mayor to provide the City of
Coralville six (6) months’ written notice of
the City of University Heights' intention to
terminate the 28E Agreement for Fire
Protection Services effective July 1,
2016. A new 28E Agreement will be
entered into with the City of Iowa City for
these services.

Legal Report
City Clerk Report

Committee Report
-Budget 2016-2017 Update

Treasurer’s Report/ Payment of Bills

Police Chief Report

Owner

Louise From

Public Comments

Jeff Maxwell/Kevin Monson

Silvia Quezada

Louise From

Steve Ballard

Chris Anderson

Jim Lane

Lori Kimura

Chief Ken Stanley



Time

Streets and Sidewalks

Building, Zoning & Sanitation

e-Government

Announcements

9:00 Adjournment

Topic Owner

Committee Report

-Consideration of Resolution No. 15-77
extending and continuing the employment
of Police Chief Kenneth Stanley.
-Consideration of Resolution No. 15-78
authorizing the Mayor to sign and the Clerk
to attest a 28E Agreement with the City of
Cedar Rapids permitting University Heights
Police Officers to ride along and otherwise
train with Cedar Rapids Police Department
Officers and employees.

Committee Report

-Consider waiving the $100 extra fee for
sidewalk repair for 230 Koser Ave.

Sign Audit Review

Carla Aldrich/M.
Haverkamp

Virginia Miller

Josiah Bilskemper
Engineer Report

Committee Report

-Second Consideration of Ordinance No.
192, Adopting the 2015 International
Building Code, Plumbing Code, Electrical
Code, Residential Code, and Property
Maintenance Code with amendments.

- Consideration of Motion to Accept Dorothy
“Dotti” Maher resignation from the
University Heights Board of Adjustment
effective December 31, 2015.

Silvia Quezada

-Zoning Commission Chair report
-Board of Adjustment Chair report

Committee Report

Pat Yeggy
Dorothy Dotti Maher

Mike Haverkamp

Anyone

Recommendation of City Attorney to meet
in closed session pursuant to Iowa Code
Sec. 21.5(1) to discuss strategy with
counsel in matters in litigation where its
disclosure would be likely to prejudice or
disadvantage the position of the City.

Reconvene to open session

Louise From

Next Regular City Council Meeting is January 12, 2016: Location to be announced.



RESOLUTION NO. 15-75

RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO SIGN A MEMORANDUM OF
UNDERSTANDING ADDENDUM WITH NATIONAL DEVELOPMENT COUNCIL
REQUIRING NDC TO RETAIN RECORDS FOR FIVE YEARS.

RESOLVED that the Mayor of the City of University Heights is authorized
to sign a Memorandum of Agreement Addendum with National Development
Council in the form set forth in Exhibit “A” attached.

Upon motion by , and seconded by
, the vote was as follows:

AYES NAYS ABSENT

Aldrich
Haverkamp
Lane

Miller
Quezada

Upon Roll Call thus recorded, the Resolution is declared adopted this 15"
day of December, 2015.

Louise From, Mayor
City of University Heights

ATTEST:

Christine M. Anderson, City Clerk

Steve/UH Resolutions/Resolution 15-75 authorizing mayor to sign NDC MOU re retaining records 12 15 15



TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE AGREEMENT

This Technical Assistance Agreement (this “Agreement”) is made and entered into this
14" day of April, 2015, by and between the City of University Heights (CITY), an lowa municipal
corporation, the City office of which is located at 1004 Melrose Avenue in University Heights,
lowa 52246 (hereinafter called "Client") and NATIONAL DEVELOPMENT COUNCIL a New
York non-profit corporation, which is a tax-exempt organization under Section 501(c}{(3) of the
Internal Revenue Code , whose address is 708 3" Avenue, Suite 710 New York, New York

10017 (hereinafter called "NDC")
WITNESSETH:

WHEREAS, Client has determined that it needs the professional services of an advisor
to work with Client to assist it in achieving its pullic goals of developing and implementing
community and economic programs, and

WHEREAS, NDC is willing to provide, on such terms and conditions as are hereinafter
provided, technical assistance to Client utilizing its expertise in economic and community
development activities.

NOW THEREFORE, Client and NDC do hereby agree as follows:
I SCOPE OF SERVICES

The Client acknowledges that NDC regularly performs services for various clients located
across the United States. The purpose of this Agreement is to set forth the terms upon which
NDC will provide Client with assistance it has requested which is generally described as
technical assistance and professional services. NDC agrees to perform such services as are
requested from time to time by Cliert and to provide such services as it deems necessary to
accomplish the goals requested. Exhibit A attached hereto and made a part of this Agreement,
fully describes the services to be provided toClient upon its request by NDC. In performing the
requested services, NDC shall consult with officers and employees ofClient and shall meet, as
appropriate, with such representatives or other entities when necessary, including without
limitation, State and Federal officials and other local organizations.

il.  DURATION, TERMINATION

NDC agrees to commence work for Client effective April 1, 2015, and shall provide the
services described in Exhibit A for a term of two (2) consecutive months thereafter, with one (1)
two (2) month renewal starting at the conclusion of the initial term. Either party may, at any time,
terminate this Agreement with or without cause by sending written notice to the other party, in
which event this Agreement shall be terminated effective30 days after receipt of such notice.
Upon notice of termination from Client, NDC shall immediately refrain from incurring any
additional costs under this Agreement and shall provide Client within thirty (30) days a final
invoice for any outstanding costs incurred prior to receiving the notice oftermination from Client.



. COMPENSATION
Client shall compensate NDC for performance of services received heeunder for the
initial term in the total amount of $7,000.00, payable upon one invoice for $7,000.00. The
payment of fee will be due within 30 days of the effective date of this Agreement.

Compensation for the two month renewal period, if exercised, will be at the same rate and inone
payment of $7,000.00 due at the beginning of the renewal term at the same terms as provided
for the initial term.

The compensation amount includes all of NDC's time, travel expenses, supplies, postage,
telephone, and any other expenses. NDC will invoiceClient consistent with the payment
schedule identified above. Additionally, to the extent financially feasible and when it has no
adverse effect to the projects, NDC will structure the financing for projects in such a way that
recovers all or a portion of this compensation.

As an independent contractor, NDC is responsible for all legal requiements, taxes and
employment requirements associated with an independent contractor and nothing contained
herein shall be interpreted as creating a relationship of servant, employee, partnership, or
agency between Client and NDC. Payment by Client for services rendered under this Agreement
evidences Client’s acceptance of such services in accordance with the terms of the Agreement.

IV, MISCELLANEQUS PROVISIONS

4.1 Ownership of Material and Documents All final reports and other materials prepared
by NDC for Client shall be the property of Client, however all work papers and other source
materials shall be the property of the NDC. NDC shall deliver suchsource materials to Client in
accordance with the terms and conditions of this Agreement. If subsequent changes are made
to any final reports or other materials prepared by NDC,Client shall not, without NDC's written
consent, associate NDC's name with the altered reportiproduct.

4,2 Right to Audit. NDC shali establish and maintain appropriate procedues and
documents which will assure the proper accounting of all funds paid {o it under this Agreement.
Client or any of their duly authorized representatives shall have access to any books,
documents, papers and records of NDC and/or its subcontractors which are directly associated
to this Agreement or pertinent to a specific program for the purpose of making an audit, an
examination, excerpts and transcriptions. All such books and records shall be retained for such
periods of time as required by lowa law, provided, however, notwithstanding any shorter periods
of retention, all books, records and supporting details shall be retained for a period of at least
three (3) years after the expiration of the term of this Agreement.

4.3 Confidentiality of Reports. NDC shall keep confidential all reports, information and
data given to, prepared or assembled by NDC pursuant toNDC’s performance hereunder and
Client designates as confidential. Such information shall not be made available to any person,
firm, corporation or entity without the prior written consent of Client first obtained.




4.4  Equal Opportunity. NDC shall comply with all provisions of Title VI of the Civil Rights
Act of 1964 and of the rules, regulations and relevant order of the Secretary of Laboregarding
discrimination.

4.5  Conflicts of Interest No board member, officer or employee of Client or its designees
or agents, and no other public official who exercises any functions or responsibilities with respect
to any requested technical assistance, shall be permitted to financially benefit from this
Agreement or have any interest, direct or indirect, in any contract or subcontract, or the proceeds
thereof, for work to be performed in connection with this Agreement.

4.6  Notices. All notices shall be sent by certified mail, hand-delivery or over night mail and
in all events with a written acknowledgment of receipt to the address set forth at the beginning of
this Agreement.

4.7  Release of News Information. No news release, including photographs, public
announcements or confirmation of same, or any part of the subject matter of this Agreement or
any phase of any program hereunder shall be made without prior written approval of both

parties.

4.8 Compliance with Laws. NDC agrees to comply with all applicable federal, state and
local laws in the conduct of the work hereunder. This Agreement shall be construed, interpreted
and the rights of the parties determined, in accordance with the laws of the Stateof lowa.

4.9  Assignment Neither this Agreement nor any rights, duties or obligations described
herein may be assigned by either party without the prior expressed written consent of the other

party.

4.10 Severability. A determination that any part of this Agreement is invalid shall not
invalidate or impair the force of the remainder of this Agreement.

411 Dispute Resolution. Upon mutual consent of the Parties, any disputes or claims under
this Agreement may be submitted to arbitration in a manner provided under the Commercial
Arbitration Rules of the American Arbitration Association then in effect, such arbitration to be
conducted before three arbitrators chosen in accordance with the rules of the Stateof lowa and

shall be binding on the parties.

412 Entire Agreement. This Agreement contains the final agreement between the parties

regarding the matters covered and supersedes any and all other agreement, either oral in
writing, regarding the matters contained herein.

4.13 City as Client Client and NDC understand, acknowledge, and agree that Client will or
may be reimbursed forthe compensation contemplated by this agreement by the Jeffrey
Maxwell, proposed developer of the Property. Client and NDC further understand, acknowledge,
and agree that all of the professional and ethical duties o NDC, including without limitation

duties of diligence, loyalty, and confidentiality, run exclusively to Client and not to Jeffrey Maxwell
or any other person or entity.



IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have caused this Agreement to be executed as of
the day and year first written above.

CLIENT: NDC:

The City of University Heights National Development Council
By: QWﬁ—-’/ By:

Jim L&ne, City Council Member Robert W. Davenport
Its: Chair\ef Finance Committee Its: President




NDC TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE AGREEMENT
SCOPE OF SERVICES

EXHIBIT A

To promote the comprehensive development within the City of University Heights, Client is
considering a redevelopment proposal of the site located at 1300 Melrose and owned and
operated by the St. Andrew Presbyterian Church, as well as certain property immediately to
the east of the church that is owned by Jeffrey Maxwell (the Property). Among other services,
NDC will provide technical assistance to Client in reviewing the proposal, the financing
structure, and the request for City financing assistance for this project during pre-development

and project development.

This Scope of Services describes the assistance available under this Technical Assistance
Agreement during the specified contract period. Client and NDC by mutual agreement may
revise this Scope of Services. Client will direct NDC's activities and determine which services
are to be rendered by NDC. Payment by Client evidences Client's acceptance of the
assistance provided under this Agreement. The assistance offered includes:

° Review and evaluation of projects being considered by Client, including redevelopment
of the Property, for community and economic development assistance. This assistance

may include, as directed:

evaluating feasibility and suitability for use of various public finance programs,
including tax increment financing and federal and state tax credits, as sources to
resolve financing gaps

advising on various private and public sources of financing, their requirements
and structuring options

evaluating sponsor/developer experience and capacity

review of appraisals, cost assumptions, capital budgets, operating statements,
marketing data and other funding commitments
identifying other funding sources when required
assisting with non-financial development issues during the pre-development and
development phases
structuring loan documents and development agreements
advising on program regulation issues
Coordinating with other third parties as needed
Structuring the transaction to maximize tax credit equity for the project if such
sources are appropriate and available
Determining necessary leases, agreements, and other documents required to
comply with public financing programs considered or utilized for the project.
Reviewing financial information provided to or by the developer:

* Cost budgets

* Debt schedules (if applicable)

» Income pro forma




TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE AGREEMENT

This Technical Assistance Agreement (this “Agreement”} is made and entered into this _

day of April, 2014, by and between the City of University Heights (CITY), an lowa municipal
corporation, the City office of which is located at 1004 Melrose Avenue in University Heights, lowa
52246 (hereinafter called "Client") and NATIONAL DEVELOPMENT COUNCIL, a New York non-
profit corporation, which is a tax-exempt organization under Section 501(c)(3) of the internal
Revenue Code , whose address is 708 3™ Avenue, Suite 710 New York, New York 10017
(hereinafter called "NDC")

WITNESSETH:

WHEREAS, Client has determined that it needs the professional services of an advisor to
work with Client to assist it in achieving its public goals of developing and implementing community
and economic programs, and

WHEREAS, NDC is willing to provide, on such terms and conditions as are hereinafter
provided, technical assistance to Client uiilizing its expertise in economic and community
development activities.

NOW THEREFORE, Client and NDC do hereby agree as follows:

.  SCOPE OF SERVICES

The Client acknowledges that NDC regularly performs services for various clients located
across the United States. The purpose of this Agreement is to set forth the terms upon which NDC
will provide Client with assistance it has requested which is generally described as technical
assistance and professional services. NDC agrees to perform such services as are requested from
time to time by Client and to provide such services as it deems necessary to accomplish the goals
requested. Exhibit A attached hereto and made a part of this Agreement, fully describes the
services to be provided to Client upon its request by NDC. In performing the requested services,
NDC shall consult with officers and employees of Client and shall meet, as appropriate, with such
representatives or other entities when necessary, including without limitation, State and Federal
officials and other local organizations.

. DURATION, TERMINATION

NDC agrees to commence work for Client effective on a date specified by Client and shall
continue providing services as described in Exhibit A for a term of four (4) consecutive months
thereafter, with one (1) four (4) month renewal starting at the conclusion of the initial term.. Either
party may, at any time, terminate this Agreement with or without cause by sending written notice to
. the other party, in which event this Agreement shall be terminated effective 30 days after receipt of
such notice. Upon notice of termination from Client, NDC shall immediately refrain from incurring
any additional costs under this Agreement and shall provide Client within thirty (30) days a final
invoice for any outstanding costs incurred prior to receiving the notice of termination from Client.

: . COMPENSATION
Client shall compensate NDC for performance of services received hereunder for the initial
term in the total amount of $14,000.00, payable upon two invoices of $7,000.00 each:

1




» The first payment of $7,000.00 will be due within 30 days of the effective date of this
Agreement; and,

¢ The second payment will be due within 30 days of the end of the initial four month term of
this Agreement.

Compensation for the four month renewal period, if exercised, wil be at the same rate and in two
payments of $7,000.00 each due at the beginning and end of the renewal ferm at the same terms as
provided for the initial term.

The compensation amount includes all of NDC's time, travel expenses, supplies, postage,
telephone, and any other expenses. NDC will invoice Client consistent with the payment schedule
identified above.. Additionally, to the extent financially feasible and when it has no adverse effect to
the projects, NDC will structure the financing for projects in such a way that recovers all cra portlon
of this compensation.

As an independent contractor, NDC is responsible for all legal requirements, taxes and
employment requirements associated with an independent contractor and nothing contained herein
shall be interpreted as creating a relationship of servant, employee, partnership, or agency between
Client and NDC. Payment by Client for services rendered under this Agreement evidences Client's
acceptance of such services in accordance with the terms of the Agreement.

IV. MISCELLANEQUS PROVISIONS

41 Ownership of Material and Documents. All final reports and other materials prepared by
NDC for Client shall be the property of Client, however all work papers and other source materials
shall be the property of the NDC. NDC shall deliver such source materials to Client in accordance
with the terms and conditions of this Agreement. If subsequent changes are made to any final
reports or other materials prepared by NDC, Client shall not, without NDC's written consent
associate NDC's name with the altered report\product.

4.2 Right to Audit. NDC shall establish and maintain appropriate procedures and documents
which will assure the proper accounting of all funds paid to it under this Agreement. Client or any of
their duly authorized representatives shall have access to any books, documents, papers and
records of NDC and/or its subcontractors which are directly associated to this Agreement or
pertinent to a specific program for the purpose of making an audit, an examination, excerpts and
franscriptions. All such books and records shall be retained for such periods of time as required by
lowa law, provided, however, notwithstanding any shorter periods of retention, all books, records
and supporting details shall be retained for a pericd of at least three (3) years after the expiration of
the term of this Agreement.

4.3 Confidentiality of Reports. NDC shall keep confidential all reports, information and data
given to, prepared or assembied by NDC pursuant to NDC's performance hereunder and Client
designates as confidential. Such information shall not be made available to any person, firm,
corporation or entity without the prior written consent of Client first obtained.

4.4 Equal Opportunity. NDC shall comply with all provisions of Title VI of the Civil Rights Act of
1964 and of the rules, regulations and relevant order of the Secretary of Labor regarding
discrimination.

4.5 Conflicts of Interest. No board member, officer or employee of Client or its designees or
agents, and no other public official who exercises any functions or responsibilities with respect to

2




any requested technical assistance, shall be permitted to financially benefit from this Agreement or
have any interest, direct or indirect, in any contract or subcontract, or the proceeds thereof, for work
to be performed in connection with this Agreement.

4.6  Notices. All notices shall be sent by certified mail, hand-delivery or over night mail and in all
events with a written acknowledgment of receipt to the address set forth at the beginning of this
Agreement.

4.7 Release of News Information. No news reilease, including photographs, public
announcements or confirmation of same, or any part of the subject matter of this Agreement or any
phase of any program hereunder shall be made without prior written approval of both parties.

4.8 Compliance with Laws. NDC agrees to comply with all applicable federal, state and local
laws in the conduct of the work hereunder. This Agreement shall be construed, interpreted and the
rights of the parties determined, in accordance with the laws of the State of lowa.

49  Assignment. Neither this Agreement nor any rights, duties or obligations described herein
may be assigned by either party without the prior expressed written consent of the other party.

410 Severability. A determination that any part of this Agreement is invaiid shall not invalidate or
impair the force of the remainder of this Agreement.

411 Dispute Resolution. Upon mutual consent of the Parties, any disputes or claims under this
Agreement may be submitted to arbitration in a manner provided under the Commercial Arbitration
Rules of the American Arbitration Association then in effect, such arbitration to be conducted before
three arbitrators chosen in accordance with the rules of the State of lowa and shall be binding on the
parties.

412 Entire Agreement. This Agreement contains the final agreement between the parties
regarding the matters covered and supersedes any and all other agreement, either oral in writing,
regarding the matters contained herein.

413 City as Client. Client and NDC understand, acknowledge, and agree that Client will or may
be reimbursed for the compensation contemplated by this agreement by the Jeffrey Maxwell,
proposed developer of the Property. Client and NDC further understand, acknowledge, and agree
that all of the professional and ethical duties of NDC, including without limitation duties of diligence,
toyalty, and confidentiality, run exclusively to Client and not to Jeffrey Maxwell or any other person or
entity.

IN WITNESS WHEREQF, the parties have caused this Agreement to be executed as of the
day and year first written above.

CLIENT: NDC:

The City of University Heights

By:

Jim Lane, City-CounciFMember

y: } avdd .
7 E)aven
Its: Chair of Finance Committee lts: PreSIde //176



NDC TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE AGREEMENT
SCOPE OF SERVICES
EXHIBIT A

To promote the comprehensive development within the City of University Heights, Client is
considering a redevelopment proposal of the site located at 1300 Melrose and owned and
operated by the St. Andrew Presbyterian Church, as well as certain property immediately to
the east of the church that is owned by Jeffrey Maxwell (the Property). Among other services,
NDC will provide technical assistance to Client in reviewing the proposal, the financing
structure, and the request for City financing assistance for this project during pre-development
and project development.

This Scope of Services describes the assistance available under this Technical Assistance
Agreement during the specified contract period. Client and NDC by mutual agreement may
revise this Scope of Services. Client will direct NDC's activities and determine which services
are to be rendered by NDC. Payment by Ciient evidences Client's acceptance of the
assistance provided under this Agreement. The assistance offered includes:

. Review and evaluation of projects being considered by Client, including redevelopment
of the Property, for community and economic development assistance. This assistance
may include, as directed:

s evaluating feasibility and suitability for use of various public finance programs,
including tax increment financing and federal and state tax credits, as sources to
resolve financing gaps

o advising on various private and public sources of financing, their requirements
and structuring options

* evaluating sponsor/developer experience and capacity

» review of appraisals, cost assumptions, capital budgets, operating statements,
marketing data and other funding commitments
o identifying other funding sources when required .
assisting with non-financial development issues during the pre-development and
development phases
structuring loan documents and development agreements
advising on program regulation issues
Coordinating with other third parties as needed
Structuring the transaction to maximize tax credit equity for the project if such
sources are appropriate and available
e Determining necessary leases, agreements, and other documents required to
comply with public financing programs considered or utilized for the project.
» Reviewing financial information provided to or by the developer:
» Cost budgets
» Debt schedules (if applicable)
* Income pro forma



MEMORANDUM OF UNDERSTAND ING

This Memorandum of Understanding is made and entered into as
of the 15th day of December, 2015, by and between the City of
University Heights (“City”), and National Development Council
(““NDC™) .

WHEREAS, City and NDC entered into an agreement dated April
22, 2014 (Exhibit “A” attached hereto), and an agreement dated
April 14, 2015 (Exhibit “B” attached hereto), for professional
services of an adviser to assist City in achieving its goals of
developing and implementing community and economic programs; and

WHEREAS, neither agreement specifically provides for the
retention of records given, procured, generated, or produced by
NDC, or file documents of any medium; and

WHEREAS, City desires and requests that NDC retain any
documents and Tfile material, regardless of storage medium,
including emails and other correspondence, that relate in any
respect to the One University Place proposal and NDC’s analysis of
tax increment financing related to that proposal,

NOW, THEREFORE, City and NDC do hereby agree that NDC will
retain any documents and file material, regardless of storage
medium, and including emails and other correspondence, that relate
in any respect to the One University Place proposal and NDC’s
analysis of tax increment financing related to that proposal for
a period of five (5) years. NDC will retain any paper documents
in its possession related to its services pursuant to either the
2014 or 2015 agreement, and will store any electronic communication
or materials of any other medium, on a secured server. In
responding to any request made for the iInspection or transmittal
of records or documents, of any medium, NDC may bill to City at a
reasonable rate for the copying and transmittal of such documents.
This Memorandum of Understanding amends and modifies the parties”
prior agreements.

Louise From, Mayor Robert W. Davenport
City of University Heights President,
National Development Council



Attest:

Christine M. Anderson,
City Clerk



Mayor Report- December 2015

My Mayor’s MVP’s for 2015 My Most Valuable (Volunteer) Players

| started the Mayor’s MVP when | became Mayor in 2006 to thank volunteers who dedicated so
much of their time and talents to the city.

John McLure -our city videographer. John has been a dedicated volunteer for five years.
Because of his many hours of video work & editing the city has a dedicated time slot on
Thursdays at 9:00pm on local Cable Channel 4 so residents & the greater community can view
our city council meetings. Many people tell me all the time they are watching the meetings.
Thank you John!!

Scott & Carol Ann Christiansen and Pat Yeggy — of the city Garden Club. The University Heights
Garden continues each and every year to be one of the most beautiful city gardens in Johnson
County! | continually hear from people within and outside of the community about our
wonderful garden. The Garden Club relies only on donations to add plantings to the garden
every year. | appreciate the dedication of these talented residents!! Thank you Scott & Carol
Ann and Pat!!

Mike Ritchie-has been our city park landscaper for the past two seasons. Mike came to me to
ask me if he could mow and take care of the “triangle” city park, | didn’t have to ask him. He
provides his own equipment as well as any supplies needed. | appreciate the care he gives the
city park. Thank you Mike!

Meetings Attended:

November 18- MPO- Urbanized Area Policy Board meeting. A three member nominating
committee was selected to bring a recommendation back to the board members for Chair and
Vice Chair. The Severson Charity Challenge was announced to begin Dec. 1-thru Jan. 4t.
University Heights will again sponsor: Ronald McDonald House of lowa City. NOTE: At the
November 2015 meeting, the MPOJC Board decided to award this year’s trophy to the MPO
entity that shows the greatest improvement in their total percentage increase in
items or dollars donated over last year’s tally. This is an attempt to “even the playing
field” and inspire increased giving as the community charities chosen have varied needs—
food items, clothing, cash. University Heights donations of the last year was $1,745 which
includes money and donations total. Let’s all try and win the trophy again this season. Please review
the online donation list of Ronald McDonald House and drop off your donations to the city office.

December 3"-Emergency Management Meeting. Highlights: New Chair and Vice Chairs were elected:
Brian Wayson of North Liberty was elected Chair and Tim Kemp of Hills was elected Vice-Chair.



RESOLUTION NO. 15-76

RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO GIVE WRITTEN NOTICE
TERMINATING THE 28E AGREEMENT FOR FIRE PROTECTION SERVICES
WITH THE CITY OF CORALVILLE

WHEREAS, the City of University Heights and the City of Coralville
entered into an Agreement dated July 1, 2013, pursuant to lowa Code ch. 28E
for fire protection services; and

WHEREAS, the Agreement provides that either party may terminate the
Agreement by giving six (6) months’ written notice of termination to the other
party; and

WHEREAS, the City of University Heights has negotiated an agreement
with the City of lowa City to provide fire protection services starting July 1, 2016,
and therefore desires to terminate the existing 28E Agreement with the City of
Coralville effective that date,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Mayor of the City of
University Heights is authorized to provide written notice to the City of Coralville
that the parties 28E Agreement for fire protection services shall terminate
effective July 1, 2016.

Upon motion by , and seconded by
, the vote was as follows:

AYES NAYS ABSENT

Aldrich
Haverkamp
Lane

Miller
Quezada

Upon Roll Call thus recorded, the Resolution is declared adopted this 15"
day of December, 2015.

Louise From, Mayor
City of University Heights



ATTEST:

Christine M. Anderson, City Clerk

Steve/UH Resolutions/Resolution 15-77 authorizing Mayor to give Coralville notice to terminate 28E for fire services 12 15
15



28E AGREEMENT

THIS AGREEMENT entered into by and between the City of Coralville, 1512 i Street,
Coralville, lowa 52241, hereinafier referred to as “Coralville”; and the City of University
Heights, Iowa, hereinafter referred to as “University Heights.”

WHEREAS, Coralville has been providing fire protection to University Heights under an
agreement dated March 14, 1978, with subsequent amendments thereto; and

WHEREAS, Coralville and University Heights have discussed entering into a new
agreement whereby the annual fee paid to Coralville will increase via the Consumer Price Index;

and

WHEREAS, the City Attorney of Coralville has drafted this 28E Agreement to
accomplish the same.

WHEREAS, it is necessary for Coralville and JCCSD to enter info an agreement pursuant
to Chapter 28E of the Code of lowa (2013) to outline the responsibilities of each party.

NOW, THEREFORE, IN CONSIDERATION OF THE MUTUAL COVENANTS AND
CONDITIONS CONTAINED HEREIN, THE PARTIES AGREE AS FOLLOWS:

I. PURPOSE. Coralville shall provide fire protection services to University Heights during
the term of this Agreement.

. DURATION. The parties hereto agree this Agreement shall be effective upon its
execution by both parties and remain in effect for an initial term of five (5) vears and will

continue uniil terminated be either party as discussed below,

IILLADMINISTRATION. The Fire Chief of Coralville and City Council of University
Heights shall administer this Agreement on behalf of the cities.

IV.COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES. University Heights agrees that it shall
compensate Coralville for providing fire protection services to University Heights as follows:

Fiscal Year 2014: $30,122.74

For each Fiscal Year after, the total annual fee payable 1o Coralville shall increase annually by an
amount equivalent to the percentage change in the CPI for each current vear over the CPI for the
prior year. For purposes of this Agreement, “CPI” refers to the Consumer Price Index, which
shall mean the Consumer Price Index, U.S. City Average, Urban Wage Earners and Clerical
Workers, All Items (base index year 1982-4 = [00) as published by the United States Department

of Labor, Bureau of Labor Siatistics.




Said payments shall be made to Coralville semiannually in an amount of 50% of the total annual
fee. Said payments to Coralville shall be made to Coralville within 30 days of invoice by

Coralville.

V. TERMINATION

Either party to this Agreement may terminate this Agreement by providing six (6)
months’ wrilten notice to the other party by delivering written notice of the same to the City

Clerk of the other city.

V1. MODIFICATIONS TO THE AGREEMENT

Coralville and University Heights acknowledge that from time to time it may be to their
mutual advantage to modify the terms and conditions of this Agreement, In that event, both
partics agree that any mutually agreed upon modifications shall be allowable as they may
become necessary or desirable to implement the general purpose of this Agreement; provided,
however, that no waiver, change, modification or amendment of this Agreement shall be binding
upon either party unless in writing and signed by the affected party. The waiver of wither party
hereto of a breach of any provision of this Agreement shall not operate or be construed as a
waiver of any subsequent breach of that provision by the same party, or of any other provision or
condifion in this Agreement.

VII. INDEMNITY AND HOLD HARMLESS

Each party agrees to release, indemnify and held the other party, its officers and
employees harmless from and against any and all claims, suits, actions, debts, damages, costs,
charges, and expenses, including court costs and reasonable attormey’s fees, and expenses
incidental thereto, and against any and all Hability for property damage and personal injury,
including death resulting directly or indirectly therefrom, which may be suffered by, or charged
to, the other party arising out of or by reason of any breach, violation or non-performance by the
party or its servants, employees or agents of any covenant or condition of this Agreement or by
any act or failure fo act of those persons,

VIH. APPROVAIL

For reference purposes, this Agreement is dated this {gi day of i ,2013.
It has been approved as required by law by the City Council of the City of Coralville and
the City Council of University Heiglits on the dates as indicated below,

IX.  FILING. Upon approval and execution of this Agreement by Coralville and
University Heights, the City Clerk of Coralville shall file this Agreement with the Office of the
lowa Secretary of State as required by law.



Dated:

(SIGNATURE PAGE OF CITY OF CORALVILLE TO 28E AGREEMENT)

&l2/i3

CORALVILLE:

4 , ,/(

H M .
N '/EN A A i S

Jim L. Fausett, Mayor

ATTEST:
/

Thorsten J. Johnson, City Clerk



(SIGNATURE PAGE OF UNIVERSITY HEIGHTS TO
28E AGREEMENT)

Datedsiﬁ‘;\itj pa s ; Bk UNIVERSITY HEIGHTS:

O %«f (,’{::M,Q,/ f? 1‘7/{')’/0])\ .

EEE
Louisé From, Mayor

ATTEST:

Clanr e . Loncrvaon

Chris Anderson, City Clerk




December ‘15 — City Attorney's Report

1. Adopting Building Codes. The Council will have its second consideration of
Ordinance No. 192, which adopts current versions of various building codes. This
ordinance is the work product of Silvia Quezada, Terry Goerdt, and | believe one or
more members of the University Heights Zoning Commission and Board of
Adjustment. A copy of Ordinance No. 192 is attached.

2. National Development Council — Records Retention. The City entered into
agreements with the National Development Council to help evaluate the request for
economic development assistance in the form of TIF for the One University Place
proposal. These agreements did not specifically require NDC to retain documents it
received or prepared as part of its work. The Council will consider Resolution No. 15-
75 authorizing the Mayor to sign and the Clerk to attest and Memorandum of
Understanding Addendum to the City’s Agreement with the National Development
Council requiring NDC to retain documents for five years. Copies of the Resolution,
the proposed MOU Addendum, and the two prior NDC agreements are attached.

3. Changing Fire Protection Service Provider. As discussed in prior meetings, the lowa
City Fire Department is interested in providing fire protection services beginning July
1, 2016, under the terms presently in effect with the City of Coralville pursuant to a
28E Agreement. | have communicated with the City Attorney’s Office with the City
of lowa City to confirm that the terms of the existing 28E Agreement with Coralville
are acceptable. The agreement with Coralville requires that an intention to terminate
services must be given in writing six months in advance. | am comfortable with the
City giving Coralville notice of its intention to terminate the 28E Agreement effective
July 1, 2016, based upon lowa City’s assurances and commitment that a similar
agreement will be forthcoming. The Council will consider Resolution No. 15-76
authorizing the Mayor to provide the City of Coralville notice of the City of University
Heights’ intention to terminate the 28E Agreement for fire Protection Services effective
July 1, 2016. Copies of the resolution and the existing 28E Agreement with Coralville
are attached.

4. Extending Chief Stanley’s Employment. The Community Protection Committee
recommends that Chief Ken Stanley’s employment be extended and continued with the
same compensation and benefit as provided in the written Employment Agreement
from 2014. The Council will consider Resolution No. 15-77 extending and continuing
Chief Stanley’s employment as an at-will employee. Copies of the Resolution and 2014
Employment Agreement are attached.

5. UHPD Officer Training with CRPD. Chief Stanley has discussed having UHPD
officers ride along and train with Cedar Rapids Police Department Officers to further
their education and experience. The UHPD officers are recent graduates of the Cedar
Rapids Police Academy. The City of Cedar Rapids requests that the City of University




Heights retain liability for the actions of UHPD officers and release the City of Cedar
Rapids from such liability. The City of Cedar Rapids does not request compensation
for this training. A 28E Agreement is being put together setting forth the Cities’
arrangement as outlined above. The Council will consider Resolution No. 15-78
authorizing the Mayor to sign and the Clerk to attest a 28E Agreement with the City of
Cedar Rapids subject to review and approval of the University Heights Chief of Policy
and City Attorney. A copy of the Resolution is attached.

6. Dotti Maher — Resignation from Board of Adjustment. In light of Dotti Maher’s
election to the City Council, she will be resigning her position on the Board of
Adjustment. The Council will consider a motion to accept Dotti’s resignation. Incoming
Mayor Wally Heitman is informed and prepared to make an appointment to complete
Dotti’s term on the Board.

7. City Liability for Construction Vehicles. | was asked last month whether the City
had any liability exposure if construction vehicles associated with the One University
Place development cause an accident or are involved in an accident while sitting on
North Sunset Street. | do not believe the City has any liability exposure for these
construction vehicles. The City has general oversight authority regarding the
development and construction, and if there are concerns about safety practices, | would
encourage anyone to bring those to Josiah Bilskemper’s attention so he may discuss
them with the developer and have them addressed. in the event a claim was made
against the City for liability based upon construction activity, the City would look to
the developer and to the City’s insurance carrier.

8. Zoning Ordinance Enforcement. Several enforcement efforts remain underway
regarding pavement of property in excess of Zoning Ordinance restrictions. Council
Member Quezada, as chair of Building, Zoning, and Sanitation, has been coordinating
efforts of Terry Goerdt, Building Official, Stan Laverman, Rental Housing Inspector,
and my office.

9. Closed Session. | recommend and advise that the Council to go into Closed Session at
the December meeting to discuss litigation matters. A motion to that effect is attached.

Leff/SEB/UH/UH Atty Reports/UHAttyRept December 15 legal report



City Clerk Report
December 2015

e Two building permits received since the last meeting:

One University Place — electrical permit
328 Koser Avenue — addition and remodel to house

e 177 rental permits received for FY16 fiscal year (176 last month):

74 for Grandview Court (73 last month)
103 for rest of University Heights (103 last month)

e Mailed in the annual financial report to the state.
e Received complaint regarding recycling program at Grandview Court.

e Received complaint regarding potential non-compliant rental property at 1517
Oakcrest Avenue.

Report from Stan Laverman — Rental Inspector:

The trash left from tailgating activities is a moving target as the wind blows it around.
Many times because the tenants are not the ones parking cars for football they do not
feel it is their responsibly to pick it up! We might want to look at regulation (permitting &
fees) and using the fees to provide trash cans and trash removal for lowa football
gamedays if we don't see voluntary compliance.

Did you know that you can call the Press-Citizen to shop the delivery of the free
Wednesday paper? Call the lowa City Press Citizen at 319-866-4246 or 337-3181 and you
can have that paper stopped!

The banner on the garage at 909 Melrose Avenue was removed following the football
season. If people want this activity prohibited we will need to clarify our regulations.

The parking at 1009 Melrose is being addressed. The issue is not resolved at this time.
We are in agreement that the yard was paved and little more.

| am addressing a trash issue at 30 Prospect Place. The building permit has been closed
out and the construction debris remains.

| have attached a flyer on mold from the lowa department of public health. This is the
guidelines we operate under when addressing mold in lowa. We don't address the mold,



we address the moisture. We've gotten multiple complaints from tenants this year about
mold and moisture.

Parking on the grass issue at 32 Olive Ct has been referred to the police department as
it's in their domain. | have made the landlord aware of the problem and

he's encouraged us to ticket the vehicles as he is also unhappy with the tenants. (The
lease will not be renewed.)

I've gotten multiple inquires about occupancy as people are looking for placed to lease
for August 2016. Occupancy is an issue that will be before the state legislature again
and University Heights should be aware of the ramifications if the State occupancy bill
passes.

The software purchase and implementation has reached a point where it is exasperating
to me. This is the company | recommend we use: htitps://www.accela.com/ |am
making one last effort between now and February 1st to see if we can get anyone to
respond. If I can't get aresponse by February 1st | will recommend looking at a different
provider. There's been a lot of consolidation in this marketplace in the last 6 months

and smaller cities such as University Heights are not being well served by it. Attached is
the link to lowa City's service this is provided by Accella: https://icgov.ora/ICgovXpress
Johnson County lowa also has a contract for their services, but implementation has been
slowed. With the two largest entities in the county using this software provider it would
be nice to use it for University Heights also. You can also download the app on your
smart phone (search under GOrequest) and play with that too. The smartphone app does
not send University Heights the complaints, but it will give you an idea of some of it's
uses.

Please tell everyone about the University Heights Nextdoor webpage. It's a great way to
get information out quickly and accurately to a large group of digitally connected
residents!


https://www.accela.com/
https://icgov.org/ICgovXpress

YIDPH

lowa Department of Public Health

Division of Environmental Health

Frequently Asked Questions about Mold

Overview: Mold is a natural part of the outdoor environment. Mold is present in
outdoor air at some level throughout the year. In order for mold to grow indoors,
there must be a significant source of water, moisture or humidity. Mold is found
through simple visual inspection. Once a mold problem is identified, the first step to
solving the problem is to get rid of the moisture. Once the moisture problem is solved,
the mold can be cleaned or removed. Homeowners can use a mild household
detergent and water solution to clean mold off of non-porous surfaces. For porous
surfaces, it is recommended that items are removed, discarded and replaced.

What are the
health effects
from exposure to
mold?

In general, mold Rl
only causes an allergic reactlon Symptoms
of an allergic reaction are itchy or watery
eyes, runny nose, sinus drainage,
respiratory discomfort and cough.
According to the Centers for Disease
Control and Prevention, about 50% of the
population of the United States is allergic
to mold. If you are NOT allergic to mold,
there will be NO health effects from
exposure. If you ARE allergic to mold,
your reaction depends on the sensitivity of
your allergy.

How do I know if I have a mold
problem?

Mold problems are ALWAYS caused by a
moisture or water problem. It does no
good to clean up the mold, if you haven't
solved the water issue first. Environmental
professionals “inspect” for mold through
simple visual examination. There is no
special state of lowa training or
certification for mold inspectors.

Where should I look for mold?

Most homeowners can tell if they have a
mold issue in their home. Simply look for
mold in places where there may be water
issues (under sinks, in laundry rooms,
kitchens, bathrooms, where a roof has
leaked, in the basement, etc.) Very simply,
if you see mold in your home, you have
mold. If you don’t see mold in your home,
you probably don’t have mold.

Refrigerator door seals

Underneath sinks and drain pans

Window Sills Window Sills

Laundry rooms Basements walls

Air conditioning syslem_s




I have mold in my home and I want
to have it tested, what should I do?
The lowa Department of Public Health
does NOT recommend testing for mold for
several reasons:
1. Mold is a natural part of our
environment.
2. Mold is present at some level in
outdoor air throughout the year.
3. Itis very difficult, even for
professionals, to get meaningful
test results for mold.
4. Mold testing is very costly.
5. There are no regulatory levels or
guidelines for comparing results.

There is black
mold in my
home, What if it
Is the toxic kind
you see on TV?
There are
thousands of different types of mold in
the environment that come in a variety
of colors. Just because a mold is black
does not mean that it is any more or
less toxic than mold that is green, blue,
yellow or orange.

Mil

There has been a lot of media attention
about a particular type of mold,
Stachybotrys that has been reported to
be very toxic. In the middle to late
1990’s there was an indication that this
type of mold was linked to a respiratory
disease called acute idiopathic
hemorrhagic airway disease. Currently,
it is believed there is no link between
mold exposure and this disease, which
causes bleeding in the lungs. In reality,
all molds may cause the same type and
severity of health reaction. No matter
what color the mold is in your home, it
still needs to be cleaned up in the same
way.

I've identified the area covered in
mold, how do I clean it up?

It depends on the type of material that the
mold is growing on. If the material is
non-porous (it will not absorb water)
such as a concrete, tile or vinyl flooring,
plastic patio furniture, plastic toys, tub
surrounds, paneling, molding, etc., use a
mild household detergent solution to wipe
away the mold. Ifitis a porous surface
(it will absorb water) such as drywall,
carpeting, furniture, bedding, clothing,
stuffed animals, books, etc., remove,
discard, and replace the items or surfaces
the mold is growing on.

What if the
mold is trapped
behind a wall,
in a crawl
space or in the
A attic?
In order for there to be mold behind a
wall, in a crawl space or attic, there would
have to be a water, moisture, or humidity
problem to feed the mold. Most likely if the
mold is behind the walls or in the attic, you
are not being exposed to it, so there
should not be a problem. If the water
problem persists in the area, the mold will
eventually work its way through the wall,
ceiling, or floor and become obvious.

The best way to check for mold is through
visual inspection, or looking for it. If there
is access to an area behind the wall or in
the attic, use a flashlight to look for the
mold. If not, the only way to determine if
there is mold would be to cut a hole and
look. This is typically not recommended.

For More information contact:
Sara Colboth, Health Educator

lowa Department of Public Health at
(515) 281-5894




University Heights Building Permits

January 1, 2015 - December 12, 2015

Date Building
Permit # Building Address Issued Fee Valuation Description of Remodeling
Kitchen and bathroom remodel (bldg., mechanical, electrical and plumbing
BLD15-001 220 Koser Avenue 2/1/2015 $832.00 $62,320.00 | permits)
BLD15-002 207 Mahaska Drive 2/5/2015 $421.00 $17,000.00 | Bedroom and bath remodel (bldg., electrical and plumbing permits)
Remodel kitchen and move stairs (bldg., electrical, mechanical and
BLD15-003 2 Leamer Court 4/12/2015 $519.30 $30,000.00 | plumbing permits)
BLD15-004 40 Koser Avenue 4/21/2015 $369.30 $20,000.00 | 20x20 garage
BLD15-005 1465 Grand Avenue 9/15/2015 $832.00 $45,000.00 | 24x24 two story garage (approved through BOA)
2 Leamer Court 6/9/2015 $50.00 $1,500.00 | Service upgrade from 100 to 200 amp
BLD15-006 30 Prospect Place 6/9/2015 | $1,389.15 | $150,000.00 | Remodel of SFD: new roof, bathroom, closets, deck and concrete patio
100 Koser Avenue 7/7/2015 $50.00 $1,000.00 | Electrical permit - wiring for bathroom remodel
28 Highland Drive 8/5/2015 $50.00 Electrical permit - move overhead service
BLD15-007 409 Monroe Street 9/15/2015 $573.00 New kitchen, 3 bathrooms and a laundry room
1455 Grand Avenue 10/5/2015 $50.00 $2,000.00 | Plumbing permit - main floor bathroom remodel
1455 Grand Avenue 10/9/2015 $50.00 Electrical permit - main floor bathroom remodel
BLD15-009 254 Highland Drive 10/5/2015 $127.80 $5,000.00 | 18x25 concrete slab for patio
One University Place $79,500.00 Building permit for OUP
One University Place $22,820.00 Electrical permit for OUP
Addition to and remodel to 1960 home (bldg., electrical, mechanical and
BLD15-011 328 Koser Avenue 11/18/2015 | $1,485.75 | $130,000.00 | plumbing permits)




Treasurer’s Report November 2015

Our total revenue for the month of November was $66,729.47 comprised of the following
amounts:

Property Taxes $24,193.56
Parking fines $ 925.00
Traffic Fines from Clerk of Court $ 2,798.92
Interest on bank accounts $ 104.22
Road Use Funds $11,235.10
Building permits $24,305.75
Rental permit $ 250.00
Contribution from Grandview COA for recycling $ 475.00
Police reports $ 7.00

In addition, we received reimbursements from 6 property owners for sidewalk repairs that were
done totaling $1,874.20. This amount was recorded as a negative expense and will offset the
expense from last month

Balances in the bank accounts as of 11/30/15:

MidwestOne Bank Checking Account $384,362.35
Hills Bank Money Market Account $ 1,044.01
Forfeiture Fund $ 4,066.30
Time Acct at Hills Bank $ 23,027.50
CD at UICCU (1002 due 3/22/17) $77,511.86
CD at UICCU (1003 due 8/28/17) $43,754.34
CD at UICCU (1004 due 10/22/15) $53,412.29
CD at UICCU (1011 due 5/19/17) $73,370.88

| made the interest payment that was due on the loan from Hills Bank in the amount of
$1,249.29. The balance due is approximately $60,000. (The loan was taken out in 8/2007 in
the amount of $240,000 at 3.95% interest — we’ll make the last payment in June 2017)






12:13 AM City of University Heights, lowa
12114115 Profit & Loss Budget vs. Actual

Cash Basis July through November 2015
Jul - Nov 15 Budget % of Budget
Ordinary Income/Expense
Income
CHARGES FOR SERVICES
Police Reports 37.00 1,000.00 3.7%
Total CHARGES FOR SERVICES 37.00 1,000.00 3.7%
GENERAL PROPERTY TAXES
Benefits Levies 42,293.56 83,371.00 50.7%
Commercial Prop Tax Rpimnt adj 0.00 -4,339.00 0.0%
Debt Service Levy 16,631.71 32,400.00 51.3%
Insurance Levy 5,406.40 14,252.00 37.9%
Library Services Levy B8,723.64 17,143.00 50.9%
Regular Property Tax 263,923.09 514,277.00 51.3%
Transit Levy 22,698.91 44,605.00 50.9%
Total GENERAL PROPERTY TAXES 359,677.31 701,709.00 51.3%
INTERGOVERMENTAL/SHARED REVENUE
Other State Grants/Reimburse.
Seatbelt Incent/Traffic Safety 2,990.67
Total Other State Grants/Reimburse. 2,990.67
State Shared Revenues
Commercial Property Tax Rplcmnt 0.00 4,339.00 0.0%
Road Use/Street Construction 59,389.21 105,000.00 56.6%
Total State Shared Revenues 59,389.21 109,339.00 54.3%
Total INTERGOVERMENTAL/SHARED REVEN... 62,379.88 109,339.00 57.1%
LICENSES & PERMITS
Beer/Wine/Liquor/Cig Permits 0.00 390.00 0.0%
Building/Equipment Permits 107,427.70 10,000.00 1,074.3%
Misc. Licenses/Permits
Parking Permits 1,370.00 1,000.00 137.0%
Rental Permits 27,480.00 15,500.00 177.3%
Total Misc. Licenses/Permits 28,850.00 16,500.00 174.8%
Total LICENSES & PERMITS 136,277.70 26,890.00 506.8%
MISCELLANEQUS REVENUES
Cable TV Franchise 3,411.08 14,000.00 24.4%
Contributions 475.00 250.00 190.0%
Fines
Parking Fines 1,920.00 7.000.00 27.4%
Traffic Fines-Clk of Ct 29,838.68 90,000.00 33.2%
Total Fines 31,758.68 97,000.00 32.7%
Misc. Income
Other -50.00 1,000.00 -5.0%
Total Misc. Income -50.00 1,000.00 -5.0%
Refunds and Reimbursements 1,207.50 1,000.00 120.8%
Total MISCELLANEOUS REVENUES 36,802.26 113,250.00 32.5%
OTHER CITY TAXES
Utility Excise Tax 5,584.77
Total OTHER CITY TAXES 5,684.77
USE OF MONEY & PROPERTY
Interest on Cash Investments 1,311.34 5,000.00 26.2%
Total USE OF MONEY & PROPERTY 1,311.34 5,000.00 26.2%
Total Income 602,070.26 957,188.00 62.9%
Gross Profit 602,070.26 957,188.00 62.9%



12:13 AM City of University Heights, lowa

12114115 Profit & Loss Budget vs. Actual
Cash Basis July through November 2015
Jul - Nov 15 Budget
Expense
COMMUNITY & ECONOMIC DEV.

Tree Trimming/Lawn Care 1,140.00 5,000.00
Total COMMUNITY & ECONOMIC DEV. 1,140.00 5,000.00
CULTURE & RECREATION

Community Support Projects 66.00 500.00

Library 9,291.50 44,677.00

Parks

Park Expenses 978.79 800.00
Park Update Contribution 5,000.00 5,000.00

Total Parks 5,978.79 5,800.00
Total CULTURE & RECREATION 15,336.29 50,977.00
DEBT SERVICE

Interest 1,249.29 2,400.00

Principal 0.00 30,000.00
Total DEBT SERVICE 1,249.29 32,400.00
GENERAL GOVERNMENT

City Hall & General Buildings

Commodities

Supplies 0.00 200.00
Total Commodities 0.00 200.00
Contractual

Rents & Leases 6,871.15 16,491.00
Total Contractual 6,871.15 16,491.00
Employee Benefits & Costs

FICA 0.00 31.00

IPERS 0.00 45.00

Medicare 0.00 7.00
Total Employee Benefits & Costs 0.00 83.00
Repair/Maint/Utilities

Maintenance 0.00 1,000.00

Telecommunications 900.71 2,000.00

Utilities 493.99 1,600.00
Total Repair/Maint/Utilities 1,394.70 4,600.00
Salaries-Regular Part Time

Facilities Assistant 240.00 500.00
Total Salaries-Regular Part Time 240.00 500.00

Total City Hall & General Buildings 8,505.85 21,874.00
Clerk/Treasurer & Finance Admin

Commodities

Hardware/Software 0.00 1,000.00

Minor Equipment/Supplies/Techno 151.25 700.00

Office Supplies and Postage 575.79 1,000.00

Taping meetings 0.00 250.00
Total Commodities 727.04 2,950.00
Contractual Services

Accounting Fees 470.00 4,400.00

Bank/CCard Fees 21.20 50.00

Legal Publications 270.36 3,000.00

Meeting Set Up Fees 240.00 125.00

Payments to Other Agencies

Notary Fees 0.00 60.00
Total Payments to Other Agencies 0.00 60.00

% of Budget

22.8%
22.8%

13.2%
20.8%

122.3%
100.0%
103.1%

30.1%

52.1%
0.0%

3.9%

0.0%
0.0%

41.7%
41.7%

0.0%
0.0%
0.0%

0.0%

0.0%
45.0%
30.9%

30.3%

48.0%
48.0%

38.9%

0.0%
21.6%
57.6%

0.0%

24.6%

10.7%
42.4%
9.0%
192.0%

0.0%
0.0%

Page 2



12:13 AM City of University Heights, lowa
12114115 Profit & Loss Budget vs. Actual

Cash Basis July through November 2015
Jul - Nov 15 Budget % of Budget
Printing/Copying 433.00 500.00 86.6%
Technology Services 677.25 750.00 90.3%
Total Contractual Services 2,111.81 8,885.00 23.8%
Employee Benefits & Costs
FICA 280.74 608.00 46.2%
IPERS 449.00 875.00 51.3%
Medicare 65.66 142.00 46.2%
Unemployment Compensation 49.82 120.00 41.5%
Total Employee Benefits & Costs 845.22 1,745.00 48.4%
Salaries-Regular Part Time
Clerk, Treasuer, Historian 4,288.13 9,800.00 43.8%
Total Salaries-Regular Part Time 4,288.13 9,800.00 43.8%
Staff Development
Dues & Memberships
Chamber of Commerce 0.00 500.00 0.0%
Dues and Memberships 0.00 500.00 0.0%
IA League of Cities 726.00 635.00 114.3%
JCOG Assessment 1,664.83 1,665.00 100.0%
Total Dues & Memberships 2,390.83 3,300.00 72.4%
Total Staff Development 2,390.83 3,300.00 72.4%
Total Clerk/Treasurer & Finance Admin 10,363.03 26,680.00 38.8%
Election Expenses 0.00 1,600.00 0.0%
Legal Services 98,307.06 50,000.00 196.6%
Mayor/Council Operations
Employee Benefits & Costs
FICA 101.49 370.00 27.4%
IPERS-Council 17.86 89.00 20.1%
Medicare 21.63 87.00 24.9%
Unemployment Compensation 16.41 80.00 20.5%
Total Employee Benefits & Costs 157.39 626.00 25.1%
Salaries-Regular Part Time
Council 1,000.00 4,000.00 25.0%
Mayor 491.75 1,967.00 25.0%
Total Salaries-Regular Part Time 1,491.75 5,967.00 25.0%
Total Mayor/Council Operations 1,649.14 6,593.00 25.0%
TIF Analysis 14,000.00
Tort Liability Insurance 133.00 6,450.00 21%
Total GENERAL GOVERNMENT 132,958.08 113,197.00 117.5%
PUBLIC SAFETY
Building Inspections
Building / Rental Inspection 9,045.00 15,200.00 59.5%
Total Building Inspections 9,045.00 15,200.00 59.5%
Crossing Guard
Employee Benefits & Costs
FICA 63.55 279.00 22.8%
IPERS 96.02 402.00 23.9%
Medicare 14.86 65.00 22.9%
Unemployment Compensation 11.27 60.00 18.8%
Total Employee Benefits & Costs 185.70 806.00 23.0%
Salaries
Crossing Guard 1,575.00 4,500.00 35.0%
Total Salaries 1,575.00 4,500.00 35.0%

Page 3



12:13 AM

12/14/15
Cash Basis

Supplies
Crossing Guard - Other

Total Crossing Guard

Fire
Contracts w/Other Agencies
Coralville Fire Dep't
Hydrant Flush-City of lowa City

Total Contracts w/Other Agencies

Total Fire

Hazmat-Johnson County
Police
Commodities
Car Purchase
Major Equipment
Car Equipment

Total Major Equipment

Minor Equipment
Operating Police Equipment
Regular Officer Uniform

Total Minor Equipment

Supplies
Ammunition
Business Meetings/Meals
Office Supplies
Operating Supplies
Other Supplies
Postage/Shipping
Professional Memberships

Total Supplies

Total Commodities

Contractual Services
Garage Rental
Payments to Other Agencies
County Jail/Service/Filing Fees
Evidence testing
Technology Services

Total Payments to Other Agencies

Police Insurance-Car/Liability
Printing/Copying

Prof Serv-Psych Testing-Physica
Special Events Staff

Total Contractual Services

Police Benefits & Costs
Police FICA
Police Health Insurance
Police IPERS
Police Medicare
Police SUTA
Police Workers Compensation

Total Police Benefits & Costs

Police Gross Wages
Holiday & Other Pay
Miscellaneous Payroll Item
Police Gross Wages
Salaries-Reserves

Total Police Gross Wages

City of University Heights, lowa

Profit & Loss Budget vs. Actual
July through November 2015

Jul - Nov 15

0.00
0.00

1,760.70

15,508.50
0.00

15,508.50

15,508.50
525.50

0.00

2,250.00
2,250.00

678.00
0.00

678.00

2,550.00
0.00
1,106.90
0.00
604.85
76.38
330.00

4,668.13

7,596.13

600.00

0.00
0.00
0.00

0.00

0.00
7.01
552.00
175.00

1,334.01

7,731.71
4,102.59
11,217.62
1,810.32
681.44
958.00

26,501.68

18,473.69
395.00
105,826.66
0.00

124,695.35

Budget

200.00
0.00

5,506.00

31,820.00
3,520.00

35,340.00

35,340.00
526.00

16,000.00

5,000.00
5,000.00

1,500.00
3,500.00

5,000.00

3,500.00
300.00
3,000.00
3,000.00
2,000.00
600.00
400.00

12,800.00

38,800.00

2,400.00

300.00
150.00
500.00

950.00

7,802.00
1.000.00
500.00

12,652.00

16,541.00
13,417.00
26,253.00
3,869.00
2,000.00
18,031.00

80,111.00

28,000.00

238,773.00
24.00

266,797.00

% of Budget

0.0%
0.0%

32.0%

48.7%
0.0%

43.9%

43.9%
99.9%

0.0%

45.0%
45.0%

45.2%
0.0%

13.6%

72.9%

0.0%
36.9%

0.0%
30.2%
12.7%
82.5%

36.5%

19.6%

25.0%

0.0%
0.0%
0.0%

0.0%

0.0%
0.7%
110.4%

10.5%

46.7%
30.6%
42.7%
46.8%
34.1%

5.3%

33.1%

66.0%

44.3%
0.0%

46.7%

Page 4



12:13 AM

12/14/15
Cash Basis

Repair/Maint/Utilities
Telecommunications Expense
IT Support
Verizon/Pager Fees/Mediacom

Total Telecommunications Expense

Vehicle Operations
Fuel
Other
Washes

Total Vehicle Operations

Vehicle Repair
Bicycle Maint/Repair
Car Maint/Repair

Total Vehicle Repair

Total Repair/Maint/Utilities

Staff Development
Regular Officer Training
Academy Training
Officer Training
Training Supplies

Total Regular Officer Training
Total Staff Development
Total Police

Total PUBLIC SAFETY

PUBLIC WORKS
Other Public Works
Contracts-Other Agencies
IC Animal Center
IC Bus Service
SEATS Service

Total Contracts-Other Agencies

Total Other Public Works

Roads, Bridges, & Sidewalks
Contractual Services
Engineering Fees
Repairs/Improvements
Arterial panel replacements
Asphale patch projects
Local panel replacements
Melrose East - panel replacemnt
Sidewalk Repairs
Street Repairs
Sunset Street landscape
Traffic sign assessment/mgmt

Total Repairs/improvements
Striping/Curb Renumbering
Total Contractual Services

Snow Removal-Contractual
Storm water permit

Street Lighting Electricity
Street Sweeping-Contractual

City of University Heights, lowa

Profit & Loss Budget vs. Actual
July through November 2015

Jul - Nov 15

719.30
1,047.24

1,766.54

3,300.90
0.00
312.00

3,612.90

95.00
2,227.91

2,322.91

7,702.35

0.00
925.00
502.22

1,427.22
1,427.22
169,256.74

196,096.44

423.45
15,013.85
3,518.30

18,955.60

18,955.60

37,307.33

0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
5,198.80
5,617.00
0.00
1,366.00

12,181.80
5,218.00
54,707.13

0.00
0.00
3,382.24
0.00

Budget

1,000.00
3,636.00

4,636.00

16,000.00
500.00
700.00

17,200.00

200.00
10,000.00

10,200.00

32,036.00

7,500.00
6,500.00
2,000.00

16,000.00
16,000.00
446,396.00

502,968.00

1,200.00
36,161.00
8,444.00

45,805.00

45,805.00

50,000.00

16,000.00

4,000.00
13,500.00
23,000.00

2,500.00
4,500.00

63,500.00
6,000.00
119,500.00

35,000.00
3,000.00
8,500.00
3,500.00

% of Budget

71.9%
28.8%

38.1%

20.6%
0.0%
44.6%

21.0%

47.5%
22.3%

22.8%

24.0%

0.0%
14.2%
25.1%

8.9%
8.9%
37.9%

39.0%

35.3%
41.5%
4M1.7%

41.4%

41.4%

74.6%

0.0%
0.0%
0.0%
0.0%

0.0%
30.4%

19.2%
87.0%
45.8%

0.0%
0.0%
39.8%
0.0%

Page 5



12:13 AM City of University Heights, lowa
12114115 Profit & Loss Budget vs. Actual
Cash Basis July through November 2015
Jul - Nov 15 Budget
Traffic Controls and Safety
Street Signs-Commodities 26.50 250.00
Traffic Light Electricity 322.90 750.00
Total Traffic Controls and Safety 349.40 1,000.00
Total Roads, Bridges, & Sidewalks 58,438.77 170,500.00
Sanitation
Contractual
Grandview Recycling 153.00 1,200.00
Leaf Vacuuming 0.00 13,500.00
Trash/Recycling 10,486.25 20,862.00
Total Contractual 10,639.25 35,562.00
Total Sanitation 10,639.25 35,562.00
Total PUBLIC WORKS 88,033.62 251,867.00
Total Expense 434,813.72 956,409.00
Net Ordinary Income 167,256.54 779.00
Net Income 167,256.54 779.00

% of Budget

10.6%
43.1%

34.9%

34.3%

12.8%
0.0%
50.3%

29.9%
29.9%
35.0%
45.5%
21,470.7%

21,470.7%

Page 6



} abed

%0'004 000 e %0°00L 000 LL'8E9'SL %6°LEL 00'6.Z'€} 1v'586'16 3woay| 19N
343 %0 00} 000 12829'GL %6 LEL 00 6L2'€L 1¥'586'16 awodup AreupiQ 3oN
000 %6t 0000v'2€ 628’1 %C €5 00'9EL'€ZL 00 EV.'PBE asuadx3 [ejoL
000 000 %8 6% 00 Z9E'VEL 8} Z06'99 SHAOM D178N0d
ooo0 000 %1 oF 00°150'2Zy 90'607'694 A134vS oInand
000 000 %Z6LL 00 EVL'0L} L SS6'LEL LNIWNYIA0O TVHINIO
000 %6 € 0000p'2E 626V L 000 30IAN3S 1830
000 000 %1 0€ 00'//6'05 62 9EE'GL NOILY3NO3Y % uNLIND
000 000 %8 22 00000'S ooorL't "A3d JINONOD3 B ALINNWWOD

osuadxg
34 %4 TS 00'00p'2E 00'888'9+ %9 69 00 \p'9EL v 8zT.'T8Y yoid ssoin
e %1'2S 0000p'2E 00888'9L %969 00°Liv'eEL 1r'ez.'eey 3woou) jejo L
e 000 %0vC 00000'6 8661 L ALY¥3dOdd ® ASNOW 40 3ISN
000 6 95¢ 20699 SIAXVL ALID ¥3HLIO
000 000 %G Z€ 000SZ'ELt 9Z'Z0R'9E SIANNIAIY SNOINYTIIOSIN
000 000 %8905 00 068'9Z 0L'2.Z'9ElL S1INY3d *? SASN3ON
000 000 %6 89 00 6EE'Y /9'066'C "'NIAIY AIYYHSVLINIWHIAOOHILNI
000 %E LS 00°00b'2e L2 1E9'9L %E’LS 00 8€6'68S ¥0'25.'00€ SAXVL ALY3AJOYd TVHINID
000 000 %.L'€ 00000'L 00'.E SAJIAYIAS YOS SIDYVHD
awoau}

asuadxgjawonsu| AueuipiQ

196pna Jo % ya6png SI AON - [ 196png J0 %, 196png SL AON - I 196png Jo %, 1abpng SL AON - 0
IHUNLIFINOL 30170d 30IAN3S 1830 R CELEDR]
6102 1aqwaaoN ybnoayy Ajne siseg yseo
[en)oy 'sA }obpng sso R Jjoid SLPLREL

emo| ‘syybioH Ayssaaun jo Ao WY 91:ZL



Z 3abed

%L0LY'1E 00642 v5'952'291 %0001 000 8LLLE'S) %1°90¢- 000051~ L11S2'8¢ awoduj 31aN
%2 012 00644 ¥G'95¢2'/9t %0 001 000 gl LE'GL % '90€- 00'005'2L- 11'152'8e awoou| AeuipiQ 19N
%G 'Sy 00 60¥'956 ZLELR'YEY %Z €€ 00 L.€'€8 66'689'22 %08l 00'00S'2L} rlEL'Le asuadx3 |ej0)
%0 S€ 00'/99'152 29€e0'ss 000 %08l 0000G'241 v LEL'LT SHIOM o1T8Nnd
%0 6¢ 00'896'20S ¥ 960'96 L %0 €€ 00/16'08 8e489'02 000 Al34vS on8nd
%S LLL 00 /8L'ELL 80 BS6'CEL %6 0% 00 ¥SP'e 19Z00'L 000 INIWNYIA0D TVHINIO
%6'€ 0000F'ZE (A AL 000 000 32IAY3S 1830
%1 0€ 00 £/6'05 6T 9EE'SL 000 000 NOILVZNO3Y B 3¥NLIND
%8 ¢C 00000'S 000vL't 000 000 ‘A3a JDINONOD3 B ALINNWWOD
asuadxgy
%6 29 00881256 92 0£0'209 %L LS 00 LLE'ES 21190'er %995 00000'S0} 12 6BE'65 1yoid ssoun
%629 00'88L'/56 92 0.0'09 %2'LS 00 LLE'ES Z1'L90'EY %9 99 00°000'50L LZ 68E'65 swoouj |ejol
%Z 9¢ 00000'G vELLE'L G 8ol 000 ALH3dOYd ® ASNOW 40 3ISN
%0001 000 LLY8S'S 9’659 000 S3XVYL ALID ¥AHLO
%G'Ce 00°052'€LL 92'208'se 000 000 SIANNIAIY SNOINVTTIIIOSIN
%8 905 00 068'9Z 0L'L42'9EL 000 000 SLINN3d ® SISN3DIN
%l 1S 00'6EE'60} 88'6.€'29 000 %995 00°000'50L LZ 68E'65 “"NIATY QIUVHSV.LNIWHIAODN¥ILNI
%E’LS 00'604'L0L LE 1/9'65€ %2'0S 00 LLE'e8 96 €622V 000 SIAXVL ALH3dO¥d TVH3INID
%/, '€ 00000t 00 L€ 000 000 S32IAYIS YOS SADUVYHD
awoou|

asuadx3/swoou) AeuipiQ

196png jo % 19Bpng §L AON - NP 126png yo % 1abpng Gl AON - Inf° jabpng J0 % jebpng Gl AON - Inf
IvioL SLI4IN3E IIA0TdNI Xv1 3sn avoy
§10Z JoqwaAoN ybnoayy Ainr siseg yse)
jenjoy "SA ummu:m $S07 9 Jijoid SHPLRZL

emo| ‘syybiey Ayssaalun jo Ao Wy 9124



| abeq

000
000

000
000
000
000

000
000
000

000
000

0o

000
000
000

000
000

000

goo

000
000

000
000

000

000
000
000
000
000
000
goo

000
000

19bpng 0 % 1eBpng
JY¥NLIZIWOL 32170d

SL AON - Inf

62962
62'95¢

000
000
000

000

000
000
000

000
000

000

000
000
000

000
000

000

000

000
000

000
000

L2 1E9'9L

000
000
000
000
LLLEQ'OL
000
000

%E LS 00 00v'ZE

%E LS 0000%'2E

000
000

196png Jo % 196png
301AN3S 1830

S} AON - N

%S TE
%8 0¢C|
%0'G-

%06

%1'CE

%CTEE
%Y'LC

%0061
%y T

%8 905

%8VLl

%E LLL
%0'.EL

%E¥20'L
%00
%6 89

%00

%00

%E LS

%605
%E 1S
%605
%6 LE

%00

%LE
%€

1ebpng 40 %

510Z JoqwaaoN ybnoayy Ainp
jenjoy "SA uow—usm S$S07 g Jijoid

emo| ‘spybiaH Ausiaaun jo Ao

0005Z'ELt
00000t
00'000'L
00'000'L

00000'26

00'000'06
00000°L

00052
000001

00'068'9Z

00'005'9L

00'005's+
00'000't

00'000'0L
0006€

00'6EE'Y

00'6EE'Y

00 6EEY

00'8€6'58S

00'509'v¥
00'2L2'P)S
00°Evt'LL
00'2SZ'v)

00'6EE 't~

00'000°L
00'000'L

126png
RV ENED]

20'699'%
20'699'%

92'208'9€

05'20C'L
00'0g-

00°0%-

89'85.'LE
89'88'6Z
00026'L

00'Sip
BO'LIP'E

07'1/Z'9EL

00'058'8C
0008V’ LT
000.€'L

0L'/zy'L04
000

19'066'C

000

000
000

19086'C
19'066'C

¥0'252'00€

16'869'CC
60'€26'€9C
v9'€CL'
o '90v's
000

000

000

00 ¢
00 ¢

SL AON - Inf

SIAXVL ALID ¥IHLO [ejoL

xe} as19x3 AN
SAXVL ALID ¥3HIO

SINNIATH SNOANVITIADSIW lejoL
SJUSWASINQWIDY PUR SPUNJIYy
awoou| "SIy [B101

120
awodu| "ISIN

seuld [BjoL

10 30 jjO-sauly syjel]
saul4 Bunjed
sauly
suopnquuod
asiysuesd AL 3|qeD
SIANNIAIY SNOINVTIIOSIN

S1INY3d ? SISN3ON 8301

SJULIaY/SaSUOI ISIW |BIOL

sHWIRY |ejudy
shuuad Bunped
SHWIBJ/SISUBDIT "ISIN
sjuLad yuawdinbg/Buip|ing
sjuLad 615/10nbreup 1009
SLINY3d ? SISNIJN

“AAIY QIAVYHS/TVLNIWNIAODYILNI 230l

S3NUAASY PIILYS BIBIS 18I0

uoaNIsuUoy) 193135/95 peoy
Juwoidy xe] Apadoud jeissswwor)
SONUBABY PAJBEUS 3181

"9SINQUIISY/SIUBID 9)elS JUIO [BIOL

f13)eg ouger] puasu) JaqIeas
*8SINQUIBY/SIUBID B1RIS 110
INNIATY GIUVHSIVINIWHIAODHILNI

SAXVYL ALYIJOUd TVHINIO |eoL

A9 Jisuel
xe] Apadoid Jeinbay
£Aaan saoimag fseiqr]

Aaa 9sueinsu)
Anra 2011898 199Q
Ipe Juwidy xe] doud [el2 bo]
SalAaT s)yeusg
SAXVL ALHILOUd TVHINID
S3OIAYAS ¥O4 SIOUVHO Ie10L
suoday asljod
S3DIAYIS ¥Od SIOUVHO

awosu)
asuadxz/awoou) euipi0

siseg ysen
SLIVLRL
Wy s4:2L



Z abeg

198png jo %

j9bpng
UNLEINOL 3010d

34

34

e
We

§1 AON - [nf

%l s

%l 25

196png Jo %

00°00p'Z€ 00'888'9L %9 59 00 Lib'oes
00 00%'Z€ 00888'9l %9 G9 00'LLP'9EL
000 %0 e 00000'S
000 %0+ 00000'S
jebpng §1 AON - Inp* jebpng Jo % 108png
IOIAN3S 1830 b\ CENED]

S10Z JaqwiaAoN ybnouy Anp
enjdy "SA acmt:m $S07 9 }joid
emo| ‘spybiaH Aissaaun jo Ao

b8’y

L¥'8TL'Tey

8.661'L
82664

§1 AON - Inf

jyolid sso1n
awoou| [e101

ALN3dO¥Nd ¥ AINOW JO 3SN [EIoL
| ysed uo 1sassiuj
ALM3IdOHd ? AINOW JO 3SN

siseg ysed
SHYIRE
Wy si:Zi



¢ abed

000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000

000

000
000

000

000
000
000

000

000
000
000

000
000

000
000

000

000
000

000

000
000
000

000
000

ooo
000

1bpng o % 196png
3M¥NLIZANOA 301704

Sl AON - Inf*

000 %0 264 006Z)
000 %06 00'000'€
000 %Y Th 0005
000 %204 0000v'%
000 %9¥Z 00'0$6'2
000 %00 00052
000 %9 LS 00000'}
000 %912 0000/
000 %00 00000}
000 %0 6€ 00'LB2'+C
000 %0'8Y 00°005
000 %0'8Y 00'005
000 %E OF 00008y
000 %6 0€ 00'009't
000 %0 S¥ 00'000'C
000 %0 0 00000}
000
000
000
000
000 %Ly 00 167'94
000 %L\ 00 +6¥'9L
000 %0'0 00002
000 %00 00002
%6'€ 00 00v'zZE 6C6PZ't
%00 00'000'0E 000
%12 0000¥'2 6Z6r2't
000 %} 0€ 00 £/6'05
000 %1 €01 00'008'S
000 %000+ 00°000'S
000 %ECTL 00008
000 %802 00'2/9'%Y
000 % €L 00005
000 %822 00000'S
000 %8 2T 00'000'S
190png Jo % 19bpng §L AON - Inf 196png Jo % 1ebipng
JDIAM3S 1630 L CENED]

510z J8quiaAoN ybnoayy Ainp

|en)oy ‘sA jJabpng ss0 ' JJoid
emo ‘sjybiaH Assaaiun jo Ao

000rZ
9€'0/2
oc'le

000.¥

v0'/2.

000
61G.S
SCiSh
000

68605'8

ele}¢i 24
0o0'0be

0L'v6€'}
66 €6V

12006
000

000

000
000
000

GL'ei8'e
S1118'9

000
000

000

000
000

6Z 9EE'SL

6.8.6'S
00°000'S

6.'8.6

05'162'6
0099

oo ovk'l
oo'ovk't

S} AON - Inf

saa4 dn 198 Gunespy
suoneanqnd reba
$334 pienopjueg
s3a4 Bununoosoy
Sa0IAJSS |eN)ORHUOD

sapjipowwoy) [ej0L

sBunaaw Buide
abejsod pue saiddng asy0
ouyaa] /saljddngauawdinbg Jouly
aJempog/aiempieq
sapipowiwo)
ulWPpY aouBULY F J3INSEAI| PUBID

sBuipping |esaus 3 JleH A1D [ejoL

awlj ued Jejnbay-saueeg [ejo]
Jue)ISISSY SaNijIoe

awi] Hed senbay-sauejeg

saninnAvieREday felol

n

SUONEBDIUNWILWIODA|S |

ERUTTITET
sannAuEeday

$1S02) @ S)youag aako|dwg [ejoL

EYCEITET
SHadi
voIid
s1509 '@ S)YauUdg dako|dwy
lemde)U0) |0 L

S9SBaT R SUDY
|lenjoeNUOD
Ssapipowwio) |ejo
satddng
sapIpowwo)
sbuipjing |essuag) g lleH AuD
INIWNHIA0D TVH3INID
JOIAY3S 1930 IeJoL
lediouud
1s8493U]
J0IAN3S 1930

NOLLYINO3Y ? 3¥NLTIND [BlIOL

SHed |ejoL
uonnquiuod ayepdn yred
sasuadx3 yed
sred
Aseagny
spoeloid yoddng Alunwwon
NOLLYZNO3Y 2 JHNLIND
‘A3G DINONOD3 9 ALINNINIWOD [eloL
2D ume/BunuiL 831

‘A30 DINONOO3 ® ALINNWWOD
asuadxy

siseg ysen
SLiviizL
Wv S4:21



¢ abeyd

000 000 %S 65 00002'SH 00'S%0'6 suonoadsu| Buipjing |ejo L
000 000 %G'65 00002'sL 00's¥0'6 uopoadsui |eyuay / Buipiing
suonosadsu| Buipjing
AlL34vS oInand
000 000 %Z 641 00 ErL'0LE LV'GS6'LEL LINFWNYIAOD TVHINID j&10L
000 000 14 00'0St'9 00 €El asueansu| Aujiqer] Hoy
000 000 0000071 stshjeuy JIL
000 00'0 %0'SC 00'/96' SZ'Leb'L suonesadQ |1ounod/ioke [e1oL
000 000 %0'ST 00'/96'S S2'16p'L awil) Med Jeinbay-sauejes (ejoL
Q00 000 %062 00496t SLev lohew
000 000 %0 ST 00000t 00'000'L (1ounoy
awn] yed Jejnbay-sauejes
000 000 000 $1509 B Siyauag dafojdwy |ejo|
000 000 000 uonesuadwo?) yuawiojdwaun
000 000 000 aled|papy
000 000 000 11oUNoY-SH3dI
000 000 000 vauid

S1509) P sljauag aakojdwg
suonesadQ jIounodiohey

000 000 %9961 00'000'05 90'/0€'86 S9dIAI9g feba
000 000 %00 00'009't 000 sasuadx3 uonss|z
000 000 %C'8E 00'G€6'vC 18'216'6 UNpY ddUBULY @ JAINSE3I| PISID [eloL
000 ooo % CL 00'00€'e €8'06E'Z uswdojarsg KelS [eJOL
000 000 % L 00'00€'E €8'06E'C sdiysiaquiay 2 sang 2101

000 000 %0001 00599'} £8%99'L juswissassy 900

000 000 %EVLL 00'GE9 00'9¢L santy jo anbea |

000 000 %00 00005 000 sdiysiequialy pue sang

000 000 %00 00 00S 000 22J3WwWo) jo saquieyd

sdiysiequisiy p sang
juswdojaraq yers

000 000 %8 €Y 00008'6 €188ty auil] Med teinbay-sauees |ejo)
000 000 %8 €Y 00008'6 £1'882' UBLIOJSIH “JaNSEal] 1D
awi] Ued seinbay-sauejes
000 000 000 $1502 P Slysuag aakojdw3z [eroL
000 000 000 I dwo) Aordwaun
000 000 000 aJeslpa|y
000 000 000 SyadI
000 000 000 vold
$150D 'g Slyauag aakojdwig
000 000 %8'€T 00'g88'8 18LLLe S92IAJBS (BNIORAUOD [BIOL
000 000 %E 06 00'0G. 6Z'1/9 saolalag ABojouyoa )
000 000 %9 98 00 00S 00 €Ey Buikdop/Bunuud
000 000 %00 0009 000 salousby Jayi 01 sjuswAhed |ejol
000 000 %0'0 0009 000 so94 luejoN
salouaby JayjQ 01 sjuswiey
1abpng 0 % 1ebpng Gl AON - N[ 1abpng Jo % 1ebpng §L AON - Inf 1e6png Jo % 1e6png §1 AON - Inf
NLI3IHOL 32NM0d 2DIAN3S 18930 IVH3NTD
§10Z 49quaaoN ybnouayy Ainp siseg ysen
|enjdy "SA uwm_u:m SSO07 B Jjoid ShiviieL

emo] ‘syybiay Ayssaaiun jo Ao WY 5124



g abed

000

000
000
000

000
000

0oo

000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000

000
000

0o'o
000

000
000

000

000
000

000

000
000

000
000

000

000
000
000
000

128png 10 % 1e6png

FANLI3IHOL 301M0d

Gl AON - Inf

196png jo %,

000 %00
000 %00
000 %00
000 %00
000 %0'GZ
000 %964
000 %G 9€
000 %G 28
000 %22}
000 %2 0F
000 %00
000 %6 9€E
000 %00
000 %6 2L
000 %IE}
000 %00
000 %Z St
000 %0 S¥
000 %0 St
000 %00
000 %6 66
000 %6t
000 %6 EY
000 %00
000 %.8F
000 %S €€
000 %00
000 %00
000 %0'GE
000 %0 GE
000
00'0
000
000
000
1ebpng SL AON - N[ 18bpng j0 %
ADIANIS 1930

6102 1aqwaAoN ybnoayy Ajnp
|enjdy ‘sSA uwm—..v:m S$S07 @ Jjoid
emo| ‘syyBreyH Ayisiaaiun jo Ao

00 0S6

0000S
00051
00'00€

0000P'C

00'008'8E

00008'ZH

00 00v
00008
000002
00'000'€
00000'€
00 00e
00'00S'e

00000'S

00°005'e
0000S't

00000'S
00000's

00 000'9L

00925
00'0VE'SE

00'0¥E'SE

000zS'e
00028't€

00'00L'%

000
00002

00005 ¥
00005y

196png
IVHINTD

000

000
000
000

00009

€1'965'2

€1'899'%

00 0ee
8€ 9/
8709
000
06'904'}
000
00055'2

00849

000
0082

00052'Z
00052'T

000

05'gzg
05'80G'SL

05'805'SH

000
05'805'S}

00'G.5'}

000
000

00'GS'Y
00'6/5'L

000
000
000

000
ooo

SL AON - Inr

1ouaby JaLQ 03 Aed |eror

sadiaeg ABojouysa)
Bunsa) asuapiag
sea Buid/esinegiirer funod
sa1ouaby JayiQ o) sjuawied
[eyuay abeieq)
S82IA19G [ENJOENUOY

SeRIpOWWOY [e10)

salddng jeyo L

sdiysiaquiapy |euolssajosd
Buddiygabeysogd
salddng JayiQ
saijddng BuyeladQ
salddng aau30
s[eajy/sbunesiy ssauisng
uonunuUWY

saliddng

juawdinb3 souly B304

uuoyun 189140 seinbay
juawdinb3 aoijod Gunesado
jJusawdinbz Joulw

juawdinb3 Jofey jejog

wawdinb3 Je)
juawdinbg sofey
aseysind sep
sapowwon
adljod
fQunog uosuyor-jewzey

all4 |ejol

S219UabYy JAYIO/M SIOBILOD [BJOL

AatD emo] jo Aio-ysnid uespAy
ydeq aud sjiAesC)
sajouaby JaYlO/Mm SJoRIUOD
aid
pJens) Buissol) |ejo)

18410 - paeng Buissol)
salddng

saue[eg |ejo)

pleng Buissoln
sauejeg

1509 B Sjyausg s9kojdwz eyol
! dwod Aojdwaur
a1ealpaly
Sy3dl
Yald
S1509) P Slyauag aakojdwz
pJens) Buissoi)

siseg ysep
SLiviZL
WV SL:ZL



g abed

000

000

000

000
000
000

000

000

000
000

000

000
000
000

000

000
000

000

000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000

1abpng Jo % 196png
J¥NLIZINO4 30170d

Sl AON - [Nf

000
000
000

ooo

000
ooo
000

000

Q00

000
000

000

000
000
000

000

000
000

000

000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000

196png Jo % jebpng
3IDIAN3S 1830

S} AON - Inr

%1 0¥
%0 6€
%6 8

%68

%l ST
%C ¥l
%00

%0 ¥C

%82C

%E T
%S v

%0'LC

%9 ¥
%00
%9 02

%l 8€

%8 8¢
%6 1L

%l'9Y

%00
%E vr

%0 99

%S0

%y OLL
%L 0
%00

196png jo %

G10Z JaquaAoN ybnoayy Ainr
jenjdy "sA uwmﬁ:m $S07 B Jijoid

emo| ‘sjybiay Ayissaaun jo Ao

00°160'2ey
00'682'99€
00000'SL

00'000'9)

000002
00005'9
00°005'Z

00'9€0'Z€

00002'0L

00000'0L
00002

0000Z'LL

0000/
00005
00'000'9+

00'9E9'Y

00'9E9'E
00'000°'L

00°/62'99¢
0ve
00€.L'8EC

00'000'82

00289

00 00S
00000’}
00208'L

19bpng
IVH3NTD

90'60v'69)
9065yl
ey’

cz et

22208
00626
000

SE'TOL'L

1622€'C

16 /22T
0066

06'C19'c

oozie
000
06'00E'E

¥599.L'L

¥TIv0'L
ogels

GE'S69'VTL

000

99 928'S0}
00'g6€
69°€/b'8)

000

000
ooo
000
000
000
000

LO'PEE'L

00'GLL
00 Zss
102
000

S} AON - inf

AL34vS 01N8Nd felot
aoljod |ej0L
juawdojarag Yels [e1o]

Bujuies | 12530 Jenbay [e10)

salddng Guiulesy
Buues) 13210
Buiutes] Awapeosy
Buures] JaoyQ seinbay
awdojaaaqg yeis

sanlnnauien/eday (elo)

lreday 3joIyaA [BI0L

Jedaypuiely Jes

nedayaulely ajphaig
1ieday adIyap
suonesadQ 3|91YysA [e10L

SaUSEA

2yo

[EUE
suonesadQ 3IoIYsA

3 suone| 131 1ejol

wooeipajy/saad Jabed/uozuap
woddng 11
asuadxy SUOHEIIUNWIWOD|3 |
samnnAueyaredoy
sabepy ssou9 ao1jod [eloL
SaAIaSaY-SoaLejeS
sabepp ssou0) 9o1j0d
way| |loshed snoaue|j@osiy
Aed 10y10 2 AepiioH
sabep ssolo) aoljog
S)S0D % Sjyauag adljod [ej0L

uonesuadwoy SIaHIOM 221j0d
v.1ns 82jod
21e21pay 991j0d
S¥3di 9dt10d
asuesnsu| YyieaH asljod
VOld @2jod
$150D B Slysuag sdllod
S391AJ9G [ENJORIUOY) [BJOL

1e1S SjusAg |e1dadg
eaisfyd-bunsa) yoshsd-a1ag joid
BuiAdon/Bunuuyg
Ajjiqernsen-asueinsu) asijod

siseg yseo
SLvLiZL
Wv sL:2)



1 abed

%000} 00’0 e
re
000
000
000

000

000
000
000

000

000

000
000

000
000
000
000

000

000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000

000

000
000

000
000
000

196png jo % 196png
FANLIFLHOL 39170d

Sl AON - Inf

%000 000 L8951 %6 LEL 00'6L2'EL
%0 001 000 L2'8e9'sL %6 LEL 00'BLEEL
%6'C 00'00%'2¢ 62 642"} %Z €5 00'gEL'ETL
000 %8'6¢ 00'L9e'vEL
000 %6 62 00'295'se
000 %662 00'295'sE
000 %E 05 00298'0¢
000 %00 0000S'EL
000 %8 TL 0000Z'}
000 %t 0L 00'000'€S
000
000
000
000
000
000 %00 00'000'€
000
000 %9V 00'000'05
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000 %9 YL 00000'05
000 %t Ly 00'S08'Sy
000 %' Lt 00'608'Sy
000 %L L 00vhr'e
000 %S bt 00'L9L'9E
000 %E GE 0000Z'+
1a6png Jo % 1ebpng SL AON - Inf 196png o % 1ebpng
JDIAN3S 1930 R ENED)

§1.0Z JoquiaaoN ybnoayy Ainp
|enjdy ‘sSA uwmﬂsm $S07 % Jjoid

emo| ‘syblaH Asiaalun jo Ao

LV'SBE'L6
Ly'GB6'L6
D0'ERLVBE
BL 206'99
SZ'6E90L

SZ'6E9'0L

GZ'98Y'01
000
00 €St

€€'/0¢'/€

000

ooo
000

000
000
000
000

€€°L0€'E
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
ooo
000
000

€€'20€'L€

09'656'81

09'656'8L

0€8lS'E
GB'€L0'SL
Sr'ecr

Sl AON - Inf

awoou| 12N
awosuy AewpiQ 18N
asuadx3 [gjol

SHHOM 217and leloL
uoneueg [e30L

Jemyaeaiuod |30 )

Buyohoayysesy
Buiwnnoep jea
Bupohoay mapuels
[en3oenUo)
uonejiues

s)lemapIS B ‘sabpug ‘speoy [e30)

K1ajeg pue sjonu0) dYel] [BI10L

Ayo130313 Y611 ouyesy

sapipownon-subig 19ans
A12Jeg pUB S|0JU0D JUJel]
1enjoenuo)-buidsamg joansg
Anouoal3 bunybi 10ang
Juuad Jajem Wio)s
|enjoBUOD-[EACWDY MOUS

S32IAISS [ENJORIHUOY |0 L
Buuaquinuay qingBuidulg
sjuawarosdwysiieday jero}

Jwbwpauawssasse ubis oyjes)
adeospue| j9a1g 19sung
sieday 19318
sJieday sremapis
wade|dal [sued - }seg asosap
sjuawaoejdal |aued |esoT]
sjoofoud yoyed sjeydsy
sjuawade|das |oued |euspy

sjuawarosdwyysiieday

$994 Buussuibugy

S39IAI9G |EMIENUOD
sy|emapis g ‘'sebpug ‘speoy

SHIOMA J1[gnd 13410 [BJ0L
sa|ouaby Jayjp-s1oenuo) [B10 |

201198 S1VIS
asinag sng o)
J9jua] Jewluy o]
sa|ouaby Jayjp-s1oenuos
S}JOM 211qGnd J8WO
SMYOM oInand

siseqg ysen
SLvLZL
WvstL:zy



g abed

%0 001
%0 001

%HSZE
HBOZL
%0'S-

%0'S

%L TE
%l ee
%Y LC

%0 061
%b vT

%8905

%8PLL
%E 2111
%0LEL

%EVLO'L
%00

%l LS

%E VS

%9 99
%00

%000}
%0 00L

%E LS

%6 0%
%E LS
%6 05
%6LE
%E LS
%00

%4 08

%lE
%L €

13bpng jo %

000
000

000STELL
00000}
00000'}
00°000'}

00'000'26
00'000'06
00000’

0005¢
00'000'%4

00'088'se
00’005 91
0000551
00'000'L

00°000'0L
00'06€

00'6€€'601

00'6EE'60L

00'000'50}
00'6€E'V

000
000

00'60.'1L0L

00'509'vv
0022718
00'EPL'LL
00'2sT vl
00'00v'C€
00'6€€ ¥~
00'L/E'E8

00000}
00000'L

Jabpng
IVLOL

1Lv88's
LL¥85'S

92'Z08'9e

05 20Z'L
00°05-

0005

8985.'1E
89'8€8'6Z
000Z6'L

00G.¥
80 LIv'E

0L LLZ'9EL

00058'82
0008v'/T
000LE'}

0/'zzy' L0V
000

88'6.€'C9

12'68€'65

1Z'68E'65
000

19'066'C
19'066'C

L€'2/9'65€

1686922
60 €26'€92
y9€zL'e
ob'90Y's
L2 1E9'9)
000

95 €622

00 e
00 ¢

§1 AON - Inf

9 659
9’659

000
000
000

000

000
000
000

000
000

000

000
000
000

000

000

000 %9 95 00000'50}

000 %9 85 00000'S0L

ooo %9 85 00'000'G0}
000

000
000

%1 08 00'L/E'E8 95'€62'ey

000

000

000

000

000

000
%208 00'LIE'e8 95 '€62'CY

000
000

196png 40 % 19bpng Sl AON - Inf 196png 30 9 1ebpng
SL1I43N38 I3A0TdW3 XV1 3$N avoy

6102 J2qwaAoN ybnoayy Aine
[enjoy "sA jJobpng $s0 B J0Id
emo| ‘syybrey Ayssanun jo A1D

000
000

000
0oo
000

000

000
000
000

000
000

000

000
000
000

000
000

12 68€'6S

L2 68E'6S

1Z2'68E'65
000

000
000

000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000

S} AON - In[

SAXVL ALID ¥3HLO 1e104
xe] as10x3 Ayan
SIXVL ALID ¥IHLO

SINNIAIYH SNOINVYTIIOSIN lejol
N pue

awooul *osIy 2101

Y0
awosuy "SIy

seuld [BjoL

10 J0 YIO-sduld oljel |
saulg Bupped
saury
suopnquiued
asiysuesq Al 3|qeD
S3NNIAIY SNOINVIT3OSIN

SLIWY3d ¥ SISNION IBI0L

S)IULIBG/S5U3217 "OSI| |e10L

sjuIad |ejuay
sjulad bunped
S)ilIa4/Sasuan ISy
sjuuad uawdinb3/buippng
syuuRd Hi1naonbiyeupiasg
SLlINd3d 8 S3SN3ON

“"IAIY QFUVYHSTVLNIWHIAODUILNI [e10L

SanUaAay PaJeys AelS B0 )
UoIIONIISUOY) 1931S/9SN Peoy
Juwdidy xe] Apadold je1dsawwod)
sanuasay paieug 91BIg

'3SINqUUIISY/SIURIS 2)elS JSYIO [eloL

Alajeg ouyel ) fuadu| J|aqiess
3SINGLUISY/SIURIL) 981G JaLN0
INNIATY QIYYHSTVLINIWHIAODUIANI

SAXVL ALYIJOUd TUINTD [B10L

AAa1 usues)
xe] Auadold Jejnboy
A9 seomueg Meiqr
AnaT @oueInsy)|
A2 9211138 1920
fpe Juwdy xe) doid feraawwod
Sa1A9T Sjyauag
SAXVYL ALHIdO¥d TVHIN3D
S3ADIAYIAS YO STADYVHD IBI0L
spoday asljod
SIJIAYIS YO SADUVHO

awosu|
asuadxgz/swoou] AeuipiQ

siseg ysen
SLvLZE
Wy GL:2l



6 abed

%629
%629

%< 92
%C'9C

396png 40 9,

00'881'.56

00'egl'/s6

00000's
00°000°s

198png
IwioL

92'0£0'209

9200209

VELLE')
PELLE'L

SL AON - Inf

%l LS

%LLS

196png 40 %

00'L2€'e8 LL190'ep %9 95
00°LE'ER LL1S0'EY %995
SL80L
SL'80L
jebpng S1 AON - N[ 196png 40 %
S1143NZE IIA0HWI

5§10z JaquiaaoN ybnoay Ainp

|enjoy "sA jJabpng sso1 B Jjoid
emo] ‘syybiaH AyisisAlun jo Ao

00'000'S0}

00000'50}

19bpng
Xv.1 3Sn avoy

1Z'68€E'6S
12'68€'65
000

000

Sl AON - inf

1014 SSOID)

alwodu| [ejo)

AL¥3d0Oud 3 AANOW 40 3sSn =0l

SIUBWISAAU| YSEY) UO 1S3193U)
ALY3d0O¥d 8 ASNOW 40 3ISN

siseg ysed
SHYLRZL
L) 4] %4



ol abed

%0 261
%06
%Yy
%, 0L

%9 e

%00
%9'/S
%9 L
%00

%6 8E

%08
%0 8¥

%€ 0E

%6 0€
%0 Gt
%00

%00

%00
%00
%00

%Ly
%L\

%00
%00

%6 €

%00
%1 ¢S

%L°0e

%L €0}

%0001
%ETCh

%8 0C
%TEL

%8 ¢C
%82T

196png jo %

00621
00'000'€
00°0S
00'00%'y

00'0$6'2

00°052
00°000'+
00004
00'000'L

00'v/8°LT

0000g
00°00S

00009'%

00'009'L
00000'Z
00'000'L

ooes

002
00'Gh
o0'le

00 I6v'9L
00'L6¥'9L

00 00¢
00002

00'00p'ZE

00'000'0E
00'00%'2

00'£26'05

00'008's
00000's
00008

00'L.9'vY
00'00g

00'000'S

00'000'S

1ebpng
WI0L

00 0Fe
9e0LC
oc'ie

000.Lp

y0'22L

000
6LG.S
erAal =13
000

$8'605'8

ooore
00 ove

0 ¥6E'}

66 €6Y
1,006
000

000

000
000
000

SL'1/8'9
SL'H/8'9

000
000

6Z6vZ't

000
6Z6vC'L

67 9EE'S)

6.'8/6'S

00'000's
6496

0562’6
0099

000rL'L
00'0ovL'L

S| AON - inf

000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000

%00 ooee 000

000
000

000

000
000
000

%0 0 00 €8 000

%00 00 . 000
%00 00y 000
%00 0o'Le 000

000
000

000
000

000

000
000

000

000
000
000

000

000

000

000

12Bpng 30 9% 1e6png Gl AON - N[

S1143N39 33A0dW3

§10Z JoquaAaoN ybnoay Ainp
|enjoy ‘SA uwmvsm SSO0T7 9 J1joid
emo| ‘sjybray Ayssaaiun jo £19

196png
XvL 3sn avoy

000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000

000
000

000

000
000
000

000
000
000
000

000
000

000
000

000

000
000

0oo

000

000
000

000

000
000

000

Sl AON - r

s394 dn 1ag Buneay
suonesiqng [e6a
s934 paenopjueg
saa4 Bunpunosay
S321AI98 |EN)JOENUOD

sapIpowwoy [ejoL

sbunsaw buide )
abejsod pue sanddng asu0

ouyaa | ssaiiddngpuawdinbg souly

aJemyog/asemprey
salipowwo)
UUPY 9JUBUIY P JOINSEAI] PUBID

sBuipjing [esauas) @ |[eH 1D |ejoL

awll] ued Jeinbay-sauees [ejoL
JUBISISSY Sanlioed

awi) ped sejnbay-sauejes

nnauep/redsy ejoL

samn

SUOBEIILINWIWO93J8 |

asueuajurely
InnAueyJedsy

51500 B Sjyouag sakojdw |eyof

sal;

sal

asedpapy
Sy3adl

vold
s1509) @ sjyauag aafojdwg

1enoenuol) 1ol

S3sSPa B SUdY
[enyoenuod
safIpowio) |ejo)
sayddng
sanipowwod)
sBuipiing |esaua9 3 lleH A1
ANIWNNIA0D TWHINID
20IAN3S 1930 [e10)
lediduud
1sas2)U|
FoIAN3S 1830

NOILY3HOIY 7 JUNLIND 8101

Syed [ejol
uonnquuo) ayepdn ded
sasuadx3 yied
sed
Aeign
spoaloid yoddng fjiunwwod
NOILY3¥O3Y % ¥NLIND
‘A3 JINONOD3 ? ALINNWIWNOD 1B10L
ajey ume/Bulwy) a3

*A3d JINONOD3 2 ALINNWWOD
asuadxg

siseg ysen
112147741
Wv §1ZL



11 abed

%G 65
%G 65

%SG LLL

%l c
%0004

%052

%0'sc

%052
%0'sC

%t'GC

%G 02
%6 vT
%l 02
%b LT

%9961
%00

%8 8E
%'l

%Y L

%0 001
BEVLL
%00
%00

%8'EP
%8'ey

%V'8y

%S ¥
%C S
%E LS
%C 9

%8'€C

%E 06
%9 98

%00
%00

1abipng Jo %

00'00Z'S}H
0000Z'SL

00'/6L'ELL

00'05+'9
000

00'€65'9

00/96'S

00'296'}
00000'%

009z9

0008
00 /8
0068
00'04¢

00000'05
00009’}

00089'9Z
00 00E'E

00 00€E'E

00699’}
00 6€9
00 00$
00 00s

00008'6
00008'6

00svL'L

000zl
002rl
00¢G.8
00809

00688'8

000sL
0000g

0008
0009

1eBpng
IYLOL

00's¥0'6
00'6¥0'6

80'BS6'CEL

00EEl
000007}

pL'ev9'L

Sl ieb'L

SLley
00°000'}

6€ .61

Lol
€912
98/l
6v'10L

90'/0€'86

000

€0'E9E0L
€8 06€'C

£806€E'C

€8'799't
009¢.
000
000

€882
€188Z'

(44 2]

28 6%
9969
00 6v¥
¥2'082

1812

§C./9
ooeey

000
000

S} AON - Inf

%6 0¥

%l S¢

%l SC

%502
%6 ¥C
%102
%Y'LZ

%y 8y

%P 8y

%S Ly
%C o¥
%E LS
%T oY

19Bpng Jo %

00'¥5¥'C

00929

00929

0008
00'/8
0068
oo oie

00'SPL'L

00SPLL

000Z4
00'erl
00'G/8
00809

1abpng
S1143N38 3IA0dNI

000
000

19200'}

000
000

6€'L5L

000

000
000

[Sowiels

Lol
€912
98 /L
6% 10l

000
000

[2A4 <]
000

000

coo
000
000
000

000
000

[z 4]

8’6y
99'G9
00'6¥y
¥.'082

000

000
000

000
000

§I AON - NP

§1.0Z JaquiaaoN ybnoayy Aine

|en)ay "sA }9bpng ss01 B Jjoid
emo| ‘sjybiray Apssaaun jo Auo

000
000

000

000
000

000

000
000
000

000

Q00
000
000
000

000
000
000

000

000

000
000
000
000

000
000

000

Q00
000
000
000

000

000
000

000
000

Gl AON - |nr

suopoadsu) Bupjing |e10L

uonosadsu| [ejuay / Butpjing
suonsadsu| Gupjing
Al34vs o11and

ANIFWNJIAOD TVHINID (BloL

soueinsul Aunger woy
sishjeuy Hi1

suoljesadQ j1ouncH/IoAey |ejo L

aw] yed Jeinbay-sauees |ejol

J0fel
pounc)
Buwi] Hed reinbay-sauejes

s1509) @ Slydusg sakojdw3 feyo

uonesuadwo?) juawiojdwoaun
aledipajy
112uUNOD-SY3dI
voId
5)S02) ' sjyauag aakojdwz
suonesadQ pounodtokely
saoteg |eba
sasuadx3 uonaala

UIWPY 82UBULY P JAINSEA] PUB[D [RIOL
juswdojaraq yeis [e1oL

sdiyssaquiapy 9 sang |e10]

JUSISSASSY DO
sanI) Jo anbea y|
sdiysiaquisy pue sanq
9243WWOY JO J3qWeYD
sdiysiaquesy § sang
wawdojarag yeis

awi] ued rejnBay-saueeg |eIoL

ueUO)SIH “Janseal] HualD
auwn) yed sejnbay-sauejeg
$]150) ® Sjyauag sakojdwig |ejoy
uonesuadwos uswiojdwaun
alesipapy
Sy3adi
voId
51509 ¥ sjysuag aakojdwz
S901AJ3G |PN)ORHUOD |BI0 L
sa91M9g ABojouyoa)
BuiAdon/Bunuug

6y JoU10 0} Aed [e101

saag fuejoN
salsuaby JayQ 01 syuswifed

siseg ysen
SLviie)
WY sL:21



Z1 abegq

%00

%00
%00
%00

%0'6T

%9 61

%G 9E

%G 8
%.TL
% 0€
%00

%6 9€
%00

%6 2L

%9 €l

%00
%C SP

%0'sy
%0 G

%00

%666
%6 €

%6 eV

%00
%/ 8%

%0ce

%00
%00

%0'GE
%0'GE

%0'eC

%881
%6'CT
%6 €C
%B'CC

196png 10 %

00 056

00005
000st
00°00E

00°00%'C

00'008'8€

00°008'CL

0000
00009
00'000'C
00°000'€
00000°€
0000€
00005'€

00000'G

0000S'e
00005’}

00'000'G
00000'G

00°000'9L

00'92s
00'0¥E'SE

00 OvE'se

00025’
000z8'Le

00'90S'S

000
00002

0000S'¥
00005 ¥

00908

0009
00 69
00 20
006.¢

yeBpng
Iv1ioL

0oo

000
000
000

00 009

€1 965°L

€1'899'%

00°0ee
89/
S8 09
000
06'90L'L
000
000S5'C

008.9

000
008l

000S2'C
000522

000

05'szg
06'805'SL

05'80G'St

000
05'805'SH

0L09L'L

000
000

006.5'}
00'5.S'}

0LG84

LTLL
o8l
2096
§5€9

§i AON - Inr

000

000
000
000

000

000

000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000

000
000

000
000

000

000
000

000

000
000

%0'€C 00908 0.g8t

000
000

000
000

%0'€C 00908 0Lg8L

%881 0009 120
%86 T 0069 98l
%6 €2 00'2or 2096
%8'ce 00642 jejege)

196png Jo % 126png Sl AON - [nft 196png Jo % 19bpng
S1143N38 I3A01dN3I XV1 3Sn avoy

610z JoquaAroN ybnoayy Ainp
|1enjoy "sA uom_usm $S07 '@ Jljoid
emo| ‘syybray Aussaaiun jo Ao

000

000
000
000

o0oo

000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000

000
000

000

000
000

000
000
000

000
000
000
000

000

000

ooo
000
000
000

S1 AON - INf

saiouaby JayiQ 01 sjuswiked [ejoL

saosag ABojouysa)
Bunsa) sousping
$994 Buyjig/einiag/er Ajunod
sa19uaby JaY1Q 0} sjusWwAed
|ejuay abeies)
S901AJ8G |ENJORIUOD

saliipowwioy |ejol

saiddng [ejo L

sdiyssaquisly |euolssajoid
Buiddiyg/abeisod
sanddng JayiQ
sanddng Bunesadg
salddng 8210
speapy/sbunasayy ssauisng
uonUNUIWY

salddng

juswdinb3 Jouly |eyo)

utogiun 13910 Jenbay
juawdinb3 aosiod Bunesadp
uawdinb3y Jouly

juawdinbg Jofey |10

awdinbg sep
juawdinbg Jofepy
aseyodind 1en
sanipowwo)
adn0d
Ajunoy uosuyor-jewzey

alld |0

sadusBy JayiO/m s10BNUOY (€10 )

A9 emoy jo AND-ysni4 werpAy
1daq aui4 a|l1AleI0D
sa19uaby JayIO/M S10RUOD
aid

piene) Buissol) [ejol

18410 - paens Buissoln
sanddng

salejes [ejol

prens) Buissosn
saueesg

§)502) 9 slyouag aakojdw3 [ejol

p foid

I o] | n
aIedIpapy
SH3adl
voId
$1502 B Sjyauag aakojdwz
piens) Buissosd

siseg ysed
SLIPLRL
WY siL:2t



€| abed

%0'6E
%6'LE
%68
%68
%l 5S¢

%
%00

%0 ¥C

%8¢C

%E CC
%S Ly

%0'Le

%9 ¥
%00
%9 0C

%1 8¢

%8 82
%6'1L

%/ '9%

%00
%E v
%0 001
%0 99

%lEe

%ES

%l vE
%8 oF
%L ch
%9 0€
%/, ¥

%S 01

%0001
%y 0Ll
%L0
%00

19bpng jo %

00'896'20S
00 96€ 'O
00000'9}

00 000'9}

00000
00'006'9
00°00S"2

00'9€0'2€

0000201

00'000'0}
00002

0000Z'LL

00002
00°00S
00'000'g}

00'9€9'P

00'9€9'e
00'000't

00'£6L'99C

00vZ
00'€L2'8E2
000
00000'8Z

00°LLL'08

00 L€0'8L
000002
00'698'€
00'€52'9¢C
00 LLF'EL
00 I¥S'9L

00259'CL

000
00005
00'000'}
00208'Z

1ebpng
Iv1ioL

b 960'961
¥2'95Z'691
zz lTv'L

ez eyl

2z 20s
00'G26
000

§eT0L'L

16'2Z€'C

16'222'C
00G6

06CL9'E

00ZIE
000
06 00E'E

¥5'99L'L

vT Lp0'L
oeeLs

SEG69'PEL

000
99928'G0}
00 g6€E
69°€Lr'8)

89 105'92

00'856
¥ 189
ze018'L
91T
8520+ Y
LLLEL'L

LOVEE'L

006l
00¢ess
0L
000

S} AON - N[

%0 €€ 00'.16'08 8€'/89'92

%lEE 0041108 89'105'9C

000

000

000
000
000

000

000

000
000

000

000
000
000

000

000
000

000
000
000
000
000

89'105'9Z

00'856
Py 189
Ze0L8't
2912
65°20L'Y
L2VeL'.

%1 €€ 00'L1L'08

%ES 00'LE0'8L
%} vE 000002
%8 9¥ 00'698'c
%lcy 00 €52'9C
%9 0E 00 LIV'EL
%L 9 00 I¥S'9L

000

000
000
000
000

jaBpng
Xv1 3SN avoy

19bpng 19bpng J0 %

S1i4INI8 IIA0TdW3

126png 40 % Sl AON - Inf

§1.02 JaquaAoN ybnouyy Aine
|enjoy "sA uomvzm S$S07 9 Jjoid
emo| ‘sjybroH Aussaaun jo 1D

000

000

000

000

000
000
000

000

000

000
000

000
000

000
000

000

000
000

000
000
000
000
000

000

000
000
000
000
000
Q00

000

000
000
000
Q00

Sl AON - inf

AL3dvS O1and 1MoL
as1j0d [ejol
juawdojaraq Yels [ejoL

Buluies) 122130 Jeinbay jejo)

saljddng Bujuery
Buules) JasyQ
Buures) Awapeoy
Buiures] 139140 Jenbay
uswdojaaaQg Heis

sannnAue/edsy feo)

Jreday 3|2IYaA [eIOL
sedaynuiey jen
nedaynuey a|dAag

1eday a|oIysp

suonesadQ a191ysA [RI0L

saysepm
1Yo
1and4

suonesadQ ajoIyoA

A

=l ey 3L [eloL

wooeIpap/saa4 Jabed/uozuap
uoddng 1|
3 st 2L

senunnAureN/Eday

A

sabepp sso19 991jod [@10)

SaAlaSay-saue|es
sabepp ssol) aoljod
way| [JoiAed SNOJUR||IISIN
Ked Jay30 3 AepijoH
sabep ssoin) asljod
S)S0D R SiIyauag aaljod |BIoL

uoljesuadwio?) SIHIOM 3d1j0d
v.ins @dliod
asesipajy adljod
Sy3dl 8d1jod
asueInsu| YieaH aoljod
VOId @d1jod
$IS0D | Sjyduag adljod
S91A19G |enorU0Y |B)0 |

Heis sjuaAg [eioadg
eoIsAyd-bunsa) yoAsg-aiag joid
HuAdon/Bunuug
Ageryen-adueinsy| ad1jod

siseg ysen
1549748
WV SL:ZL



¥t ebed

%L'0LY'V T
%L 07V T
%S SV
%0 G€

%6 62

%662

%E0S
%00
%82l

%E vE

%6 vE

%LEr
%901

%00
%8 6€
%00
%00
%8 'S¥
%0 .8
% 6L

%V 0E
%00
%0001
%0001
%00
%00
%00
%00

%9vL

%Y Ly

%¥ Ly

%Ly
%G ¥
%ESE

1abpng jo %,

00'6.LL
006
00'601'956
00 /98'152
00295'SE

00'295'se

00298'0Z
00 00S'€}
0000Z'}

00 00S'0ZL

00000'L

0006Z
00052

00'005'€
00°005'8
00000'E
00000'6€

00'005'6}1
00000'9
00'00S'€9

00'005'%
00005'Z
000

000
00000'€C
00005 '€}
00000y
00000'9L

00 000'0S

00'508'S¥

00'508'Sy

00'vbi'8
00'L9L'9E
0000Z'}

jebpng
TvLOL

¥5°952°L9)
¥5'952'291
ZLEI8'YEY
29'€e0'ss
STEE90L

GZ 6£9'0)

GZ'98v'0L
000
00°€st

L1 BEP'BS

Oy 6vE

06 22¢
059z

000
yezeee
000
000

€L 20L'YS
0081Z'S
og'18L'zt

00'9%€'L
000
00'219'S
08'86l'S
000
000
000
000

€€ L0E'LE

09'656'81

0955681

0E8LS'E
S8'ELO'S)
sy ey

S| AON - Inf

%0°001 000 8L'LLE'S) %1°90€- 00°005°Z}- J79114:1
%0001 000 8L LLE'SL %1'90€- 00005'ZL- 1116T'8¢
%2 EE 00 +2€€8 66'689'/C %081 00005241 P IEL 1T
000 %0'81 00005211 vy LELLE
000 000
000 000
000 000
000 000
000 000
000 %081 00 00S'LLL vrleL'Lz
[al] %6 VE 00'000't Ob 6vE
000 %L ey 0005/ 06'2Z€
000 %90 00'05¢ 05'92
000 %00 00°005'€ 000
000 %8 6 000058 ¥Z Z8E'E
000 000
000 %00 00'000'GE 000
000 %0 6T 00°005'69 08'66'LL
000 %0 L8 00'000'9 00812's
000 %Z 6L 00°005 '€9 08181
000 %% 0E 00005y 00'99€'tL
000 %00 00'005'2 000
000 00£19'S
000 08'86L'G
000 %00 00000'€C 000
000 %00 00'00S'E} 000
000 %00 00°000'y 000
000 %00 000009} 000
000 000
000 000
000 000
000 000
000 000
000 000
19bpng J0 % jebpng SL AON - Inf 1eBpng Jo0 % 126png SL AON - Inf
SLI43N3G 33A0TdW3 Xv.1 35N avoy

10z JaquiaaoN ybnoay Ainp
{enjoy "sA jobpng sso7 g 1joid
emo| ‘sjyBioy Apssaaiun jo A0

awodu| 1aN
awosu| JueuipiQ 19N
asuadx3 jejo]
SHUOM 2178Nd eroL
uonejiueg [ejol

[enjdenuo) [ejo

BuipAsayysel ]
Buunnoep Jea

m:__n;uwz M3IApUEIS)
|lenjoenUOD
uonejiueg

siemapig 3 ‘sabpug ‘speoy |ejoL

Kjajeg pue s|onuo02 diyel] €10

Anonos3 Wb oupes )

sanipowwon-subig 19ang
£f19Jeg puUe S|0JU0YD dLel ]
[emoenuo)-buideams 191
Ayowyoarg Bunybi 1eang
Huuad Jajem Wwio}g
Jen}oeJjuo)-[eAOLUIY MOUg

S921A19G [EN}ORIUOY [BJO]
Buuaquinuay qiny/6uiduyg
syswaaocsdwysiteday [ejo)

Jwbwpuawssasse ubis oyges|
adesspue| 19941g Jasung
sleday 19ans
saiedoy yjemopls
wwaoe|dal |aued - }se3 asoljely
sjuswase|dal jaued jeaso]
sjo9loud yored ajeydsy
sjuawase|dal jaued jeuspy

sjuawarocsduwilsaieday

saa4 Buuaauibug

$32IAJAG [ENJORIHUOD
sylemapls B 'sabpug 'speoy

SMJOM 21IqQnd J1ayiQ [e10L

satousby Jayi0-s10eU0Y) [BI0L

#91A198 S1V3S
801188 Sng J)|
19)U9) [eunuY 9|
sauaby Jayi0-s)1oenuo)
SMJOM 2lIgnd J9UYl0
SYYOM DInand

siseg ysep
SLVLRE
Wv 512}



City of University Heights

Cash Receipts and Disbursements by Fund

July 1, 2015 to November 30, 2015

STREET CAPITAL GENERAL DEBT POLICE ROAD USE EMPLOYEE
CONSTRUCTPROJECTS FUND SERVICE |FORFEITURE TAX BENEFITS TOTAL
Receipts
Local Option Sales Tax $ -
Property Tax $ 300,752.04 | $ 16,631.71 $ 4229356 | $ 359,677.31
Other City Taxes $ 4,669.02 | $ 256.29 $ 659.46 | $ 5,584.77
Licenses and Permits $ 136,277.70 $ 136,277.70
Use of Money and Property $ 1,199.78 $ 3.41 $ 108.15 | $ 1,311.34
Intergovernmental $ 2,990.67 59,389.21 $ 62,379.88
Charges for Services $ 37.00 $ 37.00
Special Assessments $ -
Miscellaneous $ 36,802.26 $ 36,802.26
Other Financing Sources $ -
Total Receipts $ $ - $ 482,728.47 | $ 16,888.00 | $ 341 59,389.21 | $ 43,061.17 | $ 602,070.26
Disbursements
Payroll Expenses
Public Safety $ 169,409.06 $ 26,687.38 | $ 196,096.44
Public Works $ 66,902.18 21,131.44 $ 88,033.62
Culture & Recreation $ 15,336.29 $ 15,336.29
Community & Economic Dev. $ 1,140.00 $ 1,140.00
General Government $ 131,955.47 $ 1,002.61 | $ 132,958.08
Principal/Interest $ 1,249.29 $ 1,249.29
Uncategorized/Miscellaneous 0
Total Disbursements $ - $ 384,743.00 | $ 1,249.29 | $ - 21,131.44 | $ 27,689.99 | $ 434,813.72
Net Cash Increase (Decrease) $ - $ 9798547 | $ 15,638.71 | $ 3.41 38,257.77 |$ 15,371.18 | $ 167,256.54
Balance, beginning of year $ - $ (189,563.90)| $ 520,594.33 | $ (368.95)| $ (1,050.92) 27,366.71 | $ (58,077.97)| $ 298,899.30
|
Balance, end of period $ - $ (189,563.90)| $ 618,579.80 | $ 15,269.76 | $ (1,047.51) 65,624.48 | $ (42,706.79)| $  466,155.84




12/14/15

Date

Nov 11 - Dec 15, 15
11/12/2015
11/15/2015
11/15/2015
11/15/2015
11/15/2015
11/15/2015
11/15/2015
11/15/2015
11/15/2015
11/15/2015
11/15/2015
11/19/2015
11/19/2015
11/19/2015
11/23/2015
11/23/2015
11/30/2015
11/30/2015
11/30/2015
11/30/2015
11/30/2015
11/30/2015
11/30/2015
11/30/2015
11/30/2015
11/30/2015
11/30/2015
11/30/2015
11/30/2015
11/30/2015
12/01/2015
12/01/2015
12/10/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015
12/15/2015

City of University Heights, lowa

Warrants for Council Approval
November 11 through December 15, 2015

Name

City of lowa City
Jones, Christian R
Lyon, Kristofer S
Plate, Harold,
Schmitz, Jakub J
Sherman, Nicholas M
Simcox, Levio M
Stanley, Kenneth L
Stanley, Kenneth L
Schmitz, Jakub J
Internal Revenue Service
MidAmerican Energy
MidAmerican Energy
MidAmerican Energy
MidAmerican Energy
MidAmerican Energy
Anderson, Christine M.
Jones, Christian R
Kimura, Lori D.

Lyon, Kristofer S
Schmitz, Jakub J
Sherman, Nicholas M
Simcox, Levio M
Stanley, Kenneth L
Plate, Harold,
Wellmark BC/BS
Internal Revenue Service

IOWA PUBLIC EMPLOYEES ...
IOWA PUBLIC EMPLOYEES ...

Hills Bank and Trust

Paul J. Moore, Melrose Aven...
Verizon Wireless

City of lowa City

Brad Wiley

Internet Navigator

Stan Laverman

Aero Rental

CenturyLink

Hawkeye Community College

lowa Law Enforcement Acade...

lowa City Press-Citizen

lowa Police Chiefs Association
City of lowa City

J & L Construction

Johnson County Auditor
Johnson County Refuse, Inc.
Louise From

Leff Law Firm, L.L.P.

Lynn Card Company
Mediacom

Nate Moore Wiring Service
Polyraise of Eastern lowa

Julie Pulkrabek Law Office, P....

Stanley, Kenneth L

Russ Boyer Construction
Shive Hattery

Shive Hattery

Soniclear

Westport Touchless Autowash
Terry Goerdt

Winkel, Parker & Foster, CPA...

Memo

City Hall water/sewer automatic payment

VOID:wrong rate

42-1109342

pedestrian lights at 113 Golfview
1301 Melrose stop light

1011 Melrose stop light

street lights

City Hall gas/electricity

monthly insurance payment
42-1109342

interest due on capital loan note #80238742
City Hall Rent/garages automatic deposit
monthly wireless service

City Hall water/sewer automatic payment
council meeting filming

monthly fee for city website/email service
rental inspector salary

bal owed for chair rental for farmers market
telephone service

training class for Simcox

evaluation of MMPI-2 for Jones

October & November publications

2016 IPCA Member dues

bus, fuel for police vehicles

final payment for storm intake repair
November 2015 election costs

November recycling / leaf vacuuming
reimburse for 12/15 meeting fee

legal services 11/7/15-12/11/15

holiday cards

online service 12/3/15-1/2/16

replace flag pole light/gfci receptacle at park
sidewalk repairs @Sunset & Melrose

legal fees to handle Brown case

reimburse for hotel/meals @ meeting
street sign work/patching 10/28/15-11/24/15
engineering services 10/3/15-10/30/15
engineering services 10/31/15-11/27/15
software annual support renewal
October-November vehicle washes
November inspection services

prepare AFR/file with auditor/final adjustments/...

Amount

-14.22
-696.84
-1,633.58
-200.00
0.00
-2,004.10
-1,355.36
-1,575.49
-610.15
-1,355.36
-4,206.36
-30.81
-30.81
-26.59
-645.61
-54.93
-348.74
-2,059.95
-272.93
-1,660.59
-1,584.96
-2,010.67
-1,708.11
-1,56756.49
-199.99
-1,861.56
-4,219.34
-190.25
-4,506.23
-1,249.29
-1,374.23
-120.41
-24.43
-100.00
-24.95
-500.00
-22.00
-421.10
-85.00
-140.00
-1,577.18
-75.00
15,790.64
-768.00

Page 1



City of University Heights, lowa

12114115 Warrants for Council Approval
November 11 through December 15, 2015

Date Name Memo Amount
12/15/2015 Sherman, Nicholas M reimburse for candy for halloween -45.54
12/15/20156  VISA folder/intoximeter/phone system/fuel -505.48
12/15/2015  VISA schedule printing/water dispenser rental/grant ... -33.10
12/15/20156  VISA flash drives/postage for housing inspector -81.98
12/15/2015 Jones, Christian R -1,267.33
12/15/2015 Lyon, Kristofer S -1,241.51
12/15/2015  Plate, Harold, -162.80
12/15/2015  Schmitz, Jakub J -1,146.96
12/15/2015 Sherman, Nicholas M -1,680.25
12/15/2015  Simcox, Levio M -1,146.96
12/15/2015  Stanley, Kenneth L -1,675.51
12/15/2015  SEATS Seats Payment -703.66

Nov 11 - Dec 15, 15

Page 2



university Ul heights

The Height of Good Living Established 1935

December 2015 Community Protection report

Officers Kris Lyon Jakub Schmitz and Lee Simcox graduated on Dec. 11" from the Cedar Rapids
Police Academy. Congratulations to all three.

Community Protection Committee recommends that Kenneth Stanley continue as Police Chief for the next
year at his current salary.



RESOLUTION NO. 15-77

RESOLUTION CONTINUING AND EXTENDING THE EMPLOYMENT OF
KENNETH L. STANLEY AS CHIEF OF POLICE FOR
THE CITY OF UNIVERSITY HEIGHTS

WHEREAS, the City of University Heights entered into an Employment
Agreement with Kenneth L. Stanley September 24, 2014, to serve as Chief of
Police for a period of one (1) year; and

WHEREAS, the Community Protection Committee recommends that Chief
Stanley’s employment be continued and extended with the same compensation
and benefits as set forth in that Agreement; and

WHEREAS, Chief Stanley’s service will continue as an at-will employee
with the compensation and benefits outlined in the prior Agreement,

IT IS, THEREFORE, RESOLVED that Kenneth L. Stanley’s employment
as Chief of Police of the City of University Heights is hereby continued and
extended as an at-will employee with the same compensation and benefits as set
forth in the Employment Agreement dated September 24, 2014.

Upon motion by
, the vote was as follows:

, and seconded by

AYES NAYS ABSENT

Aldrich
Haverkamp
Lane

Miller
Quezada

Upon Roll Call thus recorded, the Resolution is declared adopted this 15"
day of December, 2015.

Louise From, Mayor
City of University Heights



ATTEST:

Christine M. Anderson, City Clerk

Steve/UH Resolutions/Resolution 15-77 extending employment of Chief Stanley 12 15 15



- CITY OF UNIVERSITY HEIGHTS, IOWA
CHIEF OF POLICE EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT

This Agreement is made this 24" day of September, 2014, by and between the City
of University Heights, an fowa Municipal Corporation ("City") and Kenneth L.
Stanley ("Chief of Police”).

WITNESSETH:
WHEREAS, the City of University Heights desires to appoint and employ
Kenneth L. Stanley to serve as Chief of Police for the City of University Heights,

and

WHEREAS, Kenneth L. Stanley accepts appointment by the Mayor and City
Council to the position of Chief of Police for the City of University Heights.

NOW, THEREFORE,; the parties agree as follows:

Appointment:

1. The City hereby appoints Kenneth L. Stanley as the Chief of Police of the City
of University Heights for one-year, subject to the terms and conditions herein, as
well as all applicable laws, Kenneth L. Stanley is hereby vested with the authority
applicable to the position of Chief of Police and hereby assumes the duties,
responsibilities and obligations of that office, as set foﬁh in the lowa Code and the
City’s Code of Ordinances.

2. The appointment of Kenneth L. Stanley as Chief of Police and the conditions of
this contract shall become effective at on October & 7 , 2014, and shall terminate
on October g% , 2015, or such other dates as imay be agreed to in writing by the
parties.

Compensation:

1. As compensation for his services, the City shall pay to Kenneth L. Stanley an
annual salary of fifty-nine thousand dollars ($59,000), payable in installments on
regular City paydays, and subject to applicable payroll withholding. All other
benefits provided to full-time City Employees will also be provided to Kenneth L.
Stanley, excluding medical, dental and vision-care insurance. The City shall not

K9



pay Kenneth L. Stanley additional sums for overtime work.

2. The City will pay Kenneth L. Stanley’s dues to become a member of the lowa
Peace Officers Association and such other professional organizations and the City
and Kenneth I.. Stanley mutually agree for his continued professional participation,
growth, and advancement, and for the good of the City. The City will reimburse
Kenneth L. Stanlcy’s for the reasonable expenses associated with Kenneth L.
Stanley becoming a sworn peace officer in the State of [owa pursuant to the rules
and regulations of the lowa Law Enforcement Academy and otherwise
promulgated by lowa law.

3. The City hereby agrees that the City’s annual Police Department budget will
incorporate and include the expenses of the Chief of Police for professional and
official travel, meetings, and occasions considered desirable by the City, to allow
the Chief of Police to continue professional development and to adequately pursue
necessary official and other functions for the City. These expenses shall include
attendance at the Jowa Peace Officers Association and such other national,
regional, state and local governmental groups and committees thercof for which
provision has been made in the annual Police Department budget.

4. The City hereby agrees to reimburse Kenneth L. Stanley, to the extent provided
in the City’s annual Police Department budget, for short courses, institutes, and
semtnars necessary lor his professional development and for the good of the City
without prior approval of the City Council. The Chief of Police will fall under
General Orders of the Police Departiment, with final approval of the Mayor or
Community Protection Committee.

5. The Chief of Police will utilize his personally owned cellular phone in the
course of performing the functions of his office, and in lieu of a cellular telephone
supplied by the City. The City will reimburse the Chief of Police in an amount
equal to 50% (fifty percent) of the basic monthly charges for this telephone.

6. The Chief of Police will be furnished uniforms required for his position as Chief
of Police to be paid for by the City.

7. The Chief of Police will furnish his firearm, gun belt, handcuffs, and
miscellaneous duty equipment and accessories.

8. The City agrees to provide the Chief of Police with the same sick leave, and
other leave benefits available to other full-time commissioned members of the

2 Hj



police departiment. The Chief of Police will be given four (4) weeks of vacation
leave. .

9. The City recognizes it is desirable to have representation in and before local
civic, Fraternal and other such organizations, and the Chief of Police is authorized
to become a member of such organizations approved by the Mayor.,

10. Should the City vote to terminate Kenneth L. Stanley’s employment as Chief
of Police for just cause, he shall be entitled to all regular compensation due at the
time of termination, including unused vacation , sick and other leave credits
accrued up to the time of termination. Should the City vote to terminate Kenneth
L. Stanley’s empioyment as Chief of Police without just cause, he shall be entitled
to any regular compensation due at the time of termination, inciuding unused
vacation ,sick and other leave credits, accrued, as well as severance pay in an
amount equal to one (1) year base salary compensation, payable in the form of a
lump-sum cash payment, subject to appropriate payroll withholdings.

1. For the purpose of this agreement, “just cause” exists when the Chief of
Police:
(a) Is unable to perform his duties with reasonable competence or reasonable
safety as a result of a physical or mental condition, including alcohol or substance
abuse;
(b) Has committed any act that constitutes reckless disregard for the safety
of the public or another law enforcement officer; '
(c) Has caused a material fact to be misrepresented,
(d) Acts in a manner for the sole purpose of furthering his self-interest or in a
manner inconsistent with the interests of the public or the Chief's governing body;
(e) Violates any law, statute, or ordinance which constitutes a felony or
aggravated or serious misdemeanor under lowa law or which, if committed in Iowa
and charged under state law, would be a felony or aggravated or serious |
misdemeanor; or |
(f) Fails to become certified as a peace officer by and through the lowa Law
Enforcement Academy no later than June 1, 2015; or !
(g) Has his certification as a peace officer suspended, revoked, otherwise 3
subject to discipline, or restricted in any fashion by licensing, certifying, or
credentialing authorities in lowa or any other state; or
(h) Dies;
(1) Engages in conduct that constitutes unsatisfactory quality of performance,

3 [4(5



is unethical, constitutes serious neglect of duty, or is willfully dishonest in dealings
with the City or the public; or

(j) Has been deemed insubordinate or found to be in violation of a written
established policy, unless such claimed insubordination or violation of a written
established policy was a violation of any federal or state law or local ordinance.

12. If the City intends to terminate the employment of the Chief of Police for any
of the reasons set forth in section 11(a) through 11(j) (but excluding 11(f) and
11(h)) above, the following procedure shall be followed:

(1) The City shall issue a written notice to the Chief of Police no fewer than
ten business days prior to the meeting at which his removal will be considered;

(2) The written notice of the City’s intention to terminate the Chief of
Police’s employment shall include the following:

(a) Specification of the just cause for which removal is sought;

(b) A statement of facts that are alleged to constitute just cause; and

(c) The date, time, and location of the meeting at which the Chief of Police’s
removal will be considered;

(3) The Chief of Police will be given an opportunity to be heard before the
City Council, and to present witnesses, evidence, and argument in his defense,
personally and/or through legal counsel of his choosing; and _

(4) The City may, by majority vote, find just cause for removing the Chief.

Upon the satisfaction of this just cause termination procedure, the Chief of
Police shall be immediately removed from his or her office, shall be relieved of all
duties and responsibilities of his office, and shall be entitled to no further
compensation or benefits not already earned, accrued, or agreed upon.

The City may, in its sole discretion, suspend the Chief of Police with pay
during the time it is considering termination of employment for just cause. Notice
of any such suspension shall be given to the Chief of Police with the notice
specified in subsection 12(2) above or at such other time as the City deems
appropriate.

Any Chief of Police whose employment is terminated for just cause shall be
issued a written notice of the grounds of his or her removal within fourteen (14)
calendar days of the removal.

13. Itis recognized that the Chief of Police will be required to devote considerably
more hours to his position and the business affairs of the City than is normally
required of other full-time employees. Working hours will be flexible to

4

K5



accommodate the requirements and practices of the professional administrator
position. The concept of "overtime" is not applicable to the position of Chief of
Police, with the exception of grant-funded, either State or Federal, overtime.
Should the Chief participate in grant-funded enforcement operations, overtime
shall be paid per the specifications of the particular grant but only if and when
funding is received by the City. No additional compensation will be paid for
overtime, and compensatory time will not be due, based upon particular evening or
weekend requirements or demanding projects. However, occasional time away
from the office for the unusual demands on the Chief of Police’s time will be
recognized with the nature of the professional position.

14. If any provision, or any portion thereof, contained in the Agreement is held to
be unconstitutional, invalid, or unenforceable, the provision, or any portion thereof,
shall be deemed severable; however, the remainder of the Agreement shall not be
affected, and shall remain in full force and effect. The District Court for Johnson
County, State of lowa, shall have exclusive jurisdiction over any disputes arising
under this Agreement.

15, The recital paragraphs appearing at the beginning of this agreement are
substantive portions hercof and are incorporated by this reference herein.

16.  The paragraph/section titles, headings, and/or captions set forth in this
agreement have been employed solely as a means of reference and convenience.
Such designations shall not affect the interpretation or construction of this
agreement and shall not define, limit, extend,-or otherwise describe the scope of
this agreement or the intent of any provisions hereof. Such designations are not
substantive.

17. This agreement was drafted and shall be construed pursuant to the laws of
the State of lowa.

18.  This agreement sets forth the entire agreement between the parties, and
supersedes any and all prior written or oral agreements or understandings between
the parties pertaining to the subject matter hereof.

19.  Words and phrases used herein shall be construed as singular or plural
number, and as masculine, feminine, or neuter gender, according to context.

20. This agreement has been drafted jointly and shall not be construed against
any party. The language of all parts of this agreement shall be construed as a
whole, according to their fair meaning, and not strictly for or against any party.

: g,




21.  This agreement may be executed in several counterparts, each of which shall
be deemed to be an original and which counterparts shall together contain the
signatures of all of the parties hereto and shall constitute a single binding, and
complete agreement. The parties agree that facsimile signatures are and will be
treated the same as original signatures.

IN WITNESS THEREOF, the parties have entered into this Agreement at the City
of University Heights, in the State of lowa, and have signed the Agreement in
duplicate or caused it to be signed by their duly authorized representatives as of the
date and year first aboys stalegds

Chicl 6t Pnlu,c KC;T'IﬁI L. Siemlcy

Date: ?’_y’?/_‘f,/

City of University Heights, lowa

Lotise F101 ay

Date: ol - /

Attest:

MW? ﬂwcu-m

Christine Anderson, City Clerk
Date:  4-3% I"’




Streets and Sidewalks Report 12/15/2015

1)

2)
3)

Josiah is reviewing the street sign audit plan done by the MPO and may have
an update for us this month.

Asking council to waive $100 of the sidewalk repair fee for 230 Koser.
Update on Community Visioning project: 4 of us traveled to Ames in
November for a day-long training session (though the snow turned it into a
half-day session for some of us). Attending were myself, Mike Gay, Martha
Terry and Thad Wunder. We got a chance to see board presentations of
projects done for other cities in lowa, heard a presentation on pollinator
habitat, and worked with our landscape designer for a short session looking
at a map of University Heights and identifying where some possible project
locations could be.

We’ll start our monthly meetings in January. Meeting dates will be set by
surveying the steering committee to try to find a meeting time that works
best for all members. The first stage of the program is identifying areas for
improvement, next coming up with possible solutions and improvements,
then designing them and getting feedback on the designs, and then searching
for funding. All meetings are open to the public and will be announced on the
city website so that anyone who wants to attend may do so.



SHIVEFI

II1TFE
HITEC

TO:
FROM:
DATE:
RE:

ATTERY

ENG

INEERING

MEMORANDUM

University Heights, Mayor, Council, and Staff
Josiah Bilskemper, P.E.

December 13, 2015

City Engineer’s Report

(1) 2015 Sidewalk Repair Project (SE Quadrant)

a. The council adopted Resolution 15-73 (Resolution Setting the Administrative Fee for

the 2015 Sidewalk Repair Project and Authorizing and Directing Invoicing for Repair
Costs) at the November 10, 2015 meeting. This resolution set the administrative fee at
$100 per property for those that that elected to join the city repair project and at $200
per property for owners that did not elect to join the city repair project and did not
complete the required work by the July 20, 2015 deadline. Invoices have been mailed
to all residents involved, and a listing of amounts has been provided to the City Clerk.

The next step for this portion of the sidewalk repair program is to send invoices to
residents to collect reimbursement of repair costs paid to the contractor. (Nov. Mtg.)

(2) 2015 Sidewalk Inspections (SW Quadrant)

a.

Letters with sidewalk reports were mailed to 33 properties. At this time, 9 properties
have responded with requests to join the city sidewalk repair project.

There is an invoice from “Polyraise of Eastern lowa” included in the list of warrants for
council consideration. This relates to the sidewalk repair already completed at the SW
corner of the Melrose and Sunset intersection described in last month’s engineering
report. This sidewalk location was identified as a trip hazard during sidewalk
inspections, and is a city responsibility as it is located at the intersection. We
recommend approval of this payment.

In an effort to attract more contractors to bid on the 2016 repair contract, the notification
and sign-up dates are being moved ahead this year. The notification process will occur
earlier (October instead of January), and the sign-up for the city administered repair
project will occur earlier (February 1 instead of April 15). This will allow bids to be
obtained earlier (April instead of June), therefore providing more time for the work to be
completed, and hopefully generating more contractor interest. (October Mtg.)

(3) MS4 Permit — Damaged Street Intake

Project #115102-0

Shive-Hattery, Inc. | 2834 Northgate Drive | lowa City, IA 52245 | 319.354.3040 | fax 319.3546921 | shive-hattery.com

a.

The remaining 20% payment to J&L Construction is included in the warrants, as the
remaining clean-up work for the storm intake repair has been completed. We
recommend approval of this payment.

The intake top has been reconstructed by J&L Construction. There is some remaining
work to remove the forms, backfill, restore and clean up the area. (Nov. Mtg.)



Page 2 of 3

(4) One University Place — East Ravine

a. Atthe November meeting, council approved recommendations from Judy Joyce with
EarthView Environmental for restoration of the east ravine at a 3:1 grading plan,
including removal of several existing trees. Jeff Maxwell indicated at the meeting he
would put together his proposed plan to accomplish these recommendations and
provide to the City for review. This letter of intent (attached) was provided to the City on
November 12, 2015.

b. Engineering comments were provided to Jeff Maxwell on November 16™, which were
acknowledged and confirmed by Jeff on November 23" including a commitment to
have Judy Joyce on site to confirm and mark the exact trees for removal that were
identified in her earlier report. Council and staff were copied on each of these
communications.

¢. Judy Joyce visited the site with Jeff on December 4™ to confirm and identify tree
removals. Judy prepared a summary of this site visit (attached) which was sent to
Council on December 7" Implementing the 3:1 grading plan as directed will require
removing a few small diameter trees, and extending the storm pipe outlet about 15-feet.

d. Jeff indicated the weather has kept the ravine fairly wet, so they have not been able to
begin any grading. Once the weather allows the grading work to be accomplished,
temporary erosion control measures will be installed on the slope. We will be receiving
the slope compaction reports, and reviewing as-constructed survey of the ravine to
verify the 3:1 grading has been accomplished.

e. Once the grading work is completed satisfactorily, a revised landscaping plan will be
prepared and submitted to the Council for review.

f. Atthe October meeting, during Jeff Maxwell’s discussion with the city council, it was
agreed that an outside environmental consultant (Judy Joyce with EarthView
Environmental) would visit the site and provide recommendations for the work that
would need to be prepared for this portion of the ravine. This report was provided to
council on October 28". The report addresses three main concerns: Light Pollution and
Screening, Erosion/Slope Grading, and Vegetation Restoration. (Nov. Mtg.)

(5) One University Place — Public Improvements Project

a. The council approved a motion at the November 10, 2015 meeting to include
replacement of several poor condition street panels on Melrose Avenue (adjacent to the
One University Place frontage) as part of the One University Place Public
Improvements Project being prepared by MMS Consultants. The City will be
responsible for the construction costs associated with these additional panels that are
outside the scope of work necessary for the OUP site construction.

b. An updated project schedule for the “Public Improvements Project” has been requested
for dates of plan submittals for city review, right-of-way acquisition and public bidding.

Project # 115102-0 | December 13, 2015 SHIVEFIATTERY
ARCH T'E EERING

ECTURE+ENGIN



Page 3 of 3

(6) Olive Court Street Reconstruction — Topographic Design Survey

a. The council provided direction at the November 10, 2015 meeting to prepare the
topographic survey of Olive Court. This survey work is substantially complete, and
attached is a reduced scale drawing of the work completed.

b. The first step in preparing proposed designs for Olive Court reconstruction is to have
the street topographically surveyed. This will create a design base map with accurate
locations and elevations of the existing roadway, intersection, trees, driveways, storm

water intakes, sidewalks and property lines. The survey will then be used throughout
the project to develop construction drawings and/or exhibits. (Nov. Mtg.)

(7) lowa DOT - All Town Sign Replacement Program

a. Russ has completed installation of all signs received as part of the All Town Sign
Replacement Program. We’ll notify the DOT that the work has been completed.

Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions about these or any other items.

JDB

Project # 115102-0 | December 13, 2015 SHIVEFIATTERY
A'REHITE EERING

ECTURE+ENGIN



3011 Sierra Court SW, lowa City, lowa 52240 Phone 319-354-5858 Fax: 319-354-0759

November 12, 2015

Honorable Louise From, Mayor
City Council Members

City of University Heights

1004 Melrose Avenue

lowa City, lowa 52240

Honorable Louise From and Council Members:

At the November 10th regular City Council Meeting, | asked the Council to consider allowing the
Maxwell Development team to prepare a written "Letter of Intent” clearly defining the plan moving
forward in regards to the additional work yet to be completed in the "East Ravine Area". This request
was made by me with the intention of:

* Demonstrating our ability to clearly communicate with the Council and the Community and,
e Demonstrating our commitment with a first class, well defined, and agreed upon Plan.

The details of this plan, as outlined below are put forth in lieu of having our respective legal teams
spending both hours and dollars defining something that “reasonable partners" can define themselves.
The Council granted me permission to prepare this "Draft Agreement" as follows:

1. Construct a Temporary Green colored plastic fence line defining the Boundary of all remaining Work.

2. Install and reposition additional erosion control measures to prevent any migration of soil
downstream.

3. Remove the three (3) remaining trees which the retaining wall was designed to protect.
4. Abandon all of the proposed retaining walls as originally approved.
5. Attempt to remove the top 8" to 12" of existing topsoil and stockpile for later use.

6. Import additional fill material in order to create the desired and approved 3 to 1 Grading Plan as
approved By Council.

7. Request inspection by the City Engineer and our Civil Engineer to review and confirm conformance to
the approved Grading Plan prior to any consideration of Plant Material Placement.

8. Following approval of the Grading Plan, we would contract with our landscaping design team and
Judy Joyce for an onsite visit. This meeting would be scheduled in advance so Mayor From, Councilors,
incumbents and newly elected, as well as all interested community members could attend. The purpose
of this onsite meeting will give us a fresh view of the final shape of the ravine in an attempt to help
everyone visualize the yet to be finalized landscaping plan!



9. Following that onsite meeting and exchange of thoughts and ideas my hope is that everyone will be
excited and able to review the combined efforts of two great design companies. | am confident that we
will all listen to the professionals’ input and suggestions and, they, in turn, listen to the Community
Members concerns, preferences and hopes!

10. Following this meeting, the two design teams will work together and create an acceptable
landscaping plan, full of beauty and quality. This plan will ultimately require Council authorization prior
to installation.

| believe that by putting our heads together and working towards resolution of all challenges, this
project can be a lot of fun moving forward.

Thank you for allowing the "One University Place LLC” development team and me the opportunity to be
able to demonstrate our ability not only to do great work, but do so with reliability, integrity, and Trust!
Your confidence in our organization is truly appreciated.

Respectfully,
ONE UNIVERSITY PLACE, LLC

* ey K

Jeffrey L. Maxwell
3011 Sierra Court SW
lowa City, lowa 52240
319-631-1121



#* Wetland Services and Natural Resources Consulting % Watershed Studies % Soil Borings % Educational Training % Geoarchaeological and Geomorphological Services ¥Prescribed Fire & Vegetation Management

December 7, 2015

Mayor and City Council
City of University Heights
City Hall 1004 Melrose Ave
lowa City, lowa 52246

RE: OUP East Ravine Restoration — Update 1

To The Mayor and City Council of University Heights:

This letter is to update the council on the status of the ravine restoration efforts. | met with Jeff Maxwell on site on
Friday to review the site with him. During the visit, | verified with him the trees to be removed including the three
large trees referred to on Page 1 of my previous report (Page 1, Item 1) and four large trees near the bottom of the
ravine next to the existing culvert (Page 4). These trees are shown in Figure 1. | also verified that during grading
understory shrubs (honeysuckle) and a few small trees (most less than 4” in diameter with one at <6” diameter) will
also be removed.

In addition, we noted that in order to
accommodate the 3:1 slope, the existing
culvert will need to be extended
downslope approximately 15-20 feet.

Please let me know if you have any
guestions, comments or concerns.

i

Sincerely,

e \@\‘5;%‘; |
\ i X\\ /4
V\" N /,,. '

AT Y O\ 1

i - \‘ . /), 4 1 /

\'. /&' AN XS A /  LOT1s0
g ‘ ] . )Y */"/ f "'/

\ L7 W /| /

Figure 1: Grading Plan showing 3:1 slope and Tree Removal (Provided by MMS
Consultants 2015-12-01

L %)

bl A
c. 7/

HhE. Joyce, PWS & Geol
EarthView Environmental/r

#*EarthView Environmental, Inc. 310 Second Street Coralville, lowa 52241 % Office: 319-358-2542 * Fax: 319-358-2562
#* Mobile: 319-330-3833 # Email: EVE@EVEInc.consulting ¥ Web site: www.EVEInc.consulting



NOISIATY Q3IN0¥ddY
wooAlepey-onys MWy LINOSSIY | euelpul | sioul | emo) »oo8 d134 HLM Nmva f SR o
ONIY¥IINIONI+IINLOILIHOYY 08 = J1v0S si/ev/el ENNASH oy -t
- \e=of VI ‘SLHOIIH ALISHIAINN =g U <L
\g/ cl _Imllmln._u _I_| _ >_ Im AIAYNS SNOILIANOD ONILSIX3 S
14N0O2 INITO
| / S
(@]
20d | g AN
Py
Amw AN ¥ -
WA 7
D / =
T s K3 | wx m
L
—
fe]
~, \ -
% o
L1y 101 WA ~ l // w/v %/ zir 107 o ALm
- 85 ooV . N\ 193,
71 S31L¥AI0Hd mﬁwomw\n%o‘m [ , / ﬁ ! ﬂ 571 SINOH SLHOIEH ALISHIAINA Suvas Z - %
3 0d
¢ ] o~
o o I _ . ﬁ’ \/%V /% m VM ONINIVLIY %0079
- ° / (8)don S Frzor
3 / (W) dOA .8 3 §1 07
ﬁua onz«éﬁ.m " .ﬁ - STIVA ONINIVLZY #0078
\ >~ o
0Ly 101 / / \ / €y 101
|
A o1 R4C *
1030 TS / / ~
v SINVI *AISNVINAHS _ _ \ I
- e——————— T T T T T C ¥ ———— Savon
—'/uzza 20d PMV ! H IW v x&(yﬂmmb__‘._mhw
m VM 3NOLS
/m>_mo 20d
gor 107 e o \ \ITVM ONINIVLIY %0078 yv a0l
5 AVA
b / — — @ Av\ <
lllll - —— |
- T 153109 — O~
NMVHS "L ‘'0LVS
5 g | gl T
\
Gy 101
AT TIAVHD / / 10 IAINO 65
w / o 4 VANVAY “IVLSAHO
B % \ A\

10 3A0 o7
NITTHLY 'dW3H

10v 107

90v LOT

‘19 3AI0 9€
0 SINVF ‘DIOISNIAA

Sov 1O

‘19 3NN0 2E
‘N QYVMOH ‘@13l

0oy L0

10 3NT0 8T
NSNS ‘QHOIIBNND

€ov LOT

1D IO 72
71 SONIQTIOH L3N0D 3NIT0

20v L0

‘19 3NT0 02
0711 SONIQTOH L¥N0D 3N0

971 SONIQTOH 1IN0 3ANO

|
|
|
19 M/_._o ol
|
|

“IAV 3SOYTIN 606
vV ANVHL ,mv;__n_(x

00y LOT

o8

—

.w%a 9 1562
[} L3 NWE

@) dgn .z ANzeseL
1V66L
TOHNVITANVLINYS

1%
| M\:zﬂ 00d
/ @\ ﬂ/\@ / / 9Ly 101
“| K
N | :ro
o \
|~ Wi €
/ x
! W ﬂ L\ 101
@ \ *19 ANINO S
~

NNV SI¥OQ ‘A0

RS
o = —
|
v “mz 9d
\W/ﬂ TIVM ONINIVLZY
/ ¥3IENIL GOOM

8Ly LO1

‘10 3AN0 €
1 ANVHJ3LS HIVM

61y 10T

1D 3NT0 L2
‘4 Qvyg ‘HEN0H

ozy 101

“103N0 ST
v AMHAC ‘NYWONYH

LIVE COURT

12y L0

1D 3NN0 €2
‘N NOHAZY “TVHINIENV1

N

S

EN mmom.ﬂs_ 00k

131 ‘N NONASM “TVHINIENVT

|
—

o .
L

g
\

22y 101 £2r 101

‘ “3AV ISOYT3IN S0k
ALL3E VBN

30

(Me3) 40w .+2 31 90622
W 9V 9EL
BIVINIW¥OLS

(M) d¥ 2 31 19'82L
(N) dOY .2 31 9882
I LY'9EL

BDIVIN WHOLS

(S'N) 0¥ 492 31857221 (
I €298 \
BIVINIWEOLS

() 3199eL
[NEREA
(s)316e922

W P 9L

FIOHNVIN AYVLINYS

¢

L¥:6l -Gl ‘€l "08Q :PaUIPO 1seT
1w Bmniaiceial | n-1 a-dnodo i 11n0n aamAaa ineveBlime i ealnriIaAlamnzni el nAnanaloin 1 -fiumein

\oTiaanre fiacn



Building Zoning & Sanitation Committee
November 2015 Report ¢ By Silvia Quezada

Lights in the Heights II — Luminary Walk 2015 - 1,300 Lights

* Postponed to December 31, starting at 2pm — meet at 18 George Street off of
Melrose
o 2pm to 4pm - place luminaries along Sunset and/or Melrose
o 4pm start lighting luminaries

* Call event Chair -Susan Wells (333-1617) or co-Chair Silvia (354-3854) if you
can volunteer

Johnson County Assessor’s Office & University Heights Review

* At my request, Tom Van Buer, County Assessor, would like to have the Jo. Co.
Assessor’s office present to the Council and residents information on recent
Assessor’s office visits. Presentation date to be determined by Council
consensus.

Zoning Complaints Trend:
* Large signs (e.g., 4 x 6 size) on homes left post tailgating party
* Post game day trash on yards and right-of-way
* Parking boats/vehicles on yards
* Asphalting front yards



Prepared by: Terry Goerdt, Building Inspector, City of University Heights. 319-330-9806
ORDINANCE NO. 192

AN ORDINANCE PROVIDING FOR THE ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE,
2015 EDITION, INCLUDING APPENDIX K; ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL
CODE, 2015 EDITION, INCLUDING APPENDIX F AND APPENDIX J, AND PROVIDING FOR
CERTAIN AMENDMENTS TO THOSE CODES; ADOPTION OF THE STATE ELECTRICAL CODE
(IOWA CODE § 103.6(1)(A)); AND ADOPTION OF THE STATE PLUMBING AND MECHANICAL
CODES (IOWA CODE § 105.4(1)(A)); AND REPELAING ORDINANCE 147.

WHEREAS, the City’s current building code is the 2003 edition of the International Building Code (IBC) and
the International Residential Code (IRC), and the City should adopt the 2015 editions of those codes; and

WHEREAS, for purposes of uniformity throughout the State, the State Code has been amended to require all
local jurisdictions to adopt the State Plumbing and Mechanical Codes by December 31, 2016; and

WHEREAS, the fuel gas code is contained in the State Plumbing Code; and
WHEREAS, for uniformity in greater Johnson County area, the City should adopt the State Electrical Code; and

WHEREAS, the purpose of this ordinance to provide for the protection of the health, welfare and safety of the
r ts of University Heights,

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY UNIVERSITY HEIGHTS
Section .

(A) Codes Adopted: Subject to the following amendments, the 2015 edition of the international building code
(IBC) including Appendix K, electrical administrative process, and 2015 edition of the international residential code (IRC)
including Appendix F, radon control methods, and Appendix J, Existing Buildings And Structures, are adopted.

(B) Additionally, the City further adopts Section 103.6(1)(a) of the lowa Code (the lowa State Electrical Code),
Section 105.4(1)(a) of the lowa Code (the lowa State Mechanical Code), and Section 105.4(1)(a) of the lowa Code (the
lowa State Plumbing Code).

(C) Collectively, these codes shall be known and may be identified, in this Ordinance and elsewhere, as “the City
of University Heights Building Code” or the “Building Code”. Interpretations of the building official may be guided by
publications of the International Code Council, Inc., or the International Existing Building Code, or by such other and
further professional and regulatory publications and information as the building official in the official's reasonable
discretion deems prudent and appropriate.

(D) Interpretation of Building Code provisions: The provisions of the Building Code shall be held to be
the minimum requirements adopted for the protection of the health, safety and welfare of the residents of the City
of University Heights. Any higher standards in the state statute or City ordinance shall be applicable.

(E) Amendments to Code: The following sections of the 2015 edition of the international building code and 2015
edition of the international residential code are amended as follows:

(1) Section 101.1 of both the IBC and IRC. Delete Section 101.1 of both the IBC and IRC and insert in lieu
thereof the following:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of City of University Heights, hereinafter
referred to as "this code.”

(2) Section 105.2 of both the IBC and IRC. Delete Section 105.2 of both the IBC and IRC and insert in lieu
thereof the following:

105.2 Work Exempt from Permit. A permit shall not be required for the following:
Building

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and

1



3

similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 144 square feet provided the structure
is not located in a flood hazard area.

2. Fences not over 6 feet (1829 mm) high.
3. Oil derricks.

4. Retaining walls which are not over 4 feet (1219 mm) in height measured from the bottom of the
footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or impounding Class |, Il or lIl-A liquids.

5. Water tanks supported directly on grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons (18 925 L)
and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2 to 1.

6. Sidewalks and driveways not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above grade and not over any
basement or story below and which are not part of an accessible route.

7. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish work.
8. Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery.

9. Prefabricated swimming pools which are less than 24 inches deep, do not exceed 5,000 gallons and
are installed entirely above ground.

10. Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes and not including service
systems.

11. Swings and other playground equipment accessory to detached one- and two-family dwellings.

12. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall which do not project more than 54 inches (1372
mm) from the exterior wall and do not require additional support.

13. Movable cases, counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches (1753 mm) in height.

14. For structures regulated by the IRC the reapplication of shingles and roof sheathing provided:

a. Less than 50% of the structural sheathing is replaced and other structural alterations are not
required.

Note: Applying solid sheathing over space sheathing is not considered structural sheathing.
15. For structures regulated by the IRC replacing windows provided:

a. Replacement window(s) is in compliance with Appendix J.
16. For structures regulated by the IRC replacing exterior doors, including garage doors, provided:

a. Replacement door(s) is in compliance with Appendix J.
Note: screen and storm doors do not require a permit regardless of the location.

Electrical:

1. Portable motors or other portable appliances energized by means of a cord or cable having an
attachment plug end to be connected to an approved receptacle when that cord or cable is permitted by
this code.

2. Repair or replacement of fixed motors, transformers or fixed approved appliances of the same type
and rating in the same location.

3. Temporary decorative lighting.

4. Repair or replacement of current-carrying parts of any switch, contactor, control device or contact
device of the same type and/or rating.



5. Replacement of non-emergency over-current device of the required ampacity and interrupt rating in
the same location.

6. Repair or replacement of electrodes or transformers of the same size and capacity for signs or gas
tube systems.

7. Temporary wiring for experimental purposes in suitable experimental laboratories.
8. The wiring for temporary theater, motion picture or television stage sets.

4) Gas:
1. Portable heating, cooking or clothes drying appliances.

2. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment or make such equipment
unsafe.

(5) Portable-fuel-cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping system and are not
interconnected to a power grid.

Mechanical:
1. Portable heating appliances.

2. Portable ventilation appliances.
3. Portable cooling units.
4. Steam, hot- or chilled-water piping within any heating or cooling equipment regulated by this code.

5. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment or make such equipment
unsafe.

6. Portable evaporative coolers.

7. Self-contained refrigeration systems containing 10 pounds (4.54 kg) or less of refrigerant or that are
actuated by motors of 1 horsepower (746 W) or less.

8. Portable-fuel-cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping system and are not
interconnected to a power grid.

9. The replacement of fixed appliances provided however that the replacement appliance is in the same
location and has a rating equal to or less than the appliance being replaced, and it is not necessary to
remove, replace, alter, or install any additional ductwork or piping.

(6) Plumbing:

1. The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste or vent pipe; provided, however, that if any
concealed trap, drainpipe, water, soil, waste or vent pipe becomes defective and it becomes necessary
to remove and replace the same with new material, such work shall be considered as new work and a
permit shall be obtained and inspection made as provided in this code.

2. The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes, valves or fixtures, and the removal and
reinstallation of water closets, provided such repairs do not involve or require the replacement or
rearrangement of valves, pipes or fixtures.

3. The replacement or removal and reinstallation of any fixture or appliance, provided, however, that the
fixture or appliance is installed at the same location and it is not necessary to remove, replace, alter, or
install any piping. Exemption from the permit requirements of this Code shall not be deemed to grant
authorization for any work to be done in violation of the provisions of the Code or any other laws or
ordinances of this jurisdiction.

Exemption from the permit requirements of this Code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to
be done in a manner in violation of the provisions of this Code or any other laws or ordinances of this
jurisdiction.



. Modify Section 105.5 of both the IBC and IRC by adding a
sentence to the end as follows:

In no case shall the permit be effective unless the work covered by the permit has a documented inspection
every 6 months minimum and is completed within 24 months of the date on which the original permit
was issued.

(8) Section 105.8 of the IBC and R105.10 of the IRC. Add two new Sections 105.8 and 105.8.1 to the IBC
and R105.10 and R105.10.1 to the IRC as follows:

105.8(IBC) R105.10(IRC) Demolition permits required. A demolition permit shall be required as follows:
1.For the removal of any building or structure.

2. For the removal of any portion of a building (i.e. porch, porch railing, decorative brackets and trim,
dormers, chimneys, etc.)

105.8.1(IBC) and R105.10.1 Requirements. The applicant for any demolition permit shall state on the
application the proposed disposal plans for all demolition materials. No demolition permit shall be issued
until seven (7) working days after the date an application has been properly filed and said demolition
permit shall not be effective until applicant has posted the premises to be demolished with a notice to be
provided by the City and as directed by the City; provided, however, that accessory buildings as defined
in the City of University Heights Zoning Ordinance and dangerous buildings shall be exempt from said
notice and waiting requirement.

(9) Section 105.9 of the IBC and R105.11 of the IRC. Add two new Sections 105.9 to the IBC and
R105.11 to the IRC as follows:

105.9 (IBC) and R105.11 (IRC) Permittee:

1. An electrical, plumbing or mechanical permit may be issued to any person holding a valid master
license for the respective trade as described in Section 17-11-1 E of the City of Univsersity Heights Code,
or to any company who employs a duly licensed master in the respective trade on a full-time basis who
supervises the work of the apprentice and or journeymen during the company's normal business hours.

2. An electrical, plumbing or mechanical permit may be issued to the owner of an existing owner-
occupied single-family dwelling, pursuant to a valid certificate of occupancy and used exclusively for
residential purposes, to do any electrical work in connection with said dwelling and accessory buildings.
The owner must personally purchase all material and perform all labor in connection with the permit.

(10) Section 105.10 of the IBC and R105.12 of the IRC. Add two new Sections 105.10 to the IBC and
R105.12 to the IRC as follows:
105.10 (IBC) and R105.12 (IRC) Insurance:
Before any permit to perform electrical or plumbing work may be issued, the applicant shall have on file with the
building official a copy of a certificate of insurance stating the liability amounts of no less than three hundred
thousand dollars ($300,000.00) property damage and five hundred thousand dollars ($500,000.00) bodily injury.
The city shall be named as additional insured. The policy shall also provide for at least ten (10) days' notice by
the insurer to the city of termination of the policy by the insured or insurer. Electrical permits issued under
sections 105.9 (IBC) and R105.11 (ICR) 2 and 3 shall be exempted from this insurance requirement.

(Usection R107.3 of the IRC and Section 108.3 of the IBC. Amend Section R107.3 of the IRC and Section
108.3 of the IBC as follows:

R107.3 (IRC) 108.3 (IBC) Temporary Power: Replace the "NFPA 70" with "lowa State Electrical Code.".

(12) Section R108.2 of the IRC and Section 109.2 of the IBC. Delete Section R108.2 of the IRC and Section
109.2 of the IBC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

R108.2 (IRC) 109.2 (IBC) Permit Fees and Valuations. The fee for any permit shall be as set forth in the
permit fee schedule as established by resolution of the City Council. The determination of value or valuation
under any of the provisions of this Code shall be made by the Building Official. The value to be used in
computing the building permit and building plan review fees shall be the total value of all construction work

4



for which the permit is issued, as well as all finish work, painting, roofing, site grading, paving, landscaping,
elevators, and other permanent equipment. The value to be used in computing the value of construction
for reports shall be the total value of all construction work for which the permit is issued, as well as all
finish work, painting, roofing, electrical, plumbing, heating, air conditioning, site grading, paving,
landscaping, elevators, fire extinguisher systems and other permanent equipment.

FBection R108. 5 of the IRC and Section 109.6 of the IBC: Delete Section R108.5 in the IRC and Section
109.6 of the IBC and insert in lieu thereof the following:
R108.5 (IRC) 109.6 IBC Refunds: The Building Official may authorize the refunding of any fee paid
hereunder which was erroneously paid or collected. The Building Official shall not authorize the refunding
of any fee paid except upon written application filed by the original permittee within one hundred eighty
(180) days from the date of fee payment.

(14) Section R108.6 of the IRC and Section 109.4 of the IBC. Delete Section 108.6 of the IRC and Section

109.4 of the IBC and insert in lieu thereof the following:
R108.6 (IRC) 109.4 (IBC) Work commencing before permit issuance: Any person who commences
work on a building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system before obtaining the
necessary permits shall be subject to a fee equal to the amount of the permit fee plus a penalty of twice
the amount of the permit. This fee shall be collected whether or not a permit is issued. The payment
of such fee shall not exempt any person from compliance with all other provisions of this Code or
from any penalty prescribed by law. Only the Building Official may reduce this fee when it is
demonstrated that an emergency existed that required the work to be done without a permit.

(15) Section 202 of both the IBC and IRC. Add new definition as follows:

Authority Having Jurisdiction. The organization, office, or individual
responsible for approving equipment, materials, an installation, or a
procedure.

(16) Section 202 of both the IBC and IRC. Add new definition as follows:

Chief Electrical Inspector. A building inspector who either is the authority having jurisdiction or is designated by
the authority having jurisdiction and is responsible for administering the requirements of this code.

(17) Section 202 of both the IBC and IRC. Add new definition as follows:

Electrical Inspector. A building inspector authorized to perform electrical inspections.

(18) Section 202 of both the IBC and IRC. Add new definition as
follows:

Emergency Communications Center. Shall mean the Johnson County Emergency Communications
Center.

(19) Section 202 of the IBC and IRC. Modify definitions as follows:

Habitable space: Add a sentence to the end of the definition of habitable space or room to read as follows:
Basement areas finished to a degree to encourage their use as anything other than storage or mechanical
rooms shall be considered habitable space.

(20) Section R202 of the IRC. Delete definition of Accessory Structure and insert in lieu thereof the
following: ACCESSORY STRUCTURE. See Zoning Definitions in the City Code.

(21) Table R301.2 (1) of the IRC Modify by inserting data in the table as

follows:
Wind Design Subject to Damage From Flood Hazards
Ground Speed Topographic effects, Seismic Winter Ice-Barrier Air Mean
Snow Design Weathering Frost Termite Design Underlaymen NFIP FIRM Freezing
line " Maps
Load (mph) Special wind region, or Category Temp t Required P Annual




Wind-borne debris zone depth Index Temp

Moderate
25 115 No A Severe 42" H -5°F Yes 5/22/77 2/16/07 2000 50°F
eavy

(22) Section R302.5.1 of the IRC. Delete Section R302.5.1 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

R302.5.1 Opening protection. Openings from a private garage directly into a room used for sleeping purposes
shall not be permitted. Other openings between the garage and residence shall be equipped with solid wood
doors not less than 1 3/8 inches (35 mm) in thickness, solid or honeycombcore steel doors not less than 1 3/8
inches (35 mm) thick, or 20-minute fire-rated doors.

(23) Section R302.13 of the IRC. Delete Section R302.13 of the IRC entirely.

(24) Section R304.1 of the IRC. Delete Section R304.1 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

R304.1 Minimum area. Habitable rooms shall have a floor area of not less than 70 square feet .
Exception: Kitchens.

(25) Section R310.6 of the IRC. Delete Section R310.6 in the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

R310.6 Alterations or repairs of basements in structures built after May 10, 1989. An emergency escape and
rescue opening is not required where existing basements undergo alterations or repairs.

Alterations or repairs in structures built prior to May 10, 1989 shall conform to Appendix J Section AJ102.4
Replacement windows.

Exception: New sleeping rooms created in an existing basement shall be provided with emergency escape and
rescue openings in accordance with Section R310.1.

(26) Section R312.2 of the IRC and 1015.8 of the IBC. Delete Section R312.2 of the IRC and 1015.8 of the IBC
entirely.

(27) Section R313 of the IRC: Delete Section R313 of the IRC entirely.

(28) Section R320.2 of the IRC. Add Section R320.2 in the IRC as follows:

R320.2 Accessibility for projects other than those mentioned in Section R320.1.

R 320.2.1 Scope. The provisions of this section are enacted to implement universal design features that provide
accessibility, usability and visit-ability for all.

R320.2.2 Definition. Public funds shall mean funding or assistance from the City of University Heights or any
agent thereof through any of the following means:

1. a building contract or similar contractual agreement involving a City-funded program or fund;
2. any real estate received by the owner through a subsidy, lease, or donation by the City or its agents;

3. preferential tax treatment, bond assistance, mortgage assistance, or similar financial advantages
from the City or its agents;

4. disbursement of federal or state construction funds including a Community Development Block
Grant; or

5. a City contract to provide funding or a financial benefit for housing.
R320.2.3 Applicability. The amendment applies to new one- and two-family dwellings and is not required for
new townhouses, accessory apartments or existing structures for repairs, alterations, change of occupancy or
additions unless the square footage of the addition is more than 25% of the existing structure, then, the addition
must comply.
Exception: Applies to new townhouses constructed using public funds.

The minimum usability requirements are as follows:

6



1. Step-less Entrance: At least one building entrance must be designed, without encroaching into any required
parking space, that complies with the City of University Heights Building Code standard for an accessible
entrance on an accessible route served by a ramp in accordance with section R311.8 or a no-step entrance. The
accessible route must extend from a vehicular drop-off, or parking to a building entrance. The entry door
must have a minimum net clear opening of thirty-two inches (32").

Exception:

1. If public funds are used the step-less entrance must be provided.

2. The building official may waive this requirement based upon the determination that strict compliance is
financially or environmentally impractical. Split-level and townhouse style homes may be exempted.

2. Interior doors: At least one bedroom and one bathroom (if either are provided) and
all other passage doorway header widths, on the level served by the designed step-less entrance,
must be framed toaccommodate a minimum 38" clear rough opening. The framing for the doorway

width opening may be reduced to accommodate any door size.

Exception:

1.If public funds are used the minimum door clear opening shall be thirty-two inches (32") when the door
is open ninety degrees (90 ), measured between the face of the door and the opposite stop.

2.Doors serving closets twenty-four inches (24") or less in depth need not be framed to 38" clear opening
width.

Note: A 34" door hung in the standard manner provides an acceptable 32" opening.

3. Sanitation facilities: There must be at least one bathroom containing a water closet (toilet) and
lavatory (sink) on the level of the dwelling to be accessed by the designed step-less entrance. The room
shall have a minimum thirty inches (30") by forty-eight inches (48") clear floor space at the water closet and
lavatory. The clear floor space can be shared by both fixtures. The clear floor space shall not be obstructed
by a doorway swing.

The plans must show a shower, bathtub or combination tub/shower can be provided within the room or an
adjoining room without removing part of the concrete floor to provide necessary plumbing to the future plumbing
fixture(s).

Exception:

1.If public funds are used a shower, bathtub or combination tub/shower shall be provided within the room.

2.Doors may swing into the clear floor space provided at any fixture if sufficient maneuvering space is provided
within the room for a person using a wheelchair or other mobility aid to enter and close the door, use the
fixtures, reopen the door and exit. Maneuvering space may include any knee space or toe space available
below bathroom fixtures.

3.The building official may waive this requirement based on the determination that strict compliance is
financially impractical.

4._Wall Reinforcement: A bathroom must be provided with wood blocking installed within wall framing to
support grab bars as needed. The wood blocking, when measured to the center, will be located between
thirty-three inches (33") and thirty-six inches (36") above the finished floor. The wood blocking must be
located in all walls adjacent to and behind a toilet.

Exception: Backing is not required behind pre-manufactured showers and bathtubs.

5. Decks: All exterior decks and patios surfaces adjacent to the level served by the designed step-less
entrance must be built within four inches (4") of the dwellings finish floor level. Decks shall be a minimum 50%
the size of a patio that is served by level served by the designed step-less entrance.



6. Switch and outlet requirements: All wall switches, controlling light fixtures, fans, all temperature
control devices and all receptacles shall be located in an area between fifteen (15) and forty-eight (48) inches
above finished floor. The height will be determined by measuring from the finished floor to the center of the
device. When the control or receptacle placement is prohibited by the height of the window or design feature,
alternative locations may be approved by the building official.

7. Electrical panel requirements: Electrical panels on the level of the dwelling to be accessed by the
designed step-less entrance shall be located so that the individual circuit breakers are located between 15"
and 54 " above the floor.

8. Garages: Must be wired for power operated overhead

(29) Section R326 of the IRC. Delete Section R326 of the IRC entirely.

(30) Section R403.1.4.1 of the IRC. Modify by deleting all exceptions and inserting in lieu thereof the

following:
Exceptions:
1. One story detached accessory buildings of wood or steel frame construction not used for human occupancy
and not exceeding one thousand (1,000) square feet in floor area may be constructed using slab on grade
construction as follows. The slab shall be three and one half inches thick, poured monolithically with
thickened perimeter footings extending twelve inches (12") below finish grade and be twelve inches (12")
wide at the base. The top of the foundation shall not be less than six inches (6") above finish grade.
Reinforcement of the slab, including the thickened portion, shall be minimum 6x6-10/10 welded wire
mesh, #4 deformed reinforcing bars at twenty four inches (24") on center each way or fiber mesh reinforced
concrete.

2. One-story wood or metal frame building not used for human occupancy and not over 200 square feet in
floor area may be constructed with walls supported on a wood foundation plate or "skids" when approved
by the building official.

3. Decks not supported by the structure need not be provided with footings that extend below the frost line.

(31) Section R404.1.1 of the IRC: Amend Section R404.1.1 of the IRC by adding an Exception after number 2 as follows:

Exception: Foundation walls with unbalanced lateral forces created by finish grade, i.e. walkout basements which
are exempt from the lowa Architectural Act shall be designed by a licensed structural engineer or constructed in
accordance with the Table R404.1.1(5) and diagram as follows:



T
Table R401.1.1(5)
b
CB = Corner Bars
5 = Span of Wall
T =Thickness
D = 4 Offset _ I
— ' . 2" Minimum Inside Face of
D ! s Wall to edge of reinforting
) [ - )
ey | s [y )
cB &" & 12" Foundation Walls 7 : T
A Provide corner bars to match harizontal
foundation wall reinforcing into wall 2'
T J
Span Wall Thickness |  Horizontal | Corner Bar 4
() m Relnforcing (cB) = See Schedule for
10 or less 8" 44 @ 12" 20" /_ Horizontal Reinforcing
10' 0 12 8" 5 @ 12" 2-6" 1
1210 14' L3 i@ 127 30 #4 Reinforcing Vertical
14'to 16 12" i5 @ 12° 2'-6" 39" 0.0 TYDiC&l
16' to 18' 12" #6 @ 14" 3-0°
18'to 20 12" 6 @ 12" 3'-0" .
! #4 Reinforcing Dow
P
— g
Frost Wall & Footing [Walkout) R
Naotes:
1. Corner Bars are required in addition to horizontal reinforcing.
2. All Corner Bar reinforcing splices shall be lapped a minimum of 24*,
3. If span (S) is greater than 16", the minimum dimension of (D) shall be &',

(32) Section R404.1.3 of the IRC. Modify Section R404.1.3 by adding a second paragraph as follows:

Wall thickness may be reduced to eight inches (8") if a minimum of three (3) one-half inch diameter
deformed ASTM A615 grade 40 steel bars are placed horizontally at the center of the wall thickness with
one bar located within 14" of the top, one bar within 14" of the bottom and one bar located within 14" of the
mid-height of the wall provided the wall height does not exceed eight feet (8").

(33) Section 423.4 of the IBC. Delete Section 423.4 in its entirety and insert in lieu thereof the following:

Group E occupancies. In areas where the shelter design wind speed for tornados is 250 MPH in
accordance with Figure 304.2(1) of ICC 500, all new Group E occupancies shall have a storm shelter
constructed in accordance with ICC 500. The shelter shall be capable of housing the total occupant load of
the Group E occupancy or as required by 661-301 of the lowa State Building Code, whichever is more
restrictive.

Exceptions:
1. Group E day care facilities.
2. Group E occupancies accessory to places of religious worship.
3. Buildings meeting the requirements for shelter design in ICC 500.

4. Portable buildings.

(34) Section 501.2 of the IBC (F). Modify by inserting the following after the second sentence:

From 100-199 feet from the street the number shall be a minimum of 6 inches high with a minimum stroke
of 0.5 inches. From 200-299 feet from the street the numbers shall be a minimum 8 inches high with a
minimum stroke of 0.5 inches. For each additional 100 feet from the street, the number shall increase
by an additional 2 inches in height. Measurements to determine the minimum number size shall be measured
from the approved address location to the center line of the street for which the premises is addressed.

9



(35) Section R703.2 of the IRC. Modify by deleting the last sentence in the paragraph.

(36) Section R807.1 of the IRC. Modify by adding a sentence at the end of the second paragraph as follows:

The opening shall not be located in a closet, bathroom, mechanical room, laundry room, or similar room or
location.

(37) Section 903.2.2 of the IBC (F). Delete Section 903.2.2 of the IBC and replace with:

903.2.2 Group B ambulatory health care facilities. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed
throughout all fire areas containing a Group B ambulatory health care facility occupancy.

(38) Section 903.3.5.3 of the IBC (F). Add a new Section 903.3.5.3 in the IBC to read as follows:

903.3.5.3 Water supply safety margin. Provide a minimum 10%, but not less than 5 psi, safety margin
above static pressure in the fire protection system hydraulic calculation.

(39) Section 903.4.2 of the IBC (F). Delete Section 903.4.2 of the IBC and replace with:

903.4.2. Alarms. An approved weatherproof horn/strobe device shall be mounted directly above the
fire department connection between seven (7) and ten (10) feet in height above grade. The water-
flow alarm device shall be activated by water flow equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the
smallest orifice size installed in the system. Approved and supervised audible visual notification
appliances shall be installed on each level of the interior of the building as required by the fire code official
and NFPA 72.

(40) Section 903.6 of the IBC (F). Add a new Section 903.6 to the IBC to read as
follows:

903.6 Zones. Automatic sprinkler system zones shall not exceed the area permitted by NFPA 13 or
NFPA 13R and shall provide a sprinkler control valve and water flow device for each normally occupied floor

(41) Section 906.1 of the IBC (F). Delete the exception without substitution.

(42) Section 906.3 of the IBC (F). Add a sentence to the end of the section to read as
follows:

The minimum rating of any required portable fire extinguisher for Class A, Class B, or Class C
hazard shall be 2-10 B C

(43) Section 907.2 of the IBC (F). Delete the section and replace
with:

907.2 Where required-new buildings and structures. An approved and addressable fire alarm system
installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided in new buildings
and structures in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.23 and provide occupant notification in
accordance with 907.5, unless other requirements are provided by another section of this code.

A minimum of one manual fire alarm box shall be provided in an approved location to initiate a fire
alarm signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or water-flow detection devices.
Where other sections of this code allow elimination of fire alarm boxes due to sprinklers, a single fire
alarm box shall be installed.

EXCEPTION:

1. The manual fire alarm box is not required for fire alarm systems dedicated to elevator recall
control and supervisory service.

(44) Section 907.2.1 of the IBC (F). Delete the "exception" in Section 907.2.1 in its entirety and insert in lieu
thereof the following exceptions:

EXCEPTION:

10



1) Except for Group A-2 occupancies with occupant loads of 200 or more, manual fire alarm boxes
are not required where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system and the
alarm notification appliances will activate upon sprinkler water flow.

2) Group A-2. An automatic/manual fire alarm system shall be installed in Group A-2 occupancies
with and occupant load of 200 or more. Activation of the fire alarm shall additionally
cause:

a. lllumination of the protected premises to not less than 10 foot-candles over the area of the
room at a height of 30 inches above the floor; and

b. All conflicting or confusing sounds and visual distraction to automatically stop.

(45) Section 907.2.3 of the IBC (F). Modify by adding a sentence to the end of the first paragraph as
follows:

New and existing educational occupancies shall have a monitored fire alarm system.

(46) Section 907.2.3 of the IBC (F). Modify by adding a 4' exception as
follows:

4, Day care occupancies classified as Group E Occupancy shall not require a monitored fire alarm
system unless required elsewhere in the code.

(47) Section 907.2.11.2 of the IBC. Modify by adding a fourth location requirement as follows:

4. Supervised smoke alarms shall be installed in all common corridors and at the top and bottom of all
stairway enclosures in Groups R-2, R-4 and 1-1 occupancies. In corridors, detectors shall be located
within fifteen (15) feet of the end of the corridor and in such a way that one detector is located for each
thirty (30) feet of corridor length or spaced as allowed by the code.

(48) Section 907.4.2 of the IBC. Modify by adding a sentence to the end of the section to read as follows:

Where in the opinion of the code official manual fire alarm boxes may be used to cause false fire
alarms, the code official is authorized to modify the requirements for manual fire alarm boxes.

(49) Section 907.6.4 of the IBC (F). Modify by deleting the exception and inserting in lieu thereof the following
exception:

Exception: Automatic sprinkler system zones shall not exceed the area permitted by NFPA 13 and
shall provide a sprinkler control valve and waterflow device for each normally occupied
floor.

(50) Section 907.6.4.3 of the IBC (F). Add a section to read as
follows:

Section 907.6.4.3 Zone and address location labeling. Fire alarm and/or annunciator panels shall have all
zones and address points plainly and permanently labeled as to their location on the outside of the panel
or on an easily readable map of the building.

(51) Section 907.6.6 of the IBC (F). Modify Section 907.6.6 by adding two sentences to the end as follows:

Each address point identification, shall have an alpha/numeric descriptor location. Alpha/numeric
descriptor locations are required to be reported to the Emergency Communications Center upon activation
of supervisory and/or alarm conditions as specified by the fire code official.

(52) Section 910.2 of the IBC (F). Delete exception 2 without substitution.

(53) Section 910.3.2.2 of the IBC (F). Delete Section 910.3.2.2 and replace with:

910.3.2.2 Sprinklered buildings. Where installed in buildings provided with an approved automatic
sprinkler system, smoke and heat vents shall be designed to operate automatically by actuation of
a heat- responsive device rated at least 100 degrees F (38 degrees C) above the operating temperature

11



of the sprinkler.
Exception: Gravity-operated drop-out vents complying with Section 910.3.2.1.

EGSection 912.6 of the IBC (F). Add a new section 912.6 to the IBC to read as follows:

912.6 Size. Minimum fire department connection size shall be 21?2 inch National Standard Thread.

(55) Section 912.7 of the IBC (F). Add a new section 912.7 to the IBC to read as follows:

912.7 Water supply. Fire department connections shall be located not more than 100 feet from a
hydrant and both the fire department connection and hydrant shall be located on the same side of
the fire department access or as approved by the fire code official.

(56) Section 1011.3 of the IBC. Modify by adding a third exception as follows:

EXCEPTION:

3. Stairs within individual dwelling units of Residential Group R occupancies that existed prior to
8/28/02 (adoption of the 2000 IRC) are permitted a 78-inch (6’-6”) headroom clearance.

(57) 1015.8 of the IBC. Delete Section 1015.8 of the IBC entirely.

@Section 1023.4 of the IBC. Modify Section 1023.4 by adding a fourth unnumbered paragraph as follows:

Fire door assemblies that provide access to a non-pressurized interior exit of R-2 occupancies shall also be
automatic closing by actuation of a smoke detector.

(59) Section 1029.2 of the IBC (F). Modify by adding two new exceptions as follows: EXCEPTION:

1) Except for Group A-2, in assembly occupancies where there is no well-defined main exit or
where multiple main exits are provided, exits shall be permitted to be distributed around the perimeter
of the building provided that the total width of egress is not less than 100 percent of the required width.

2) The main entrance/exit of A-2 occupancies shall be of a width that accommodates not less than
two-thirds of the total occupant load

(60) Section 1030.1 of the IBC. Modify by deleting the exceptions and inserting in lieu thereof the following:

EXCEPTIONS:

1. The emergency escape and rescue opening is permitted to open onto a balcony within an atrium
in accordance with the requirements of Section 404 provided the balcony provides access to an exit
and the dwelling unit or sleeping room has a means of egress that is not open to the atrium.

2. Regardless of what Tables 1006.3.2(1) and 1006.3.2(2) allow, all group R-2 occupancies other than
hotels and motels must be provided with emergency escape & rescue openings.

3. Emergency escape and rescue openings are not required from basements or sleeping rooms

that have an exit door or exit access door that opens directly into a public way or to a yard, court or
exterior exit balcony that opens to a public way.

(61) Section 1030.3 of the IBC. Modify by adding an exception as follows:

EXCEPTION: For emergency escape and rescue openings required for the remodeling or finishing of
space in an existing basement, the maximum sill height may be measured from an elevated landing
not less than 36 inches wide, not less than 18 inches out from the interior finish of the exterior wall and
not more than 24 inches in height. The landing shall be permanently affixed to the floor below and
the wall under the window it serves.

(62) Section 1030.6 of the IBC. Add a new Section 1030.6 to the IBC to read as follows:

Section 1030.6. Emergency escape windows under decks and porches. Emergency escape windows
12



are allowed to be installed under decks and porches provided the location of the deck allows the
emergency escape window to be fully opened and provides a path not less than 36 inches in height to a
yard or court.

(63) Chapter 11 of the IRC. Delete Chapter 11 in its entirety and insert in lieu thereof the following:

Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency, Section N1101. Energy efficiency for the design and construction of
building regulated by this code shall be as required by 661-303 of the lowa State Administrative Code.

(64) Chapter 11 of the IBC. Delete Chapter 11 in its entirety and insert in lieu thereof the following:

Chapter 11 Accessibility, Section 1101. Buildings or portions of buildings shall be accessible to persons
with disabilities as required by 661-302 of the lowa State Administrative Code.

(65) Section 1209.2 of the IBC. Modify by adding a second unnumbered paragraph as follows:

1209.2 Attic spaces. The opening shall be located in a corridor, hallway, or other readily accessible location.
The opening shall not be located in a closet, bathroom, mechanical room, laundry room, or similar room or
location. Attics with a maximum vertical height of less than thirty inches need not be provided with access
openings.

(66) Chapter 13 of the IBC. Delete Chapter 13 in its entirety and insert in lieu thereof the following:

Chapter 13 Energy Efficiency, Section 1301. Energy efficiency for the design and construction of
building regulated by this code shall be as required by 661-303 of the lowa State Administrative Code.

(67) Section G2406.2 (303.3) of the IRC. Prohibited locations of the IRC. Modify by deleting exceptions 3 and 4.

(68) Section G2415.3 (404.3) of the IRC. Prohibited locations of the IRC. . Modify by deleting the last sentence.

(69) Part VIl Plumbing, Chapters 25 through 33 inclusive of the IRC. Delete Part VII Plumbing Chapters
25 through 33 inclusive of the IRC and insert the following:

Part VII Plumbing, Chapter 25

Section P2501 GENERAL

P2501.1 Scope. Plumbing systems shall comply with the lowa State Plumbing Code.

Administrative Provisions. The Plumbing Code shall be administered in accordance with administrative
provisions in chapter 1 of this code as amended.

(70) Chapter 27 of the IBC. Delete Chapter 27 of the IBC and insert the following:

Chapter 27 Electrical
Section 2701.1 Scope. Electrical systems shall comply with the lowa State Electrical Code.

Administrative Provisions. The Electrical Code shall be administered in accordance with administrative
provisions in chapter 1 of this code as amended and Appendix K as amended.

(71) Chapter 28 of the IBC. Delete chapter 28 of the IBC and insert the following:

Chapter 28 Mechanical Systems

Section 2801.1 Scope. Mechanical systems shall comply the lowa State Mechanical Code with the following
amendments:.

Administrative Provisions. The Mechanical Code shall be administered in accordance with administrative
provisions in chapter 1 of this code as amended.

Commercial Kitchen Hood Exhaust Termination:

In addition to the code requirements for commercial kitchen hood exhaust terminations locations, the following
shall apply:
13



For new construction, change in occupancy or change in use, that requires a new commercial kitchen hood or
revisions to an existing commercial kitchen hood, the new or existing commercial kitchen hood exhaust duct
shall terminate as follows:

1. Above the roof level without passing through an exterior wall; or
2. Through an alley facing exterior wall provided the termination is above the roof level; or

3. Toan alley right of way per 3202.3.2 of the International Building Code.

(72) Chapter 29 of the IBC. Delete Chapter 29 of the IBC and insert the following

Chapter 29 Plumbing Systems

Section 2901.1 Scope. Plumbing systems shall comply with the lowa State Plumbing Code.
Administrative Provisions. The Plumbing Code shall be administered in accordance with administrative
provisions in chapter 1 of this code as amended.

(73) Section 3002.4 of the IBC. Delete Section 3002.4 of the IBC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

3002.4 Elevator car to accommodate ambulance stretcher.

In buildings four or more stories above, or four or more stories below, grade plane, at least one
elevator shall be provided for fire department emergency access to all floors. The elevator car shall be
of such a size and arrangement to accommodate an ambulance stretcher 24 inches by 84 inches (610
mm by 2134 mm) with not less than 5-inch (127 mm) radius corners, in the horizontal, open position
and shall be identified by the international symbol for emergency medical services (star of life). The
symbol shall not be less than 3 inches (76 mm) high and shall be placed inside on both sides of the
hoistway door frame.

(74) Part VIII Electrical, Chapters 34 through 43 inclusive of the IRC. Delete Part VIII Electrical Chapters
34 through 43 inclusive of the IRC and insert the following:

Part VIII Electrical, Chapter 34

Section E3401 GENERAL

E3401.1 Applicability. Electrical systems shall comply with the lowa State Electrical Code.
(75) (Appendix K of the IBC.)

(76) Section K103.2 of the IBC. Work exempt from permit. Delete Section K103.2 in the IBC and insert in lieu
thereof the following:

Section K103.2 Work exempt from permit. See section 105.2 in both the IRC and IBC.

(77) Section K106.5 of the IBC. Add a new Section K106. 5 as follows:

Section K106. 5 Energy Connections; An electrical system or equipment regulated by this code for which a
permit is required shall not be connected to a source of energy or power until approved by the building
official.

(78) Section K106.6 of the IBC. Add a new Section K106. 6 as follows:

Section K106. 6 Temporary Energy Connections. The building official may authorize the temporary
connection of the electrical system or equipment to the source of energy or power for the purpose of testing
the equipment, or for use under a temporary certificate of occupancy.

(79) (Appendix J of the IRC.)

(80) Section AJ102.4 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ102.4 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

14



AJ102.4 Replacement windows and doors. Regardless of the category of work, where an existing window or
door, including the sash and glazed portion, or safety glazing is replaced, the replacement window, door or
safety glazing shall comply with the requirements of Sections AJ102.4.1 through AJ102.4.3, as applicable.

(81) Section AJ102.4.1 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ102.4.1 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

AJ102.4.1 Energy efficiency. Replacement windows or doors shall comply with the requirements of Chapter 11.

(82) Section AJ102.4.4 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ102.4.4 of the IRC entirely.

(83) Section AJ501.7 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ501.7 and insert in lieu thereof the following:

AJ501.7 Ceiling height. Habitable spaces created in existing basements or attics shall have ceiling heights of
not less than 6 feet, 8 inches (2032 mm), except that the ceiling height at obstructions shall be not less than 6
feet 4 inches (1930 mm) from the basement or attic floor. Existing finished ceiling heights in nonhabitable
spaces in basements or attics shall not be reduced.

(84) Section AJ501.8.1 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ501.8.1 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

AJ501.8.1 Stair width. Existing basement and attic stairs and handrails not otherwise being altered or modified
shall be permitted to maintain their current clear width at, above and below existing handrails.

(85) Section AJ501.8.2 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ501.8.2 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

AJ501.8.2 Stair headroom. Headroom height on existing basement or attic stairs being altered or modified shall
not be reduced below the existing stairway or attic finished headroom. Existing basement or attic stairs not
otherwise being altered shall be permitted to maintain the current finished headroom.

(86) Section AJ501.8.3 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ501.8.3 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

AJ501.8.3 Stair landing. Landings serving existing basement or attic stairs being altered or modified shall not
be reduced below the existing stairway landing depth and width. Existing basement or attic stairs not otherwise
being altered shall be permitted to maintain the current landing depth and width.

(87) Section AJ601.4 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ601.4 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following:

AJ601.4 Ceiling height. Habitable spaces created in existing basements and attics shall have ceiling heights of
not less than 6 feet, 8 inches (2032 mm), except that the ceiling height at obstructions shall be not less than 6
feet 4 inches (1930 mm) from the basement or attic floor. Existing finished ceiling heights in nonhabitable
spaces in basements or attics shall not be reduced.

SECTION Il. REPEALER. Ordinance No. is hereby repealed.

SECTION Il CONFLICTS. If any section, provision or part of the Ordinance, as now existing or as hereafter
amended, conflicts with the University Heights Zoning Ordinance, Ordinance No. 79, or the University Heights
Rental Housing Code, Ordinance No. 110, as either now exists or is hereafter amended, such conflicts will be
resolved by applying and enforcing the more stringent or more restrictive provision or provisions.

SECTION IV. SEVERABILITY. If any section, provision or part of the Ordinance shall be adjudged to be invalid or
unconstitutional, such adjudication shall not affect the validity of the Ordinance as a whole or any section, provision
or part thereof not adjudged invalid or unconstitutional.

SECTION V. EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ordinance shall be in effect after final passage, approval and publication as
provided by law.

15



Passed and approved this day of , 2016.

MAYOR

ATTEST:

CITY CLERK

Approved by

City Attorney's Office

16



November 23, 2015

University Heights December 2015 eGovernment Report

o Winter Sidewalks snow shoveling policy

November 15, 2015

o Isabella Robles wins writing contest, council meeting webstream posted

November 12, 2015

o  Councilor Aldrich’s baby born

November 11, 2015

o Construction Updates page

November 9, 2015

o Council meeting agenda and attachments

November 8, 2015

o  Council meeting agenda

November 4, 2015
o Election Results

Monthly Statistics from Stat Counter

Page Views Unique Visits 15t Time Visits Returning Visits
1,779 1,332 973 359 Total
60 45 33 12| Average

Monthly Statistics from Webalyzer

Hits per Hour 85

Hits per Day 2492

Pages per Day 439

Total Visits 7374

Total Unique User Agents 990

Average Visits Per Day 245

-H Website Twitter istics November 1- 30, 201

Tweets 8
Re-tweets 4
Followers 78



http://university-heights.blogspot.com/2013/02/february-5-2013.html
http://university-heights.blogspot.com/2013/02/february-5-2013.html
http://university-heights.blogspot.com/2013/02/february-5-2013.html
http://university-heights.blogspot.com/2013/02/february-5-2013.html
http://university-heights.blogspot.com/2013/02/february-5-2013.html

U

niversity Heights City Council Meeting Webcasts Viewing Statistics From EarthChanne

November Council Meeting statistics 11/12/15 to 11/30/15

M P et | 2901 - Aoventar X
S aid
Total Hits: 1,160
Media Types
Vs Type Taty iews & of Tonw
Cvers = L0
Ve s nar 00
O Dewand) Seneans » o
Orv Damuart o 1ee wn
Agiia (PO ] o0
A Aokt ] sm
Packat 1°0F) 0 B0
e ] o
Mo Alactrren (] oo
asaer Atacvrernt o tm
Moot (Al T 064
Podesn (Video 0 2
I Nesa [ o0
Browsers
Brvaver Tepe Tortel Vs ot Tomt
Wedowy o sm
foyso | W we AL
Mosie - PratPad®none e (X
Wotide - Ancvad o 200
Motee < O ‘. o
U ! @iccund " 3

Wi femes © Event: University Heights City Council Meeting of 11/10/1... (11/12/2015)

B S

Dono Rarge | Lt Morth

-

oo wis 7

Potcast (Augind 4 ¢ OO Seasoms
|

Wik | Blocked
Wolsle)Ombes ——— )
: _//ﬂ \
Masile /105
L

\ A

T Windows

October Council Meeting statistics 10/14/15 to 11/30/15

Mk heoons < Event: University Heights City Council Meeting of 10/13/1... (20/14/2015)

Duew Pasgn: Mowandes 1, 2019

B ta)
Total Hits: 1,306
Mecka Types

Wbl - Anyont

Unar o ¢ emon)

Nervemmet 38 13

ot Tomal

war

oot Vol
@aw
"
om
s
oo

..

Dt Range Last Mosth

Podcast el | ¢ OD Sessiam

i




	000 Agenda- Dec. 15, 2015
	00 Resolution 15-75
	00A NDC 2nd Agreement 041415 signed by UH
	00B UH - NDC 1st agrmt 2014 signed
	00C UH - OUP - NDC MOU agrmt addendum 12 15 15
	01 Mayor Report- December 2015
	02 Resolution 15-76
	03 28E Agreement for fire protection
	04 UHAttyRept
	05 City Clerk Report - December  2015
	05A mold_facts
	 
	 
	Iowa Department of Public Health 
	Division of Environmental Health 
	What are the health effects from exposure to mold?  
	 
	In general, mold only causes an allergic reaction. Symptoms of an allergic reaction are itchy or watery eyes, runny nose, sinus drainage, respiratory discomfort and cough. According to the Centers for Disease Control and Prevention, about 50% of the population of the United States is allergic to mold.  If you are NOT allergic to mold, there will be NO health effects from exposure.  If you ARE allergic to mold, your reaction depends on the sensitivity of your allergy.   



	05B University Heights Building Permits
	06 Treasurers Report November 2015
	06A december reports
	06B Cash Receipts & Disbursements Report November 2015
	07 Warrants
	december reports_20151214001750 23
	december reports_20151214001750 24

	08 Community Protection report
	09 Resolution 15-77 extending employment
	09A UH - Stanley Contract Signed and Dated 092414
	11 Streets December report
	12 Engineer-Report-2015-12
	13 BZS_121315
	14 Ordinance 192 adopting building
	15 15-12eGovReport



