
           

                                       AGENDA 
City of University Heights, Iowa 
 City Council Meeting 
Tuesday, January 12, 2016 
Horn School Library room 
600 Koser Ave. 
7:00-9:00pm. 
 
Meeting called by Mayor Wally Heitman 
 

Time 

               

 Topic 

 

 

Owner 

7:00 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Call to Order Meeting 

 

 

 

 

Roll Call 
-Swearing in of Mayor and City Council 
 
-Approval of Minutes-December 15th   
 
Public Input  
 
-One University Place (OUP) construction 
report and updates.  
-Follow-up on proposed division of OUP 
development site into parcels (consistency 
with existing PUD and TIF agreements and 
possibility of effect on assess valuation). 
-Independent building inspector/expert to 
be hired by the city to work with OUP 
developer to oversee the project. 
-Legal's December 2015 comments 
regarding Maxwell Development Request to 
subdivide OUP parcel.  
 

 
Steve Ballard 
 
Wally Heitman 
 
Public Comments 
 
Jeff Maxwell 
 
Jerry Zimmerman 
 
 
 
Jerry Zimmerman 
 
 
Silvia Quezada 

 Administration 

 

  

 -Mayor Mayor’s Report 
-Consideration of Resolution No. 16-01 
ratifying the Mayor’s appointments to the 
Zoning Commission and to the Board of 
Adjustment. 

Wally Heitman 
 
 
 

 -City Attorney Legal Report Steve Ballard 

 -City Clerk City Clerk Report 
-Consideration of Resolution No. 16-02 
adopting a policy concerning the recording, 
publication, and keeping of minutes of 
Council meetings. 
-Discussion regarding record keeping of 
meeting audio recordings. 
-Discussion regarding microphone/recorder 
for audio-taping. 

Chris Anderson 

 Committee Reports:   

  Finance  Committee Report 
-Budget 2016-2017 Process 

Jim Lane 
 



Time 

               

 Topic 

 

 

Owner 

-Budget 2016-2017 Input 
 
Treasurer’s Report/ Payment of Bills  

 
 
Lori Kimura 
 

 Community Protection Police Chief Report 
Committee Report 
 
 

Chief Ken Stanley 
Dotti Maher/Jerry 
Zimmerman 

 Streets and Sidewalks Committee Report 
-Discussion on need for a subdivision 
ordinance for the city. 
-Ice on streets and citations for walks. 
-Issues at Sunset/Oakcrest intersection. 
 
Engineer Report 
-Discussion on removing/repositioning signs 
on various city streets. 

Dotti Maher/Jerry 
Zimmerman 
 
 
Dotti Maher 
 
Josiah Bilskemper 

 Building, Zoning & Sanitation Committee Report 
-Third Consideration of Ordinance No. 
192, Adopting the 2015 International 
Building Code, Plumbing Code, Electrical 
Code, Residential Code, and Property 
Maintenance Code with amendments. 
- Johnson County Assessor’s Office and 
property assessments February 
presentation. 
- Competitive bidding policy and acquisition 
of city's rental tracking software. 

Silvia Quezada 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 e-Government Committee Report  
-Discussion of a Google domain for the city. 

Mike Haverkamp 

  

Announcements 

 
Recommendation of City Attorney to meet 
in closed session pursuant to Iowa Code 
Sec. 21.5(1) to discuss strategy with 
counsel in matters in litigation where its 
disclosure would be likely to prejudice or 
disadvantage the position of the City. 
 
Reconvene to open session 
 
 

 
Anyone 

9 :00 Adjournment  Wally Heitman 
 

    

    

Next Regular City Council Meeting is February 9, 2016:  Horn School Library room 
 



MAYOR’S REPORT - JANUARY 12, 2016 

 

 

Introduction – more civility by and large – work for the benefit of the community. I would to thank Louise 

and all the previous and continuing council members for all the information that was shared in the 

process of my acclimation to the task at hand. 

 

I hope to be a proactive mayor and one of the challenges will be to learn what I can do and what I should 

leave to others. 

 

Travel is one of my passions.  I plan to arrange my occasional travel between council meetings. However, I 

have a trip to France planned in the spring, and I will miss the April meeting. 

 

Appointments to commissions:  

 

Pat Bauer will return to Zoning after serving in the past FOR 15 years. Thank you, Pat, for being willing to 

serve again. 

 

Board of Adjustment – 2 vacancies 

 

Carol Christiansen 

 

I have lived in UH for 25 years in the same house on Grand Ave.  I have been married to Scott for 25 years 

also.  About 10-11 years ago, I started the University Heights Garden Club. The garden is funded solely by 

donations from individuals and greatly appreciated. I graduated from Creighton University with a BS 

degree and attended UI Dental School of Hygiene. Besides gardening, enjoys knitting, reading, and doing 

jigsaw puzzles.  Carol is the president of Johnson County Republican Women. 

 

Shahzad Ali 

 

Shahzad is 33 years old and has live in UH since July of 2014. He is married to Shilpa Balikai, a physician at 

the University of Iowa Children's Hospital. He has a degree in economics and finance from Emory 

University (Atlanta, GA) in 2003.  Shahzad has worked for SunTrust Bank where he helped manage over 

$100 billion in assets within the Trust Department and then worked as a financial analyst within the Equity 

Research department for several years. Shahzad left SunTrust in 2011 to manage assets independently for 

a small group of wealthy investors. 

 

I would like express special thanks to Ann Dudler for having a brief orientation session for Carol and 

Shahzad regarding their service on the BOA. 

 

Sand containers being used for Garbage.  Either Jerry Zimmerman or I will talk about this. 

 



Per request of Virginia Miller, four residents in addition to Virginia have agreed to serve on the Tree 

Board: David Guise, Dan Stence, Kathy Belgum, and Jim Bradley. 

 

Please note that the Community Visioning committee will meet Jan 19 @7:30 at the University Club. 

 

Duncan Stewart has requested that the city seek more bids for city services (RFP).  Jim and I talked about 

this and we will address this in the near future.  The immediate concern is the city budget which must be 

submitted by March 15. Once that process is behind us we take up this issue.  Silvia will also talk about 

this in her report. 

 

Please note that the Iowa City Senior Center will have a lecture on the history on University Heights March 

7 at 2:00 pm in Room 208. 

 

There is another lecture before this one on Feb 1 – same time and place about the railroad coming to 

Iowa City in 1860.  Mike on website?? 

 

The Farmers Market remains a possibility for this year even though the previous site is not available. We 

are considering alternatives. 



RESOLUTION NO. 16-__ 
 

RESOLUTION RATIFYING APPOINTMENTS TO  
THE UNIVERSITY HEIGHTS ZONING COMMISSION 

 
BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of University Heights, Iowa, that the 

appointments by the Mayor of the following individuals to the University Heights 
Zoning Commission and Board of Adjustment are hereby ratified and these 
individuals are duly appointed to the Commission and Board, respectively: 

 
Zoning Commission 

 
Pat Bauer (term ends 12/31/20) 

 
Board of Adjustment 
 
 Carol Christiansen (term ends 12/31/19) 
 Shahzad Ali (term ends 12/31/20) 
 

 
Upon motion by _____________________, and seconded by 

________________, the vote was as follows: 
 
 

  AYES:    NAYS    ABSENT 
 
Haverkamp _____   _____   _______ 
Lane  _____    _____     _______ 
Maher  _____    _____   _______ 
Quezada _____    _____   _______ 
Zimmerman _____   _____    _______ 
 

 
 

Upon Roll Call thus recorded, the Resolution is declared adopted this 12th 
day of January, 2016. 
 
 
 
 _______________________________ 
 Weldon E. Heitman (Wally), Mayor 
 City of University Heights 
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
_____________________________ 
Christine M. Anderson, City Clerk 
 



 
 

January ‘16 – City Attorney's Report 
 

 
1. Swearing In Elected Officials – Oath of Office.  The Mayor and Council members 

have already been officially sworn in by signing and providing to the City Clerk their 
respective Oaths of Office. A public swearing in will be held as part of the January 
meeting. A copy of the Oath of Office that will be recited is attached in case you want 
to practice. 
 

2. Ratifying Mayor’s Appointments.  The Council will consider a Resolution ratifying 
Mayor Heitman’s appointments to the City’s Zoning Commission and Board of 
Adjustment.   

• Pat Bauer is appointed to the Zoning Commission. Pat’s term ends December 
31, 2020.  

• Carol Christiansen and Shahzad Ali are appointed to the Board of Adjustment. 
Carol’s term ends December 31, 2019; Ali’s term ends December 31, 2020. 

• The proposed Resolution is attached. 
 

3. Policy Regarding Meeting Minutes.  City Clerk Chris Anderson will present with her 
monthly report a proposed policy related to the taking, reporting, recording, 
dissemination, publication, and revision of Council meeting minutes. The Council will 
consider a Resolution adopting such a policy. A copy of the Resolution is attached. You 
will note that the Resolution is quite bare-bones: the proposed policy itself will come 
from Chris and will be attached to the Resolution as Exhibit “A”. 
 

4. Adopting Building Codes.  The Council will have its third consideration of Ordinance 
No. 192, which adopts current versions of various building codes.  This ordinance is 
the work product of Silvia Quezada, Terry Goerdt, and I believe one or more members 
of the University Heights Zoning Commission and Board of Adjustment.  A copy of 
Ordinance No. 192 is attached. 
 

5. Changing Fire Protection Service Provider.  At the December meeting, the Council 
adopted Resolution No. 15-76 authorizing the Mayor to provide the City of Coralville 
notice of the City of University Heights’ intention to terminate the 28E Agreement for 
fire Protection Services effective July 1, 2016. That notice was provided. I am awaiting 
a proposed 28E Agreement from the City of Iowa City to commence such services 
effective July 1. The price for the services will not change significantly, if at all, in the 
new agreement; Iowa City has committed to the financial component – I just don’t have 
the actual proposed agreement yet.  I expect to have the agreement in hand for the 
February meeting.  

 
6. OUP – Assessor’s Classification of Property. At the December meeting, I reported 

that the OUP developer had divided the property into two parcels by filing plat of 
survey. The plat draws a line dividing the property into a north parcel (containing the 
church building and surrounding area) and a south parcel (containing the portion of the 
OUP project presently under construction).  A copy of the plat of survey is attached. 



2 
 

• At the December meeting, I was asked whether dividing the property in two 
parcels affected the Johnson County Auditor’s assessment of the property. 
After speaking with the auditor’s office, the short answer is that the division 
does not impact the assessed value or the taxes that will be paid. The detail 
follows. 

• If no plat had been filed (if the property was not divided), the auditor would 
have classified the entire OUP property as commercial. 

o That would be good for the City because commercial property is taxed 
at a larger portion of its assessed value; residential property is subject 
to a significantly larger rollback set by the Legislature each year. 

o That classification – commercial – would have remained in place until 
a condominium declaration was filed showing that all or part of the 
property would be used as residential. After the condominium 
declaration is filed, the auditor would classify the property based upon 
the use shown in the declaration. 

• Filing the plat of survey, or more precisely, the condominium declarations for 
the north and south buildings, will impact the classification of the OUP 
property: the north portion will be classified as residential, and the south 
portion as mixed-use commercial and residential.  

o But whether classified as commercial or residential (and whether 
maintained as one parcel or divided into two), the portion of the 
property now leased to the church and used for church purposes is 
exempt from taxation (just like the entire church property has been for 
many years). 

o The test for whether the church portion of the OUP property is exempt 
is whether the portion is leased to the church for no pecuniary 
(financial) gain to OUP.  

o The lease between OUP and the church provides just that – no 
pecuniary gain to OUP. A copy of the lease is attached. 

o The OUP development plan has always been to permit the church to 
occupy part of the property and operate as a church during the first 
part of construction to give the church some time to build its new 
facility.  

o If there had been no division of the property, the north part would still 
have been exempt from taxation because it was being used as a church. 

• So, dividing the property may permit or require the auditor to classify the 
parcels differently based upon the condominium declarations. But the 
difference in classification was going to happen anyway (the north building 
was always going to be classified as residential and the south building as 
mixed) regardless of the division, and dividing the property does nothing to 
the assessed value or the property taxes the City will receive.   

• The only present circumstance that impacts the assessed value and taxation of 
the OUP property is the use of a portion of the property by the church pursuant 
to a lease with no pecuniary gain to OUP.  That circumstance would exist (and 
the north part of the property would be exempt from taxation) whether or not 
the OUP property was divided into two parcels. 



3 
 

• The OUP developers did, in fact, file a condominium declaration for the south 
building December 29, 2015. A copy is attached.  

o So, the south parcel will be assessed effective January 1, 2016 (as 
required by law), as partly residential and partly commercial. (Again, 
the north parcel will be classified as commercial but exempt from 
taxation based upon use by the church pursuant to lease with no 
pecuniary gain to OUP as landlord.) 

o Because property taxes in Iowa are paid in arrears, the January 1, 2016,  
assessed value of the south parcel will be used to calculate taxes for 
fiscal year 2016-17. Those taxes will be paid half in September 2017 
and half in March 2018.  

o The City’s TIF Development Agreement with OUP provides that the 
first TIF payment will be made June 1, 2018. A copy of that agreement 
is also attached. 

• So long as the church uses the north parcel as a church pursuant to a lease 
whereby OUP receives no pecuniary gain, the north parcel will be exempt 
from payment of any property taxes. Once the lease terminates (May 31, 
2016), the north parcel will be subject to taxation just like the south parcel or 
any other property in the City.  

• In summary, the division of the OUP property does not impact the assessed 
value or the taxes to be paid. 

• At the December meeting, I was also asked whether the division of the OUP 
property impacted National Development Council’s assumptions and 
evaluation of the TIF request.  

o I have asked Tom Jackson with NDC and will share what I learn. 
Given there is no effect on assessed value or taxes generated, I 
anticipate there will be no impact. 

o I have confirmed with Tom Jackson that if the division does not 
change the assessed value or the taxes to be paid, it would not impact 
NDC’s assumptions and evaluation of the TIF request. 

 
7. OUP – Condominium Declaration – Compliance with City Agreements. The OUP 

PUD Development Agreement and TIF Development Agreement require that certain 
provisions and restrictions be set forth in the OUP condominium declaration. (The 
“condominium declaration” is the legal document that turns a piece of real property – 
land – into separate units that may be identified and sold individually (the condominium 
units.)).  

• The OUP declaration was prepared with certain provisions in bold to identify 
compliance with various provisions of the PUD and TIF agreements. I will 
review the declaration as a whole, and these bold provisions in particular, to 
confirm compliance with the agreements. You are invited to do so, as well. 

• The declaration may be amended.  
o For example, a certificate from ehe OUP engineer will be added to 

confirm that the project “as built” conforms to the OUP plans, as 
approved.  



4 
 

o Other changes and additions may be required as well, as the City has 
the opportunity to review the declaration. 

• A copy of the declaration and the PUD Development Agreement and TIF 
Development Agreement are attached for your ready reference. 

 
8. OUP – Professional and Clerical Fee Reimbursement.  I was asked at the December 

meeting to summarize the City’s arrangement with Jeff Maxwell concerning 
reimbursement of City expenses related to consideration and approval of the OUP 
development and TIF request.  Throughout the process of considering and approving 
the OUP development proposal and TIF request, Jeff Maxwell has agreed to (and has) 
reimbursed the City for professional and clerical fees and expenses as requested.  

• The City’s agreement with Mr. Maxwell initially related to those fees and 
expenses related to consideration of the OUP proposal and TIF request. A 
copy of the pre-approval agreement is attached. 

• Once the proposal and TIF were approved August 11, 2015, a new agreement 
was approved and signed. The new agreement continues to obligate Mr. 
Maxwell to reimburse the City for its expenses related to the OUP 
development, including overseeing construction.  

o The agreement gives Mr. Maxwell a credit toward such 
reimbursement in the amount of the costs of required fees and permits 
associated with construction (building permit, electrical permit, etc.). 

o The reason for providing this credit in the agreement is that the 
purpose of those permit fees is to cover the City’s costs of overseeing 
construction related to those particular items.  

o Mr. Maxwell’s obligation to reimburse the City for its expenses 
extends beyond the permit fees (he has to reimburse the City for 100% 
of the City’s expenses), but he does receive a credit in the amount of 
those permit fees required to be paid. 

o To date, my understanding is that Mr. Maxwell has paid approximately 
$100,000 in permit fees. Thus, City expenses related to the OUP 
development have already been paid by Mr. Maxwell to that extent. If 
and when City expenses exceed what has been paid in required permit 
fees, the City will request reimbursement. If City expenses do not 
exceed what has been paid, the City retains the full amount paid even 
though expenses are less than that amount. 

o A copy of the post-approval agreement is also attached. 
 

9. OUP – National Development Council – Records Retention.  At the December 
meeting, the Council adopted Resolution No. 15-75 authorizing the Mayor to sign and 
the Clerk to attest a Memorandum of Understanding Addendum to the City’s 
Agreement with the National Development Council requiring NDC to retain documents 
for five years or the life of the One University Place TIF, whichever is longer. (The 
City previously entered into agreements with the National Development Council to help 
evaluate the request for economic development assistance in the form of TIF for the 
OUP proposal.)  



5 
 

• Shortly after the December meeting, I communicated with Tom Jackson to 
ask that NDC sign the MOU adopted by the Council. Mr. Jackson indicated 
that NDC was considering the MOU and might propose simply turning the 
documents over to the City for retention. I haven’t heard anything further but 
followed up with Mr. Jackson this week and will continue to do so. I will 
report what I learn. 

• Mr. Jackson informs me that NDC will burn a CD with documents and files 
NDC received and prepared and send it to the City. If the CD is sent to me, I 
will inform the Mayor and Council when I receive it. 
 

10. Closed Session.  I recommend and advise that the Council to go into Closed Session at 
the January meeting to discuss litigation matters.  A motion to that effect is attached. 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Leff/SEB/UH/UH Atty Reports/UHAttyRept January ‘16 legal report  





































































































































































































































City Clerk Report 
January 2016 
 

 
 
 

 Two building permits received since the last meeting: 
 

One University Place – mechanical and plumbing permit 
1450 Grand Avenue - remove 2 interior walls, add beams/joists 
 

 178 rental permits received for FY16 fiscal year (177 last month): 
 

75 for Grandview Court (74 last month) 
103 for rest of University Heights (103 last month) 
 

 Proposing new minutes’ timeline for council consideration. 
 

 Spoke with property owner at 1527 Oakcrest Avenue regarding notification 
received for sidewalk covered in ice. 
 

 Received reimbursement for sidewalk repairs from the following properties: 
 

21 Highland Drive  114 Highland Drive 
140 Highland Drive  212 Highland Drive 
222 Highland Drive  245 Highland Drive 
270 Highland Drive  24 Koser Avenue   
127 Koser Avenue  141 Koser Avenue 
205 Koser Avenue  209 Koser Avenue 
230 Koser Avenue  255 Koser Avenue 
210 Marietta Avenue  240 Marietta Avenue 
1005 Melrose Avenue 1239 Melrose Avenue 
20 Olive Court  32 Olive Court 

 
 



University Heights     

Building Permits     

January 1 - December 31, 2015     

Permit # Building Address 
Date 

Issued Fee 
Building 
Valuation Description of Remodeling 

BLD15-002 207 Mahaska Drive 2/5/2015 $421.00 $17,000.00 Bedroom and bath remodel (bldg., electrical and plumbing permits) 

BLD15-001 220 Koser Avenue 2/1/2015 $832.00 $62,320.00 Kitchen and bathroom remodel (bldg., mechanical, electrical and plumbing permits) 

BLD15-003 2 Leamer Court 4/12/2015 $519.30 $30,000.00 Remodel kitchen and move stairs (bldg., electrical, mechanical and plumbing permits) 

BLD15-004 40 Koser Avenue 4/21/2015 $369.30 $20,000.00 20x20 garage 

BLD15-005 1465 Grand Avenue 9/15/2015 $832.00 $45,000.00 24x24 two story garage (approved through BOA) 

 2 Leamer Court 6/9/2015 $50.00 $1,500.00 Service upgrade from 100 to 200 amp 

BLD15-006 30 Prospect Place 6/9/2015 $1,389.15 $150,000.00 Remodel of SFD: new roof, bathroom, closets, deck and concrete patio 

 100 Koser Avenue 7/7/2015 $50.00 $1,000.00 Electrical permit - wiring for bathroom remodel 

 28 Highland Drive 8/5/2015 $50.00  Electrical permit - move overhead service 

BLD15-007 409 Monroe Street 9/15/2015 $573.00  New kitchen, 3 bathrooms and a laundry room 

 1455 Grand Avenue 10/5/2015 $50.00 $2,000.00 Plumbing permit - main floor bathroom remodel 

 1455 Grand Avenue 10/9/2015 $50.00  Electrical permit - main floor bathroom remodel 

BLD15-009 254 Highland Drive 10/5/2015 $127.80 $5,000.00 18x25 concrete slab for patio 

 One University Place  $79,500.00  Building permit for OUP 

 One University Place  $22,820.00  Electrical permit for OUP 

BLD15-010 1450 Grand Avenue 10/12/2015 $920.50 $60,000.00 Remove 2 interior walls, add beams/joists (bldg., electrical and plumbing permits) 

BLD15-011 328 Koser Avenue 11/18/2015 $1,485.75 $130,000.00 
Addition to and remodel to 1960 home (bldg., electrical, mechanical and plumbing 
permits) 

 One University Place 12/23/2015 $1,985.00  Mechanical permit for OUP 

 One University Place 12/23/2015 $6,170.00  Plumbing permit for OUP 

 



At the request of and in consultation with our mayor, I am proposing a change to our minutes’ process, 
beginning with the January 2016 meeting minutes. Iowa law states minutes must be published 15 days 
after the meeting is held. The Press Citizen’s requirements state items must be received at least 4 days 
prior to the publish date AND they will not publish minutes on Wednesdays (due to other legal notices 
published on that day). 
  
Therefore, I propose the following timeline (using January’s meeting as a guide): 
  
1)      I will have 3 days to work on the council minutes. I ask that the “warrants by fund” list now be 
included in the monthly council financial packet. Any corrections/additions/subtractions, from the warrant 
list, will result in a new list sent to me within this time frame. (January 13th-15th) 
  
2)      I will distribute the draft of the minutes to the mayor, council members and staff for review. (January 
16th) Council and staff will have until EOB (5:00 pm) four days later to return their comments/suggestions 
to me. (January 20th) This does not prevent the council from discussing items/issues and/or making 
changes at the following council meeting. 
  
3       If comments/suggestions are clerical or minor in nature, I will make the changes and then send the 
minutes to be published.  If the changes appear to be more significant or if there might be disagreement 
on the changes, I won’t include them in the minutes I send on for publication but will send the minutes to 
be published in the form I circulated them (transparency), with the understanding that the council will 
discuss the minutes and resolve the disagreement at next month’s meeting. (February) In any event 
either case, I will proceed with publishing the draft of the minutes according to the approved timeline. 
I will apprise the mayor, council and staff as to any significant/contested changes that were not included. 
  
4)      Minutes will be e-mailed to Sara Crosby (my contact at the Press-Citizen); the mayor, council and 
staff will be cc’d on the e-mail. I will ask that minutes are published, at the latest, the 14th day after the 
meeting. (January 26th). 
  
5)      If there are material changes to be discussed and decided at next month’s meeting (February), and 
in accordance with recommendations from our city auditor, changes/amendments will be listed in the 
minutes (as they are now) and the changes will be published with the next council meetings’ minutes. 
(February minutes) 
  
Material changes must be circulated via e-mail no later than 7 days prior to the next council meeting to 
mayor, council and staff. 
  
  
  
The amount charged by newspapers for City legal publications is set by statute (state law). The city is not 
able to negotiate a different rate. 
  

Iowa 2015 Legal Inch Rates 

Ordinance 3.0452 
Full 4.0664 
Ordinance 2 2.8934 
Ordinance 3 2.8428 
Full 2 3.4040 
Full 3 3.1832 
Auditor Ord 2.1344 
Auditor Full 2.8483 
Aud Ord 2nd Day 2.0277 
Aud Ord 3rd Day 1.9921 
Aud Full 2nd Day 2.3846 
Aud Full 3rd Day 2.2301 

 



RESOLUTION NO. 16-__ 
 

RESOLUTION ADOPTING A POLICY CONCERNING  
MINUTES OF COUNCIL MEETINGS 

 
RESOLVED that the City Council of the City of University Heights hereby 

adopts a policy concerning minutes of Council meetings as set forth in Exhibit “A” 
attached. 

 
Upon motion by _____________________, and seconded by 

________________, the vote was as follows: 
 
 

  AYES:    NAYS    ABSENT 
 
Haverkamp _____   _____   _______ 
Lane  _____    _____     _______ 
Maher  _____    _____   _______ 
Quezada _____    _____   _______ 
Zimmerman _____   _____    _______ 
 

 
 

Upon Roll Call thus recorded, the Resolution is declared adopted this 12th 
day of January, 2016. 
 
 
 
 _______________________________ 
 Weldon E. Heitman (Wally), Mayor 
 City of University Heights 
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
_____________________________ 
Christine M. Anderson, City Clerk 
 
Steve/UH Resolutions/Resolution 16-__ adopting policy re minutes 011216 



Budget Timelines-2016 

 

2016-2017 Budget- Submit to State of Iowa by March 15, 2016 

 

2015-2016 Budget-Submit amended budget to State of Iowa by May 15, 2016 

 

2015-2016 Budget- Submit final Budget results by November 15, 2016 

 

 

 

Contract with other Municipalities-“28e” 

 

Fire Protection- Current budget- $31,000, increases based on CPI each year. Expect to 

move contract from Coralville to Iowa City in July, 2016. 

 

Library—Current budget- $44,677, increases each year based on overhead costs at Iowa 

City and Coralville Public Libraries. Library costs also include population of University 

Heights, so it changes every 10 years with the census. There is a library services levy 

which produces $17,143 this year and is collected with property taxes. This levy is set by 

law and cannot be raised, so we are spending $27,500 from general budget each year and 

this number is increasing. 

 

Hydrant Flush- Current budget- $3,520 and it stays pretty stable each year. This is 

performed by City of Iowa City each year 

 

Bus Service-Current budget-$36,121 and it stays pretty stable each year as ridership does 

not tend to increase. This is provided by City of Iowa City. 

 

SEATS Service- Current budget-$8,444 and it stays pretty stable each year as ridership 

does not tend to increase. This is provided by City of Iowa City. 

 

Animal Shelter-Current Budget-$1200/year. This is based on amount of animals taken to 

animal shelter from University Heights. Currently this number is low for us as we have 

very little use of the shelter by our residents. This is provided by City of Iowa City.  

 

 

Contracts with Private Companies 

 

Johnson County Refuse- Trash/Recycling and Leaf Vacuuming-$35,500 est. 

 

L.L. Pelling- Street Sweeping-$3,500 est. 

 

Hawkeye Construction and Snow Removal- Snow removal- $35,000 est. 

 

Jim Lane 

01/12/2016 



Treasurer’s Report by Lori Kimura    December 2015  
 
Our total revenue for the month of December was $49,678.77 comprised of the following 
amounts: 

    

Property Taxes       $ 18,929.25  
Parking fines       $    640.00 

Traffic Fines from Clerk of Court    $  3,789.98 

Interest on bank accounts/CD’s     $  1,206.02 
Road Use Funds      $ 11,340.51 

Rental Permits       $   200.00 

Parking permits       $    40.00 

Governors Traffic Safety Grant     $  1,141,25 
Mediacom Cable Franchise Fees 7/1/15-9/30/15   $  3,281.26 

Mechanical & plumbing permit OUP    $  8,155.00 

Other building permits/excavation permits   $    945.50 
 

In addition, we received reimbursements from 12 property owners for sidewalk repairs 

that were done totaling $4,889.02.  This amount was recorded as a negative expense and 

will offset the expense from November. 
 
Balances in the bank accounts as of 12/31/15: 

 

MidwestOne Checking Account    $330,203.93 
Hills Bank Money Market Account   $   1,044.19  

CD at UICCU (1001 due 3/22/17 @ 1.7%)  $ 77,861.58 

CD at UICCU (1003 due 8/28/17 @ 1.24%)  $ 43,891.09 

CD at UICCU (1007 due 9/20/17 @ 1.79%)  $ 26,323.92 
CD at UICCU (1009 due 11/2/18 @ 2.38%)  $ 26,341.97 

CD at UICCU (1011 due 5/19/17 @ 1.99%)  $ 73,738.90 

UICCU Savings      $     5.00 
Time Account at Hills Bank    $ 23,027.50 

Forfeiture Fund      $  4,066.99 

 
The total amount of interest we earned in 2015 on our CD’s at the UICCU was $3,801.89.  We 

currently have a total balance of $248,157.46 being held at the UICCU.  The limit of what we can 

have there is $250,000 so in the next month we will need to move some money out of the UICCU 

and either put in the MidwestOne checking account, or open up another CD somewhere else.  
 

We’ve only gotten one bill for snow removal so far from Hawkeye Construction & Snow 

Removal which was for the November snow storm.  It was $4,347.50. 



City of University Heights  

Cash Receipts and Disbursements by Fund

July 1, 2015 to December 31, 2015

STREET CAPITAL GENERAL DEBT POLICE ROAD USE EMPLOYEE

CONSTRUCTIONPROJECTS FUND SERVICE FORFEITURE TAX BENEFITS TOTAL

Receipts

Local Option Sales Tax -$                    

Property Tax 316,577.43$    17,500.36$    44,528.77$     378,606.56$       

Other City Taxes 4,669.02$        256.29$         659.46$          5,584.77$           

Licenses and Permits 145,618.20$    145,618.20$       

Use of Money and Property 2,374.31$        4.10$              140.60$          2,519.01$           

Intergovernmental 4,131.92$          70,729.72$       74,861.64$         

Charges for Services 47.00$             47.00$                

Special Assessments -$                    

Miscellaneous 44,513.50$      44,513.50$         

Other Financing Sources -$                    

Total Receipts $ -$                   517,931.38$    17,756.65$    4.10$              70,729.72$      45,328.83$     651,750.68$       

Disbursements

Payroll Expenses   

Public Safety 200,026.12$    33,464.68$     233,490.80$       

Public Works 106,220.15$    19,276.46$      125,496.61$       

Culture & Recreation 26,281.96$      26,281.96$         

Community & Economic Dev. 1,140.00$        1,140.00$           

General Government 149,739.02$    1,293.62$       151,032.64$       

Principal/Interest 1,249.29$      1,249.29$           

Uncategorized/Miscellaneous 0

Total Disbursements -$                   483,407.25$    1,249.29$      -$                19,276.46$      34,758.30$     538,691.30$       

Net Cash Increase (Decrease) -$                   34,524.13$      16,507.36$    4.10$              51,453.26$      10,570.53$     113,059.38$       

Balance, beginning of year -$             (189,563.90)$    520,594.33$    (368.95)$        (1,050.92)$      27,366.71$      (58,077.97)$    298,899.30$       

Balance, end of period -$             (189,563.90)$    555,118.46$    16,138.41$    (1,046.82)$      78,819.97$      (47,507.44)$    411,958.68$       











































Date Name Memo Amount

Dec 16, '15 - Jan 12, 16
12/22/2015 MidAmerican Energy pedestrian lights at 113 Golfview -36.82
12/22/2015 MidAmerican Energy 1301 Melrose stop light -33.47
12/22/2015 MidAmerican Energy 1011 Melrose stop light -28.57
12/22/2015 MidAmerican Energy City Hall gas/electricity -55.58
12/28/2015 MidAmerican Energy street lights -644.78
12/30/2015 Jones, Christian R -1,743.12
12/30/2015 Lyon, Kristofer S -1,241.53
12/30/2015 Schmitz, Jakub J -1,213.53
12/30/2015 Sherman, Nicholas M -1,510.46
12/30/2015 Simcox, Levio M -1,146.97
12/30/2015 Plate, Harold, -162.80
12/30/2015 Stanley, Kenneth L -1,575.49
12/30/2015 Aldrich, Carla -184.70
12/30/2015 From, Louise A. -454.14
12/30/2015 Haverkamp, Michael J -172.80
12/30/2015 Lane, James -184.70
12/30/2015 Miller, Virginia G -184.70
12/30/2015 Quezada, Silvia M -184.70
12/30/2015 Anderson, Christine M. -394.99
12/30/2015 Kimura, Lori D. -251.04
12/30/2015 Wellmark BC/BS monthly insurance payment -2,602.05
12/31/2015 Internal Revenue Service 42-1109342 -3,282.62
12/31/2015 IOWA PUBLIC EMPLOYEES ... -209.32
12/31/2015 IOWA PUBLIC EMPLOYEES ... -3,743.70
01/01/2016 Paul J. Moore, Melrose Aven... City Hall Rent/garages automatic deposit -1,374.23
01/07/2016 City of Iowa City City Hall water/sewer automatic payment -14.22
01/08/2016 Verizon Wireless monthly wireless service -120.05
01/12/2016 Stan Laverman rental inspector salary -500.00
01/12/2016 SEATS Seats Payment -703.66
01/12/2016 City of Iowa City bus, fuel for police vehicles -3,974.03
01/12/2016 Johnson County Refuse, Inc. December recycling -1,738.50
01/12/2016 Mediacom online service 1/3/16-1/2/16 -109.95
01/12/2016 Iowa City Press-Citizen December publications -473.53
01/12/2016 Safeguard Business Systems parking citations for football days -320.41
01/12/2016 Tri Tech Forensics urine sample tests -215.00
01/12/2016 Internet Navigator monthly fee for city website/email service -24.95
01/12/2016 Shive Hattery engineering services 11/28/15-1/1/16 -3,860.99
01/12/2016 Leff Law Firm, L.L.P. legal services 12/12/15-1/8/2016 -7,225.00
01/12/2016 Terry Goerdt December inspection services -1,085.00
01/12/2016 Iowa City School District facility use fees for Jan-Feb-March meetings -90.00
01/12/2016 VISA vacuum cleaner for city hall/postage for treasur... -415.99
01/12/2016 VISA water cooler rental -8.48
01/12/2016 VISA postage/office supplies -892.04
01/12/2016 Pyramid Services Inc. oil changes -92.91
01/12/2016 Domain Listings annual website domain name listing 2016 -105.00
01/12/2016 City of Coralville fire protection 1/1/16-6/30/16 -15,508.50
01/12/2016 Brad Wiley December council meeting filming & editing -100.00
01/12/2016 Hawkeye Construction & Sno... snow removal 11/21/15-12/13/15 -4,347.50
01/12/2016 Alex Cross reimbursement for towing in error -158.20

Dec 16, '15 - Jan 12, 16

City of University Heights, Iowa

01/10/16 Warrants for Council Approval
December 16, 2015 through January 12, 2016

Page 1



 

Project #116102-0 
 

 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 
 
TO:   University Heights, Mayor, Council, and Staff 

FROM:   Josiah Bilskemper, P.E. 

DATE:   January 9, 2016 

RE:   City Engineer’s Report 

 
(1) 2015 Sidewalk Inspections (SW Quadrant) 

 
a. Letters with sidewalk reports were mailed to 33 properties.  At this time, 10 properties 

have responded with requests to join the city sidewalk repair project.  The deadline to 
electively join the City administered sidewalk repair project is February 1, 2016. 
 

b. As explained in the mailed notification letters, for property owners who prefer to perform 
or coordinate repairs on their own, the deadline to have sidewalk repairs completed in 
June 1, 2016.  Sidewalks marked for repair will be inspected again after this date.  If no 
attempt was made to repair the sidewalk, or if the unsatisfactory repairs are not 
corrected, the City will take charge and arrange for the repair work to be completed.  In 
this instance, both construction and administrative costs may be higher, and the 
adjoining property owner will be invoiced for all such costs. 
 

c. In an effort to attract more contractors to bid on the 2016 repair contract, the notification 
and sign-up dates are being moved ahead this year.  The notification process will occur 
earlier (October instead of January), and the sign-up for the city administered repair 
project will occur earlier (February 1 instead of April 15).  This will allow bids to be 
obtained earlier (April instead of June), therefore providing more time for the work to be 
completed, and hopefully generating more contractor interest. (October Mtg.) 

 
(2) MPOJC Report – Sign Recommendations 

 
a. Attached is the MPOJC report with recommended sign alterations (Melrose, Sunset, 

Koser and George) that was provided with Virginia’s report at the November meeting, 
and was discussed at the December meeting.  At the December meeting, council 
requested that Chief Stanley also review the signs and provide input.  At the meeting, I 
anticipate discussing Chief Stanley’s input and then determining if council would like to 
consider any of the proposed sign adjustments. 
 

(3) One University Place – Public Improvements Project 
 

a. I communicated with Ron Amelon at MMS regarding the planned project schedule for 
the roadway and intersection improvements project. 
 

i. He reports that an updated set of plans is to be submitted to the city for review 
in early January.  I haven’t received anything as of yet, but will continue to 
follow up with Mr. Amelon, and will forward to council when it is received. 
 

ii. Mr. Amelon would like to have this project out to bidders in February, and 
receive bids in early March so that council could consider awarding a 
construction contract in March.  The goal is to have the roadway and 



Page 2 of 2 

Project # 116102-0  |  January 9, 2016 

 

intersection work completed by August 1, 2016, which is the planned 
occupancy date for the OUP south building currently under construction. 
 

iii. Once the plans and specifications are reviewed and completed, council will 
need to take several actions associated with the public bidding process.  This 
includes “Setting a Public Hearing,” “Holding a Public Hearing,” and then 
reviewing the bids received and “Consideration of Awarding a Construction 
Contract” based on those bids.  I anticipate a special council meeting would 
need to be held at some point to accommodate this proposed schedule of 
awarding a construction contract in March 2016. 
 

iv. There will also be a need during this time for the developer to provide, and the 
council to take action on, required legal documentation for the acquisition of 
additional right-of-way on the north side of the intersection.  This will 
accommodate the realigned street on the north side of the intersection. 

 
b. The council approved a motion at the November 10, 2015 meeting to include 

replacement of several poor condition street panels on Melrose Avenue (adjacent to the 
One University Place frontage) as part of the One University Place Public 
Improvements Project being prepared by MMS Consultants.  The City will be 
responsible for the construction costs associated with these additional panels that are 
outside the scope of work necessary for the OUP site construction. (Dec. Mtg.) 
 
 

Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions about these or any other items. 
 
JDB 





	
   1	
  

Building Zoning & Sanitation Committee 
January 2016 Report ♦  By Silvia Quezada 
 
 
 Lights in the Heights II – Luminary Walk 2015 – aprox. 1,300 Lights 

• Thank You to the volunteers for helping prepare luminaries and set-up/lighting 
• If you have suggestions for next year, let us know as we’ve received some good 

ideas for the next time. 
§ Silvia Q. & Susan Wells 

 
Johnson County Assessor’s Office & University Heights Review 

• County Assessor’s Office confirmed availability to present in February. 
• Presentation will explain the process of recent property assessment increase, in-

home inspections and next steps.  Q&A to follow. 
  
Zoning & Board of Adjustments Commissions: 

• Securing training resources for Zoning Commission and Board of Adjustment 
members 

• To convene both bodies to elect chairperson, schedule monthly meetings and 
review current process 

 
Inspector Reports 
 
Housing Inspector (Stan Laverman): 
 

1.	
  	
  Permit	
  Tracking	
  Software	
  -­‐-­‐	
  Acella	
  and	
  UH	
  Housing	
  Inspector	
  have	
  made	
  
contact;	
  researching	
  Johnson	
  County’s	
  Acella	
  use.	
  	
  	
  
	
  
2.	
  	
  Front	
  Yard	
  Paving	
  -­‐	
  	
  Enforcement	
  with	
  1	
  property	
  owner	
  underway.	
  
	
  
3.	
  	
  Commercial	
  Parking,	
  Home	
  Occupation	
  &	
  Rentals.	
  	
  	
  	
  Legal	
  opinion	
  requested.	
  
	
  
4.	
  	
  Un-­‐shoveled	
  Sidewalks.	
  	
  Police	
  Department	
  tagged	
  non-­‐compliant	
  
properties.	
  	
  Have	
  arrangements	
  been	
  made	
  for	
  the	
  properties	
  that	
  are	
  still	
  not	
  in	
  
compliance?	
  	
  

 
Building Inspector (Terry Goerdt) 

 
1. 1003 Melrose – One University Place – Construction moving along. 
  
2. Other Residential Construction – Moving along, required inspections 
made, completed and approved.   

  



	
   2	
  

LIGHTS	
  IN	
  THE	
  HEIGHTS	
  II	
  -­‐	
  2015	
  
The	
  City	
  shined	
  beautifully	
  

Thanks	
  to	
  all	
  the	
  volunteers	
  &	
  sponsors	
  	
  
for	
  making	
  this	
  possible!	
  

	
  
Sponsors	
   Volunteers	
  
Susan	
  Bruelle	
   Haruhi	
  Abbas	
  &	
  Family	
  
Beth	
  Cavalier	
   Randal	
  &	
  Sue	
  Aitchison	
  Family	
  
Teresa	
  &	
  David	
  Giese	
   Peter	
  Alexander	
  
Amy	
  &	
  Tyler	
  Gums	
   Nancy	
  Barth	
  
Robin	
  Hayward	
   Amy	
  Gums	
  	
  
John	
  McLure	
   Gloria	
  Hanson	
  
Lisa	
  Mellacker	
   Clayton	
  Hargrave	
  
Jerry	
  Musser	
   JP	
  Hourcade	
  
Kim	
  Pickering	
  (Iowa	
  City)	
   Jim	
  Lane	
  
Silvia	
  Quezada	
   Art	
  Novak	
  
Mary	
  Russell	
  (Iowa	
  City)	
   Lauren	
  Ripley	
  
Keith	
  Rutherford	
  (Iowa	
  City)	
   Ruben	
  Quezada	
  
Marvin	
  Sims	
   Silvia	
  Quezada	
  
	
   Susan	
  Wells	
  	
  
	
   	
  
	
   	
  

 



 

1 
 

 
 

Prepared  by: Terry Goerdt, Building Inspector, City of University Heights. 319-330-9806 
 

ORDINANCE NO.  192 
 

AN ORDINANCE PROVIDING FOR THE ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, 
2015 EDITION, INCLUDING APPENDIX K; ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL 
CODE, 2 0 1 5  E D I T I O N ,  INCLUDING APPENDIX F AND APPENDIX J, AND PROVIDING   FOR   
CERTAIN  AMENDMENTS TO THOSE CODES; ADOPTION OF THE STATE ELECTRICAL CODE 
(IOWA CODE § 103.6(1)(A)); AND ADOPTION OF THE STATE  PLUMBING AND MECHANICAL 
CODES (IOWA CODE § 105.4(1)(A)); AND REPELAING ORDINANCE 147.  

 
WHEREAS, the City’s current building code is the 2003 edition of the International Building Code (IBC) and 

the International Residential Code (IRC), and the City should adopt the 2015 editions of those codes; and 
 

WHEREAS, for purposes of uniformity throughout the State, the State Code has been amended to require all 
local jurisdictions to adopt the State Plumbing and Mechanical Codes by December 31, 2016; and 

 
  WHEREAS, the fuel gas code is contained in the State Plumbing Code; and 
 
WHEREAS, for uniformity in greater Johnson County area, the City should adopt the State Electrical Code; and 
 

WHEREAS, the purpose of this ordinance to provide for the protection of the health, welfare and safety of the 
residents of University Heights,  

 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY UNIVERSITY HEIGHTS 
 
Section I. 
 
(A) Codes Adopted: Subject to the following amendments, the 2015 edition of the international building code 

(IBC) including Appendix K, electrical administrative process, and 2015 edition of the international residential code (IRC) 
including Appendix F, radon control methods, and Appendix J, Existing Buildings And Structures, are adopted.   

 
(B) Additionally, the City further adopts Section 103.6(1)(a) of the Iowa Code (the Iowa State Electrical Code), 

Section 105.4(1)(a) of the Iowa Code (the Iowa State Mechanical Code), and Section 105.4(1)(a) of the Iowa Code (the 
Iowa State Plumbing Code).   

 
(C) Collectively, these codes shall be known and may be identified, in this Ordinance and elsewhere, as “the City 

of University Heights Building Code” or the “Building Code”. Interpretations of the building official may be guided by 
publications of the International Code Council, Inc., or the International Existing Building Code, or by such other and 
further professional and regulatory publications and information as the building official in the official’s reasonable 
discretion deems prudent and appropriate. 

 
( D )  Interpretation of Building Code provisions: The provisions of the Building Code shall be held to be 

the minimum requirements adopted for the protection of the health, safety and welfare of the residents of the City 
of University Heights. Any higher standards in the state statute or City ordinance shall be applicable. 

 
(E) Amendments to Code: The following sections of the 2015 edition of the international building code and 2015 

edition of the international residential code are amended as follows: 
 
(1) Section 101.1 of both the IBC and IRC. Delete Section 101.1 of both the IBC and IRC and insert in lieu 
thereof the following: 
 

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of City of University Heights, hereinafter 
referred to as "this code." 

 
(2) Section 105.2 of both the IBC and IRC. Delete Section 105.2 of both the IBC and IRC and insert in lieu 
thereof the following: 
 

105.2 Work Exempt from Permit. A permit shall not be required for the following: 
Building 
 
1. One-story detached accessory  structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses  and 



 

2 
 

similar uses,  provided  the floor area does not exceed  144 square feet  provided  the structure  
is not located in a flood hazard area. 
 

2. Fences not over 6 feet (1829 mm) high. 
 
3. Oil derricks. 
 
4. Retaining  walls which are not over 4 feet (1219 mm)  in height measured  from the bottom of the 
footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or impounding Class I, II or III-A liquids. 
 
5. Water tanks supported directly on grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons (18 925 L) 
and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2 to 1. 
 
6.  Sidewalks  and  driveways  not  more  than  30 inches  (762  mm)  above  grade  and  not  over  any 
basement or story below and which are not part of an accessible route. 
 
7. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish work. 
 
8. Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery. 
 
9. Prefabricated swimming pools which are less than 24 inches deep, do not exceed 5,000 gallons and 
are installed entirely above ground. 
 
10. Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes  and not including service 
systems. 
 
11. Swings and other playground equipment accessory to detached one- and two-family dwellings. 
 
12. Window  awnings supported by an exterior wall which do not project more  than 54 inches (1372 
mm) from the exterior wall and do not require additional support. 
 
13. Movable cases, counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches (1753 mm) in height. 
 
14. For structures regulated by the IRC the reapplication of shingles and roof sheathing provided: 
 

a. Less than 50% of the structural sheathing is replaced and other structural alterations are not 
required.  
 
Note: Applying solid sheathing over space sheathing is not considered structural sheathing. 

 
15. For structures regulated by the IRC replacing windows provided: 
 

a.   Replacement window(s) is in compliance with Appendix J. 
 

16. For structures regulated by the IRC replacing exterior doors, including garage doors, provided: 
 

a.   Replacement door(s)  is in compliance with Appendix J. 
Note: screen and storm doors do not require a permit regardless of the location. 

 
(3) Electrical: 

 
1 . Portable  motors  or  other  portable  appliances  energized  by means  of  a cord  or cable  having  an 
attachment plug end to be connected to an approved receptacle when that cord or cable is permitted by 
this code. 
 
2.  Repair or replacement  of fixed motors, transformers  or fixed approved appliances of the same type 
and rating in the same location.  

 
3. Temporary decorative lighting. 
 
4. Repair or replacement  of current-carrying  parts  of any switch, contactor,  control  device or contact 
device of the same type and/or rating. 
 



 

3 
 

5. Replacement  of non-emergency over-current  device of the required  ampacity and interrupt rating in 
the same location. 
 
6. Repair or replacement  of electrodes or transformers  of the same size and capacity for signs or gas 
tube systems. 
 
7. Temporary wiring for experimental purposes in suitable experimental laboratories. 
 
8. The wiring for temporary theater, motion picture or television stage sets.  
 

(4) Gas: 
 

1. Portable heating, cooking or clothes drying appliances. 
 
2. Replacement  of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment  or make such equipment 
unsafe. 
 

(5)  Portable-fuel-cell   appliances   that  are   not  connected   to  a  fixed   piping  system   and  are  not 
interconnected to a power grid. 
 

Mechanical: 
1. Portable heating appliances. 
 
2. Portable ventilation appliances. 
 
3. Portable cooling units. 
 
4. Steam, hot- or chilled-water piping within any heating or cooling equipment regulated by this code. 
 
5. Replacement  of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment  or make such equipment 
unsafe. 
 
6. Portable evaporative coolers. 
 
7. Self-contained refrigeration  systems containing 10 pounds ( 4.54 kg) or less of refrigerant or that are 
actuated by motors of 1 horsepower (746 W) or less. 
 
8.  Portable-fuel-cell   appliances   that  are  not  connected   to  a  fixed   piping  system   and  are  not 
interconnected to a power grid. 
 
9. The replacement  of fixed appliances provided however that the replacement  appliance is in the same 
location and has a rating equal to or less than the appliance being replaced, and it is not necessary to 
remove, replace, alter, or install any additional ductwork or piping. 
 

(6) Plumbing: 
 

1.  The  stopping  of  leaks  in  drains,  water,  soil,  waste  or  vent  pipe;  provided,  however,  that  if  any 
concealed trap, drainpipe, water, soil, waste or vent pipe becomes  defective and it becomes necessary 
to remove  and replace  the same with new material,  such work  shall be considered  as new work and a 
permit shall be obtained and inspection made as provided in this code. 
 
2. The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes,  valves or fixtures, and the removal and 
reinstallation of water closets, provided such repairs do not involve or require the replacement or 
rearrangement  of valves, pipes or fixtures. 
 
3. The replacement  or removal and reinstallation of any fixture or appliance, provided, however, that the 
fixture or appliance is installed at the same location and it is not necessary to remove, replace, alter, or 
install any piping.  Exemption from  the permit requirements  of this Code shall not be deemed  to grant 
authorization  for any work to be done in violation of the provisions  of the Code or any other laws or 
ordinances of this jurisdiction. 

 
Exemption from the permit requirements of this Code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to 
be done in a manner in violation of the provisions of this Code or any other laws or ordinances of this 
jurisdiction. 



 

4 
 

 
 

(7) Section 105.5 of both the IBC and IRC. Modify Section 105.5 of both the IBC and IRC by adding a 
sentence to the end as follows: 
 

In no case shall the permit be effective unless the work covered by the permit has a documented inspection 
every 6 months minimum and is completed  within 24 months of the date on which the original permit 
was issued. 

 
(8) Section 105.8 of the IBC and R105.10 of the IRC. Add two new Sections 105.8 and 105.8.1 to the IBC 
and R105.10 and R105.10.1 to the IRC as follows: 
 

105.8(IBC) R105.10(IRC) Demolition permits required. A demolition permit shall be required as follows: 
 

1. For the removal of any building or structure. 
 
2. For the removal of any portion of a building (i.e. porch, porch railing, decorative brackets and trim, 
dormers, chimneys, etc.)  
 
105.8.1(IBC) and R105.10.1 Requirements.  The applicant  for  any  demolition  permit  shall  state on  the  
application the proposed disposal plans for all demolition materials. No demolition permit shall be issued 
until seven (7) working days after the date an application has been properly filed and said demolition 
permit shall not be effective until applicant has posted the premises to be demolished with a notice to be 
provided by the City and as directed by the City; provided, however, that accessory buildings as defined 
in the City of University Heights Zoning Ordinance and  dangerous buildings shall be exempt from said 
notice and waiting requirement. 

 
(9) Section 105.9 of the IBC and R105.11 of the IRC. Add two new Sections 105.9 to the IBC and 
R105.11 to the IRC as follows: 
 
   105.9 (IBC) and R105.11 (IRC) Permittee: 
 
   1. An electrical, plumbing or mechanical permit may be issued to any person holding a valid master 

license for the respective trade as described in Section 17-11-1 E of the City of Univsersity Heights Code, 
or to any company who employs a duly licensed master in the respective trade on a full-time basis who 
supervises the work of the apprentice and or journeymen during the company's normal business hours. 

 
  2.  An electrical, plumbing or mechanical permit may be issued to the owner of an existing owner-

occupied single-family dwelling, pursuant to a valid certificate of occupancy and used exclusively for 
residential purposes, to do any electrical work in connection with said dwelling and accessory buildings. 
The owner must personally purchase all material and perform all labor in connection with the permit.  

 
(10) Section 105.10 of the IBC and R105.12 of the IRC. Add two new Sections 105.10 to the IBC and 
R105.12 to the IRC as follows: 

105.10 (IBC) and R105.12 (IRC) Insurance: 
Before any permit to perform electrical or plumbing work may be issued, the applicant shall have on file with the 
building official a copy of a certificate of insurance stating the liability amounts of no less than three hundred 
thousand dollars ($300,000.00) property damage and five hundred thousand dollars ($500,000.00) bodily injury. 
The city shall be named as additional insured. The policy shall also provide for at least ten (10) days' notice by 
the insurer to the city of termination of the policy by the insured or insurer. Electrical permits issued under 
sections 105.9 (IBC) and R105.11 (ICR) 2 and 3 shall be exempted from this insurance requirement. 

 
 (((11) Section R107.3 of the IRC and Section 108.3 of the IBC. Amend Section R107.3 of the IRC and Section 
108.3 of the IBC as follows: 
 

R107.3 (IRC) 108.3 (IBC) Temporary Power:  Replace the "NFPA 70" with "Iowa State Electrical Code.". 
 

(12) Section R108.2 of the IRC and Section 109.2 of the IBC. Delete Section R108.2 of the IRC and Section 
109.2 of the IBC and insert in lieu thereof the following: 
 

R108.2 (IRC) 109.2 (IBC) Permit Fees and Valuations. The fee for any permit shall be as set forth in the 
permit fee schedule as established by resolution of the City Council. The determination of value or valuation 
under any of the provisions of this Code shall be made by the Building Official. The value to be used in 
computing the building permit and building plan review fees shall be the total value of all construction work 



 

5 
 

for which the permit is issued, as well as all finish work, painting, roofing, site grading, paving, landscaping, 
elevators, and other permanent equipment. The value to be used in computing the value of construction 
for reports shall be the total value of all construction work for which the permit is issued, as well as all 
finish work, painting, roofing, electrical, plumbing, heating, air conditioning, site grading, paving, 
landscaping, elevators, fire extinguisher systems and other permanent equipment. 
 

 
 (13)  Section R108. 5 of the IRC and Section 109.6 of the IBC: Delete Section R108.5 in the IRC and Section 
109.6 of the IBC and insert in lieu thereof the following: 

R108.5 (IRC) 109.6 IBC Refunds: The Building Official may authorize the refunding of any fee paid 
hereunder which was erroneously paid or collected. The Building Official shall not authorize the refunding 
of any fee paid except upon written application filed by the original permittee within one hundred eighty 
(180) days from the date of fee payment. 

 
(14) Section R108.6 of the IRC and Section 109.4 of the IBC. Delete Section 108.6 of the IRC and Section 
109.4 of the IBC and insert in lieu thereof the following: 

R108.6 (IRC)  109.4  (IBC)  Work  commencing  before permit  issuance:  Any person  who commences 
work on a building,  structure,  electrical,  gas, mechanical  or plumbing  system  before obtaining  the 
necessary permits shall be subject to a fee equal to the amount of the permit fee plus a penalty of twice 
the amount of the permit. This fee shall be collected w h e t h e r   or  not  a  permit  is  issued.  The  payment  
of  such  fee  shall  not  exempt  any  person  from compliance with all other provisions of this Code or 
from any penalty prescribed by law. Only the Building Official may reduce this fee when it is 
demonstrated tha t  an emergency  existed  that required  the work  to be done without a permit. 

 
 
(15) Section 202 of both the IBC and IRC. Add new definition as follows: 
 

 Authority Having Jurisdiction. The organization, office, or individual 
responsible for approving equipment, materials, an installation, or a 
procedure. 

 
(16) Section 202 of both the IBC and IRC. Add new definition as follows: 
 

Chief Electrical Inspector. A building inspector who either is the authority having jurisdiction or is designated by 
the authority having jurisdiction and is responsible for administering the requirements of this code. 

 
(17) Section 202 of both the IBC and IRC. Add new definition as follows: 
 
  Electrical Inspector. A building inspector authorized to perform electrical inspections. 

 
 

(18) Section 202 of both the IBC and IRC. Add new definition as 
follows: 
 

Emergency Communications Center.  Shall mean the Johnson County Emergency Communications 
Center. 

 
(19) Section 202 of the IBC and IRC. Modify definitions as follows:   
 

Habitable space: Add a sentence to the end of the definition of habitable space or room to read as follows:  
Basement areas finished to a degree to encourage their use as anything other than storage or mechanical 
rooms shall be considered habitable space. 

 
(20) Section R202 of the IRC.  Delete definition of Accessory Structure and insert in lieu thereof the 

following: ACCESSORY STRUCTURE.  See Zoning Definitions in the City Code. 
 

(21) Table R301.2 (1) of the IRC Modify by inserting data in the table as 
follows: 
 

 

Ground 
Snow 
Load 

Wind Design  

Seismic 
Design 

Category 

Subject to Damage From  

Winter 
Design 
Temp 

 

Ice-Barrier 
Underlaymen

t Required 

Flood Hazards  

Air 
Freezing 

 

Mean 

Annual 

Speed 

(mph) 

Topographic effects, 

Special wind region, or 
Weathering 

Frost 
line 

Termite NFIP 
FIRM 
Maps 



 

6 
 

Wind-borne debris zone depth Index Temp 

25 115 No A Severe 42” 
Moderate 

Heavy 
-5°F Yes 5/22/77 2/16/07 2000 50°F 

 
 
 

 
(22) Section R302.5.1 of the IRC.  Delete Section R302.5.1 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following: 
 

R302.5.1 Opening protection. Openings from a private garage directly into a room used for sleeping purposes 
shall not be   permitted. Other openings between the garage and residence shall be equipped with solid wood 
doors not less than 1 3/8 inches (35 mm) in thickness, solid or honeycombcore steel doors not less than 1 3/8 
inches (35 mm) thick, or 20-minute fire-rated doors. 

 
(23) Section R302.13 of the IRC.  Delete Section R302.13 of the IRC entirely. 
 
(24) Section R304.1 of the IRC. Delete Section R304.1 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following: 
 
 R304.1 Minimum area. Habitable rooms shall have a floor area of not less than 70 square feet . 
  Exception: Kitchens. 

 
(25) Section R310.6 of the IRC. Delete Section R310.6 in the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following: 
 

R310.6 Alterations or repairs of basements in structures built after May 10, 1989. An emergency escape and 
rescue opening is not required where existing basements undergo alterations or repairs.  
Alterations or repairs in structures built prior to May 10, 1989 shall conform to Appendix J Section AJ102.4 
Replacement windows. 
Exception: New sleeping rooms created in an existing basement shall be provided with emergency escape and 
rescue openings in accordance with Section R310.1. 

 
(26) Section R312.2 of the IRC and 1015.8 of the IBC. Delete Section R312.2 of the IRC and 1015.8 of the IBC 
entirely. 
 
(27) Section R313 of the IRC: Delete Section R313 of the IRC entirely. 
 
(28) Section R320.2 of the IRC. Add Section R320.2 in the IRC as follows: 
 

R320.2 Accessibility for projects other than those mentioned in Section R320.1. 
 
R 320.2.1 Scope. The provisions of this section are enacted to implement universal design features that provide 
accessibility, usability and visit-ability for all. 
 
R320.2.2 Definition. Public funds shall mean funding or assistance from the City of University Heights or any 
agent thereof through any of the following means: 
 

1. a building contract or similar contractual agreement involving a City-funded program or fund; 
 
2. any real estate received by the owner through a subsidy, lease, or donation by the City or its agents; 
 
3. preferential tax treatment, bond assistance, mortgage assistance, or similar financial advantages 
from the City or its agents; 
 
4. disbursement of federal or state construction funds including a Community Development Block 
Grant; or 
 
5. a City contract to provide funding or a financial benefit for housing. 
 

R320.2.3 Applicability. The amendment applies to new one- and two-family dwellings and is not required for 
new townhouses, accessory apartments or existing structures for repairs, alterations, change of occupancy or 
additions unless the square footage of the addition is more than 25% of the existing structure, then, the addition 
must comply. 
 
Exception: Applies to new townhouses constructed using public funds. 
 
The minimum usability requirements are as follows: 



 

7 
 

 
1. Step-less Entrance: At least one building entrance must be designed, without encroaching into any required 
parking space, that complies with the City of University Heights Building Code standard for an accessible 
entrance on an accessible route served by a ramp in accordance with section R311.8 or a no-step entrance. The 
accessible route must extend from a vehicular drop-off, or parking to a building entrance. The entry door 
must have a minimum net clear opening of thirty-two inches (32"). 
 
Exception: 
 
1. If public funds are used the step-less entrance must be provided. 
 
2. The building official may waive this requirement based upon the determination that strict compliance is 
financially or environmentally impractical. Split-level and townhouse style homes may be exempted. 
 
2.  Interior doors: A t  l e a s t  o n e  b e d r o o m  a n d  o n e  b a t h r o o m  ( i f  e i t h e r  a r e  p r o v i d e d )  a n d  
a ll o the r  passage doorway header widths,  on  the  level  served  by  the  designed  step-less  entrance,  
must  be  framed  to accommodate  a minimum  38" clear  rough  opening. The framing for  the  doorway  
width opening may be reduced to accommodate  any door size. 
  
Exception:   
 
1.If public funds are used the minimum  door clear opening shall be thirty-two inches (32") when the door 
is open ninety degrees (90 ), measured between the face of the door and the opposite stop. 
 
2.Doors serving closets twenty-four inches (24") or less in depth need not be framed to 38” clear opening 
width. 
 
Note: A 34" door hung in the standard manner provides an acceptable 32" opening.  
 
3. Sanitation facilities: There must be at least one bathroom containing a  water closet (toilet) and 
lavatory (sink) on the level of the dwelling to be accessed by the designed step-less entrance. The room 
shall have a minimum thirty inches (30") by forty-eight inches (48") clear floor space at the water closet and 
lavatory.  The clear floor space can be shared by both fixtures.  The clear floor space shall not be obstructed 
by a doorway swing.  
 
The plans must show a shower, bathtub or combination tub/shower can  be provided within  the room  or  an 
adjoining room without removing part of the concrete floor to provide necessary plumbing to the future plumbing 
fixture(s). 
 
Exception: 
 
1.If public funds are used a shower, bathtub or combination tub/shower shall  be provided  within  the room. 
 
2.Doors may swing into the clear floor space provided at any fixture if sufficient maneuvering space is provided 
within the room for a person using a wheelchair or other mobility aid to enter and close the door, use the 
fixtures, reopen the door and exit. Maneuvering space may include any knee space or toe space available 
below bathroom fixtures. 
 
3.The building official may waive this requirement based on the determination that strict compliance is 
financially impractical. 
 
4. Wall Reinforcement:  A bathroom must be provided  with wood blocking installed within wall framing to 
support grab bars as needed. The wood blocking, when measured to the center, will be located between 
thirty-three inches (33") and thirty-six inches (36") above the finished floor. The  wood  blocking  must  be  
located  in all walls  adjacent  to and behind  a toilet. 
 
Exception: Backing is not required behind pre-manufactured showers and bathtubs. 
 
5.  Decks:  All exterior decks and patios surfaces  adjacent to the level served by the designed step-less 
entrance must be built within four inches (4") of the dwellings finish floor level. Decks shall be a minimum 50% 
the size of a patio that is served by level served by the designed step-less entrance. 
 



 

8 
 

6.__Switch   and  outlet  requirements:   All  wall  switches,   controlling   light  fixtures,   fans, all temperature 
control devices and all receptacles  shall be located in an area between fifteen (15) and forty-eight  (48)  inches 
above  finished  floor. The height will be determined by measuring from the finished floor to the center of the 
device. When the control or receptacle placement is prohibited by the height of the window or design feature, 
alternative locations may be approved by the building official. 
 
7. Electrical panel requirements: Electrical  panels on the level of the dwelling to be accessed by the 
designed step-less entrance shall be located so that the individual circuit breakers are located between 15" 
and 54 " above the floor. 
 
8. Garages: Must be wired for power operated overhead 

 
  
(29) Section R326 of the IRC. Delete Section R326 of the IRC entirely. 
 
(30) Section R403.1.4.1 of the IRC. Modify by deleting all exceptions and inserting in lieu thereof the 
following: 

Exceptions: 
1. One story detached accessory buildings of wood or steel frame construction not used for human occupancy 
and not exceeding one thousand (1,000) square feet in floor area may be constructed using slab on grade 
construction as follows. The slab shall be three and one half inches thick,  poured  monolithically  with 
thickened perimeter footings extending twelve inches (12") below finish grade and be twe l ve  inches (12") 
wide at the base. The top of the foundation shall not be less than six inches (6") above finish grade. 
Reinforcement of the  slab,  including  the  thickened  portion,  shall  be  minimum  6x6-10/10  welded  wire  
mesh,  #4  deformed reinforcing bars at twenty four inches (24") on center each way or fiber mesh reinforced 
concrete. 
 
2. One-story wood or metal frame building not used for human occupancy and not over 200 square feet in 
floor area may be constructed with walls supported on a wood foundation plate or "skids" when approved 
by the building official. 
 
3. Decks not supported by the structure need not be provided with footings that extend below the frost  line. 

 
 
(31) Section R404.1.1 of the IRC:  Amend Section R404.1.1 of the IRC by adding an Exception after number 2 as follows: 

Exception:  Foundation walls with unbalanced lateral forces created by finish grade, i.e. walkout basements which 
are exempt from the Iowa Architectural Act shall be designed by a licensed structural engineer or constructed in 
accordance with the Table R404.1.1(5) and diagram as follows: 

 



 

9 
 

 
 
(32) Section R404.1.3 of the IRC. Modify Section R404.1.3 by adding a second paragraph as follows: 
 

Wall thickness may be reduced to eight inches (8") if a minimum of three (3) one-half inch diameter 
deformed ASTM A615 grade 40 steel bars are placed horizontally at the center of the wall thickness with 
one bar located within 14" of the top, one bar within 14" of the bottom and one bar located within 14" of the 
mid-height of the wall provided the wall height does not exceed eight feet (8'). 

 
(33) Section 423.4 of the IBC. Delete Section 423.4 in its entirety and insert in lieu thereof the following: 
 

Group E occupancies. In areas where the shelter design wind speed for tornados is 250 MPH in 
accordance with Figure 304.2(1) of ICC 500, all new Group E occupancies shall have a storm shelter 
constructed in accordance with ICC 500. The shelter shall be capable of housing the total occupant load of 
the Group E occupancy or as required by 661-301 of the Iowa State Building Code, whichever is more 
restrictive. 
 
Exceptions: 
 

1. Group E day care facilities. 
 
2. Group E occupancies accessory to places of religious worship. 
 
3. Buildings meeting the requirements for shelter design in ICC 500. 
 
4. Portable buildings. 

 
(34) Section 501.2 of the IBC (F). Modify by inserting the following after the second sentence: 
 

From 100-199 feet from the street the number shall be a minimum of 6 inches high with a minimum stroke 
of 0.5 inches.   From 200-299 feet from the street the numbers shall be a minimum 8 inches high with a 
minimum stroke of 0.5 inches.   For each additional 100 feet from the street, the number shall increase 
by an additional 2 inches in height.  Measurements to determine the minimum number size shall be measured 
from the approved address location to the center line of the street for which the premises is addressed. 



 

10 
 

 
(35) Section R703.2 of the IRC. Modify by deleting the last sentence in the paragraph. 
 
(36) Section R807.1 of the IRC. Modify by adding a sentence at the end of the second paragraph as follows: 
 

The opening shall not be located in a closet, bathroom, mechanical room, laundry room, or similar room or 
location. 
 

(37) Section 903.2.2 of the IBC (F).  Delete Section 903.2.2 of the IBC and replace with: 
 

903. 2.2 Group  B ambulatory  health care  facilities.   An automatic sprinkler  system  shall  be installed 
throughout all fire areas containing a Group B ambulatory health care facility occupancy. 

 
(38) Section 903.3.5.3 of the IBC (F). Add a new Section 903.3.5.3 in the IBC to read as follows: 
 

903. 3.5. 3 Water supply safety margin. Provide a minimum 10%, but not less than 5 psi, safety margin 
above static pressure in the fire protection system hydraulic calculation. 

 
(39) Section 903.4.2 of the IBC (F).  Delete Section 903.4.2 of the IBC and replace with: 
 

903.4.2.  Alarms.   An approved weatherproof horn/strobe  device shall be mounted directly above the 
fire department  connection  between seven (7) and ten (10) feet in height above grade.  The water-
flow  alarm device shall be activated  by water flow equivalent  to the flow of a single sprinkler  of the 
smallest  orifice  size installed in the system.  Approved and supervised audible visual notification 
appliances shall be installed on each level of the interior of the building as required by the fire code official 
and NFPA 72. 

 
(40) Section 903.6 of the IBC (F).  Add a new Section 903.6 to the IBC to read as 
follows: 
 

903.6 Zones.  Automatic sprinkler system zones shall not exceed the area permitted by NFPA 13 or 
NFPA 13R and shall provide a sprinkler control valve and water flow device for each normally occupied floor 

(41) Section 906.1 of the IBC (F).  Delete the exception without substitution. 

(42) Section 906.3 of the IBC (F). Add a sentence to the end of the section to read as 
follows: 
 

The minimum  rating of any required portable fire extinguisher for Class A, Class B, or Class C 
hazard shall be 2-10 B C 

 
(43) Section 907.2 of the IBC (F). Delete the section and replace 
with: 
 

907.2 Where required-new buildings and structures. An approved and addressable  fire alarm system 
installed in accordance  with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided in new buildings  
and structures in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.23 and provide occupant notification in 
accordance with 907.5, unless other requirements are provided by another section of this code. 

 
A minimum  of one manual fire alarm box shall be provided  in an approved location to initiate a fire 
alarm signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors  or water-flow detection devices.  
Where other sections  of this code allow elimination  of fire alarm  boxes  due to sprinklers,  a single fire 
alarm  box shall be installed. 
 
EXCEPTION: 
 
1.   The  manual  fire alarm  box  is not required  for fire  alarm  systems  dedicated  to elevator  recall  
control and supervisory service. 

 
(44) Section 907.2.1 of the IBC (F).  Delete the "exception" in Section 907.2.1 in its entirety and insert in lieu 
thereof the following exceptions: 
 

EXCEPTION: 
 



 

11 
 

h 

1)      Except for Group A-2 occupancies with occupant loads of 200 or more, manual fire alarm boxes 
are not required where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system and the 
alarm notification appliances will activate upon sprinkler water flow. 
 
2)  Group A-2. An automatic/manual  fire alarm system shall be installed in Group A-2 occupancies 
with and occupant load of 200 or more.  Activation of the fire alarm shall additionally 
cause: 
 

a.  Illumination  of the protected premises  to not less than 10 foot-candles  over the area of the 
room at a height of 30 inches above the floor; and 
 
b.   All conflicting or confusing sounds and visual distraction to automatically stop. 

 
(45) Section 907.2.3 of the IBC (F). Modify by adding a sentence to the end of the first paragraph as 
follows:  
 
     New and existing educational occupancies shall have a monitored fire alarm system. 
 
(46) Section 907.2.3 of the IBC (F). Modify by adding a 41   exception as 
follows: 
 

4.       Day care occupancies  classified as Group E Occupancy shall not require a monitored fire alarm 
system unless required elsewhere in the code. 

 
(47) Section 907. 2.11.2 of the IBC.  Modify by adding a fourth location requirement as follows: 
 

4.   Supervised  smoke alarms shall be installed in all common  corridors and at the top and bottom of all 
stairway enclosures  in Groups  R-2, R-4 and 1-1  occupancies.    In corridors,  detectors  shall be located  
within fifteen (15) feet of the end of the corridor and in such a way that one detector is located for each 
thirty (30) feet of corridor length or spaced as allowed by the code. 

 
(48) Section 907.4.2 of the IBC. Modify by adding a sentence to the end of the section to read as follows: 
 

Where  in the opinion  of the code official  manual  fire alarm  boxes may be used to cause  false fire 
alarms, the code official is authorized to modify the requirements  for manual fire alarm boxes. 

 
(49) Section 907.6.4 of the IBC (F). Modify by deleting the exception and inserting in lieu thereof the following 
exception:   
 

    Exception:  Automatic  sprinkler  system zones shall not exceed  the area permitted  by NFPA 13 and 
shall provide a sprinkler control valve and waterflow device for each normally occupied 
floor. 

 
(50) Section 907.6.4.3 of the IBC (F). Add a section to read as 
follows: 
 

Section 907.6.4.3 Zone and address location labeling. Fire alarm and/or annunciator panels shall have all 
zones and address points plainly and permanently labeled as to their location on the outside of the panel 
or on an easily readable map of the building. 

 
(51) Section 907.6.6 of the IBC (F). Modify Section 907.6.6 by adding two sentences to the end as follows: 
 

Each address point identification, shall have an alpha/numeric descriptor location. Alpha/numeric 
descriptor locations are required to be reported to the Emergency Communications Center upon activation 
of supervisory and/or alarm conditions as specified by the fire code official. 

 
(52) Section 910.2 of the IBC (F).  Delete exception 2 without substitution. 
 
(53) Section 910.3.2.2 of the IBC (F). Delete Section 910.3.2.2 and replace with: 
 

910.3.2.2  Sprinklered  buildings.  Where  installed  in buildings  provided  with an approved  automatic 
sprinkler  system,  smoke  and heat  vents shall be designed  to operate  automatically  by actuation  of 
a heat responsive device rated at least 100 degrees F (38 degrees C) above the operating temperature 



 

12 
 

of the sprinkler. 
Exception:  Gravity-operated drop-out vents complying with Section 910.3. 2.1. 

 
 
(54)  Section 912.6 of the IBC (F). Add a new section 912.6 to the IBC to read as follows: 
 

912.6 Size.  Minimum fire department connection size shall be 2 1'2  inch National Standard Thread. 
 
(55) Section 912.7 of the IBC (F). Add a new section 912.7 to the IBC to read as follows: 
 

912.7  Water  supply.   Fire  department  connections  shall  be located  not more  than 100 feet from  a 
hydrant  and both  the fire department  connection  and hydrant  shall be located  on the same  side of 
the fire department access or as approved by the fire code official.   

 
(56) Section 1011.3 of the IBC. Modify by adding a third exception as follows:  
 
 EXCEPTION: 
 

3. Stairs  within individual  dwelling  units  of  Residential  Group  R  occupancies  that  existed  prior  to 
8/28/02 (adoption of the 2000 IRC) are permitted a 78-inch (6’-6”) headroom clearance. 

 
(57) 1015.8 of the IBC. Delete Section 1015.8 of the IBC entirely. 
 
(58)  Section 1023.4 of the IBC. Modify Section 1023.4 by adding a fourth unnumbered paragraph as follows: 
 

Fire door assemblies that provide access to a non-pressurized interior exit of R-2 occupancies shall also be     
automatic closing by actuation of a smoke detector. 

 
(59) Section 1029.2 of the IBC (F). Modify by adding two new exceptions as follows: EXCEPTION: 
 

1)      Except  for Group  A-2, in assembly  occupancies  where  there is no well-defined  main exit or 
where multiple main exits are provided,  exits shall be permitted  to be distributed around the perimeter 
of the building provided that the total width of egress is not less than 100 percent of the required width. 
 
2)  The main entrance/exit of A-2 occupancies  shall be of a width that accommodates  not less than 
two-thirds of the total occupant load. 

 
(60) Section 1030.1 of the IBC. Modify by deleting the exceptions and inserting in lieu thereof the following:  
 
 EXCEPTIONS: 
 

1.      The emergency escape and rescue opening is permitted to open onto a balcony within an atrium 
in accordance  with the requirements  of Section 404 provided  the balcony provides  access  to an exit 
and the dwelling unit or sleeping room has a means of egress that is not open to the atrium. 
 
2.  Regardless of what Tables 1006.3.2(1) and 1006.3.2(2) allow, all group R-2 occupancies other than 
hotels and motels must be provided with emergency escape & rescue openings. 
 
3.       Emergency  escape and rescue openings  are not required from basements  or sleeping rooms 
that have an exit door or exit access door that opens directly into a public way or to a yard, court or 
exterior exit balcony that opens to a public way. 

 
(61) Section 1030.3 of the IBC.  Modify by adding an exception as follows: 
 

EXCEPTION: For emergency escape and rescue openings required for the remodeling or finishing of 
space  in an existing basement,  the maximum  sill height  may be measured  from an elevated landing 
not less than 36 inches wide, not less than 18 inches out from the interior finish of the exterior wall and 
not more than 24 inches in height. The landing shall be permanently affixed  to the floor below and 
the wall under the window it serves. 

 
(62) Section 1030.6 of the IBC.  Add a new Section 1030.6 to the IBC to read as follows: 
 

Section 1030.6. Emergency escape windows under decks and porches.  Emergency escape windows 



 

13 
 

are allowed to be installed under decks and porches  provided  the location of the deck allows the 
emergency escape window to be fully opened and provides a path not less than 36 inches in height to a 
yard or court. 

 
(63) Chapter 11 of the IRC. Delete Chapter 11 in its entirety and insert in lieu thereof the following: 
 

Chapter  11 Energy Efficiency,  Section N1101.  Energy efficiency for the design  and construction  of 
building regulated by this code shall be as required by 661-303 of the Iowa State Administrative Code. 

 
(64) Chapter 11 of the IBC. Delete Chapter 11 in its entirety and insert in lieu thereof the following: 
 

Chapter 11 Accessibility, Section 1101. Buildings or portions of buildings shall be accessible to persons 
with disabilities as required by 661-302 of the Iowa State Administrative Code. 

 
(65) Section 1209.2 of the IBC. Modify by adding a second unnumbered paragraph as follows: 
 

1209.2 Attic spaces. The opening shall be located in a corridor, hallway, or other readily accessible location. 
The opening shall not be located in a closet, bathroom, mechanical room, laundry room, or similar room or 
location. Attics with a maximum vertical height of less than thirty inches need not be provided with access 
openings. 

 
(66) Chapter 13 of the IBC. Delete Chapter 13 in its entirety and insert in lieu thereof the following: 
 

Chapter  13  Energy  Efficiency,  Section  1301.  Energy  efficiency  for  the design  and  construction  of 
building regulated by this code shall be as required by 661-303 of the Iowa State Administrative Code. 

 
 
(67) Section G2406.2 (303.3) of the IRC. Prohibited  locations of the IRC. Modify by deleting exceptions 3 and 4. 

(68) Section G2415.3 (404.3) of the IRC. Prohibited locations of the IRC. . Modify by deleting the last sentence.   

(69) Part  VII Plumbing,  Chapters 25 through 33 inclusive of the IRC.  Delete Part VII Plumbing Chapters 
25 through 33 inclusive of the IRC and insert the following: 
 

Part VII Plumbing, Chapter 25 
Section P2501 GENERAL 
P2501.1 Scope. Plumbing systems shall comply with the Iowa State Plumbing Code. 
Administrative Provisions.  The Plumbing Code shall be administered in accordance with administrative 
provisions in chapter 1 of this code as amended. 
 

(70) Chapter 27 of the IBC. Delete Chapter 27 of the IBC and insert the following: 
 

  Chapter 27 Electrical 
 

Section 2701.1 Scope. Electrical systems shall comply with the Iowa State Electrical Code. 

Administrative Provisions.  The Electrical Code shall be administered in accordance with administrative 
provisions in chapter 1 of this code as amended and Appendix K as amended. 

 
(71) Chapter 28 of the IBC. Delete chapter 28 of the IBC and insert the following: 

Chapter 28 Mechanical Systems 

Section 2801.1 Scope. Mechanical systems shall comply the Iowa State Mechanical Code with the following 
amendments:. 

Administrative Provisions.  The Mechanical Code shall be administered in accordance with administrative 
provisions in chapter 1 of this code as amended. 
 

Commercial Kitchen Hood Exhaust Termination: 

In addition to the code requirements for commercial kitchen hood exhaust terminations locations, the following 
shall apply: 



 

14 
 

For new construction, change in occupancy or change in use, that requires a new commercial kitchen hood or 
revisions to an existing commercial kitchen hood,  the new or existing commercial  kitchen hood exhaust duct 
shall terminate as follows: 

1.  Above the roof level without passing through an exterior wall; or 
 

2. Through an alley facing exterior wall provided the termination is above the roof level; or 
 

3.  To an alley right of way per 3202.3.2 of the International Building Code. 

(72) Chapter 29 of the IBC. Delete Chapter 29 of the IBC and insert the following 
 

Chapter 29 Plumbing Systems 
 
Section 2901.1 Scope. Plumbing systems shall comply with the Iowa State Plumbing Code. 
Administrative Provisions.  The Plumbing Code shall be administered in accordance with administrative 
provisions in chapter 1 of this code as amended. 

 
(73) Section 3002.4 of the IBC. Delete Section 3002.4 of the IBC and insert in lieu thereof the following: 
 

3002.4 Elevator car to accommodate ambulance stretcher. 
 
In buildings four or more stories above, or four or more stories below, grade plane, at least one 
elevator shall be provided for fire department emergency access to all floors. The elevator car shall be 
of such a size and arrangement to accommodate an ambulance stretcher 24 inches by 84 inches (610 
mm by 2134 mm) with not less than 5-inch (127 mm) radius corners, in the horizontal, open position 
and shall be identified by the international symbol for emergency medical services (star of life). The 
symbol shall not be less than 3 inches (76 mm) high and shall be placed inside on both sides of the 
hoistway door frame. 

 
(74) Part VIII Electrical,  Chapters 34 through 43 inclusive of the IRC. Delete Part VIII Electrical Chapters 
34 through 43 inclusive of the IRC and insert the following: 
 

Part VIII Electrical, Chapter 34 
 
Section E3401 GENERAL 
 
E3401.1 Applicability. Electrical systems shall comply with the Iowa State Electrical Code. 
 

(75) (Appendix K of the IBC.) 
 
(76) Section K103.2  of  the IBC. Work exempt from permit.  Delete Section K103.2 in the IBC and insert in lieu 
thereof the following:  
 
 Section K103.2 Work exempt from permit. See section 105.2 in both the IRC and IBC. 
 
(77) Section K106.5 of the IBC. Add a new Section K106. 5 as follows: 
 

Section K106. 5 Energy Connections; An electrical system or equipment regulated by this code for which a 
permit is required shall not be connected to a source of energy or power until approved by the building 
official. 

 
(78) Section K106.6 of the IBC. Add a new Section K106. 6 as follows: 
 

Section K106. 6 Temporary Energy Connections. The building official may authorize the temporary 
connection of the electrical system or equipment to the source of energy or power for the purpose of testing 
the equipment, or for use under a temporary certificate of occupancy. 

 
(79) (Appendix J of the IRC. ) 
 
(80) Section AJ102.4 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ102.4 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following: 



 

15 
 

AJ102.4 Replacement windows and doors. Regardless of the category of work, where an existing window or 
door, including the sash and glazed portion, or safety glazing is replaced, the replacement window, door or 
safety glazing shall comply with the requirements of Sections AJ102.4.1 through AJ102.4.3, as applicable. 

 
(81) Section AJ102.4.1 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ102.4.1 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following: 
 

AJ102.4.1 Energy efficiency. Replacement windows or doors shall comply with the requirements of Chapter 11. 
 
(82) Section AJ102.4.4 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ102.4.4 of the IRC entirely. 
 
(83) Section AJ501.7 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ501.7 and insert in lieu thereof the following: 
 

AJ501.7 Ceiling height. Habitable spaces created in existing basements or attics shall have ceiling heights of 
not less than 6 feet, 8 inches (2032 mm), except that the ceiling height at obstructions shall be not less than 6 
feet 4 inches (1930 mm) from the basement or attic floor. Existing finished ceiling heights in nonhabitable 
spaces in basements or attics shall not be reduced. 

 
(84) Section AJ501.8.1 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ501.8.1 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following: 
 

AJ501.8.1 Stair width. Existing basement and attic stairs and handrails not otherwise being altered or modified 
shall be permitted to maintain their current clear width at, above and below existing handrails. 

 
(85) Section AJ501.8.2 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ501.8.2 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following: 
 

AJ501.8.2 Stair headroom. Headroom height on existing basement or attic stairs being altered or modified shall 
not be reduced below the existing stairway or attic finished headroom. Existing basement or attic stairs not 
otherwise being altered shall be permitted to maintain the current finished headroom. 

 
(86) Section AJ501.8.3 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ501.8.3 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following: 
 

AJ501.8.3 Stair landing. Landings serving existing basement or attic stairs being altered or modified shall not 
be reduced below the existing stairway landing depth and width. Existing basement or attic stairs not otherwise 
being altered shall be permitted to maintain the current landing depth and width. 

 
(87) Section AJ601.4 of the IRC. Delete Section AJ601.4 of the IRC and insert in lieu thereof the following: 
 

AJ601.4 Ceiling height. Habitable spaces created in existing basements and attics shall have ceiling heights of 
not less than 6 feet, 8 inches (2032 mm), except that the ceiling height at obstructions shall be not less than 6 
feet 4 inches (1930 mm) from the basement or attic floor. Existing finished ceiling heights in nonhabitable 
spaces in basements or attics shall not be reduced. 

 
SECTION II.  REPEALER.  Ordinance No. is hereby repealed.  

SECTION III CONFLICTS. If any section, provision or part of the Ordinance, as now existing or as hereafter 
amended,  conflicts with the University Heights Zoning Ordinance, Ordinance No. 79, or the University Heights 
Rental Housing Code, Ordinance No. 110, as either now exists or is hereafter amended, such conflicts will be 
resolved by applying and enforcing the more stringent or more restrictive provision or provisions. 

SECTION IV.  SEVERABILITY.  If any section, provision or part of the Ordinance shall be adjudged to be invalid or 
unconstitutional, such adjudication shall not affect the validity of the Ordinance as a whole or any section, provision 
or part thereof not adjudged invalid or unconstitutional. 

SECTION V. EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ordinance shall be in effect after final passage, approval and publication as 
provided by law. 

   

 

 

  

 



 

16 
 

Passed and approved this _____ day of __________________, 2016. 

____________________________________        
 MAYOR 

           ATTEST:_____________________________ 
                          CITY CLERK 

Approved by 

_________________________ 

City Attorney's Office 



University Heights January 2016 eGovernment Report 

 
U-H Website Updates/Statistics December 1-31, 2015 

 December 31, 2015 
o Mayor and Council page update, Christmas tree pickup dates 

 December 18, 2015 
o OUP Construction Update 

 December 13, 2015 
o Council meeting agenda and attachments 

 December 11, 2015 

o Lights in Heights postponed 

 December 1, 2015 

o Lights in Heights 

 
Monthly Statistics from Stat Counter 

 

Page Views Unique Visits 1st Time Visits Returning Visits  

1,084 773 562 211 Total 

 35    25 19 7 Average 

 

Monthly Statistics from Webalyzer 

Hits per Hour 69 

Hits per Day 1673 
Pages per Day 427 
Total Visits 7395 
Total Unique User Agents 887 

Average Visits Per Day 238 

 

 
U-H Website Twitter Statistics December 1- 31, 2015 

 

 

Tweets 4 

Re-tweets 0 

Followers  77 

 

 

  

http://university-heights.blogspot.com/2013/02/february-5-2013.html
http://university-heights.blogspot.com/2013/02/february-5-2013.html
http://university-heights.blogspot.com/2013/02/february-5-2013.html


University Heights City Council Meeting Webcasts Viewing Statistics From EarthChannel 

 

November Council Meeting statistics 11/12/15 to 12/31/15 

 

 

Discussion of creating a University Heights Google Domain 

 

I have been in discussion with a representative from Tempus Nova a licensed company to create a 

Google for Business domain for University Heights. This would allow the City to have secure cloud 

storage for information as well as use the gmail client for city councilors and city staff. This would 

address our ongoing issue of access to documents and information. I would like to get the council’s 

opinion regarding this move. Besides the one time cost of setting up the domain, which should be less 

than $3,000.00 depending on services, there would be an annual fee of $50.00 per email license. I 

would anticipate that the city would use a total of 10 licenses (6 for mayor and council plus clerk, 

treasurer, building, and rental inspectors). 

 

If council is interested in pursuing this course I will continue to work on this. 



Sidewalks and Community Policy 

University Heights Community Visioning Project Survey 

The 2016 Iowa’s Living Roadways Community Visioning Process in University Heights is underway. 

Iowa State University is sending survey packets to randomly selected residents in University Heights the 

week of January 11.  If you receive a packet, take a moment to complete the questionnaire and mail it 

back using the enclosed postage-paid envelope.  The questionnaire will take approximately 25 minutes 

to complete. 

For further information about participating in the overall visioning process, please call or email Dotti 

Maher at (319) 351-6161 (home) or (319) 321-6161 (cell), dotti@university-heights.org. 

Sidewalk Clearing Procedure 

Now that winter and snow have arrived in full force, clarification of a procedure and process for dealing 

with the problem is in order.  Please be prepared to render your suggestions at Council Meeting or 

contact me regarding your ideas at the above address. 

Police Protection 

Next month at the February Council Meeting, Captain Ken Stanley and I will be discussing plans and 

procedures for 2016. 

 

mailto:dotti@university-heights.org

	160112agendaattach
	00 University Heights Agenda- Jan. 12, 2016
	01 Mayor's Report
	02 Resolution 16-01 ratfifying  ZC and BoA
	03 UHAttyRept January 2016
	03A UH - OUP - plat of survey dividing into 2
	03B UH - OUP - St. Andrew - OUP lease 09 18 15
	03C UH - OUP - south condo dec 12 29 15
	03D UH - OUP - TIF Dev Agmt Maxwell 08 11 15 signed
	03E UH - OUP - agrmt to pay fees 042211
	03F UH - OUP - agrmt to pay fees 08 11 15 signed
	04 City Clerk Report
	04A Building Permits
	04C Minutes' timeline - January 2016
	05 Resolution 16-02 adopting policy re minutes 01 12 16
	06 Treas Report
	06A Cash Receipts & Disbursements
	06B profit and loss reports  December
	07 Warrants for January Meeting
	08 Engineer-Report-2016-01
	09 BZS_011015
	09A Ordinance 192 building codes
	10 16-01eGovReport

	11 Late Dotti



